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SxA
ll.l OPS : Yes / No DOA:

Ref:

MV: $



From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Wednesday,2T March 2019 9:40 AM

Kitty Teo Poh Guek

HO Kow Wai; KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); LKK Valuation

RE: Check MV-SGJ 5008K

Dear Kitty.

The market value of SGJ 5008K is $i2K-$i3K (Estimated) as at March 2019

Best Regards,

Veron Chen I Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.corn I fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Plrk, Ubi Avenue \ #A2-25 | 5{408933)

From: HO Kow Wai <kowwai.ho@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday,26 March 201-9 6:52 PM

To: bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; frankie@fta.com.sg; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; benson@lbs-

auto.com; nick@lbs-auto.com; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)<olivialau@lkkauto.com>;
jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; ricky@rta.com.sg; elson@rta.com.sg; collin.wong@a-
pac.sg; patrick.soo@a-pac.sg; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>

Cc: TEO Kitty <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>
Subject: Check MV

Dear partners,

As per attached, pls assist to check MV and forward your finding to Ms. Kitty Teo.

Tks.
-----Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. lf you are not

the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. lf you have

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
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EnquireiPhRF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
vetrlcii'owner Par[iiu la rs

owiiat lD TYPtt
. -;i::.
O*nerlD:
Vchicle Details

Vehicle No':

VJi icr" to u. E*po*"u'
I ntended Deregistration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicie Model:

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

Entine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maxlmum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:

First ReEistration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

lntended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Elieibility Expiry Date;

PARF Rebate Amount:

lntended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE CateSory:

COE Period(Years)r

PQP Paid:

COE RebateAmount:

Total RebateAmount:

Message

Singapore NRIC

3445D

5GJ5008K

No

20 Mar 2019

SUZUKI

APV 1.6 AT

Black

2006

G15AID114902

MHYGDN71VOOTO4426

68.0 kw (91bhp)

$12,e33.00

13 Jul 2006

13Jul 2006

2

$t4,227.OO

Forfeited

$0,00

31 May 2021- 
A-Car(1600cc&below)

5

$22,78?.OO

$10,010.00

$ro,oro.oo

Daqr -
c6xCI)

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be furtherrenewed. Thevehicle must bede-reglstered upon COE expiryorwhen the

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan {if applicable), whichever is e?rlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Mar 2019

OK


