Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Lim <steve.lim@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 21 March, 2019 4:15 PM

To: Sophia Tan

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: CH16/892 Qur ref: DT/CC/BLISS-2/PD
Hi Sophia,

| have engaged LKK to do settlement with your end.
Hi Mei Kwan / Hsiao Tong,
FYNA please

Steve Lim
Manager - Claims

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five Singapore 038985
DID.: +65 6829 9197

Fax.: +65 6829 9247

steve.lim@ergo.com.sg

WWW.Ergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than
30 countries and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading
risk carriers.

Disclaimer: This message and its attachments are confidential, intended only for the named addressee, and may be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not disclose, distribute, copy or use this communication.
If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender by return email and delete this message. By opening
any attachment to this message, you agree to accept the risk that it may contain a virus or damaging code, and you
agree that ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd. will not be liable for any loss or damage thereby caused.

From: Sophia Tan [mailto:sophia.tan@advlawllc.com]
Sent: Thursday, 21 March, 2019 4:10 PM

To: Steve Lim

Subject: RE: CH16/892 Our ref: DT/CC/BLISS-2/PD

Hi Steve

Can revert urgently on your offer?



Rdgs
Sophia Tan
Advance Law LLC

From: Steve Lim <steve.lim@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, March 07,2019 12:11 PM

To: Sophia Tan <sophia.tan@advlawllc.com>
Subject: RE: CH16/892 Our ref: DT/CC/BLISS-2/PD

Hi Sophia,
Our ref should read as above
Checking survey report with LKK. Is an old file. Will respond once we received it

Steve Lim
Manager - Claims

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

5 Temasek Boulevard, #04-05 Suntec Tower Five Singapore 038985
DID.: +65 6829 9197

Fax.: +65 6829 9247

steve.lim@ergo.com.sg

WWW.Eergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than
30 countries and concentrates on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading
risk carriers.

Disclaimer: This message and its attachments are confidential, intended only for the named addressee, and may be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you should not disclose, distribute, copy or use this communication.
If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender by return email and delete this message. By opening
any attachment to this message, you agree to accept the risk that it may contain a virus or damaging code, and you
agree that ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd. will not be liable for any loss or damage thereby caused.

EMAIL DISCLAIMER

The information contained in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-transmit,
copy, distribute, act in reliance on or commercialize the information if you are authorized to do so. If you are not the
intended recipient of this email communication, please notify the sender by replying to the email and destroy any
electronic or paper copy of this message.

Any views expressed in this email communication are those of the individual sender. ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. does
not represent, warrant or guarantee that the integrity of this communication has been maintained or that the
communication is free of errors, virus or interference.

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. asserts copyright in respect to this email including any attachment-----Original Message-----
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From: Sophia Tan [mailto:sophia.tan@advlawllc.com]
Sent: Thursday, 7 March, 2019 11:21 AM

To: Steve Lim

Subject: FW: CH16/842 Our ref: DT/CC/BLISS-2/PD
Importance: High

Hi Steve

Tried calling you.

Need your confirmation of settlement for this matter.
Thanks

Sophia Tan
Tel : 63235488

From: Sophia Tan <sophia.tan@advlawllc.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 28, 2019 5:21 PM

To: 'steve.lim@ergo.com.sg' <steve.lim@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: CH16/842 Our ref: DT/CC/BLISS-2/PD

Hi Steve

To recap on our telecon today, attach our LOD for your attention.

You will note that we are not seeking any costs in the said matter.

If you are agreeable, kindly effect payment made payable to 'ADVANCE LAW LLC".
Thanks n rdgs

Sophia Tan
Advance Law LLC

From: ApeosPort-VI C5571 <copier@advlawllc.com>
Sent: Thursday, February 28, 2019 5:04 PM

To: sophia.tan@advlawllc.com

Subject: Scan Data from ADVANCE-LAW-VI-5571

Number of Images: 7
Attachment File Type: PDF

Device Name: ApeosPort-VI C5571
Device Location: 430 lorong 6 toa payoh, # 11-01 singapore-319402



