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i mam Piw Lid Campany Regmtration No. 108607 104F
51 UIEAYE |, M2-28 PAYA UL INDUSTRLAL PARK. SINGAPORE 08953 TEL @ i068) 62560551 FAX : (0681 6236115

Your ref: D19002034MFSH

Owur ref: CS/FCL19005409/Gvd3 Date: 2/4/2019

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. 5]S 968K

We thank vou for vour instruction on 26/3/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

142019 atthe premises of M/s  PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :556,578.00

Revised Estimate Amount :554.048.00

"Check” Items Amount :551,606.00

Market Value 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 55

Nett Value 55

Description of Damage:

nearside
The vehicle sustained damages at the w T = ]
rear portion. ll | -
Te—————
affsae

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

XING GUO QIANG (111 5288 0283)
MMATAL AMSAE-A
Automotive Assessor



MS @FirstCapital S Raes Qo 121,00 Sngipore DS e e

Tt (65) 6222 2311 Fax: [B5) B22T 3547

Chsima & Petnr Unaiemaniting Oupe 35 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singepore 0GBATT
Tet |65) 507 3048 Fax [B%) E507 3845

wvend e firvieagital pom. g

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 25-03-2018 Our Ref No. D18002034MFSH
Accident Date 21-03-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC7048D Third Party Vehicle. SJS9689K
Survey Location 55 UBI ROAD 1
Contact Person. SHEILA M ISMAIL
Contact No. 63882323/ 67689911 Fax No. 68411183
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
Appojag LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68418315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

PREMIUM
/ h ;
Co.: Warnsliop AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD s )
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge HENRY KADQ

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey repart via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This 15 a computer genarated letter, no signature required




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent;
To:

Cc
Subject:

Dear Carrine,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Monday, 10 June 2019 9:36 AM

Carrine Leong

jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; SUR; claims@premiumauto.com.sg
RE: FINAL REVISION - 5)59689K - TP FIRSTCAP - SURVEYED 1 APR 19

Confirm repair cost of $5015.50 before GST @ 3 days

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Bast Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 5:10 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg
Subject: FW: FINAL REVISION - SJS9689K - TP FIRSTCAP - SURVEYED 1 APR 19

Hi Veron,

Revised estimate and photographs is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $5015.50 @ 3 days

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Thanks & Best Regard
Carrine Leong

Claims Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pte Lid e ne messaanw

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408658

p. +65 B3B8 1323 d. +65 6768 9925 1. +65 6841 1183
e, carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 781 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. «+65 6836 2223



Email Disclaimer

This emall, inclisding any attachmen, iy confidentisl and my alo be privileged

1y have received |} 0 errod, please notify ul immediatety by reply amsil and then delste this message from your system
Flease do pat copy It or wse It for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment ta any ather persan. Thank you

From: Boo seng yak [mailto:boojohnny@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 29 May, 2019 5:54 PM

To: Guo Qjang (LKK Auto) <gucqiang@lkkauto.com>; cs-a@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com; Carrine Leong
<carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang Chee Sing
<claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SJS9689K - TP FIRSTCAP - SURVEYED 1 APR 19

Hi Guo Qiang and all,
Revised estimate and photographs is attached.
Please confirm repair cost of $5015.50 @ 3 days

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



‘Veron Chen SLI{I{Autn]

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April 2019 2:41 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: 'Henry Kao Cal Jie'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002034MFSH/1, 5J5 9683K
Attachments: SJS 9689K PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SJS 9689K
Date of survey: 1/4/2019
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 March 2019 4:42 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai lie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002034MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Thank vou for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@ lkkauto.com | fax: b256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto: lai msfirstcapi

Sent: Tuesday, 26 March, 2019 12:15 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai Jie <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19002034MFSH/1




Dear Sir/Mdm,

" We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 6737
e R T . T DI
Vehicle No.: SIS9689K
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 01 Apr 2019
Vehicle Make: AUDI
Vehicle Model: A4 14TFSISTRONIC
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No.: CVNO41398
Chassis No.: WAUZZZF43HA182243
Maximum Power Output: 110.0 kW (147 bhp)
Open Market Value: $32,096.00
Original Registration Date: 18 Sep 2017
First Registration Date: 18 Sep 2017
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $26,935.00
Elnfended PARE Rebiate DeGlE e = o e el
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 17 Sep 2027
PARF Rebate Amount: $20,201.00
EIitermied COE REFATE Detal Sl ] e e S
COE Expiry Date: 17 Sep 2027
COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $49,000.00
COE Rebate Amount: $41,459.00
Total Rebate Amount: $61,660.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 01 Apr 2019

OK
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

AUDI AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder : YEO CHEE KIAT (YANG ZHLJI) Vehicle No. : SJS9689K
Period of Insurance : 18 Sep 2018 To 17 Sep 2018 Policy No. : 1700051477-01
Engine No. + CVNO41398 Endorsement No.
Chassis No. : WALZZZF43HA 182243 Issued Date : 03 Aug 2018
Make/Model ;AUDI A4 1.4 TFSI S tronic
Engina Capacity/Tonnage : 1,395.00 CC Sum Insured © Market Value First Year of Registration : 2017
Driver Restriction : NA Off Peak Car : No Inguring with COE/PARF : Yes
Parson or Classas of Parsons Entitied to Drive® -
1) Thi Palcymolder

1) Arey oliver porsar who is delving on the Policyhcicer's order ar wilh hinher permissan
Trua Plicy will indemnity e Pelcyholder of ey mahorised Qe anly | amhe medain B apecied ags cordon

¥ind hiww I Py 0 momtionel sum of E1.000 e “inesperienced D Escesa™ CIDRT) 0 Vs sve or Your Autbasssd Dover (namid or unnemed| has iss ihan § ynam’ driang sepenence

Age Condition ; 30 years old and above
Limitation as to use*

L pewy bor amoal domeste: sred pleasure purpeses and bz e Daicyhiniies busnsas
T Policy does not cower uen for hine or rewerd, driving tuilion, @iing el fecing, pRCe-masng, relinbilty Tal or speed-inufing, Tm camiags of goods oitsr 1hen sempies n cannechian eif ey ireds o
TSRS OF UBD for BTy PUTPGER M Cornectan win Motor Trade

Loss of Use 1800ce - 2000ce Optional

* Limilnton refidensd inopeswties by Saciion 8 of fw Meior Vehicey (Thin:-Pemy s ed Compensation) Act (Cap. 18§) and Section #5 of the Aoed Trenepon &0, 1607 (Mssysa) sm nel i be
Pzl pled Livier these feshihge

EXCESS

Section 1
Firm - 30 Own Diwmags - $600 Thafl - 30 Fiood Cover - 30

Baction ¥
Proparty Camsgs - 30
Windecresn ; 5100

Named Drivar and EXCBSS jwhe sppicass)
YED CHEE KIAT (YANG ZHIJI) - $800 |Own Damags)

APPROVED REPORTING CENTRES/IAUTHORISED REPAIRERS (FOR CLAIMS RELATED REPAIRS)

V. Audl Cusinenar Sarvice Caniee Add: 55 Utk Foa 1 Sngepors 408580 £3687129

For othwr  Approved Reporting Camres/AlG Aumorse:d Reparers, pisass contact sur 24-Faur scoidestt eme gency Rofime ol =08 8138 4200, Alwmntvely. you moy seher @ AG welsie www 8ig toreg
¢ ARG 55 Mobile App. Senply search and dosseoad "RG0 567 om (Teres o Googe Pley

IMPORTANT NOTES

Hire Purchase Company/Employer's Loan: United Overseas Bank Limited

|Mummnunm-u m:h In Mmmurhm“ o Eanued 0 pocaidence with i provisone of ihe Mobor Veteeioed Thind Pty Risks snd Compensation) A (Cap. 188, Part Ty of
the Pl Tramuport Aoy 18T (b ) el Mbaslest [Trurs Party Misha) Fules. 1R5H (dalsyes)

0504125200
a2

PREMILM LEASING - AP

281 ALEXANDRA ROAD AUDI CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

SINGAPORE 159938 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.

Undarsritten by AIG Asia Pacific iInsursnce Pla. Lid. AUTHORISED REPRESENTATIVE

1 Sharlan Way ROT-18 AlG Baiding S079120 | Toellh G410 2000 ) F oS G415 370D | vt i, oo o4 MG Asa Puciiic msutance Pra Lid
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 6366 2323 Fax: 5841 1183
Email: Nora khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate Accident Repairs
Workshop Ubi Road 1

Contact No 6366 2323

Fax No 6841 1183

Reference PA/TR/O375/2015/CW
Date 23-Mar-19

Vehicle not IN workshop. Kindly assist to arrange for survey.

Your insured vehicle

First Capital Insurance Ltd

36 Robinson Road
# 16-01 City House
Singapore 06BB77

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Tel:6854 3909 Fax: 6507 3849

SHC 7049 D

Owner's Name Mr. Yeo Chee Kiat
Address Blk 629 Bedok Reservair Rd
#11-1630
Singapore 470629
Telephone HP +65 96896598
Type of Claim Thid Party Claims
Fullry No. 1700051477-01
Vehicle No S)S 9689 K
Model Code Aud| A4 Sedan 1.4 TFS]
Model / Year Sep-17
Engine No CYND41398
Chassis No WALUZZZF43HAL182243
Mileage
Date In
Liability
Excess Cost -
Estimated By Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date 21-Mar-19
Place of Accident PIE Paya Lebar Flyover



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 63662323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle S]S 9689 K

Estimated
S/N Nature of Jobs Charges

To remove and transfer rear parking aid and rear
1 lid kick sensor. Check function and renew according S/N S 360.00 _-~
to damage.

To dismantle and renew rear bumper. Re-organise 6
2 rear crash management components. Reinstall all S 900.00 s
parts removed.

3 Torespray rear bumper. S 800.00 éaﬁ

4 To carry out diagnostic check. S/N S 192.00 .~

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES :  §  2,252.00



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax
Damage Parts & Prices
S/N  Parts Description S/NETT REMARKS

1  REARBUMPER Ce . S 2,015.00
2 REARBUMPERFIXING PARTS ¢ | NAJ ¢ 66.00
3 REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP Hé&/ 3 203.00
4  REARBUMPERSPOILER ¥ AT s 227.00
5  REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR LIGHT-LH/RH X A/ 28 76.00
6 REARBUMPER CARRIER J 6T $ 819.00
7 REARBUMPERSEAL g ~ NN 28 25.00
8  REARBUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH % I\/‘} 40.00
9  REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-RH X S 41.00
10  REAR BUMPER UPPER GUIDE SECTION-LH/RH X 1 2 ¢ 40.00
11  REAR SENSOR 7 - 2 5 462.00
12 REARSENSORSEALRING > M - NN 45 12.00
13 SUNDRIES 7’ . 3 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS S 4,326.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 5 2,252.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 6,578.00

Legend Remarks (0K) = &pproved, Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax ’>\u\.[\

Name : éu,.w a.aq{ ~ 52550282

Surveyed Date :
Authorised Date : Z P&ij -

Excess Cost -
2§ .
Liability : bﬁ{M 070'-*'7{' PL“+
Remarks :
ol / ¢/ f7
Please Note :  This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.
For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.
I-"..*. v Lants hance notify
Yours faithfully, * To enaves 1 cantng
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd * Pasts pric ot T
:.. 5 ' reuticn’ b
ey R
Wl © Al Bpprovid rom ingy A oA
Johnny Boo Allan Wu

Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Veron Chen {LKKAutu!

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAUtS)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 1:45 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Check item photos and before paint photos for 5J5 9689 K

Attachments: WhatsApp Image 2019-04-15 at 6.51.32 PM (1) jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2019-04-15 at
6.51.32 PM (2) jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2019-04-15 at 6.51.32 PM jpeg; WhatsApp Image
2019-04-15 at 6.51.33 PM (1).jpeg: WhatsApp Image 2019-04-15 at 6.51.33 PM jpeg;
WhatsApp Image 2019-04-15 at 6.51.34 PM jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2019-04-16 at
1.25.24 PM (1).jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2019-04-16 at 1.25.24 PM jpeg; WhatsApp Image
2019-04-16 at 1.26.53 PM jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2019-04-16 at 1.26.54 PM jpeg;
WhatsApp Image 2019-04-16 at 10.36.25 AM jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2019-04-16 at
10.36.26 AM (1) jpeg; WhatsApp Image 2019-04-16 at 10.36.26 AM jpeg

Importance: High

CSFCI18005409/Gvd3

From: glory.tan@premiumauto.com.sg <glory.tan@premiumauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April, 2019 1:41 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: allan.wu@premiumauto.com.sg; 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; claims@premiumautocare.com.sg
Subject: Check item photos and before paint photos for SIS 9683 K

Dear all,

Please refer to the attached for check items, before paint photos for 5J5 9689 K.

Check Item number in marked estimate,

4. Rear bumper spoiler. (SGD 227)
6. Rear bumper carrier. (SGD 819)

Thank you.

Best Regard,
Glory Tan
Bodyworks Department

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd sy ue smssozzniw

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408659
p.+65 6388 2323 f, +65 6841 1183

e. glory.tan@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audl.com.sg
Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +85 6836 2223



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408629
Tel 63662323 Fax: 6841 1183
Emad Nora khaifipremiumauto com g / claims@premiumaulo. com sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad 1

Contact No ;63662323

Fax No ! 68411183
Reference 1 PATP/O375/2018/GW
Date + 23-Mar-19

Vehicle not IN workshop. Kindly assist to arrange for survay.

Your insured vehicle : SHCT049 D

First Capital Insurance Ltd
38 Robinson Road
# 16-01 City House

Singapore 068877
Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Tel:6854 3908 Fax: 6507 3849
Owner's Name :  Mr Yeo Chee Kiat
Address : Bk 529 Bedok Reservoir Rd

#11-1630

Singapore 470829
Telephone HP +65 06886068
Type of Claim Thid Party Claims
Policy No. 1700051477-01
Vehicle No 5JS 9689 K
Model Code Audi A4 Sedan 1.4 TFSI
Model | Year Sep-17
Engine No CVN 041208
Chassis No WAUZZZF43HA182243
Mileage
Dato In
Liability
Excess Cost ‘
Estimated By Jehnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Data 21-Mar-18
Place of Accident PIE Paya Lebar Flyover



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax 6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SJS 9689 K

Estimated
SIN Nature of Jobs Charges

To remove and transfer rear parking aid and rear lid

1 kick sensor. Check function and renew accordingto S/N § 360.00 ] 360.00
damage.
To dismantle and renew rear bumper Re-organise

2 rear crash management components. Reinstall all E: 800.00 $ 600.00
parts removed.

3 To respray rear bumper. 5 800.00 5 600.00

4 To carry out diagnostic check. SIN 8§ 192.00 192.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 5 2,252.00 ] 1.752.00

_— s |




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel | 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SJS 9689 K
=0 o accident Venicle Regn No. SJS 96¢
Damage Parts & Prices

SIN__ Parts Description SINETT REMARKS
1 REAR BUMPER 5 201500 £ 2.015.00
2 REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS 5 66.00
3 REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP $ 20300 = 203.00
4 REAR BUMPER SPOILER $ 22700 § 226.50
5 REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR LIGHT-LH/RH 3 76.00
B REAR BUMPER CARRIER 3 81800 = 819.00
7 REAR BUMPER SEAL 3 25.00
8 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH $ 40.00
8 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-RH 3 41.00

10 REAR BUMPER UPPER GUIDE SECTION-LH/RH 3 40.00

1" REAR SENSOR $ 462.00

12 REAR SENSOR SEAL RING 5 12.00

13 SUNDRIES 3 300.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 4,326.00 ¢ 3,263.50
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 2,252.00 5 1,752.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 6,578.00 °© 5.015.50
Legend Remarks (OK) = Approved. Remarks (X) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date

Authorised Date

Excess Cost

Liability

Remarks

Please Note : This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair. we shall inform you accordingly.
For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khal at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL B256 1581 FAX: 256 4315
Reg Mo 18060T186R GST Reg. No. 18-0607168-R

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Rel - CS/FCI19005408/Gvdan2
seroee o o wcaroreseserr o oose | [N
1 c
Insured Veh.  SHC 7049D
Policy No. 0.00
Claim No. D18002034MFSH 0.00
Assign From HENRY KAD
2w e ila
Make & Model  ALDI A4 c.c 1395
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg 2017
Chassis No.  WAUZZZF43HA182243 Colour BLUE
Odometer 21505 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. = ions of T 1]
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
L/H Front Tm 205/60 R16 CONTINENTAL T mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 CONTINENTAL 7 mm
L/H Rear T}‘I"l 205/60 R16 'CQNTINEHTN. 7 mm
4 7 scription of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
T e
Accident Date 21/032019
Survey held at PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD
55 UBIROAD 1 .
SINGAPORE mns
Sa._ L BNl iS “Rem
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C'IIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR IHETHUI:TIGH-E W'E HAVE NOT HU'THGRISED REPAIRS

B RN WRIE p1 I =T~
|E5T'FM|&TED NORMAL PEFIIDD Fﬂﬂ REPAIR:

lt\'urhlrul:hy-




' 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-y 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Payn Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, No 109607198R GST Reg. No. 19-960T108-R Page No. /1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJS 689K

1|REAR BUMPER (SN) DEFORMED 2,015.00 2,015.00
1|REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 68,00 =
1|REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP (SN) NECESSARY 203.00 203.00
1|REAR BUMPER SPOILER (SN| cur 227.00 226.50
2|REAR LIGHT REFLECTOR LIGHT-LH/RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 76.00 3
1|REAR BUMPER CARRIER [SN) BENT 819.00 812.00
2|REAR BUMPER SEAL (SN) NOT NECESSARY 25.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-RH [SN) NOT NECESSARY 41.00 -
2|REAR BUMPER UPPER GUIDE SECTION-LH/RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 40.00 -
Z|REAR SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 482.00 -
4|REAR SENSOR SEAL RING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 12.00 .
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NOT NECESSARY 300.00 -
4.326.00 326350

LABOUR

TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER REAR PARKING AID AND 360.00 360.00

REAR LID KICK SENSOR.CHECK FLINCTION AND RENEW

ACCORDING TO DAMAGE

TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW REAR BUMPER.RE- 500.00 600.00

ORGANISE REAR CRASH MANAGEMENT

COMPONENTS REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED.

TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER 800.00 800.00

TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK 182,00 192.00

225200 1.752.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,578.00 5,015.50

KR

XING GUD QIANG ADRIAN LING WAI PING
M.MATAI AMSAE-A B.Eng AMSOEAMIRTE.AMSAE-A MMATAI
Automotive Assessor Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIARILITY 70 THIRD PARTIES - This Reporn & made sabely for e uss and benefil ol the Client named on the froml pags of this Repan.




