M

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@®sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 12:38 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLA4294U (Ol: SNM19D201323C02/4) AND
SUS0B88U (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CT119005393/Aea3) on 23/03/2019

Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up

Flag Status: Completed

LKK REF - CC6/CTI119005393/Aea3
CTI REF —SNM15D201323C02/4 (SLA4294U)

Dear Asher
We refer to your email pertaining to the above matter,

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $14,840.00,

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 T4T8
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.comi/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: &%k Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with It is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information,
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended reciplent,
please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mall and any copies of if thereafter,

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto) [mallto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 May, 2019 6:04 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLA4294U (OI: SNM19D201323C02/4) AND SUS088U (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CT119005393/Aea3) on 23/03/2019

Your ref ;: TBA
Our ref : CC6/CTI19005393/Aea3q2

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. We are of the opinion that BOLA scenario 27 Is
applicable for this matter. Liability is not in our insured’s favour.

1



" We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.
We seek your approval to offer repairer " SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING" at $14,840.00 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with GST) 524,714.90 $12,600.00
2. Loss of Rental (16days x $180) $ 2,880.00 S 2,240.00 (16days x 5140)
Tatal $27,594.90 $14,840.00

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please,

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Hondier

LKK Auvto Consuitants Ple Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: gshenng@ikkauio.com | fox 6741-4108
Bl 51, Poya Ubl Indusiriol Park, Ubl Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Thursday, 2 May 2019 4:41 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLA4294U (01 : CAl - TBA) AND SLIS088U (TP ; LKK REF -
CCB/CT119005393/Aea3) on 23/03/2019

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896171 | M. (65) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

W: www.sg cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: £ " #ijilit Taiping SG 3 Anson Road
#16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896171 | M (65) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 2 May, 2019 4:19 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept aiping.com>

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen
<boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>;
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" Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLA4294U (Ol : CAl - TBA) AND SLIS088U (TP : LKK REF -

CC6/CT119005393/Aea3) on 23/03/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SL] 50880
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
¢ TP estimated cost of repair
¢ Preliminary advice

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action,
Thank you

Best Regards,
Mel Kwan | Admin
LEK Auto Consultanis Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 oos5 | email: MeiKwanalkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 29 March, 2019 8:48 AM
To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg cntaiping.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; C5 A Team
<gs-a(@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLA4294U (Ol : CAl - TBA) AND SUS0BBU (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/CT119005393/Aea3) on 23/03/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SLj 5088U at M/s Soon San Motor Trading - Ubi.
Enclosed here with a copy of TP's GIA report for your perusal.

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.
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Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MejKwan@kkouto com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.svmanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteceloud.com




SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING

Bik.3006,UBI ROAD 1,#01-390,SINGAPORE 408700, TEL:68414445 & FAX:67473546

To: Motor Claims Dept

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

3, Anson Rd #16-00
Springleaf Tower

S,pore 079909

Accident date:23/03/2010
Date:18/04/2019

Atten:Asher

Accident involving SL) S088U & SLA 4294U along Tampines Ave 7.

We understand that your are the insurer of SLA 5717A.

I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle SU 5088U have been completed repairs to my/our

Satisfaction by M/S SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING we therefore propose to claim from your as

Follows:-
Cost of repair

Car rental 1 day 5180 x 16

Please let us your soonest possible

Thank you

r
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Total:

$12,600.00

2,880.00

$15,480.00
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S0 UL AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX : (0651 67414108

Our Refl: CC/CTIIY005393/Aeald

03 MAY 2019

TEO TECK HUAT PAUL
BLK 366 TAMPINES ST 34
#04-177

SINGAPORE 520366

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 4294U AND SLJ 5088U ON 23/03/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Ple Lid to resolve the ¢laim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them,

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party,

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

e

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng @ lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
{Mator Claims Dept)
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AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

I, AEX (et Leec Tunk (he third party claimant™) of
Bl T34 Jenguge SF32 Wio-S20 TAee 0354 (sddress), owner of 23 Segyu
(vehicle m}ha:brmﬁmm: Scand B METeR TRBD L (“the workshop™)

mmhm%ﬂmwﬂﬂhmﬁmdmmwﬂlmdmwﬂf}fm
my vehicle no SL3 S0¥¥u that was damaged pursuant 1 the accident which occurred on
ﬂﬁ!m 26194 (date) along 'ﬂnnrﬁmﬁ e F (location)
involving vehicle no/s _SLH 424 L (“the nccident”).

Immmmmmmmmmm.mmmmm
mdﬁnwﬁ:huphfuﬂnmhﬁudmmn&wmmﬁmmm&myuﬁmwiﬁ
mwlmm&hmnf&m

Ihﬁummwmmmmmnhmmyhmﬁumlﬁmnm
pﬁuﬁuﬂﬁhﬂaﬂuﬁsﬁmdﬁu&hbﬁ:hﬂuﬂmﬁmﬁhm

vehicle/s is concemned.

Datedthis 2>  (day)of _c = (month) 20 1|(vear)
I

L/

Y/ A

'.,r'_r:: & -
oy

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”
{with chop if applicable) (with chop)
" The contents of this document 2l 16 veticla

41“151;“’5 -:!ﬂl.!f All persanal If'l]l INgs and damages
ansing therefrom are excludeo irom the ..—?'=r_~}7
and application af this documen I [
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Policy Mo
Claimant
Apoting

PaiE  #1/wvl

psher

E7414188

MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER
DMPCENI0GDSE1B00 Elaim Mo : SNM19D201323C02/4
1 RALEX =OH WEE TONG

| lvlll,ﬂ‘ﬂ-ﬂﬂ'
DOLLARS FOURTEEN THOUSAND BIGHT HUNDRED AND FORTY ONMLY.

Ifhmmmwmmmtimﬂmnt to be pald to mefus in full &
final esttlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages

Sustainoed

by mefus through an accident invelving

Claimant Vehicle No. 1 BLJ %088u
Insured Vehicle ¥o. @ SLA 42540

Dpte of Loas ¢ 23/03/201%9
Place of Accident i TAMPINES AVENWUE 7

IN CONSITERATION of the payment made to mafus of the aforemsntioned sum by
CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (5INGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/we agree absolutely to

dischasge CHINA TAIPING THSURANCE [SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Hame 1 TED TECK T P ™

briver Mame i TED TECK LENG VINCENT

fzom all clalms, present or future in respact of all loss, injury or damage

sustained

by me/os arising cut of the =aid aceident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without adnission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) General Damages 83
{2) Cost of Rapair/Gweess 5% 12, 600.00
(1) Loss of Gse/Rental/Earniey 55 2,240.00
14} GIA/Folice Reparts/
Investigation Results/Search Fess 4]
{5] Medical Reports/Expenses 3%
() Survey Fees/Towing Fes/Disbursemsnt b=
(7 Cost including Disbursomssns 53
T{ﬁ'ﬁh - ® B &5 ® F S *F B @ 8 B o8 & % 55 1"[“‘[]-“'“'
Claimant Mame : ALEX S0 WEE TONG HRIC Mo : E6H35325D
-
= b‘;’ﬁf
G —— pl I ol
Signature 72 et c.*;;lz 9
-

S\ AN

S
* The contents of this document apply 1o vehicle
damages anly. All personal injuries and damages

ariging ‘herefrom are axcluded from the ambil
e ;1}:pllrﬂlmr1 of ihis document ™




~ SOON SAN MOTOR TRADING

Blk.3006,UBI ROAD 1,#01-390,SINGAPORE 40B700,TEL:68414445 & FAX:67473546
To: Motor Claims Dept
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD
3, Anson Rd #16-00
Springleaf Tower
S,pore 079909
Accident date:23/03/2019
Date:17/04/2019

Final bill cost to repair vel: SL 5088V (Mercedes E250) claims under vel:SLA 42940,

To contract lump sum repair recommend by your surveyor and ourselves for Total: $12,600.00 nett

(Sin/Dollars: Twelve Thousand Six Hundred Only)
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LAHNEBE .

P puRTRLE
Motor Regai nEeR
BAN HONG LEE MOTOR SERVICES e insisance ciwens “nes o
» InuuFanca
BiK 5033, Ang Mo Kio Industriai Park 2 #01-279 (Off Ang Mo KI0 AVE 31 e m Ui Car DEFENCE
Soiszg e Gt TT (3 L) Tor DS et Seac  48HA9S awanns

N 2EI102000M oo
ING SERVICE: 6858 4067 (Alter 80 30pm)

EFWMEHAESE
VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

W DB

Owner: BAN HONG LEE MOTOR SERVICES (“the owner”)

Hirer Moy Bl fyen .

paoress: Ot TN Toyfies, Sty Hfe 1o 31 U
NRIC/Co. Reg. No: — S LUy D :
Tel: Fax: H/P: Yy v

Owner and Hirer have agreed 1o enter Into this Vehicle Rental Agreement for the motor vehicle described below and upon the

terms and conditions contained on both sides of this document. Hirer acknowledges having read and understood all the tarms and
conditions and signifies acceptance upan signing,

Vehicle Reg. No: ST bYHT M AgreementNo.: 1 39943
Driver's Particillars
& ol Lae? (4 - O s _
Date & Time In- '5'{%"\' "-?‘U-”f“‘_'
WC No: Dr/Licence No: U
()ﬂﬂm 68“?]& WD g Eo @8 . _;; - S
Date of Issue: QOccupation: _((x Days @% 1%~ S W
oY
= = . e _Wks @%, = ST
: ; [

' X1 ?é.‘l{ TG S s T SR e
| of each third party insurance claim ansing from the date of hire 10 date (Refundable)
MMM Hiror m:;ﬂww mm;wrw";: ojyuwg#,_r
m“mwwm for of elam on hiure rrotor / Sub-Total -
m?:lu;:m for the tirs) SM% 1o fiest party, (Le) ﬁ __Balance To Pay "E}KKL})'-’”
BAN HONG LEE MOTOR SERVICES (including lozs of eaming whiln damaged !
S foised tetvar
mbﬂm“ﬂmd S$1500 | the Authorasd Diver i below the age of 25 o
W&“ﬁﬂ“ﬂuﬂzﬁ“m o GRS R oc: PETROL/DWSEL AT YOUR OWN EXPENSE

Genersl Excoption. Insurance poficy doss nol cover agairst any diner sgo0 bolow 22 andior sbove 70 yenrs FUR LOTAL USE ONLY

ol Endior with dmang sxperence of 1 yoar and bedow

BAN HONG LEE MOTOR SERVICES ! ,5,
5T
Z Z

, Z o

Authorised Signature Hirer's Signature




