Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh®@sg.cntaiping.com=

Sent: Tuesday, 4 February 2020 2:18 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A

Cc: Ben Tang; teobuckyamia@gmail.com; chengsen@singnet.com.sg; Claims Dept of
CTl; Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201300/CHEONGML - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident
Involving GBG9650D and SHC4558X (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI19005386/)da3) on
22/03/2019

LKK REF-CC3/CTI19005386/Jda3
CTPIS REF — SNM19D201300C02/0(bt)

Dear Jia Le

We refer top your email of even date pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 55,310.48.

We await your payment advice to enable our Ben Tang to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh@sqg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: A P ¥l TaipingSG
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please
delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <Jiale@lkkauto.com=

Sent: Tuesday, February 4, 2020 5:17 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; teobuckyamia@gmail.com;

chengsen@singnet.com.sg
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201300/CHEONGML - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG9650D and

SHCA4558X (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI19005386/Jda3) on 22/03/2019

Your ref : SNM19D201300

Our ref : CC3/CTI005384/ Ida3

Dear Sirs/Madam.,



ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 9450D(Ol) & SHC 4558X(TP) ON 22/03/2019

We refer to the above matter.

The wood flew from insured vehicle and hit onto third party vehicle. Liability is not in our driver's favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be
affected.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE
LTD" ot $5,310.48(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amount Revised
Claimed
1. Cost of Repair $15,157.92 $ 4.400.00
2. Loss of Rental [7days x $100.58) $ 70404 3 403.48 (&days x $100.58)
3. Loss of Income [7days x $60) 3 42000 $ 300.00 (ddays X $50)
4. LTAJ GIA Search Fee L 7.00 $ 700

Total $16,288.98 $5310.48

**05 days recommendation for repair +1PRS = édays.

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval/instruction please.
« Wishing you a Happy and rrosperous Lunar New Yeg, »

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2019 6:20 PM
To: Admin A; Jia Le (LKK Auto)



Cc: Ben Tang; Alfred Toh; teobuckyamia@gmail.com; chengsen@singnet.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau
Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D201300/CHEONGML - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG5650D and
SHC4558X (TP ; LKK REF - CC3/CT119005386/Jha3) on 22/03/2019

LKK REF - CC3/CTI19005386/Jha3
CTPIS REF — SNM19D201300C02/0(bt)

Dear Jia Le
Please proceed to negotiate the third party property damage claim at best possible terms.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: X F-#i# Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either In whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended
reciplent, please notify the sender immediately. Flease delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:Jiale@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 10 December, 2019 10:47 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>; Albert Chua

<albert.chua@sg.cntaiping com:>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201300/CHEONGML - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG9650D and

SHCA558X (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119005386/Jha3) on 22/03/2019

Dear Alfred,
Based on the video footage, the damages is consistent.

Since insured driver admitted that wood flew from his vehicle and hit third party vehicle and there is the video
footage provided by third party, BOLA shall not apply.

Kindly let us have your instruction if we may proceed to do direct settlement with third party.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2019 2:37 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Ben Tang; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Albert Chua

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201300/CHEONGML - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG9650D and

SHCA558X (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119005386/Jha3) on 22/03/2019
3



LKK REF-CC3/CTI19005386/Jha3
CTPIS REF — SNM19D201300€02/0(bt)

Dear Jia Le
We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

Insured driver reported/”admitted” that wood flew from Insured vehicle and hit third party vehicle.

Please assist to check the consistency of damages before rejecting claim.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Email: claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh({@sg.cntaiping.com

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A% Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended anly for the named reciplents and may contaln confidential
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:Jiale@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 5 December, 2019 12:40 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong®@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201300/CHEONGML - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG3650D (Ol : CTI
- TBA) and SHC4558X (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119005386/Jha3) on 22/03/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, BOLA 27 (a) is applicable. Thus, we would like to reject the TP
claim.

Kindly let us have your approval/instructions.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 9:35 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI; Elaine Cheong

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201300/CHEONGML - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG9650D (OI : CTI

- TBA) and SHC4558X (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI19005386/Jha3) on 22/03/2019
4



Dear Elaine,

Attached Third Party’s video footage for your viewing.

Best Regards,
Carlor Chan | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept of CTl [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 5:27 AM

To: Elaine Cheong; Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D201300/CHEONGML - FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG9650D (Ol : CTI -

TBA) and SHC4558X (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI19005386/Jha3) on 22/03/2019

Dear Elaine,

Please revert,

Thank you

Lim Shu Min
Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079808
DID: (65) 63896156 | F: (B5) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: J#F#i## Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any fMes transmitted with it s infended oniy for the nemed recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
vnauthorized disciosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited, If you are nof the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copias of it thareafter.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLle@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 July, 2019 2:27 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=; Elaine
Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG9650D (01 : CTI - TBA) and SHC4558X (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT119005386/Jha3) on 22/03/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBG 9650D AND SHC 4558X ON 22/03/2019
We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that third party was hit by the falling plywood from our insured’s vehicle.



We have requested from third party for the video footage but till date we were not provided with any.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, BOLA 27 (a) is applicable. Thus, we would like to reject the TP
claim.

Kindly let us have your approval/instructions.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 67490 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 April, 2019 10:35 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat; "Chong Boon 5Sen'; Elaine Cheong; Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG9650D (01 : CTI - TBA) and SHC4558X (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT119005386/Jha3) on 22/03/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHC 4558X at M/s SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) on a WP
basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

* TP GIlAreport
s TP estimated cost of repair
o Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)
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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Taxis) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April, 2019 5:25 PM

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LOD Re: Accident on 22/3/2018 involving SHC 4558X & GBG 96500 (China Taiping's insured) Our Ref:
TAX/03/19/2111/1g

Dear All,

We guantify our claim as follows:-

Cost of Repair 54400.00
Loss of Rental 5704.06 | 7 daysx $100.58 )
Loss of Income 5420.00 | 7 dayx 560.00 )
LTA Search Fee 57.00
Total $5531.06

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repair invoice
2) Proof of rental rate
3) Police/GlA reports of our taxi
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) LTA search
&) Hirer's letter of authorisation

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regards

Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6B6E 2647)
Claims Department

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

&5 SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE
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31 UBTAVE L #0125 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 08933 1 EL : (063) 62563501 FAX ; (065) 62364313

Qur Ref: CC3/CTI19005386/1da3

12 DECEMBER 2019

CHEN SING (S) PTE LTD

5040 ANG MO K10 INDUSTRIAL PARK 2
#01-451 ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2
SINGAPORE 569543

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 9650D AND SHC 4558X ON 22/03/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHAN JIA LE

Case Handler

DID: 6749 5792

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: jiale(@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

I, SMRT_TAXIS PTE_LTD (the third party claimant™) of _BLK 60 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRI 57705 (address), owner of SHC 4558X (vehicle no.) hereby
authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with

respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no
SHC 4558X that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 22/03/2019 (date)
along SLE TOWARDS TPE (location) involving vehicle no/s GBG 9650D (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.
| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf 15 on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned,

Dated this (Q ___ {(day) of P‘?b_ (month) 20 20 (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant”™ Signed by “the workshop™

{with chop if applicable) {(with chop)



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Policy No : DMCVSHN176%571801 Claim Mo : SHMLI9D201300C02/0
Claimant @ SMBT TAXIS PTE LTD
Amount 2 555,310.48
COLLARS FIVE THCOUSAND THREE HUNDRED  TEM: AND CENTS FEORTY
EIGHT ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid te mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by mefus through an aceident involving

Claimant Vehicle Ha. : SHC 4558%

Insured Vehicle No. : GBG 9650D
Date of Loss : 22/03/2010
Place of Accldent : SLE TOWARDS TFE

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made fo me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING IWSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD. andfor

Insured Name i CHEN SING (8} PTE LTD
Criver Name 1 LIU 50NG

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/fus arisging out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made witheout admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAEPCORE) PTE. LTD.

i1} General Damages 25
{2} Cost of Repalr/Bseess S5 4,400,000
{3) Loss of dee/Rental/Earning 55 903.48
{4) GIA/Police Reports/
Investigation Results/Searcch Fees 2% 7.00
15) Medical Reports/Expenses 55
{E] Survey Fess/P.T. Fees 55
[7) Cost including Disbursement 83
ZDZEaMEELE oS ====
TOTRT s 52 s 0« &0 ssnrmieiss o i i 5 A9 5,310.448

Claimant HName

NRIC No E‘KEE! Hﬂhﬁ

6 FEB 2020

Signature H Date
* They Deschiaime Viowcher applies only o ihe clamant's claim
IF S Progery Camans: @nd wil il afecl s perss
NerES clam @0ir umnsured losses claim wn @ imer dane
Furdhier, Me seftlemant laams hedemn should nal Be gsed 22

eadance ta o

JIrT AnCice ol g
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sured losses claim aising of ihe
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SMRT Autemotive Services Fte Ltd
d stT 251 Werth Bridge Road Singapore 178102
g Tel: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247
AUTOMOTIVE

Tax Invoice

Customer Code: 3000063 ?_EGEWEG GST Reg No. @ MR-B500001-7
CRN : 1990042802

SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD J_(: Invoice No. : IV190400116
Date : 09.04.2019
Vehicle Mo. : SHC455B%

Block Unit
Your Ref Ne. : TAX/03/19/2111

Our Ref Mo. : 24100725

(5
3
n_{
Z,
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 o

SINGAPORE 757705 %o Terms : 30 Days
Description Oty Unit Add / (Discount) Emount
Cost % Amount
LUMP SUM RMOUNT FOR REPAIR 1.00 5 4,400.00
BS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDATION
GRAND TOTAL 3 4,400.00

Remark

Make/Model : TOYOTA PRIUS
Bccident Date : 22.03.2019

H.B. Payment by chegue should ba crossed and
zade payable to 'SMAT Autcmotive Services Pte Libd'.
Mo receipt will be issued unless requested. \ é—-\)
e —
Y .

Ruthorised Sighature
for SMRT Rutomotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1/1 E. & Q.E
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SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd MEMORANDUM
To: Claims Dept Our Ref:  TAX/03/19/2111
From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd Date: 29/03/2019

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 4558X & GBG 9650D ON 22/3/2019 ALONG SLE
TOWARDS TPE

This is to confirm that the daily rental rate for SHC 4558X is $100.58 per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

Thank you.

Yours-sincerely
TAXIS PTELTD

for Manager
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