Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Sam Kwok Kok Meng (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <samkwok@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 2:31 PM

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis)

Subject: RE: SHC4127

Hi Poh Suan,

As requested, the purchase value for SHC4127G was $98,148.26

Thank you.

Best regards,
Sam Kwok
DID : 68662752

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/AR & SC/Taxis)

Sent: 27 March 2019 13:44

To: Sam Kwok Kok Meng (TPHS/Ops/Fleet Ops/Ops) <samkwok@smrt.com.sg>
Subject: FW: SHC4127

Hi Sam,
Surveyor need the purchase value for SHC4127, please provide as soon as possible.

Thanks & Regards
Poh Suan

From: Hwee Jie (LKK Auto) [mailto:hweejie@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 9:48 AM

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/AR & SC/Taxis)
Subject: SHC4127

Hi poh suan,

| need to get SHC4127G purchase value from you to check the repair limit, thank you.

Best Regards,
Hwee Jie| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 9180 3151 | Email: Hweejie@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




