Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 5:42 PM

To: ‘Joyce Foo'; assignments

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SMH733Y & GBD7967U on 09/03/2019 along Jurong East

Central slip road to Jurong Town Hall Road

Dear Joyce,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Joyce Foo <joyce.foo@gbe.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 3:09 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Accident Involving SMH733Y & GBD7967U on 09/03/2019 along Jurong East Central slip road to Jurong
Town Hall Road

Our Ref. VC012404
Hi

Please assist to arrange for TP survey — Direct settlement.

Thanks & Best Regards

Joyce Foo

Senior Assistant

Claims Dept/Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 64771184 / +65 62246633

Website LinkedIn Twitter



From: Simon Koh Eng Aun <simon.koh.engaun@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 March 2019 8:55 PM

To: claims-singapore@gbe.com

Cc: Melody Teoh Man Lin <melody.teoh.manlin@simedarby.com.sg>; Chong Min Seng
<chong.min.seng@simedarby.com.sg>; Liu Chun Cheong <liu.chun.cheong@simedarby.com.sg>; Katherine Chong
<katherine.chong@simedarby.com.sg>

Subject: Accident Involving SMH733Y & GBD7967U on 09/03/2019 along Jurong East Central slip road to Jurong Town
Hall Road

Attention: Motor Claims Dept. (3rd Party Claim)

Hi,

Our client’s vehicle had involved in an accident with your insured vehicle on the above stated date and location.
Kindly refer to the attached documents for your further action.

If there is any enquiries, please do not hesitate to give me a call @ +65-6477 7413 / +65-9690 4556.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Soow Aok /{} A

Customer Service Advisor (Bodyshop)
Vantage Automotive Limited

305 Alexandra Road

#02-01 Vantage Automotive Limited
Singapore 159942

Regent Motors Limited (FORD)

AutoFrance ( PEUGEOT )

Mobile: +65-9690 4556

DID: +65-6477 7413

Email: simon.koh.engaun@simedarby.com.sg

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the Sime
Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please notify
the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all
liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious
software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily
represent those of Sime Darby's.”

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is



unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.
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