Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 July, 2019 3:16 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19/03/2019
***L KK REF:CC6/AIG19005278/Ahb3

Attachments: Release Voucher Mit Lance SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19032019.pdf

Hi Vic,

We are accept your offer .

Attached Release Voucher.
Kindly forward your PAYMENT to us, as soon as possible.

-Have a nice day w thanks.
Ms Kym

On Wed, 31 Jul 2019 at 14:20, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Ms Kym,

We refer further to your below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part, we propose a global sum of $2,200.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward back a copy to us together with the Authorization
to Act duly signed by the owner for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to KAl MOTOR TRADING.

Thank you.



"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

SR2% W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July, 2019 1:06 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19/03/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/AIG19005278/Ahb3

Hi Vic,

Awaiting for reply.

Have a nice day w thanks*



Ms Kym

On Fri, 5 Jul 2019 at 17:31, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Ms Kym,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that | will be taking over this matter.

We will get back to you for an update asap.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

i Save the Earth Print only whern necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 5 July, 2019 4:56 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Admin A; assignments; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19/03/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/A1G19005278/jb3

Hi,

We awaiting for your reply.

* Have a nice day w thanks.

Ms Kym

On Tue, 11 Jun 2019 at 14:27, Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ms. Kym

Kindly refer to our attached e-mail.

We are intending to deny liability based on the circumstances of the accident under BOLA 11 c.

Video attached for your viewing.



We are pending instruction from M/s AlG.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or
privileged information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify
the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the
material in this email is strictly forbidden.

From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 2:00 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19/03/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/A1G19005278/jb3

Dear all,

Awaiting for reply.

* Have a nice day w thanks .



Ms Kym

On Thu, 6 Jun 2019 at 16:15, Kai Motor <kaimotor @ gmail.com> wrote:

Dear all,

The above refer.
Kindly forward your offer to us, as soon as possible.

*Have a nice day w thanks.

Ms Kym

On Fri, 31 May 2019 at 15:47, Kai Motor <kaimotor @ gmail.com> wrote:

Attn: The Motor Claims Department Tax Invoice
Your Insured veh no : SMH 112 P

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. WITHOUT PREJUDICE

78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building (By Email Only)

Singapore 079120

Date : 31/05/2019 Claim no. MT/1037486-002

Officer in charge- Helena Tan

Dear Sir :-

Final Cost repair Bill To Mit Lance SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19/03/2019

To Supply :-



Total Lumpsum As Of Repair Costs Recommended By Surveyor And

Agreed By Ourselves : $2,150.00
GST 7% $ 150.50
$2,300.50

Date : 31/05/2019

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your Insured veh no : SMH 112 P

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Email Only)

78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building
Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO Mit Lance SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19/03/2019@13:50:00

We have been authorised by Mr Woo Chee Kheong, the owner of vehicle claim against the party

/ parties responsible for the damages arising from number SGT 9751 T, to the above

mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle numbe ( SMH 112 P) at the material time
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of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, ( Mr Woo Chee Kheong ).

As a result of the accident caused by your insured driver’s negligent driving and/or management
of your insured’s vehicle number ( SMH 112 P ), our client’s vehicle was damaged and we have

been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair $2,300.50
(2) Loss of use X 4days S 320.00
(3) PIR 2days $ 160.00
(4) LTA Search Fee S 745

$2,787.95

A cope of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
(a) Final repair bill

(b) GIA report with sketch plan of (our client’s veh number)
(c) LTA Search

On Thu, 11 Apr 2019 at 10:16, Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ms. Kym,

As spoken, below is our insured’s report.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ikkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.lt may contain confidential and/or
privileged information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify
the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the
material in this email is strictly forbidden.

From: Kai Motor [mailto:kaimotor@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 4:20 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assighnments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19/03/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC6/A1G19005278/jb3

Dear Ms Kym,

Thank you for your email.
Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s GIA report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Joy at 6841 24009.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

Hi all,

How hor........

On Mon, 25 Mar 2019 at 15:08, Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ms Kym,



Thank you for your email.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s GIA report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Joy at 6841 2409.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,
Shu Peil Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 23 March 2019 8:10 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19/03/2019
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From: Kai Motor <kaimotor @ gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 1:00 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-

d @lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19/03/2019

KAI MOTOR TRADING

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-440, SINGAPORE 408701
TEL: 67474006 FAX:67437591
E-mail : kaimotor @ gmail.com
REG NO: 44223100L

Date : 22/03/2019

Attn: The Motor Claims Department WITHC
Your Insured veh no : SMH 112 P

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. (By Em
78 Shenton Way

# 07-16 Chartis Building

Singapore 079120

Dear Sir / Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SGT 9751 T & SMH 112 P on 19/03/2019

We are writing on behalf of Mr Woo Chee Kheong the registered owner of SGT 9751 T
which was involved on the above mentioned accident between SMH 112 P.

Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number SMH 112 P was insured with you at the
material time of the said accident.

As aresult of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your insured
vehicle number SMH 112 P. Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair costs and other
consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our client’s vehicle at KAI MOTOR TRADING Blk 3007,
Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as to avoid further
losses incur.

We enclosed hereby the GIA report of SGT 9751 T for your kind attention.

Failing which, our client have no alternative but to proceed with the necessary repairs and the bill
will be forward to you for reimbursement.

Yours faithfully,
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Have a nice day w thanks.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day w thanks.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day w thanks.

12



Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day w thanks.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day w thanks.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

13



Have a nice day w thanks.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day w thanks.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day w thanks.

Ms Kym
Kai Motor Trading
Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440

Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006
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