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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com>
Sent: Thursday, 21 February 2019 8:54 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: Your Ref. 800664441B (Accident Involving YK4334G & SJZ3352J on 18.06.2013)
Attachments: YK4334G Repair Bill - doa 18jun13.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Auto & Carriage forwarded repair bill as attached. 
 
Please assist to conduct paper adjustment soonest possible. 
 
Thank you 
 
Kind regards 
Norsiah 
 
Norsiah Md Noor 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419-1606  
Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 
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IMPORTANT NOTICE: 

  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the 
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any 
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any 
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is 
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 

 
 
 
 
From: Auto & Carriage Engineering [mailto:autocarriagerental@gmail.com]  
Sent: Friday, February 15, 2019 4:47 PM 
To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com> 
Subject: Re: Your Ref. 800664441B (Accident Involving YK4334G & SJZ3352J on 18.06.2013) 
 
Dear Norsiah, 
 
After your surveyor came down and finished with the assessment, we were informed by him to proceed with the 
repair works and to submit the bill after and that he will submit his assessment directly to your side. And hence, 
repair works was carried out right after the assessment to avoid incurring extra days of lost of use. 
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Our repair bill should have been given to you by our previous solicitor, but you may find attached a copy of it as well.
 
If you wish to have an amicable settlement, please let us have your offer asap. If you do not wish to offer, please 
forward us a copy of your surveyor's report as we do not have the damage photos. 
 
We look forward to hearing from you within 10days, failing which, we will proceed to hand over this case to another 
solicitor of ours. 
 
Thank you very much. 
 
Regards, 
Ms Lim 
 
On Tue, Feb 12, 2019 at 2:35 PM Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com> wrote: 

Dear Ms Lim, 

  

We refer to the above. 

  

Our surveyor advised that repair cost was not finalized for this case. 

  

Kindly advise any estimate given to our surveyor? 

  

Thank you 

Norsiah 

  

From: Auto & Carriage Engineering [mailto:autocarriagerental@gmail.com]  
Sent: Friday, December 14, 2018 2:49 PM 
To: Md Noor, Norsiah <Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com> 
Subject: Your Ref. 800664441B (Accident Involving YK4334G & SJZ3352J on 18.06.2013) 

  

WITHOUR PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

We refer to your previous email correspondences with our lawyer, Yu & Co LLC. 
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We are the owner of YK4333G and please be informed that we will take over the case and handle on our end. 

  

On 10 July 2013, your appointed surveyor Mr. Rosli of LKK Adjustor came over to survey our damaged vehicle 

YK4334G at Blk 106 Ah Hood Road. We were then informed by Mr. Rosli himself that his report will be submitted 

to your insurance on his end and he told us to repair our vehicle and submit our repair bill to you. 

  

We wish to have your offer soonest as the driver of SJZ3352J has admitted that the above mentioned accident was 

caused by his/her negligence. 

  

Thank you very much. 

  

Regards, 

Ms Lim 
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