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Hsiao TonE (LKKAuto)

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 12:13 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: ‘Kelly Ding'; 'kelly"; 'ADM‘IN@DINGAUTDMOTNE.CGM_SG'; 'Dd hashim'; Admin A
Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAB784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING

OFFER/REF:--LKK REF: CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Thank you for your offer.

However we do not accept it, we will like to request global sum $4,250.00 to close this case.
This is the lowest amount that we can close this case.

Kindly reconsider and revert us a new offer soonest.

We appreciate for your action and look forward from you soon,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Motor Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte L1d
DID: B1203490

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 6 July 2019 11:44 AM

To: claims@dingautomntiue.mm.sg

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly'; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim’; Admin A

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAB784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We have our principal instruction to improve our offer at a global sum of $4.200.00{allin).

Flease confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.




in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: che @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg <claims@dingautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 1:58 PM

To: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'kelly' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>;
'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG' <ADMIN@dingautomotive.com.sg>; 'Dd hashim' <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>;
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHA8784T/TP 5LB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Good day to you.

We will like to close this case under amount $4,250.00.

Kindly revert to us soonest as our client was chasing for the status.

We appreciate for your action and look forward from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Motor Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: 81203450

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg [mailto:claims@dingautomotive.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 3:43 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding’; "kelly"; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'; 'Admin A

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAS784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,



Good day to you.

Is that any latest status for this case ?
Kindly revert us a new offer as soon as possible.

We look forward from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Mator Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: 81203490

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg [mailto:claims@din

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 10:22 AM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAUuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding’; "kelly’; "ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'; "Admin A'

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAS8784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:;
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We will like to request global sum amount $4,250.00 to close this case.
Kindly revise and revert to us as soon as possible so that we can close this soonest.

We appreciate for your action and look forward from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Motor Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: 81203490

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg [mailto:claims@dingautomotive.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 4:45 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly'; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'; 'Admin A’

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAB784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/AS5M19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,



Thank you for your offer.

We wish to get a global sum amount 4,250.00 to close this case.
Kindly reconsider and revert to us once your side have done.

We appreciate for your action and look forward from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Metor Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: 81203490

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 2:58 PM

To: claims@dingautomotive.com.sq

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly'; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'; Admin A

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHA8784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We have our principal instruction to improve our offer at a global sum of $4,100.00(all-in).

Flegse confirm acceptance,

“please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s} in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related

claims."

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
BElk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg <claims@dingautomotive.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 1:22 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'kelly' <kenneth.dinge@dingauto.sg>;
'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG' <ADMIN@dingautomotive.com.sg>; 'Dd hashim' <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>;
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: 501114599 BILLING FOR SHABRTBAT/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epal




Dear Hsiao Tong,

Ifiindly ignore the previous email.

We will like to request global sum $4,250.00 to close this case.
Kindly reconsider our request and revert us a new offer.

We appreciate for your action and look forward from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Motoer Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: 81203490

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sq [mailto:claims@dingautomative,com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 1:16 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly’; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'; 'Admin A’

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHA8784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Thank you for your offer.

We will like to request global sum $4,256.00 to close this case.
Kindly reconsider our request and revert us a new offer.

We appreciate for your action and look forward from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Motor Claims Department
Ding Automative Pte Ltd
DID: 81203490

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 6:13 PM

To: claims@din ;
Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly’; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'; Admin A
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Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHA8784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

We have our principal instruction to improve our offer at a global sum of $4,000.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Repards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June 2019 2:11 PM

To: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg

Ce: "Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'kelly' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>;
ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG' <ADMIN@dingautomotive.com.sg>; 'Dd hashim' <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>;
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHA8784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM15005239/Epa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We are seeking further instruction from our principal and get back to you asap.

Kindly bear with us for time being.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred

from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408033)

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg <claims@dingautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June 2019 1:24 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'kelly' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>;
'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG' <ADMIN@dingautomotive.com.sg>; 'Dd hashim' <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>;
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAB784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:-LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Good day to you.

We will like to request global sum amount $4,256.00 to close this case.

Kindly re-consider and revert back to us so that we can close this case soonest.

We appreciate for your action and look forward from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Meotor Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: 81203450

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg [mailto:claims@dingautomotive.com.sq]

Sent: Saturday, 1 June 2019 1:28 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly'; '"ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'; 'Admin A’

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAB784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Good day to you.



Is that any latest status for this case ?

We will like to close this case soonest.

We appreciate for your action and look forward from you soon..

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Meotor Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: 81203490

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg [mailto:claims@dingautomotive.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, 22 May 2019 3:17 FM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly'; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'; 'Admin A'

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHA8784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Good day to you and hope this email serve you well.
We will like to request global sum $4,256.00 to close this case.

We appreciate and look forward from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Motor Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: 81203490

From: claims@dingautomotive,com,sg [mailto:claims@dingautomotive.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 11:58 AM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly'; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'; 'Admin A’

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAB784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Thank you for your reply.



We do not accept this offer.
Our driver vehicle damage is from left hand side center part until rear fender.

Your insured vehicle damage part is at front fender right hand side.

Based on bola (6) , Onus is on the vehicle turning right to exercise caution while turning across
junction.

Kindly revert and revise us a new offer.

We appreciate and look forward from you soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Mator Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: B1203490

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto;chewht@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 17 May 2019 10:00 AM
To: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly'; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim’; Admin A
Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAB784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

The damages to your client vehicle seem to be at the front fender, not at the rear fender or direct rear. We
are of view that BOLA Sé(a) is applicable.

Therefore, we have cur principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $2,200.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and//or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg <claims@dingautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 16 May 2015 2:34 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'kelly' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>;
'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG' <ADMIN@dingautomotive.com.sg>; 'Dd hashim' <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>
Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAB784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM15005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Good day to you and hope this email serve you well.

Is that any new status for this case ?

We are unable submit claim due to still pending at your side.
Kindly get back to us as soon as possible.

We appreciate and look forward from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Motor Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Lid
DID: 81203490

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg [mailto:claims@dingautomotive.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 3:37 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly'; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAB784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Kindly refer the attachment. It is regarding the scene photo when accident happened.
Please get back us an offer as soon as possible after review these scene photo and video footage.

We look forward from you soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Motor Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
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DID: 81203490

From: claims@dingautomotive.com,sg [mailto:claims@dingautomotive.com.sg

Sent: Friday, 3 May 2019 11:16 AM

To: "Hsiac Tong (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly’; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim’

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHA8784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
As per your request, kindly refer the video footage that provided by our driver in this accident.

We will like to get back new status after you have review the video.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Motor Claims Department
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: 81203450

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkau
Sent: Wednesday, 1 May 2019 9:24 AM

To: claims@dingautomotive.com.sq
Ce: 'Kelly Ding'; kelly’; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.SG'; 'Dd hashim'

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHA8784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--LKK REF:
CC4/ASM19005239/Epa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We would like to request a copy of video footage as stated in your client accident report for our necessary
action.

Attached here with a copy of our insured driver accident report for your easy reference.

Thank you.
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Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg <claims dingautomotive.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 April 2019 5:48 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'kelly' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>;
'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM.5G' <ADMIN@dingautomotive.com.sg>; 'Dd hashim' <dd.has

Subject: RE: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHA8784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:-
Dear Hsiao Tong,

Good day to you.

Kindly let us know the offer once you review our documents.

We would prepared to submit claim once get back the offer from your side.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hailey

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
DID: 64521208

From: claims@dingautomotive.com.sg [mailto:claims@dingautomotive.com.sa]

Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 4:16 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto}

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'kelly"; 'ADMIN@DINGAUTOMOTIVE.COM,SG'; 'Dd hashim'

Subject: 50111499 BILLING FOR SHAB784T/TP SLB5377C/21/03/2019-PENDING OFFER/REF:--

Dear Claims Officer,

Please refer to the attachment supporting document to claims against
your insured.

We have completed the repair vehicle collected and has done finalized.
We would like to claim for our insured as per following:

Recommended Repair Days:04

Sat,Sun Public Holiday/etc:02

Total Claims Days:06
12

him @dingauto.sg>



Repair Cost:$3,477.50
Loss Of Rental:$631.80
Loss Of Income:$480.00
LTA Search Fee:$2.00
Towing Fee:-
Sur've;;,mr e—: :
Total:$4,591.30

Kindly revert us with an of fer to close this case as soon as possible.
Please do not hesitate to contact us for further assistance.

~EVERYDAY IS A JOY DAY~
SINCERELY

HAILEY

MOTOR CLAIMS EXECUTIVE
TEL:64521208
FAX:+6564520614

Virus-free. www avast.com
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DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE L'TD
OUR REF: 50111499/ TP/SHARTBAT/ADVZ1/03/ 2019/ HAILEY
YOUR REF: SLBS377C/-—---
11 APRIL 2019

MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT
AXA INSURANCE

8 SHENTON WAY, #24-01

AXA TOWER, 068811 SINGAFPORE

ACCIDENT INVOLVING: SHAS784T AGAINST SLB5377C ON 21/03//2019
LOCATION ALONG: CLEMENTI AVE 2

We refer to the above matter:

Repair/ | AMOUNT

]

:::E PE" | Clalm | BEFORE f:: gnuwr TR
days GST

Cost of Repair 5 - 6 $ 325000 | § 227.50 $ 3,477.50
Loss Of Rental | $ 10530 |6 $ 63180 | § - | $ 63180
| LossOfIncome 5 8000 |6 S 48000 | § - S 480.00
| LTA/GIA Search |
 Fee L8 . 0 $ 1.87 | § 013 | § 2,00
Towing Fee | S - D 5 - $
Surveyor Fee 5 - 0 | s - | 8 - 5 -
Total $18530 |6 | § 436367 | § 22763 | $5 4,591.30

The accident was caused solely by the negligence of your insured and as a results,We had incurred (he

following costs of repair and losses of our insurer:

Enclosed are copies of the following documents for your perusal:

@ | Repair Estimate © | Discharge Youcher

[#] GITA/Accident Police Report @ | Certificate Of Insurance

[+] LTA 3" Partv Search Fee & | Final Bill'Repair Tax Invoice

@ Milleage Record & | Confirmation Finalize/Liabilily Email Copy |
] Rental Rates Agreement @ | Letter Of Demand |.
[] Letter Of Authority 1 © ' |

Our insurer has authorized DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD to deal with the claim in this accident case and

also to receive and deal/negotiate with all payment as stated above,

Please look into our client’s claim and reveri soonest as possible,

Your Sincerely,
HAILEY

DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTI

OFFICE:64521208
FAX:64520614



DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Businesa Reg. No : 201619222G

BLK 10, #01-20 SIN MING IND EST. SEC C, SINGAPORE 575645

Tel: 6452 1208 Fax 64520614

b
L

TAX INVOICE

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD INVOICE 1-000703
8 SHENTON WAY #27-01, AXA TOWER DATE : 15/07/2019
SINGAPORE 068811 GST REG NO : 201619222G

TERMS : C.0.D.

PO NO SLB5377C
ATTN : OUR REF SHAB784T
TEL FAX : PAGE 10f1
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY | UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

1, Cost Of Repair - SHAB784T 1 3971986 3,971.96
;Ebﬂﬂls : SUB TOTAL 3,971.96
No: 50111499
Your Ref: SLBS377C (CC4/ASM15005239/Epa3) .. =
OIC: MS HSIAD TONG TOTAL SGD 4,250.00
DOA: 21/03/2019 DEPOSIT
0/S BALANCE
PAID BY GLOBAL SUM
FOR DING AUTOMOTIVEBTELTD
S

T harve inspectid and henety confimes that
the job done and the amount due herein
are entire to my satisfaction




DING AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD 'Ir’
BLK 10, #01-20 SIN MING IND EST. SEC C, SINGAPORE 575645 j
Tel: 6452 1208 Fax: 6452 0614
M/S: AXA INSURANCE
ACCIDENT DATE:21/03/2019 OURREF: SHAB784T
REF;-—-- DATE: 11/4/2019
0IC:CLAIMS OFFICER
ITEM NO. DESCRIFTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1 Repair Cost b 325000 | § 3,250.00
2 LTA/Merimen Search Fee $ 187 | § 1.87
3 Loss of Rental (w/o G5T)
[105.30X06] 5 631.80 | % 631.80
55 4 Lass of Income (w/o GST)
45 [80X06] $ 480,00 | $ 480.00
5 Towing Fee $ - -3 -
b Surveyor Fee % b -
REMARKS : SUBTOTAL: $ 4363.67
M 7% GST 3 227.63
GRAND TOTAL: | $ 4,591.30
Yours faithfully,

Authorise Signature of Ding Automotive Pte Lte



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ATTN: LYNN KHONG

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

8 SHENTON WAY #24-01
AXATOWERSINGAPORE 068811

Ref : CC4/ASM18005239/Epads2

Date; 31-07-2019

Code : ASM

1

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SLB 5377C Veh. Inspected SHA B784T
Policy No. VPA/P2006822 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SGMD1HS4 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From LYMNN KHONG Assign Date 22/03/2019
o Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140 c.C 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. KMHLB41UMHUDS8304 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 275212 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60R16 TRIANGLE 5mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60R16 TRIANGLE 5mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60R16 TRIANGLE 5mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60R16 TRIANGLE 5mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE NI/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  21/03/2018 Inspection Date 22/03/2019
Survey held at 31 CORPORATION ROAD
Repairer DING AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
ba. Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sh. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No- 199607188R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHA 8784T

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

Page No.:1of2

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition  [\/> Chop {;}] [sj}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT FENDER LHS (CONSISTENT) DENTED 523,86 523 86
1|ERONT FENDER INNER SHIELD LHS (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 175.00 :
1|FRONT FENDER STAND GARNISH LHS (CONSISTENT)  [NOT NECESSARY 4822 -
1|FRONT WHEEL CAP LHS (BROKEN) (CONSISTENT) NOT CONSISTENT 265.22
WITH THE IMPACT
1|REPAIR A PILLAR RHS (NPA) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY ! I
1|FRONT DOOR LHS (CONSISTENT) DENTED 2,256.00 2,256.00
1|FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 253.88 I
1|FRONT DOOR LOCK ASSY LHS (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 290.80 !
1|FRONT DOOR HINGE TOP LHS (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 39,00 :
1|FRONT DOOR HINGE BOTTOM LHS (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 36.10 :
1|FRONT DOOR CHECKER ASSY LHS (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 39.20 -
1|FRONT DOOR WINDOW REGULATOR LHS (CONSISTENT)|NOT NECESSARY 250.10 ]
1|REPAIR SIDE MIRROR LHS (NPA) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY :
1|REPAIR REAR DOOR LHS (NPA) (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE : 5
LABOUR
1|REPAIR REAR FENDER LHS (NPA) (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE x .
LABOUR
1|REPAIR B PILLAR LHS (NPA) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY - 2
LESS 20% DISCOUNT 835,47 -565.97
3,341.91 2,223.89
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT FENDER QTR GARNISH LHS (SN) (CONSISTENT) |NOT NECESSARY 25.00 .
1|FRONT FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIP SET LHS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 35.00 "
(CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER - COMFORTDELGRO LHS (SN)  |[NECESSARY 160.00 80.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|SET FRONT DOOR TRIM BOARD CLIP LHS (SN} NOT NECESSARY 35.00 2
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR DOOR STICKER - BOOK NOW & APPS STORE RHS |NECESSARY 160.00 80.00
(SN) (CONSISTENT)
1|SET SIDE SKIRT CLIP (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 35.00 :
450.00 160.00

Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19005239/Epads2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made solaly for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

memw_umwwmmwww
Repert. in whole or n gart, does 8¢ alhis or her own risk,

L 1 ;; ; 51 LUbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R Page Mo.2 of 2
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
riptio on
Qty Description of Parts Conditi Workshop ($)) ()
LABOUR
STRAIGHTEN AND PANEL BEAT ACCIDENT AREAS. 1,200.00 600.00
INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REPAIR REAR DOOR LHS
AND REPAIR REAR FENDER LHS.
REMOVE & RE-FIX DOOR COMPARTMENT TO REPLACE 160.00 50.00
NEW DOOR.
RUST PROOFING. 80.00 30.00
DIAGNOSTIC VEHICLE & CLEAR FAULT CODE & POWER 230.00 30,00
WINDOW SYSTEM.
RESPRAY FRONT FENDER & SIDE MIRROR LHS. NOT NECESSARY 400.00 .
RESPRAY FRONT DOOR & REAR DOOR LHS 450.00 400.00
RESPRAY SIDE SKIRT & REAR FENDER & REAR £50.00 600.00
BUMPER.
REMOVE & REFIT FRONT WHEEL CAP & TYRE & NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
BALANCING.
3,250.00 1,710.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,041.91 4,093.89
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,250.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM19005235/Epa3s2
é‘— .f'?
CHEN TSUE YEE HO LEONG CHUAN




