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Pte Ltd Company Registration No, 199607 198R

51 UBLAVE 1, #02.25 PAYA UBIL INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065} 62564315

Your ref: D19001950MFESH
Our ref’ CS/FCI19005225/Uvd3 DATE: 5/4/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.PZ 3388K

We thank for your instruction on 2/4/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

vehicle on 2/4/2019  at the premises of M/s IMPERIUM AUTOMOTIVE

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5518,396.80

Revised Estimate Amount : 5%6,000.00 (LUMP SUM)

"Check" Items Amount 5%

Market Value 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear “%‘

rear portion. ! ' }{ front
e

offside

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA

Licensed Appraiser



Ms @ FirstCapital

§ Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65} 6222 2311 Faw: (B5) 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited ceieg ho. 1530001060 GSTReg N, MEQOGLETES

Clatmn & Hator Underssitie Dt 36 Robinson Road #16-01 ity House Singagore 05Ea77

Tel (55 6507 3648 Fax: [65) 6507 3848
www, msfirstcapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
20-03-2019 Our Ref No.
19-03-2019 Claim Type.
SHC7231T Third Party Vehicle.

25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 #01-49 SYNERGY@KB
SHAWN TAN

97489940/ 97489940 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD

NA Fax No.

MA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D19001950MFSH

Third Party

PZ3388K

63467213

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

IMPERIUM AUTOMOTIVE Attention.
JUSEQUITY LAW
CORPORATION TP Solicitor Fax No.
SITHARA

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

MA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspaction,

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

emoor of [EREENE iNSURANLE GROUF




Veron Chen {LKKAutnz

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 April 2019 10:39 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: 'Sithara’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001950MFSH/2, PZ 3388K
Attachments: PZ 3388K (PRELI REVISED).pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle PZ 3388K
Date of survey: 2/4/2019
Number of days : 4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 12:46 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001950MFSH/2, PZ 3388K

Dear SirMadam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle PZ 3388K on 2/4/2019

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 25 March 2019 8:00 AM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

1



Cc: 'Sithara' <sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001950MFSH/2

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 12:50 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001950MFSH/2

Dear Sir/Mdm,

wWe refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software
: WWW. AVE.com



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 12:46 PM

To: 'CWS Maotor Claims'

Ce: ‘Sithara'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001950MFSH/2, PZ 3388K
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle PZ 3388K on 2/4/2019

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 March 2019 8:00 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Sithara' <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001950MFSH/2

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: CW5 Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com 5E]

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 12:50 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTSE LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Sithara <Sithara@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001950MFSH/2

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. A\fﬁ This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: WWW.avg.com
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> Back to OnaMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owiner 1D Type:

Owner [D:

Vehicle Details

Wehicle Mo

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

Weehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
mManufacturing Year:

Engire No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Perind(Years):

PQF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Apr 2019

PARFICOIF Rehate Fannine

Business
6016E

PZ338BK

Mo

03 Apr 2019

TOYOTA

COASTER 19 5EATER
White

2008

WO4CTQ12570
JTGFC538503000335

$48,174.00
24 5ep 2008
24 5ep 2008
2

£3,40%.00

Mo

$0.00

23 Sep 2028

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$30,696.00

£29,075.00
429,075.00

OK

nUpS:/Vr e, gov.SQitaNVTYacton/enguireKepatedyFublicoeroreUeregIinput F UNG HUN_IU= FUSUAUUE T
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IMPERIUM AUTOMOTIVE ey 4
o ’ AdAA
25 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-49 Synergy@KB, Singapore 417800 | A
HP : 9748 9940 Shawn Tan  Fax:6346 7213 /8 /
Email: shawn7530@hotmail.com : &< B b0Q0
21 March 2019
Vehicle No.: PZ 3388 K Model: Toyota Coaster Bus
Qry DESCRIPTION AMT 55
Nett Items s ;
1 Rear panel -R/H 760 D3 Lodf> $  _4,850.00—
1 Rear panel glass moulding ALt S 180.00 ~
1 Rear door -L/H s 5 3,390.00
1 Rear door glass moulding g B 165.00 X
1 Rear door lock {15 255.00 Y
1 Rear door hinge -lower 11 § 125.00 %,
1 Rear door rubber | Tras 245.00
2 Rear taillamps v -dv o OlScru 5 1,161.00 (0 ¢
1 Rear end panel -lower ENEE s 851.40 »/
1 Rear bumper assy /€2 20 i}ug/ S 1,909.40-
1 Rear number plate lamp ¢4 S 85.00 %<
‘b S 13,216.80
(72
Special Nett ltems <6/oLL
1 Rear "80/90KM/J" sticker 1ec 5 40.00 Lo
| Rear "HOTLINE SPAD" sticker U S 40.00 40U
1 Rear panel glass sealant a1 5 120.00
1 Rear door glass sealant -L/H . Lo § 120.00 L
2 Rear bumper brackets oy Yl Aef s 370.00 (9
1 Rear number with holder ' 145 EU.GD:{
1 kf Rear reverse camera v f 5 480.00 ‘7{
- 18 1,220.00
S/N. Labour Charges =
1 To remove, replaced damaged lamps and check up rear wiring. S 80.00 >
2 To remove and refit inner garnishes. S 4~ 180.00 X
3 To remove and refit rear reverse sensor. S 150.00 &7
4 To remove and refit rear windscreen glass. S 250.00 /0~
5 To apply tuff kote. $ 200.00 ;‘1:
6 Panel beating. S 1,600.00 £ 7))
7 To respray painting on the affected areas. 5 1,500.00 (4~
] 3,960.00
150k
Grand Total : % 18,396.80

PAGE 1 OF 1
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 109607198R GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19005225/vd3n2

#15.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Lo ol e NIWH"NI"H“"H
Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 72317 Veh. Inspected PZ 3388K
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D19001950MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SITHARA Assign Date 22103/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA COASTER (M) c.c 4009
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. JTGFC538503000335 Colour WHITE / YELLOW
Odometer 458254 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |20575R17.5 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/75R17.5 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/75R17.5(D) MICHELIN /8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/75R17.5(D) MICHELIN &/8 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/03/2019 Inspection Date 02/04/2019
Survey held at IMPERIUM AUTOMOTIVE
25 KAK!I BUKIT ROAD 4
#01-48 SYNERGY @ KB
SINGAPORE 417800
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. PZ 3388K

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607T198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607193-R

Page No.1of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition [ = "k‘hul'-‘?:}} “{
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR PANEL-R/H BADLY DENTED 4 880.00 4 650.00
1|REAR PANEL GLASS MOULDING NECESSARY 180.00 180.00
1|REAR DOOR-L/H TO REPAIR SEE 3.3090.00 -
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR GLASS MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 165.00 -
1|REAR DOOR LOCK NOT NECESSARY 255.00 -
1|REAR DOOR HINGE-LOWER NOT NECESSARY 125.00 -
1|REAR DOOR RUBBER TORN 24500 245 00
Z2|REAR TAILLAMPS OIS CRACKED 1,161.00 RAD.50
1|REAR END PANEL-LOWER TO REPAIR SEE 851.40 -
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER ASSY BENT 1,809.40 1,825.20
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE LAMP NOT NECESSARY B5.00 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -1,870.18
13,216.80 5.610.52
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR "80/90KM/J" STICKER (SN) WECESSARY 40.00 20.00
1|REAR "HOTLINE SPAD" STICKER (SN) MECESSARY 40.00 20.00
1|REAR PAMNEL GLASS SEALANT (SN} MNOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
1|REAR DOOR GLASS SEALANT-L/H (SN) MOT NECESSARY 120.00 =
2|REAR BUMPER BRACKETS (SN) /S BENT 370.00 150.00
1|REAR NUMBER WITH HOLDER (SN} NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|SET REAR REVERSE SEMSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 480.00 -
1,220.00 190.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE,REPLACED DAMAGED LAMPS AND CHECK B0.00 30.00
UP REAR WIRING
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INNER GARNISHES. NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
TO REMOVE AMD REFIT REAR REVERSE SENSOR. 150.00 50.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEMN GLASS. 250.00 100.00
TO APPLY TUFF KOTE. 200.00 50.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19005225/Uvd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 62564315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Page Mo.2 of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
i P Workshop 5)|___ (5)

PANEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,600.00 £00.00

DOOR-L/H AND REAR END PANEL-LOWER.
TO RESPRAY PAINTING OM THE AFFECTED AREAS. 1,500.00 BB0.00
3,960.00 1,710.00
GRAND TOTAL 18,396.80 7.510.52
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 6,000.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19005225/Uvd3n2

MARKET VALUE: $72,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $29,075.00=NETT VALUE: $42,925.00

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THERD PARTIES:- This Repart Is made solely for the use and benelit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.
Eepeort., in witohs G in @art, does S0 at his or her own risk.

pn b Report wholly o

f par. Any third party acting or repdving o4




