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‘MS@FirstCapital

6 Rafiles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

MS First Capital Insurance Limited Co.Reg No. 155000106C GST Reg No. M2/0001676-9

Clalms & Motor Undenwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3849
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
20-03-2019 Our Ref No.
18-03-2019 Claim Type.
SHA3488G Third Party Vehicle.
247 ALEXANDRA ROAD
CHARMAINE KONG
63057176/ 63057299 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
NA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D19001937MFSH

Third Party

SCR918Y

64743643

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE

Attention.
SINGAPORE Hantion
NA TP Solicitor Fax No.
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

A Member of [EEEEENE msurance GrouP




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 8:41 AM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims'

Ce 'Eileen Lee'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001937MFSH/1, SCR 918Y
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that TP had withdraw claim.

We will submit our survey report and bill accordingly.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 12:35 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001937MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrage.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 12:34 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM!
<ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM>

Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001937MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 22 March 2019 11:53 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001937MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) <charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 5:56 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); assignments; Admin A

Subject: RE: SCR918Y REPAIR LIMIT

Hi Taufikh,

Noted with thanks. FYI, Liability not clear & customer had withdraw claim.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158934

Direct line: +65 6305 7176
Main Line: +65 6305 7299
Main Fax:  +65 6474 3643
charmaine.kong@vw.com.sq
hitp://www.vw.com.sq

BLAZING TO
NUMBER HIN JUST
R ONE YEAR.

Vv i ‘-‘r_:'. ﬁ_ . ..
x (OO TN

0! " ]

Discover Singapore's most awarded car brand of 2018,

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) [mailto: Taufikh@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 27 March, 2019 5:23 PM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Subject: SCR918Y REPAIR LIMIT

Hi Charmaine,
Please take note repair limit for this car is $4000.

Regards



Taufikh
Lkk Auto

Get Outlook for Android




3/27/2019 PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |ID Type: Singapore NRIC

Owner ID: 3028l

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SCR918Y

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 27 Mar 2019

Vehicle Make: VOLKSWAGEN

Vehicle Model: GOLFA7 1.4 TSI AT 5G13GZ SRHID
Primary Colour: Black

Manufacturing Year: 2014

Engine No.: CXS209939

Chassis No.: WVWZZZAUZFWO005317
Maximum Power Output: 90.0 kW (120 bhp)

Open Market Value: $22,711.00

Original Registration Date: 17 Oct 2014

First Registration Date: 17 Oct 2014

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $8,796.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 16 Oct 2024

PARF Rebate Amount: $6,597.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 16 Oct 2024

COE Category: A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $63,880.00

COE Rebate Amount: $35,461.00

Total Rebate Amount: $42,058.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Mar 2019

OK

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vri/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDereginput?FUNCTION_ID=F0304009T1 11



MVYGS19035695 / Volkswagen Centre Singapore - HQ
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 18/03/2019 13:25
SUBMITTED BY: Edmund Goh Hul Huang

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/lor the Authorised Driver

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies o

repudiate policy liability

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies 1s not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This repart will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties
7. By the lodgement of this report 1o the insurers, you hareby consent o the archiving of this report al the centre and lo copies of the report being made available

aforesaid

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

18/03/2019 13:25
18/03/2019 10:00

Exact Location Of Accident SIMS AVE
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
Vehicle Registration Number SCR918Y
Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner NG YONG HUA
NRIC No S0073028I
Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

(LOCAL) +65-91904220
OFFICE-91904220

VOLKSWAGEN
GOLF A7 1.4 TSI (DSG)RECAT EQP

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

A 28623745 AVW

NG YONG HUA

S0073028I

22/07/1950

INDOOR

06/04/1972

46 YEARS AND 11 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-91904220

OFFICE-91904220
NOEMAIL

Page 10f 10



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be co

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to re| liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies.

5. Any false reporting may be refer P r

6. The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for a fee be made avallable upon application by
interested parties.

7. By the lodgment of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to coples of
the report being made available aforesaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

(a) My Insurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ("GIA”) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my Insurer (collectively the "Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident (all insurer(s) who have Insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the "Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purposa(s)
of :

(i) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settiement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the claims;

(ii) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
(iii) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

(iv) administering my claims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, Invoices, reparts or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/ar

(v) complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.{collectively the
“Purposes”)

(b) allinsurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
to collect, use, disclose and/or process my Persanal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

(e} my Personal information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents(including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the above Purposes,

(d) my Personal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detectian,
investigation and management in prasent and all future claims.

(e) theinformation so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(1) toall insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

(i) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

o @f&/ﬂ Z—

Policyholder's ﬁsl\ Driver’s !‘ngnatur{ Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Date & Time: h (If driver is not the cyholder] Name:
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.:

Page 3 of 10



Sketch Plan #3 Pg. 1

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

4 Shenton Way, # 21-07, SOX Centre 2, Singapore 068807
Tel +65 6827 7888, Fax +65 6827 7800

Co. Reg. No. 200412212G  GST Reg. Ne. 20-0412212C

VW DRIVEEASY RENEWAL CERTIFICATE

|4

o A

6/10/2019

17/10/2018 to 1

. T o

Ng Yeong Hua
132

Geylang East Avenue 1
#15-233

Singapore 380132

L R TSR R VT R Y

4

SGDB6L1.72

RISK NUMBER 1 VW DRIVEEASY
OCCUPATION

Retired

FINANCIAL INTEREST

DBS Bank Ltd
as Hire Purchase Owners

SCOPE OF COVER Comprehensive

INTEREST INSURED

REGISTRATION NO. SCR318Y SUM INSURED MARKET VALUE
MAKE/MODEL Volkswagen Golf A7 1.4 TSI AT INCL. COE/PARF YES

ENGINE NUMBER CX5209939 OFF-PEAK CAR NO

CHASSIS NUMBER  WVWZZZAUZFW005317 NO CLAIM DISCOUNT 50.00% (or F/D)
YEAR OF MFG 2014 GOOD DRIVER'S

CAPACITY 1395 C.C. DISCOUNT SGD42.39

SEATING CAPACITY 5 (INCL. DRIVER) NCD PROTECTOR COVERED
WINDSCREEN UNLIMITED EXCESS SGD500

ANNUAL PREMIUM SGD805.35

ACCESSORIES Aircon, radio/cassette/compact disc player, in-vehicle unit,
rust-proofing and other accessories that are factory fitted.

AUTHORISED DRIVERS

Ng Yong Hua

SACM201808251621 Qmxa1802

Page 5 of 10



Accident Photo
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Accident Photo
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VGS Singapore, 247, 159934 Singapore

NG YONG HUA

132 GEYLANG EAST AVENUE 1

O

NS
{MHW‘ 91 “f‘M“"I
wf’

sl e 15°

VGS Singapore
247

\o\ Alexandra Rogll

159934 Singapore

Phone No. +65 6305 7299
Fax No. +65 6474 3643
E-Mail service@vw.com.sg

VAT Registration No. M20098505-2
Tax No. 19910149427

:ﬁézﬁm 380132 v [hmste- o
I & .
Sifigapers . Gdr?? Service Quote
Customer No. CVv027074
Quote No SER/QUO/1900560
. AY QuoteDate 19/03/19
. Q‘V\ "'B W(YM Salesperson Anthony Yong
( Page 1
THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
Make Model Description Mileage Service Advisor
Volkswagen Passeng GOLF A7 1.4 TSI (DSG)RECAT EQP 34,233 Kong Charmaine
License No. VIN Initial Registration Sales Advisor
SCR918Y WVWZZZAUZFW005317 17/10/14 Anthony Yong
Engine Code Labor Type Engine No. Model Code
17T CXS 209939 5G13GZ b
No. Description Qty. UoM Unit Price Amount
P B&P ALEX LABOUR R&R RIM & BALANCE 1 Labor 40 v~ 5000
P B&P ALEX LABOUR LABOUR 4 Labor /630 336000
P B&P ALEX PAINT SPRAY PAINT 4 Labor /éc v 3,200.00
P B&P WHEEL ALIGNMENT B&P WHEEL ALIGNMENT -NETT 1 " 360.00
P B&P DIAG PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION 1 Time Un .~ 480.00
COMPULSORY TO DO AFTER AC
P B&P MECH CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECU, S 1 Time Un ~~ 280.00
Nett
Sum Labor 7,730.00
P 311601361 RUBBER VALVE 1 Pieces g~ 2392
Use Predecessor 281601361
P 5G0601025AFZ49 18" 'SALVADOR' RIM ONLY 1 Pieces ok~ 1,772.74
GALVANO GREY METALLIC
P 5G0919491 SENSOR BRACKET 1 Pieces L ¥16.26
P 5G0919491 SENSOR BRACKET 1 Pieces " .} *16.26
P 5G0919491A SENSOR BRACKET 1 Pieces ¥ 16.26
P 5G0919492A SENSOR BRACKET 1 Pieces £ 16.26
P 5G0998492 GRU SENSOR Bracket 1 Pieces X 29.28
P 5G6807394 BUMPER BRACKET RHS 1 Pieces 74196
P 5G6807394A BUMPER GUIDE RHS 1 Pieces T 4196
5G6807417APGRU REAR BUMPER COVER 1 Pieces 1,046.26 Kx. 1,046.26
Predecessor 5G6807417ARGRU
P 5Q0919133 9B9 SENSOR O-RING 1 Pieces uaf/ 1.79
P 5Q09192758 GRU SENSOR 1 Pieces 7 151.61
Use Predecessor 5Q0919275 GR i
Sum carried forward 10,904.56

Payments to:

- BBN: - Acc.-No..:



VGS Singapore, 247, 159934 Singapore

VGS Singapore
247

Alexandra Road
159934 Singapore

Phone No. +65 6305 7299
Fax No. +65 6474 3643
E-Mail service@vw.com.sg

Explanations
P = Proportionately Charged

Payment Terms No Credit

Payments to: - BBN: - Acc.-No. .

LKK Auto Consultants hence nolify

the Repairer of the following:

« To resurvey belore/alter spray painting

« To display damaged part({s) during resurvey

« Parts prices are subject lo canlirmation

* Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice’ basis
* No illegal modification(s) 1s allowed

« Supplementary ilem(s) mus! be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature;

NG YONG HUA VAT Registration No. M20098505-2

132 GEYLANG EAST AVENUE 1 Tax No 1991014942

#15-233

Singapore, 380132 B

S Service Quote
Customer No. CV027074
Quote No. SER/QUO/1900560
QuoteDate 19/03/19
Salesperson Anthony Yong
Page 2
THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE

Make Model Description Mileage Service Advisor

Volkswagen Passeng GOLF A7 1.4 TSI (DSG)RECAT EQP 34,233 Kong Charmaine

License No. VIN Initial Registration Sales Advisor

SCR918Y WVWZZZAUZFWO005317 17/10/14 Anthony Yong

Engine Code Labor Type Engine No. Model Code

1T CXS 209939 5G13GZ

Continued 10,904.56

P D 180KU2A1 2KADHESIVE 1 Pieces WV % 9432

P D 822150A1 BONDAGENT 1 Pieces ww X 6748

Sum Item 3,336.36

Sum Labor 7,730.00
Sum ltem 3,336.36
Total SGD 11,066.36
7% GST 11,066.36 774.65
Total SGD Incl. GST 11,841.01

Date:




' ’d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
-V 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 189607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19005214/T1vd3e2
31601 CITy HOUSESINGAPORE 086877 Dt RROERDI0 ””mmlml"""lmm
Code: FCI2
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 3488G Veh. Inspected SCR 918Y
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19001937MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  EILEEN LEE Assign Date 22/03/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN GOLF c.c 1395
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. VWWWZZZAUZFWO005317 Colour BLACK
Odometer 37097 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/40R18 PIRELLI 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/40 R18 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [225/40 R18 PIRELLI 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/03/2019 Inspection Date 27/03/2019
Survey held at VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE
247 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159934
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days




y L7l LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
;_’; ;; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SCR 918Y
Qty Description of Parts Condition WE::LI:;::?:)) Our A(gj)usted
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RUBBER VALVE (SN) NECESSARY 23.92 23.92
1|18" 'SALVADOR' RIM ONLY cut 1,772.74 1,772.74
GALVANO GREY METALLIC (SN)
1|SENSOR BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 16.26 -
1|SENSOR BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 16.26 -
1|SENSOR BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 16.26 -
1|SENSOR BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 16.26 -
1|SENSOR BRACKET (SN) NOT NECESSARY 29.28 -
1|BUMPER BRACKET RHS (SN) * CHECK 41.96
1|BUMPER GUIDE RHS (SN) * CHECK 41.96 -
1|REAR BUMPER COVER (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 1,046.26 -
LABOUR
1|SENSOR O-RING (SN) CuT 1.79 1.79
1|SENSOR (SN) * CHECK 151.61 -
1|2KADHESIVE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 94 32 -
1|BONDAGENT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 67.48 -
3,336.36 1,798.45
LABOUR
R&R RIM & BALANCE. 50.00 50.00
LABOUR. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR BUMPER 3,360.00 1,680.00
COVER.
SPRAY PAINT. 3,200.00 1.600.00
B&P WHEEL ALIGNMENT 360.00 360.00
PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION COMPULSORY TO DO 480.00 480.00
AFTER AC.
CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECU, S 280.00 280.00
7,730.00 4.450.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,066.36 6,248.45
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 6,248.45

(REPAIR COST NOT CONCLUDE)
(EXCLUDE CHECK ITEMS $$235.53 NETT)
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ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A
Licensed Appraiser

Automotive Assessor
DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




