Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com=

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 8:53 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOVLING GBES33D & SJX1617U ON 19.3.2019 [External
Confidential]

Categories: Yellow Category

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Jia Le,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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| . The all (¥ lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 9 July, 2019 3:55 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOVLING GBES533D & SJX1617U ON 19.3.2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/021547
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC19005123/Udb3
Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.,

We have highlighted to your good office on 25/03/2019 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

Insured driver reversed and collided ontao third party vehicle. Liakility is not in our driver's favour,

Summary to offer to third party repairer, "NGEE SENG AUTO WORKS" is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
|. Cost of Repair {w/GST| ¥ 6.241.32 $ 2,700.00
2. Loss of Use [Sdays x $50.00) $  250.00 $ 250.00 (5days x $50.00)




3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 800 3 8.00

Total | $ 6,499.32 $2958.00

**05days recommendation for repair.

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

sent: Monday, 25 March, 2019 9:57 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Ce: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOVLING GBE533D & SJX1617U ON 19.3.2019 [External Confidential]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SJX 1617U at M/s Ngee seng Auto Works on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP estimated cost of repair
5 Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Libi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 March 2019 5:19 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; assignments <assignments lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <a dmin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOVLING GBES533D & 5JX1617U ON 159.3,2019 [External Confidential]




Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer arrange on 21/03/2019.

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: bz256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Sfqn8033)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 20 March 2019 2:52 PM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOVLING GBE533D & SJX1617U ON 15.3.2015 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Our Ref : 19/19/19/VC05/021547
Dear Nivitha,

Please see attached and proceed with the survey.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
TeE_{_E.S) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: 65) 6296 2706
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The all (#&% ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.ave.comm







Ta: Ms Ngea Seng Auto Works
Block 3022A, Ubi Road 1,

#)1-50,
Singapore 408716
LETTER OF UNDERTAKING
o iwe, £ ] _J£0i CTONG NRIC No. S/2SCFGAT)
IAID  AUNEG G L WAL 773443, S§2¢27 s registered ouner of motor vehicle
registration number =~ " U7 7 [” hereby authorse Mis Ngee Seng Auto Works (the ‘Repairer’) fo
commence repairs to my/our motor vehicle and to forward the claim for the costs of repairs to the owner/driverfinsured
of the Third Party responsible for the scaident en _~ /-0 20 / 7 involving motor vehicle(s)
@GAE $233 D ataong X VAR OF B S

o o -

DY JiNNS 1nél7

You are further authorised o appoint solicitors on mylour behaif and give the solicitors full Instructions as if
the appointment is made and instructions are given by mefus with respect to the conduct of mylour claim against the
third party driver and/or his insurers including if necessary, to commence legal proceedings in Court in myfour name
against the third party. You have my full authority to instruct mylour solicitors to negofiate a settlement with the third

party andlor his insurers on such terms as you deem fit

Upon resalving my/our claim, you are authorised to agree with my/our solicitors on the amount of their
professional costs and disbursements for acting for me/us and to receive payment of the balance of the settiement sum
on mylour behalf directly into your account.
ifvie agree that shouid my/our claim for demages against the Tnird Pany be unsuccessiul for one reason or e other,
liwe undertake to pay the Repairer the sum of monies as agreed, being the costs of the repairs to my/our vehicle. /We
also agree to pay myfour solicitors legal costs and disbursements as well as the third party’s legal costs.

Altematively, /we agree to lef the Repairer to claim for the repair costs from mylour insurance company and
Iwe will pay the excess as stpulated in the insurance policy. However, If mylour insurance company repudiates
mylovr claim under myfour own policy, Ywe will be fully responsible for the repair costs or to pay you the difference in
amount, as the case may be.

My/Our vehicle is repaired by the Repairer on mylour own free will without any inducement threat andfor
promise.

Date : 'i;' 0= b -y
Name . LI JEoly < NG
NRIC No. i i -

13 e Bl T } .

Signature : x ) | A7)



RECEIVED

10/07/2019 11:57 67439006

pa/e7/2019 23:50 BE7dldles

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 19/19/19/VC05/021547
DATE : 10 JULY 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

/We, LIM YEOW CHONG confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of GBE 533D the sum of Singapore Dollar Two
Thousand Nine Hundred and Fifty-Eight Only ($2,958.00) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving SJX 1617U and GBE 533D on 19
March 2019 along CARPARK OF BLK 504 JURONG WEST STREET 51.

1 /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ MUA HIN POULTRY FARM PTE LTD AND/OR LIM KIM POH)
against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our
behalf in respect of the said accident.

/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to NGEE SENG
AUTO WORKS,

1/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.
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Signature of vehicle owner/Date
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] [ \ s\ \
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MName of vehicle owner /Date
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NGEE SENG AUTO WORKS & & &= rg

REGISTHATION NO: 52731300M

W
& Blk. 3022A, Ubi Road 1, #01-50, Singapore 408716. Tel: 6841 2276 Fax: 6743 9006

ALL TYPES OF MOTOR REPAIRS SERVICES. SPRAY PAINTING & INSURANCE CLAIMS

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD FINAL Repair Bill  :TP19004

300, Beach Road Date :09/04/2019

The Concourse #17-04/07 Ref No 5JX 1617 U

Singapore 189702 Your Ref :GBES33 D
Page A ¥ i §

ATTN : Motor Claims Depts

[RE : VEHICLE NO. SJX 1617 U TOYOTA VIOS

LUMP SUM REPAIRS $2,700.00
LOSS OF USE ( 5 DAYS X $50.00 ) $250.00
LTA SEARCH FEES $8.00

TOTAL 52,958.00

DOLLARS : TWO THOUSAND NINE HUNDRD AND FIFTY EIGHT ONLY

NGEE SENG AUTO WORKS
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Vehcle
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Enquire Vehicle & Owner Informatian [ Vehicle No, GBE5S330 As At 19 Mar 2019/ 11:40:00)

Law Flrm Search Details
Search Rgason;

Lawe Firm Cass Mo

Current Owner Details

Qw10 Typen

Crwrigr I

Chamer Mame:

Registered hddress Type;
Ragistared BloceHouze Mo,
Reglstered Streat Marme:
Reglstered Uit Me.:
Ragistered Building bams:
Registered Postal Cade:
Currant Vehlcls Detalls
Vahlche ho:

waka Description/Madel:
Insurance Compary Mame

Fax

P R B

https:/ivrl.lta.gov.sg/Mtalviliaction/lawFirmDetai PFUNCTION ...

Insuranes clalm i relatlon jo iraffic aceident
Hi-MISC27

Campany

19T OES 1

ML HIN POULTRY FARR PTE LTD

Private Residentlal [Conda Apdor Mause) / Shopping/ OMied Camples
az

SENOKO CRESCENT

SEMOHQ INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
T5B200

GHESHMO
TOWOTA  TOYOTA DYMA 150 MANUAL
LOMPAC IMSURANCE BHD

19/3/2019, 3:35 pm



