not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.



72972019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO COMSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP} = Menu

<« RE: Pls upload delivery order and purchase order

Type
© Question

Message

Hi, For parts ordered due to unavailability, please refer to PO. Listed items are critical parts that do not allow
repair to progress unless available. Surveyor had checked with Komoco at that time and confirmed that they do
not have parts for this make and model vehicle as it has stopped production, and replaced with electric model,
different from third party vehicle. 57 days inclusive of Sunday and PH. All parts were air freight by stockists
reducing unnecessary downtime if by sea freight. We are unable to comment whether 57 days is reasonable
because we are not privy to stock availability and / or others facts at ordered country which may affect the
delivery of parts. Thank you, Kindly let us have your mandate after review the case. Hsiao Tong- 29 July 2019

hl'.l.ps:F.l'up.smanclaima.ara.l:nm.sg.-'ciairr-n-pnrta!.-'htr'n!:'indax—vandur—seruica-raquasls.htrnI#.l'sanrica-requnsls.-'visw-mesaageﬁs&wlcaﬁaqumllﬂumbeﬁ1U. i



TI2Br2019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO COMSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Menu

<« PIs upload delivery order and purchase order

Type
@ Question

Message
TP requested for 57-day LOU for waiting of parts. Please advise what parts they were and if they would disrupt
the repair of other parts. Please also comment if those parts are unavailable in SG, and if such a long waiting

time is reasonable.
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82018 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP} - Menu

<« Pls reconfirm the price on RH Centre Door Pillar
Type
@ Question

Message
We will also review on the down time.

Reply

{édw-nm ”‘){1[9_. i:S ==

htips:/fvp.smarclaims,.axa com.sg/claim-poralhtmlfindex-vendor-service-raquests himl#service-requests/view-message/ TserviceRequestNumber=10... 11



BMr2019 Claim Portal

LEKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Menu

<« RE: Pls reconfirm the price on RH Centre Door Pillar

Type
@ Question

Message
Hi, We have checked the price from Komoco and some local stockist and the price in the estimate was within

the price range. Thank you. Kindly let us have your mandate asap. Hsiao Tong - 01 Aug 2019
Reply

https://vp.smartclaims. axa.com.sg/claim-portalhimllindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/service-requesis/view-message/ 7serviceRequestNumber=10...  1/1



Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 16 August 2019 9:27 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: New message for service request 105247, vehicle number SLZ9083Y
Message Hi, We have checked the price from Komoco and some local stockist and the —
[] |price in the estimate was within the price range. Thank you. Kindly let us have your CHT 5:37-07 PM

~ |mandate asap. Hsiao Tong - 01 Aug 2019

8/15/19 1.18 PM WANG Peter—— Pls proceed DS with below revised quantum

w COR: 530924 25 (545422 50 labour less 50% + $1473.00 Special Net + $6740.00 Labour) Lsp 1648/2019
LOL: 54100.00 ($50/day for 82 days), TOWING FEE: $120.00. Total: 35144.25. If TP 9:13:49 AM

rejects, you have mandate up to $35200 for global-sum seftiement.

1

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAute) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 August 2019 1:47 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=

Subject: FW: New message for service request 105247, vehicle number SLZ9083Y

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: peter.wang@axa.com.sg <peter.wang@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 15 August, 2015 1:35 PM

To: admin-d@Ilkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 105247, vehicle number SLZ9083Y

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number SSMO1HIF.

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forin a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



8/19/2019 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP} = Menu

&« RE: PIs proceed DS with below revised quantum

Type
@ Question

Message

Hi, third party rejected our offer and counter proposed g/s $38,800.00(all-in). Kindly let us have your further
mandate/ instruction. Thank you. Hsiao Tong - 19 Aug 2019

Reply

hitps:/fvp smariclaims.axa. com.sgiclaim-porlalfhtmlfindex-vendor-service-requests himi/service-requestsiview-message/?serviceRequesthumber=10... 11



BIZ2120189 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) - Menu

<« Service Request Details

Claim
SMOLHIF

Reference
CC4/ASM19005049/Dpb3 &

Loss Date
19 March 2019

Report Date
20 Mar 2019 9:12:00 AM

Request Date
25 July 2019

Due Date
20 March 2020

Vendor Name
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

Type of Loss
Third Party Vehicle Damage

Services
Pending verification - Direct Settlement

Actions

Mext Step
Finish the work

Com -|.'.'|':!r':' Wark Mare =

Vehicle Information

hitps:/ivp.smariclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-porlalhimliindex-vendor-service-reguests. himi#/service-requests/?serviceRequestMumber=105247 10



Br22/2019

viake
TPVD

Model
HYUMDAI

Service Address

Primary Contact/Insured

Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) -

LEONG MUN LUI @ FOO AH HOE
68 BELMONT ROAD, 269900, Singapore

81116888
johanlim05@gmail.com

Claim Handler
WAMNG Peter

peterwang@axa.com.sg

Additional Instructions

Menu

Messages Invoices History Documents Assessment Metrics Motes
TP ¥ P

TYPE o

SENT 22/8/19 2:01 PM

FROM WANG Peter

SUBJECT You may offer up to $37k

BEODY Pls start offer up to $34.5k.

*

hitps:ivp . smariclaims axa. com.sg/claim-poralhtmlfindex-vendor-service-requests. him i service-requests/ 7service RequestMumber=105247

2110



B22/2019

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSLLTANTS PTE LTD (TP} - Menu

20/8/19 2:07 PM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP}

RE: Pls offer up to $36000 (global-sum) for amicable settlement

Hi, Peter, we have offered up to global sum $36K(a...

-

19/8/19 5:35 PM

WANG Peter

Pls offer up to $36000 (global-sum) for amicable settlement

19/8/19 4:16 PM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

RE: Pls proceed DS with below revised quantum

Hi, third party rejected our offer and counter pro...

«

o

hitps-fivp.smariclaims.axa.com sg/claim-portal/htmlindex-vendor-senvice-requests. him Wisarvice-requests?serviceRequestNumber=105247

ano



8222019

FHRUIM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD (TP) - Menu

YWANL Ferer

Pls proceed DS with below revised quantum

COR: $30924.25 (545422 .50 labour less 50% + $1473...

-

1/8/1% 5:48 PM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

RE: Pls reconfirm the price on RH Centre Door Pillar

Hi, We have checked the price from Komoco and some...

L o

30/7/19 5:22 PM

WANMNG Peter

Pls reconfirm the price on RH Centre Door Pillar

We will also review on the down time.

*«

2%/7/1% 5:13 PM

hitps:iivp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portalhtmlindex-vendor-service-requests.him#/service-requests/7serviceRequestNumber=105247

4110



Bl22/2018

SUBJEL ]

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

Claim Paral

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = MenL

KE: FIS UpIoad aeliverny orger ana purcnase oraer

Hi, For parts ordered due to unavailability, pleas...

-

26/7/12 4.09 PM

WAMNG Peter

Pls upload delivery order and purchase order

TP requested for 57-day LOU for waiting of parts. ...

-

25/7/19 2:39 PM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

RE: <TP - Mandate |1A> - S?MOLHIF [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 55
333P(01) & SLZ F083Y(TP) ON 19/03/2019]

[4th REMINDER] Liability: 100%. Insured driver bea...

-

B/7/19 12:24 PM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

hitps:/ivp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portalhtmlindex-vendor-service-requesis. himi/service-requesis/TserviceRequestNumber=105247

5M10



82212015

BULY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

Claim Porial

LEE AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP} - Menu

HI, wWe Will INTOrm TNira party 1apility 15 in tne...

e

8/7/19 11:08 AM

YOMNG Johnny

mandate

Insd had admitted that he moved his car when the t...

-

B/7/19 9:06 AM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP}

RE: <TP - Mandate 14> - S9MO1HIF [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 55
333P(0O0) & SLZ 2083Y(TP) ON 1%/03/2019]

[3rd REMINDER] Liability: 100%. Insured driver bea...

L

26/6/1% 10:06 AM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

RE: <TP - Mandate |A> - S9MO1HIF [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 55
333P(0I) & SLZ 9083Y(TP) ON 19/03/2019]

hitps:/ivp smarclaims.axza.com sglclaim-portalhitmliindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/service-requests/7serviceRequestNumber=105247

610



Bi22/2019

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

Claim Portal

LKK AUTO COMNSULTANMTS PTE LTD (TP) = Menu

19/6/19 5:17 PM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

RE: Pending confirmation if lawyer discharged themselves from TPPD

claim

Hi Peter, we were informed by third party repairer...

-

19/6/19 10:52 AM

WANG Peter

Pending confirmation if lawyer discharged themselves from TPPD
claim

Hi Hsiao Tong, we received LOD from Kuru & Co earl...

-

10/6/1% 4:49 PM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

RE: <TP - Mandate |A> - SPMO1HIF [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SS
333P(0OI) & SLZ 9083Y(TP) ON 19/03/2019]

hitps:iivp smartclaims.axa. com. sg/claim-portal htmifindex-vendor-service-requests htmli#/service-requests/ Tservice RequestMumber=105247

o



8222019

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD (TP} »  Menu

1/6/1% 10:02 AM

LKK AUTO COMSULTANTS PTE LTD (TF)

<TP - Mandate |A> - S9MO1HIF [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 55
333P(0l) & SLZ 9083Y(TP) ON 19/03/2019]

Liability: 100%. Insured driver beat red light and...

*~

4/4/19 5:58 PM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

IA - SLZ 9083Y

Hi Peter, kindly inform need to indent parts from ...

L N

2/4/19 2:18 PM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)

RE: Pls update status on DS

Hi All, Pls ignore our msg dated 02/04/2019@2.02PM...

hitps/ivp smartclaims.axa.com.sglclaim-portalhimlindex-vendor-service-requests. himi¥/service-requests/ Tservice RequesiNumber=105247

B0



Bf22/2019

I1YFE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

TYPE

SENT

FROM

SUBJECT

BODY

Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = hleniu

L7

2/4/19 2202 PM

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TPF)

RE: Pls update status on DS

Dear Peter, Please be informed that vehicle has b...

-

25/3/19 2225 PM

WANG Peter

Pls update status on DS

We received TPPD LOD from lawyer. Please update st...

-

20/3/1% 6:14 PM

WANG Peter

Liability clear - pls get Ol LOA and driver DL

-

hitps:/ivp.smariclaims axa.com.sg/claim-portalhtmllindex-vendor-service-requests. himi#/service-requests/ 7service RequestNumber= 105247

810



BI22/2019 Claim Portal

LEK AUTO COMSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) - Menu
SENI 2073117 331 FM
FROM LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP)
SUBJECT VEH IN
BODY %
-

hitps /ivp.smariclaims axa.com.sg/claim-portalhtmbindex-vendor-service-requests himi#/service-requests/?serviceRequestNumber=105247 1010



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 2:44 PM

To: Alfred Quah

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref SLZ9083Y// LKK REF: CC4/ASM13005049/Dpb3(55333P) DOA:
19/03/2019

Attachments: EXPRESS SETTLEMENT FORM_SLZ9083Y pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Mr Alfred,

As spoken earlier, we confirm settlement at a global sum of $37,000.00(all-in).
Please duly sign the document attached and return to us for our necessary action.

Thanks.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter{s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Alfred Quah <alfredauto@hotmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 17 August 2019 2:18 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SLZ9083Y// LKK REF: CC4/ASM19005049/Dpb3(55333P) DOA: 19/03/2019

Dear Hsiao Tong,

With reference to our Letter of Demand Dated 17 May 2019, with Ref: SS 333 P, our cost of repair outlay
(without waiver) amounts to 5543,773.47. As a good will, we waived the Freight Charges of 552,890 and
the cost of disbursement of $5343.47, thus the total of $540,540.

For an amicable settlement within a week (by 23 September 2019) our client is prepared to settle for a
amount of $538,800 (final).

After the 23 September 2019, our client has instructed us to hand the said claim to our legal council to
seek recourse.

Alfred Quah



HP: 91454773

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, August 16, 2019 1:02 PM

To: alfredauto@hotmail.com <alfredauto@hotmail.com>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: SLZ9083Y// LKK REF: CC4/ASM19005049/Dpb3(55333P) DOA: 19/03/2019

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer fo the above matter,

wWe have our principal instruction to offer as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair $30,924.25
2. Loss of Use [82days x $50.00) $ 4.100.00
3. Towing Fee $ 12000

Total | 5 35,144.25

Please confirm acceptance.

“please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 3{408933)
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KURU & CO

PRE REPAIR INSPECTION (PRI) MEMO 1

Qur ref no
Dare

Attn,

. L.19.0388

: 27.03.18
. ALFRED

! GOH LEE HWA

Vehicle noDOAModel ; SLZ 8083Y

/__18.03.2018 / HYUNDAI

Dear Sir,

The PRI notification letter to the Third Party insurer wassenton _22 / 03 / 19 @ 0823 AM /#M. Time frame ~2
working days (not including Saturday, Sunday and Public Heliday)

D NO REPLY from Third Party insurer. Please proceed 1o appoint your surveyer and repair the vehicle,

D We have received the Third Party insurer's REPLY with their list of surveyors on / ) @ AM Y/

PM. Copy enclosed,

I:l If you

h

3)

AGREE, please indicate your choice of surveyor(s)

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS

Their surveyor bas to NOTIFY YOU IN WRITING to state that the PRI is completed and that you may
proceed to repair the vehicle, (This letter also support vour claim for lass of use/remal)

Please forward us the repair bill and supporting documents when it’s ready for us to proceed with your
claim.

Meanwhile, please let us the following information that is required for the ¢laim:

f'i by

1 | PRI (Before dismantle) | Date; ;Q\ug l;ma{ TS | (d>ayn
A R é:»;rw JEC 4 420
3 :::;re?mrmspuﬂqn (if | Date: E #“I I k :ICEJF\ o\ 'Q-{j

4 | Survevor KK Name: /

5 | Agreed COR/Days for | § *- Days" \"-E

6 :f:::;e Date in: Date out: / =

incurred.

If their surveyor is asking for Direct Settlement, our legal fees at this stage is $321.00 plus disbursements

D If you OBJECT, please let us have your list of 10 surveyor company, surveyor name and contact number,

Please ler us have your I'EEIV ASAP before the 2 Wurkiﬂg da V'S. Otherwise, it will be

deemed that you have AGREED to ANY of the surveyors listed by the Third Party insurer.

Please fax back to 65322 007.

Warmest Rgds,
deivinc ( Lena / loana
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¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- Jm ; = 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R_ GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Intarnationale Des Experts En Automaobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CC4/ASM19005049/Dpb3s2
A TONERSNGAPORE s e |||
ATTN: JOHNNY YONG Code: ASM
1z Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. 55 333P Veh. Inspected SLZ 8083Y
Policy No. GA3107561 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SOGMOTHIF Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From JOHNNY YONG Assign Date 20/03/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI KONA c.c 998
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. KMHE3811LJU0S4455 Colour GREY
Odometer 12635 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/55 R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Front Tyre [215/55 R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/55 R17 CONTINENTAL 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 215/55 R17 CONTINEMNTAL & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S AND OIS FRONT PORTION, O/S BODY, O/S REAR
PORTION AND REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  19/03/2018 Inspection Date 28/03/2019
Survey held at GOHLEE HWA AUTOMOBILE
BLK 5033, #01-255
AVENUE 3 ANG MO KIO IND, PARK 2
SINGAPORE 569536
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 25 Working Days




' ’d 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

BdE BA B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Req. Mo: 199607 198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page Mo.:1 of B
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLZ 9083Y
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | Stmace {:H ﬁl}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER (CONSISTENT) CuT 481.00 481.00
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE TOP (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 485.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER SPOILER (CONSISTENT) cuTt 265.00 265.00
2IFRONT BUMPER H/LAMP GARNISH RH/LH @ $239.20 NS CUT /O/8 NOT 478.40 23820
(CONSISTENT) NECESSARY
2|FRONT BUMPER H/LAMP COVER @ $39.60 MOT NECESSARY 79.20 -
(CONSISTENT)
Z|FRONT BUMFER FOG LAMP GRILLE @ 551.40 NIS CUT / Of5 NOT 102.80 51.40
(CONSISTENT) NECESSARY
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @ $20.50 NOT NECESSARY 41.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT BUMPER BEAM (CONSISTENT) BENT 645 40 645.40
1|FRONT BUMPER REFLECTOR LH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 69.00 -
1|FRONT EUMPER LOWER LIP (CONSISTENT) CUT !/ DEFORMED 289.00 289.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GARNISH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 265.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER SFPONGE (CONSISTENT) TORN 96.20 a6.20
4|SETS FRONT BUMPER PARKING SENSOR @ $179.80 DAMAGED 2PCS 719.20 359.60
(CONSISTENT) OMLY
1|FRONT GRILLE & LOGO (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 486.85 486.85
2|FRONT HEADLAMP RH/LH ASSY @ $1844.00 MTG CRACKED / 3,688.00 3,688.00
(CONSISTENT) BROKEN
2|FRONT SIGNAL LAMP RH/LH ASSY @ $773.50 WIS CUT 7/ OIS NOT 1,547.00 773.50
(CONSISTENT) MECESSARY
1|FRONT SUPPORT LOWER GARMISH (CONSISTENT) NOT MECESSARY 355.00 -
10|FRONT SUPPORT GARNISH CLIPS @ $5.50 MWOT NECESSARY 55.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
1|FRONT SUPPORT PAMEL (COMSISTENT) BENT / CRACKED 949 .00 049,00
1|FRONT AIR BAGS SENSOR (BUMPER LH) (CONSISTENT) JACTIVATED 385.00 385.00
1|FRONT HORMN (COMNSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 98.00 -
1|{RH FRONT FENDER (CONSISTENT) DENTED 551.50 551.50
1|RH FRONT FENDER GARNISH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 144 .45 -
1|RH FRONT FENDER PROTECTOR (CONSISTENT) CUuT 105.00 -
12|RH FRONT FENDER GARNISH CLIPS @ $5.50 NOT NECESSARY 66.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
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Qty Description of Parts Condition | Cstmare By ‘T}'}
1|RH FRONT FENDER DUST GARNISH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 175.48 -
10|FRONT FENDER DUST GARNISH CLIPS @ $5.50 NOT NECESSARY 55.00 -
{CONSISTENT)
1|RH DOOR (FRONT) (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 1,594.30 1,594 .30
1|RH DOOR HINGE UPPER (CONSISTENT) BENT 63.20 63.20
1|RH DOOR HINGE LOWER (CONSISTENT) BENT 63.20 63.20
1|RH DOOR CENTRE STOPPER (CONSISTENT) BENT 65.30 65,30
1|RH DOOR PROTECTOR (CONSISTENT) DISLODGE 173.20 173.20
1|RH DOOR LOCK ASSY (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 245,30 24530
1|RH DOOR OUTER HANDLE (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 147.50 -
1|RH DODR SIDE MIRROR ASSY (CONSISTENT) MOT NECESSARY BO2.00 -
1|RH DOOR FRAME STICKER (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 7710 77.10
1|RH DOOR GLASS MOULDING (CONSISTENT) BENT T2.60 7260
1|RH DOOR INNER RUBBER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 135.00 135.00
1|RH DOOR POWER WINDOW REGULATOR ASSY BENT 195.00 195.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|RH DOOR BOARD (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 512.00 512.00
1|RH DOOR CONTROL SWITCH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 573.00 -
1|RH DOOR INMER SEAL (FRONT) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 146,60 146.60
1|RH DOOR INNER MOULDING (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 72,60
1|RH DOOR CHANNEL RUBBER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 95,30 -
1|RH FRONT DOOR FRAME RUBBER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 89.10 B9.10
1|RH REAR DOOR (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 1,832,985 1,832.95
1|RH REAR DOOR HINGE UPFPER {CONSISTENT) BEMT 63.20 6320
1|RH REAR DOOR HINGE LOWER (CONSISTENT) BENT 63.20 63.20
1|RH REAR DOOR STOPPER [CONSISTENT) BENT 65.30 B5.30
1|RH REAR DOOR PROTECTOR (CONSISTENT) BENT 142.00 142.00
1|RH REAR DOOR LOCK ASSY (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 238.20 238.20
1|RH REAR DOOR CUTER HANDLE (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 147 20 147 .20
1|RH REAR DOCR FRAME STICKER (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 63.00 63.00
1|RH REAR DOOR GLASS MOULDING (CONSISTENT) BENT 80.00 88.00
1|RH REAR DOOR INNER RUBBER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 168.00 168.00
1|RH REAR DOOR POWER WINDOW REGULATOR ASSY BENT 190,00 180.00
(CONSISTENT)
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1|RH REAR DOOR BOARD (CONSISTENT) MTG CRACKED 533.00 533.00
1|RH REAR DOOR INNER SEAL (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 147.00 -
1|RH REAR DOOR INNER SEALANT (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 3
1|RH CENTRE DOOR PILLAR (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 3,539.00 3,539.00
1|RH CENTRE PILLAR HOUSING (CONSISTENT) DENTED 946,50 946 50
1|RH CENTRE LOCAL PANEL (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 1,480.00 1,480.00
1|RH CENTRE LOCAL PANEL GARNISH (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 338.00 338.00
1|RH REAR DOOR PILLAR RUBBER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 6530 .
1|RH REAR FENDER (CONSISTENT) DENTED 1,768.00 1,768.00
1|RH REAR FENDER PROTECTOR (CONSISTENT) DISLODGE 181.00 181.00
1|REAR BUMPER {CONSISTENT) cuT 475.00 475.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @ $37.00 (CONSISTENT) |[NOT NECESSARY 74.00 .
1|SET REAR BUMPER PARKING SENSOR @ $217.50 DAMAGED 870.00 870.00
{CONSISTENT)
1|REAR BUMPER BEAM (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 218.00 -
2|REAR BUMPER CATCH @ $28.00 (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 56.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE (CONSISTENT) DISLODGE 110.00 110.00
1|REAR FENDER DUST GARNISH (CONSISTENT) DISLODGE 159.50 159.50
1|REAR FENDER HOUSING (CONSISTENT) BUCKLED 1,085.00 1,085.00
1|REAR BUMPER CENTRE PAD (CONSISTENT) CuT 168.00 168.00
2|REAR BUMPER LAMP ASSY @ $162.00 (CONSISTENT)  |BROKEN 324.00 324.00
1|REAR BUMPER DUST GARNISH RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 96.00 :
1|REAR BUMPER PANEL GARNISH RH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 109.00 -
1|ROOF AIRBAGS (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 1,440.00 1,440.00
1|CUSHION SEAT AIRBAGS (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 1,166.30 1,166.30
1|ROOF AIRBAGS SENSOR (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 526.00 526.00
1|CUSHION AIRBAGS CONTRL UNIT (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 1,061.00 1,061.00
1|FRONT RH WINDSCREEN PILLAR GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 158.00 é
(CONSISTENT)

1|SET ROOF LINING ASSY (CONSISTENT) BENT 1,5635.30 1,535.30
1|FRONT RH SAFETY BELT (CONSISTENT) ACTIVATED 909 50 909,50
1|REAR RH SAFETY BELT CONTROL UNIT (CONSISTENT) |NOT NECESSARY 645.00 -
1|RH CUSHION ASSY (DRIVER) (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 1,690.00 1,690.00
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Q Description of Parts Condition
i e Workshop (5))| _(5)
1|FCA CONTROL UNIT (AGENT CONTROL ITEM) DAMAGED 1,990.00 1,990.00
(FORWARD COLLISION AVOIDANCE ASST)
(CONSISTENT)
1|CENTRE PILLAR UPPER GARNISH (CONSISTENT) MTG CRACKED 64.50 64.50
1|CENTRE PILLAR LOWER GARNISH (CONSISTENT) BROKEN 65.30 65.30
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN TOP MOULDING (CONSISTENT) ~ [NOT NECESSARY 56.00 .
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 52.00 -
1|REAR RH QUARTER GLASS MOULDING & SEAASSY ~ |NECESSARY 309.00 309.00
(CONSISTENT)
1|REAR RH CUSHION TOP (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 699.00 699.00
1|REAR RH CUSHION COVER (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 95.00 95.00
1|DASH BOARD (CONSISTENT) BENT / MTG 918.00 918.00
DEFORMED
1|RH FRONT ABSORBER (CONSISTENT) BENT 392.00 392.00
1|RH FRONT ABSORBER MOULDING (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 135.00 ;
1|RH FRONT KNUCKLE ARM (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED / BENT 382.00 382.00
1|RH FRONT KNUCKLE HUP & BEARING (CONSISTENT)  |DAMAGED 573.00 573.00
1|STEERING RACK ASSY (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 1,027.00 1,027.00
1|RH FRONT WHEEL SENSOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 158.00 -
1|RH LOWER ARM (FRONT) (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 472.00 472.00
2|RH REAR ABSORBER RH/LH @ $278.00 (CONSISTENT)  |0/S DISTORTED / 566.00 278.00
NIS NOT
NECESSARY
2|RH REAR ABSORBER MOUNTING RH/LH @ $149.00 NOT NECESSARY 298.00 -
(CONSISTENT)
1|RH REAR AXLE (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 1,235.00 1,235.00
2|RH REAR KNUCKLE HUP BEARING & SENSOR @ $487.00 |0/S DAMAGED / 974.00 487.00
(CONSISTENT) NIS NOT
NECESSARY
1|AIR PRESSURE SENSOR (O/S REAR) (CONSISTENT)  |DAMAGED 199.00 199,00
1|BRAKE OIL (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 90.00 -
4|WHEEL MUDFLAP @ $59.00 (CONSISTENT) 0/S FRONT/REAR / 236.00 177.00
N/S REAR CUT
LESS 20% DISCOUNT - -9,084.50
53,680.03 36,338.00
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SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
20|FRONT BUMPER. CLIPS @ $5.50 (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 110.00 30.00
10|RH FENDER PROTECTOR CLIPS @ $5.50 (SN} NECESSARY 55.00 20.00
(CONSISTENT)
10|RH FRONT DOOR PROTECTOR CLIPS @ $5.50 (SN) NECESSARY 55.00 20.00
(CONSISTENT)
10|RH DOOR BOARD CLIPS @ $5.50 (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 556.00 20.00
1|RH DOOR INNER SEALANT (SN) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 80.00 20.00
10|RH REAR DOOR BOARD CLIPS @ $5.50 (SN} NECESSARY 55.00 30.00
(CONSISTENT)
10|RH CENTRE LOCAL PANEL CLIPS @ $5.50 (SN} NECESSARY 55.00 20.00
(CONSISTENT)
10|REAR FENDER PROTECTOR CLIPS @ $5.50 (SN) NECESSARY 55.00 20.00
(CONSISTENT)
10|REAR FENDER DUST GARNISH CLIPS @ $5.50 (SN) NECESSARY 55.00 20.00
(CONSISTENT)
4|SPORT RIM (17"} @ $33.00 (SN) (CONSISTENT) OrS FRONT / REAR 1,320.00 660.00
cuT
4|TYRE (215 X 55 X R17) @%355.00 (@ $710.00 80%) (SN) O/S FRONT / REAR 1,420.00 568.00
(CONSISTENT) PUNCTURE
1|SET FRONT NUMEBR PLATE & BOX (SN) (CONSISTENT) |BENT 60.00 45.00
3,375.00 1,473.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING, CHECK SRS, AIR-BAG & ERASE B0O0.00 350.00
FAULT CODING & CODING & CENTRE LOCK WIRING.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT WINDSCREEN & QUARTER 280.00 180.00
GLASS
TO REMOVE & REFIT INTERIOR CARPET GARNISH, 800.00 300.00
ROOF LINING, CUSHION & ALL ACCIDENT AFFECTED
AREA & CLEANING.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT FRONT & REAR UNDER 1,800.00 800.00
CARRIAGE DAMAGE AFFECTED AREA,
TO REMOVE & RENEW SPORT RIM, TYRE & 200.00 80.00
REBALANCING.
TO KNOCKING, WELDING, STRAIGHTENING ALL 3,000.00 2,600.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGE AFFECTED AREA.
TO RESRAY PAINTING ON ALL ACCIDENT AFFECTED 2,400.00 1,200.00
AREA.
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- Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
TO RUST PROOF ALL ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA. 400.00 150.00
TO PRESS WHEEL HUP BEARING. NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
TO ADJUST COMPUTER WHEEL ALIGNMENT & TEST 280.00 80.00
DRIVE.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT AIR-COM CONDENSER & TURBCO 280.00 120.00
COOLER & TOP-UP GAS & OIL
TO REMOVE & REFIT & RENEW DASH BOARD B00.00 180.00
11,340.00 6,740.00

GRAND TOTAL 68,395.03 44,551.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 35,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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