Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2019 8:08 AM

To: 'Charn's Customcraft’; SUR

Subject: RE: Finalization - SKH 9158 Y - Renault Scenic
Sensitivity: Confidential

Dear Rina,

Please refer to OIC Boon Sen.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 7:02 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalization - SKH 9158 Y - Renault Scenic
Importance: High

Sensitivity: Confidential

Hi Veron
We have finalised and had sent all the documents to china Taiping.

We have not heard from them. Can you help

Rina Chua

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns @singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 17 April, 2019 1:18 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Finalization - SKH 9158 Y - Renault Scenic
Sensitivity: Confidential




Dear Sharon,
Noted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April 2019 12:13 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalization - SKH 9158 Y - Renault Scenic

Importance: High

Sensitivity: Confidential

Hi Veron
Confirmed.

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns @singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 16 April, 2019 3:53 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Finalization - SKH 9158 Y - Renault Scenic
Sensitivity: Confidential

Dear Sharon,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

List $2117 (Iess 10%)=$1905.30

Labour $700

Total $2605.30 (Less 20%)=$2084.24
Offer Lump Sum $2050 @ 3 working days.

Please check and confirm.



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 13 April 2019 11:38 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: Finalization - SKH 9158 Y - Renault Scenic

Importance: High

Sensitivity: Confidential

Hi

Kindly find attached for finalization.
Lumpsum @ $2150.00

Please confirm

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns @singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M




