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MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LLTD
BLK 3022A UBI ROAD 1 # 01-61

SINGAPORE 408717
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Tel : €748 4422/ 674 4420 Fax : 6747- 6720 REG NO 200501102H

EQ Insurance Co. Ltd

22 Gemmill Lane TP E 3
Singapore 068257 A ¥
Tel 6223.98433 f
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Rear Bumpar Side Reflecler - LH & ftH »e

{ugt_é

Fear End Pansl

IH& RH

Rear End Panel Tep Garnist
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Reverse Senaor Lo~y

2 RearEnd Panel Sealant z
[
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Rear Camara A1 M-
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To transfer taigats fitings
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Ta knocking & pull cul rear partion & rnew above paris
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 April, 2019 4:27 PM

To: Mel Kwan [LKKAuto)

Cc Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIR1225Z (01 : EQI - DM19HO00796-)G)
AND SLG2876Y (TP : LKK REF - CC6/EQI19005032/ha3) on 19/03/2019

Attachments: SJR1225Z PDF

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan
Attached our insured’s accident report as per your request.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

eqnsuronce

LV T _,?_ * S
EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 65006772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW . eQinsurance.com SE Q::

'l.! & Mdgenber of ity state :ﬂ—-_-——""

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto) [mallto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, April 1, 2019 3:24 PM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: Vic (LEKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIR1225Z (01 : EQI - TBA) AND SLG2876Y (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/EQI19005032/ha3) on 19/03/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Joel,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: SLG 2B76Y
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
* TP estimated cost of repair



Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SLG 2B76Y at M /s Modern Automotive Pte Ltd - Ubi on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair is not ready vet

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action,
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned,

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mel Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)



MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD1 #01- 61

SINGAPORE 408717

GST REG. NO : 200501102H

TEL : 6748 4422 /| 6745 4422 FAX : 67476720

Email: chin@modernautomotive.com.sg

YOUR REF : SJR1225Z
OUR REF :SLG2878Y

Date 04.04 2019

The Claims Manager

EQ Insurance Co. Ltd

5 Maxwell Road #17-00
Tower Block , MND Complex
Singapore 069110

Tel: 6223 - 9433

Fax: 6224 - 3903

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG2876Y & SJR1225Z ON 19.03.2018
ALONG TAMPINES AVE 6 TOWARDS TAMPINES AVE 9

We refer to the above matter.

We have been authorized by our client Mr Koh Chee Kiang to make claim
against your insured vehicle No.SJR1225Z in respect of the above accident

for the following :

Repair Cost
Loss of rental (7 days x $120)
Search fee

Total :

6,206.00 (Incl GST)
B40.00
2.00

@ |ea @

7,048.00

Enclosed herewith a copy each of the supporting documents for your perusal.
Kindly process the above and remit the payment to us asap.

Yours faithfully

Modern Automotive Pte Ltd
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31U AVE 1, 801-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408913 TEL : i065) 62563561 FAX  |065) 62564115

Our Ref: CC6/EQI19005032/Aha3
03 April 2019

CHEONG DE LUN

APT BLK 870 TAMPINES STREET 83
#07-151

SINGAPORE 520870

Dear SirfMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR 12257 AND SLG 2876Y ON 19/03/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or vour authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from SJR 1225Z against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

\

A

CHAN JIA LE
Case Handler
DID: 6749 5792
FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: vicalpehi@|kkauto.com

ce.  EQINSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Moror Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

Date Jﬂ’g"ﬁ e

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear 5ir,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE

ON.. 31210 9. ALONG.. tawmipies Ave § Toderels

....................................................................

....................................................

This letter is to authorize MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD at Block 3023A, Ubi Road 41,
#01-61, Singapore 408717 to resolve the above matter.

In respect of this authorization, MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD has my/our authority to
decide on my/our behalf whether to accept any offer of settlement from the third party
insurers. |/we also agreed that all payments include Loss of Use to make in favour of
MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD.

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD is also authorized to sign all the required documents
include Discharge Voucher from the third party insurers on my/our behalf,

Yours Faithfully

-----------------------------------

Signature of Owner

Kola cliee k:i;mfj He &4 43230.A

------------------ BEE R R AR

Name / NRIC



MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 #01-58/61 SINGAPORE 408717
TEL : 87474422 87454422 FAX  BT4TET20
GST REG. NO : 200501102H

EQ Insurance Company Ltd ;
5 Mexwel Road #17-00 Tower Block Tax Invoice : TP001342
Vehicle Num. : SLG 2876Y
Chassis/Eng# :
Accident Date © 19032019
Claim No. :
Reference .
Policy No. : 5084528393-02
SM  Quantity Particuiar Unit Price Amount 5%
LABOUR
ACCIDENT REPAIR (LUMPSUM) 5,800.00
Labour Total 5% : m
Total S§ : 5,800.00
GST@ 7% S5 406.00
Amount Due S§ 6,206.00

——

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
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REG NO. 53324316E

,%EM&%@&; L #01-61 SINGAPORE 408717  TEL : 6747 4422 FAX : 6747 6720

TEL: 6747 4422 FAX: 6747 68720

No. 0166

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT  oxe. %) 3/19

PARTICULARS OF HIRER
Name : k—(ﬂn Clhee !C'l. G ug

iy
Address ; 4, P"‘-—S'bu R’\.‘E. v 4’

fos—o| S 19439

Tel (O) : (Fax) :
(HP): cféé_._)‘i 612 Email
Contact Parson:

PARTICULARS OF DRIVER / AUTHORISED DRIVER

Name (as in IC) : s Aboye

IfC or Passport No. :

Address :

Nationality :

D/Exp : (¥rs) D/L Na:

D/LType : Local/ International  (please circla)

VEHICLE DETAILS
Vehicle No : SICP :"’_&72 D
Vehicle Type : Tﬂ‘j‘ ey

Vehicle Make ; Prx Lo

Vehicle Model :

Viehicle Colour :

Vehicle Mileage :

RENTAL DETAILS
Start Date and Time Hll'l“ @ 0. co0q\, .
End Date and Time ;qul-ahﬁ

HENTAL CHARGES (% box Fdays =4 34¢00)

—

Daily Charge : 4 1o Depost :

Weekly Charge : -— Adv, Payment :
Monthly Charge Total Charges : # 340 00

*Note : INTEREST OF LATE PAYMENT IS AT 2% PER MTH
THEABOVE RENTALCHARGES INCLUDE SERVICING,
PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE & REPAIR OF THE SAID
VEHICLE UNLESS THE DAMAGES WERE CAUSED
BY OPERATOR'S MEGLIGENCE OR ACCIDENTS

D/L Pass Date : {dd/mmdyy)
Date of Birth (ddimmiyy)
Tel (O) : (Fa) .

(HP): Emall :
Additional Remarks:

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1. Hirer is LIABLE for the first ($) ibtfli excess in any accident
plus cosl of repair to the rented vehicle.

2 Forusage to Malaysia subject to higher excess all claims of $5000/-

and differant rental rate.

3. Driver or autharized driver should ba at least 22 yaars old with minimum

2 yaars of driving axparniance

4. Hirer is tully liable for all damages, losses, fines, summaons and claims

to and against tha vahicle.

5 The vehicla is not 1o be used in any activities which may violats traffic
rule or law, or in any other manner by which the vehicle might becoma
liable to seizure ar confiscation.

. WNo refund will be given for vehicle returms early

No refund will be given lor patrol lell in vehicle,

. Replacament car will ba given, il vahicle Is under repair in workshop
during rental period for more than 1 working day.

8. By signing this agreemeant, tha hirer confirms having read all the tarms

and conditions and acknowiedges that all information given above is
frue to hisher knowledge.

-

1A

Stamp and/or Signature of Hirer

Signature of Driver / Authonised Driver




MODERN SALES & LEASING

BLK 3023A UBIROAD 1 #01-61 SINGAPORE 408717
TEL : 67474422 FAX : 67476720
REG NO, 53324316E

OFFICIAL RECEIPT No. C/00012

Date: 27.03.2019

Received from Koh Chee Kiang the sum of Dollars Eight Hundred & Forty Only

being payment of SKP5898D from 20.03.2019 to 27.03.2018.




Invoice

GENERAL

INSURANCE

ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MAMNAGEMENT CENTRE

Page 2 0of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone +865 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operaling Hours Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Regisiration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-043836
Date of Request 20/03/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Modem Automotive Ple Lid
Bik 3023A Ubi Road 1
#01-61 & #01-58
Singapore 408717
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 20/03/2019
Enguiry By Chin Soi Shong
TP Vehicle No. SJR1225Z
Accident Dale 19/02/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (&%)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.
This is 8 computer generaled document and requires no signature.
For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[%] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Chegue
hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_... 20-Mar-19



‘Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
GE"ERAL 6 Rafiles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

I"SUMNC Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam lo S5pm
[ 17
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE ©ST Regisiration No: M400017738

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-043836

Date of Request 20/0372019 Your Ref Na Online Purchase

Modern Automotive Ple Lid

Blk 30234 Ubi Road 1
#01-61 & #01-58

Singapore 408717

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 20/032019

Enquiry By Chin Soi Shong

TP Vehicle No. SJR12257

Accident Date 19/03/2019

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicie No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SJR1225Z EQ Insurance Company Lid 10/06/2018-09/06/2019 6223 9433
Thank You.

The images provided (o you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or In connection with the reports or their images.

This 1s a computer generated document and requires no signaiure

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_... 20-Mar-19
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Consultants

Company Registration No. 189607 168R

SLUREAVE | #02-25 PAYA LRI INDUSTHIAL PARK. SING AMOIRE JUNYAY TEL : (a5) A2563581 FAX : (065) A2504315

To : M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Date: 17/04/2019

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Viéhicie No SJR1225Z -~ (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DM18HO00786-JG
i .
SLG 2878Y (TP Veh) |Our Ref No.: CC&/EQI19005032/Ahalq2
Date of Accident 19/3/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost ] 6.206.00
Loss of Use - days
Rental (If any) '$ ?ﬂﬂ.ﬂﬂ_ 7 days
Others: 3 2.00
4. -

6,908.00
Final Settlement Sum |- § 6,900.00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks
Pa nt Instruction: Pavee's Breakd

1) |[MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

9 6,900.00

JOANNE LEE
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 188607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8507188-R

Affiliated to Federation internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CCE/EQI2005032/Aha3q2 |
o ToNER B AV
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK . Date: 17-04-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1= Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJR 12252 Veh. Inspected 5LG 2876Y
Policy No. DMPPHQ18-003099 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM19HO00796-JG Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 20/03/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA SHUTTLE C.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. GKB1005908 Colour SILVER
Odometer 77864 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre 185/60 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/80R15 YOKOHAMA B mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 19/03201% Inspection Date 20j03/2019
Survey held at MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1
#01-81
SINGAPORE 408717
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
5b, Eslimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 6 Working Days




¥
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1 74 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 402933
TEL 8256 1581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No. 199607188R GST Reg. No. 16-8607198-R PageNo 10of2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5LG 2876Y
G Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition wumhanﬁL "i:’l
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMFER DISTORTED 1,150,860 1,150.60
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
_2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER -LH & RH NECESSARY 136.00 136.00
- 1|REAR BUMPER TOW COVER MISSING 26.50 28.50
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE GIRLLE -LH & RH /S CUT 110.00 55.00
~ 2|REAR BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR -LH & RH NOT NECESSARY 173.20
1|REAR END PANEL DENTED 801.90 601.90
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH DEFORMED 261.00 261.00
2|TAIL LAMP -LH & RH NOT NECESSARY 1,040.00
< 1|TAILGATE DISTORTED 1,183.70 1,183.70
1|TAILGATE LOCK DAMAGED 181.60 181.60
1|TAILGATE LOCK SENSOR NOT NECESSARY B5.40
1| TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP cuT 168.50 168.50
1| TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD DEFORMED 320.40 320.40
1|SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
2| TAILGATE REFLECTOR -LH & RH 0O/S CRACKED 689,00 344 50
1| TAILGATE QUTER CHROME MODULDING CRACKED 485,00 485,00
1|TAILGATE GLASS MOULDING NECESSARY 138.80 138.80
1|HONDA LOGO NECESSARY 30.10 30.10
1|SHUTTLE WORDING MECESSARY 65.00 65,00
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD -LH & RH O/S DEFORMED §70.00 335,00
" 1|SET REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS MECESSARY 60.00 30,00
1|TOOLS TRAY CRACKED 428.00 428.00
1|JACK COVER DEFORMED 115.80 115,80
1|SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP COVER NOT NECESSARY 299.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST PIPE NOT NECESSARY 745.80
1|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING NOT NECESSARY 26.50 .
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,852 40 -1,225.50
7.409.60 4,002.00
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SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) DAMAGED 280.00 200,00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 60.00
1| TAILGATE GLASS SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 60.00 80.00
1|REAR CAMERA (SN) NOT NECESSARY 480.00
880.00 320.00
LABOUR
TO KNOCKING & PULL CUT REAR PORTION & RENEW 1,200.00 B00.00
ABOVE PARTS
TOPUTTY & SPRAY UP PAINT WORKS. 1,200.00 B0O0.00D/
TO CHECK WIRING 50.00 30.00
TO UNDER SEAL. 150.00 60.00
TO REMOVE UPHOLSTERY . 150.00 BOD.OO
TO REMOVE REVERSE SENSOR 100.00 50.00
TO REMOVE REAR CAMERA 100.00 50.00
TO REMOVE EXHAUST PIPE NOT NECESSARY 150.00
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE FITTINGS 150.00 80.00
TO REMOVE TAILGATE GLASS, 180.00 120.00
g 3,430.00 2,070.00
GRAND TOTAL 11.,718.60 7,202.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,800.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI
Licensed Appralser

DISCLAMWER OF LLABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - This Rogor is made salely lor the uss snd bensilil of tha Clent named on the oo page of this Repor.




Joanne Lee !LKI( Autn!

From: Joanre Lee [LKK Auto) <report@ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 April 2019 3:23 PM

To: Jjanettan@eqinsurance.com.sg’

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJR 1225Z (Ol) and SLG 2876Y (TP) on
19/03/2019

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf. TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT pdf

Dear SirMadam,

Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been seriled.

Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 emall: repori@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933
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