Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 2:50 PM
To: Celina Ng
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 6247R AND SLT 8996B ON 17/03/2019
Tracking: Recipient Delivery
Celina Ng
Admin A
Meikwan@Ikkauto.com Delivered: 24/7/2019 2:50 PM
olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 24/7/2019 2:50 PM
shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 24/7/2019 2:50 PM

Our Ref: CC6/CTI119005010/Uka3
Your Ref: GBE 6247R [Driver: NG SEOW HOON]

HOME WORKZ
[ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 6247R [CTI] AND SLT 8996B ON 17/03/2019

We refer to the above subject matter and your e-mail below.

As per your request, we will inform you upon our surveyor’s vehicle inspection and finalization on repair cost with

the Third party workshop in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Celina Ng <celina.ng@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 July 2019 2:38 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>



Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 6247R AND SLT 8996B ON 17/03/2019

Hi,

Could you please call 81818444 as we tried calling but couldn’t get through.

Thanks and Regards

Home Workz

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@l|kkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, July 18, 2019 12:01
To: CELINA.NG@HOTMAIL.COM

Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 6247R AND SLT 8996B ON 17/03/2019

Our Ref: CC6/CTI119005010/Uka3
Your Ref: GBE 6247R [Driver: NG SEOW HOON]

HOME WORKZ
[ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 6247R [CTI] AND SLT 8996B ON 17/03/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting forChina Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim

against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate

for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us

within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.



Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



