Vic (LKKAuto) —

From: ONG U U <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 15 August, 2019 10:01 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC00/021538 Request For TP Survey For
SKK51B1P : Your Insured: YP6174L LKK REF CC4/LPC19004968/Ehb3 [External
Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Vic

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
B :

Nfw ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 13 August, 2019 10:16 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC00/021538 Request For TP Survey For SKK5181P ; Your
Insured: YP6174L [External Confidential] LKK REF CC4/LPC19004968/Ehb3

Your Ref: 18/19/19/VC00/021538
Our Ref: CC4/LPC19004968/Ehb3

Dear Li LI,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES YP 6174L(01) / SKK 51B1P(TP) / OTHERS ON 18/03/2019

We refer to the subject matter and to the assignment dated 19™ March 2019 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct
Settlement with our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

It was reported that Insured vehicle was involved in a 3 vehicle chain collision and was the last car and rear-ended
TP vehicle.

As such, liability is not to our Insured’s favour.

We propose to offer to TP repairer "VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD" as below:
TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) $ 18,107.81 5 11,128.00
Loss of Rental ($150 x 10 days) S 1,500.00 S 1,350.00 (5150 x 9 days)




GIA Search Fee S 2.00 5 2.00

TOTAL | § 17,60981 — [ $ 12,480.00 =, bl

TP VEHICLE DETAILS:

MARKET VALUE  : $51,000.00 (est)
LTA REBATE : $32,700.00 (est)
NETT VALUE : $18,300.00 (est)

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 7 days
Weekends / Downtime 2 days
TOTAL 9 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

S Suve the Earth: Print only when necassary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended reciplent. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibiled, and may be a violalion of law. If you believe thal you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mall or any altached ltems. Please delete the e-mall and all altachments, Including any copies thaereol, and inform the
sendar that you have deleled the e-mall, all altachments and any copies thereafl. Thank you.

From: ONG LI LI [malilto:llong@lonpac.com)

Sent: Friday, 22 March, 2019 10:24 AM

To: Shu Pel [LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VC00/021538 Request For TP Survey For SKK5181P ; Your Insured: YP6174L [External
Confidential)

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Shu Pei

Please see attached for our Insured’s GIA report.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706



S hing Autoeity
£ 7 10 Sin Ming Drre #3303
n Srgapore 575722
; 5453 2127 (4 linex) £ 8458 1111 (24 hra)
5457 9795/ 6455 D4T3

AUTOMOTIVE GROUP adminBansautogroup.oom g
W INESUEDQrOUR. DO 85

Cur Ref : TPOI20193815

Your Refl - YP&1T4L
I0-Ape-2019

Motar Claim Department
Lonpac Insurance Bhid.
51 Ubi Avenue | 802.25
Paya Ubi Industrial Park
5(408933)

Dewr Sir, Mdm,

Accident Invalving Vehicles SKKSIRLP & ¥PAIT4L
Along  :© ALONG BRADDELL FLYOVER [AFTER TOL)
DOA 1840372019

We nte the suthorized repair workshop Tor the owner of motor vehicle no: SKKS181P, which was involved in the
caphioned aocident with your insured vehicle: YP61 741 The vehicle owner has requested and authorized us o
assisd him in presenting histher clarm against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle

As the sccident was coused by the negligent act of vour insured driving, we are subimitting these elaims for
your consideration on behall of the owner/claimant,

01y Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) $ 1112800
02)  GIA Search fees 5 200
13)  Loes of Rental_Wail For Surveyor 2 days x $150v 5 100,00
04)  Loss of Rental_Sunday | day x $1505 5 150,00
05)  Loss of Rental_7 days x $1500- £ 1.050.00

5 12,630.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims;-

al Letter of Authorisatkon / GIA veport($] / Insurance Certilicate, et
b}  Final Repair Bill
€l GIA search! Car Rental Bill & Invoiee

Kindly look into the marer and e us hear from you on the sestlernent of our customer s claims
i 5DON a8 possible

Flease note that it is o condition of any sertlement reached that it shall he without prejudice to any
personal injury elaim (il any) of the awner/claimant.

Thank you

Yoours faithfully

VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD Please ssue Cheque to: Vin's Motor Pie Lid
Please transfer to: Vin's Motor Pe Lid
LB Current Account
AT No: 451-307-638-4

Vincent'khope

{in

VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD | REGISTRATION & GST NO: 19990460676



ALUTHORISATION TO ACT

I'Ws, TE.\'\ C\'nf Ta!a (the Third sary shimant™ of |12 CasuBvine
Bnql 9(5?1‘50:) iaddress). owner of Q(l( SD‘IP (vehicle no.) hereby

wthorize VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD (*the workshop™) to act for me with respect

@ my claim r repair 2o5ts and or reatal and or oss of use (“claim™ for my vzhiclz no.

S EBI'P that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurrsd on ﬁmﬁ. (date)

along Bmﬂdl E”M( (Mter Tol) (location) involving

sohizl2anos |PE”H:L {“the accidant™

I' further authorize the workshop 1o setzle my above mentionad claim in a manner that

they deem fit and the workshop is further authorizad to eeceive pasyment further to

settlement of my claim with paymeant chequs's being mads in favour of the workshop.

| further scknowledze that any seetlement the workshop may rzach on my bzhalfison a
Without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver owner

insurers of the other vehicle’s is concerned.

Dated this ra'u\ (dav) of ﬂmh Imunth]lﬂﬂ{ycar]

Signed by “the third party claiman:” Signad by ~the workshop™
(with company stamp if applicable) (with company stamp)



I - |
"'UJJ _'_7# ,!{T’rﬂﬂ.'_wu'.{* :? ;JELF.J:}L‘ J
Vic

" LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : IR/19/19/VCO0/ 021538
DATE 15 AUGUST 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

We, TEH CHOR JOO confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or the owner of YP 6174L the sum of Singapore Dollars Twelve Thousand
Four Hundred Eighty Only ($12.480.00) in full and final sansfacuon. liguidauon and
discharge of property claim competent to mefus upon the sad M/is LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by mefus whether now or
hereafter o become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident (o

my vehicle, SKK SI181P on 18 MARCH 2019 along CTE TOWARDS CHANGL

I /We hereby agree to  indemnify and keep indemmify (ECOSYS
INFRASTRUCTURE PTE LTD / LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) agmnst all
claims and any claims whatsoever  made by any person/persans on our behalf in
respect of the sud aceident.

/We further authorize you 1o pay the above settlement sum directly to MJ/S VIN'S
MOTOR PTE LTD.

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all reluted cloims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery aciion

%

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

7,&}1%0’ Jeo. 2%ey 2011

Name of vehicle owner/Dute



S Ming Autoctty,
’ 4 140 5in Ming Drive #03-03
Singapom 575722
HA53 2121 (4 fines] / 6458 1111 (24 bra)
SA5D 9795 ¢ SA5F D433

-

AUTOMOTIVE GROUP pdmindivinsautogroup cam.sg
WA RRELIOGI DU EOIM.8G
Our Ref : TP/032019/3815 Invoice No:  VM20194007
Accident date: 18/03/2019
Your Ref : YPRITAL Dare: 20/04 /2019
Motor Claim Department
Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

51 Ubi Avenue 1 #02-25
Paya Ubi Industrial Fark
S5{408933)

FINAL REPAIR BILL TO

Vehicle No. : SKK5181P
Model : Toyota Harrier 24GL

To supply spare parts

To remove and refix rear glass

To repair front & rear damage

To spray painting

Total amount as agreed at lump sum repair $ 10400.00
Add : 7% GST $ 728.00

$ 11,128.00
VIN'S MOTOR PTE LTD Please issue Cheque fo: Vin's Motor Pue Lid

Flense transfer 1 ¥in's Motor Pre Lid
‘.. [LIOB Current Accorun
ASC MNo: 451-307-638-4




ﬂ:j' LEASING PTE LTD OFFICIAL RECEIPT

. 2
| AutoCity, 160 Sin Ming Drive #03-03, Singapore 575722 No: 0 O J 5 q
3 2121 (4 Lines) Fax: 6459 9795
. No.: 20171743E

Tel Chor  Jay
One Thousand Fire fundved ohup

ad from

n of Dollars

payment of hﬁl’t’-\ Q‘C-C}z.u]r? “813 - ')3)3)

:w!s_l 10|

[S0. OV /6”

RSSO A AR A T DTS



NiN¥=2g | EASING PTE LTD

VM

Sin Ming AutoaCity, 160 Sin Ming Drive #03-03, Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 2121 (4 Lines) Fax: 6459 9785

No: 10436

Co. Reg. No.: 20171743E RENTAL AGREEMENT
Vehicla No. Makea/Maodal quie Pl %03 .2 ﬂi
SK(30| P |7MoTA PREVIA T Self Drive || Private-Hire A0k

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

Name TEW CHoRr Jeo
hadrwes 12 CASUARINA MOAD |
(S) 5719500

Emat ] B =]

Telephorne [Mome)
[l - N
e

[ 1C o Passport No. © ;ﬂﬂ.'}qqll_i

Natenaity S ngaparéan

omwotBeh  |9.0%. 952 4o

Diriwing Lioenca No

[ 2

Oriwing Expanence

CoTMH\TE Eom s
Locajgeh bll.u.ll:lbq:'Tf

FOVL Mo

5 cis
{ 0 _ﬂ-i-r_[;] os i_m | day |500 |0
'E'\'FU:.E oL | e

Memin(y) @5 ! mgnih

Collgion Demage Warvar (CDW)

Maleysia Entry Chages

[#{ T T3]

{ ———

Totab

Sacurty Deposil [Cash/Thegue! |

Grand Todel

1500 [00

Racmlen's Sighature

Dake!

SECURITY DEPOSIT REFUND
Secuny Deposit Refung )

DRIVER'S PARTICULARS

ome - DEXTRE JABEZ TEH WiAN HWEE

Addimes
Email
_lafanhnnl [Hama) - B
:Onut.
me 9035 c0q32 —
NRIC o Fasspan No. - STEO60TEL —
Nesonsity §ngoporeas)
Qe of Bimn [7:02 .1990 Ao -
D_h-;n Licance Mo Hoecp §C  eaie -
Type 3 LocgartT imnund ty Tf =

Diriving Experlance

POVL Ne.

VEHICLE CONDITION CHECK

IWe declars Ml the sbowe parficulars ame irue and cormecl |0 every respect, &n
have cheched the vehicks and affem thal Mese are no ofher delecin (I am
nesides Ihose ligied in tho diagram sbows W hove read and endarEmod T

lenms and conditians of the hire agresment prinied cvareal

Signaturs of Driver
(i diffevent lrom Himer)

ETI:I'FP & Signature of Airar

Recgient's Signature ;_, F = /
e 22 -

Date

Date Cant
Tima Cnd

Milzage &l delvery / ples up

\8-03 .z0(9
\2.36 i

Omein 413@3“‘1
1.2

Tims in

kdiipage on reluming

Fusl resl a1 oneiry | piCk up

Fusl level an reuming

Hir panod exahes on

It unsting, ramisl pericd will be calculated bases an & 24 hr imaframe from B tme of colleciion of vehxia

Surcharge of fusl will be 81 55

por 14tk Thess will e ne rshund lor sicess lual upon relurn ol the vahicis

seraris _ SKKSIZLP




Invaice

| of2

GENERAL

ASSOCIATION

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MT

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE gt Ragiatration No: M40D017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

l“SURAHCE B Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 8224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday Sam to Spm

Our Rel No: GR-18-042377

Date of Request: 18032019 Your Ref No: Cinline Purchase

Vin's Motor Pte Lid

160 Sin Ming Drive, #03-03

Sin Ming AulaCity

Singapore 575722

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 180372018

Enguiry By Raymond Teo Yun Loang

TP Vehicle No, YPE174L

Accident Date 18032019

Enquiry Result

TP Vihicke No Insurer Period of Insurance insurer Tal. No.
YPA174L Lonpac Insurance Bhd 18/M5/2018-18/052018 +B5 62507338
Thank You.

The images provided ko you are laken from the onginal reparts forvarded 1o the centre by Ihe members of the Ganeral Insurance Asscciation
ol Singapore and we ke no responadbilily for Iheir socurecy or conlents and shall be under no lsbilly whatsoever for any ioss or damags

arising oul of or in connection with the repons of thelr images

This is & computar genaraled document and requires no signature.

1870372019, 2:57



" Invoice hitps://singapore merimen.com/claims/index. cfim?fusebox=MT

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

INSURAHCE B Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
ASSOCIATION Phone: +85 8224 D010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-04237T
Dale of Request: 18032018 Your Ref No: Onling Purchase

Vin's Motor Pte Lid
160 Sin Ming Drive, #03-03

Sin Ming AuloCity
Singapore 575722
Dear SitfMadam,
("~ Enauiry Date 18/0372019
Enquiry By Raymond Teo Yun Loong
TP Vehicle No YPB174L
Accident Data 18/032019
Enquiry Result
TF Vehicle No. [rsuner Perniod of Insurance |Irhlurnr Tal. Mo,
YPE174L Lonpac Insurance Bhd 18/05/2018-18/05/2018 |+88 62507388
Thank You

The images provided 1o you are taken from the arginal repans forwarded to ihe canire by the membears of the Genaral Insurancs Assocation
of Singapons and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or confants and shall be under na liability whatsosver for any loss or damags
anzing out of or In connection with the raports or their imagas

This is & compuler generated documenl and reguires no signature

lof2 1810372019, 2:57



