Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, B August 2019 3:30 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT Claim_SG

Subject: RE: SEEK MANDATE - Accident Involving SLG2070E (Ol : LPC - TBA) AND 5HD1169A (TP

: LKK REF - CC3/LPC19004962/K1jb3) on 18.03.2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Khanchna,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
E Y

The all £¥% 3 Jonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised exiernal parties only.

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August, 2019 2:31 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Cc: Admin A

Subject: SEEK MANDATE - Accident Involving SLG2070E (01 : LPC - TBA) AND SHD1169A (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/LPC19004962/K1}b3) on 18.03.2019

Lonpac Ret: 18/19/19/VPO5/02) 537

LEK Ref: CC3/LPC1R004762/K1kb3n2

Dear Sirs.
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 19/3/20192 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd,

Our Insured was turming al the traffic ight junclion and third party was going straight as the iraffic light was
green in his favour as per video [as aHached). We are of the opinion that liability is down against Insured.
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Tracking:

Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Tuesday, 6 August 2019 2:31 PM

'MT_Claim_SG'

Admin A

SEEK MANDATE - Accident Involving SLG2070E (Ol : LPC - TBA) AND SHD1169A (TP :
LKK REF - CC3/LPC19004962/K1)b3) on 18.03.2019

DS SUPPORTING DOCS.pdf: LKK INSPECTION PHOTOS.pdf; LKK Inspection Report.pdf,
LKK RE INSPECTION PHOTOS. pdf; LKK Survey Report.pdf; TP VIDEQ mp4

Recipient Delivery

‘MT_Claim_5G'

Admin A

plivialau@|kkauto.com Delivered: 6/8/2019 2:32 PM

Delivered: 6/8/2019 231 PM
Delivered: 6/8/20192:31 PM

shupei@ikkauto.com

Melkwan @ kkauto.com

Lonpac Ref: 18/19/19/VvP05/021537

LKK Ref: CC3/LPC17004762/K1kb3n2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 19/3/2019 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal. Lanpac Insurance Bhd.

Our Insured was turning at the traffic light junction and third party was going straight as the traffic light was
green in his favour as per video (as attached). We are of the opinion that liability is down against Insured.

summary to offer 1o third party repairer "PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD" s as follows: -

$104.47) [w/GST)

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair {w/GST) $8.144.63 $ 3.438.00
2. Loss of Rental (4 days x $ 418.48 $ 418,48 (4 days x $104.67) [w/G5T)

3. Loss of Income |4 days x $100 p/day) | $ 400.00

$ 140.00 (4 days x $40 p/day)

3. LTAa/ GlA Search Fee

$ 200 $ 200

Total | $ 896531 $4.218.68

**D4days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.



Miojib_mp_ur_qmﬂ

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email; Khanchna@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




e Khaneln

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:62148880 FAX:62141511
CO. REG200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Ref: SHD1169A/S) WITHOUT PREJUDICE
6 May 2019 (By Email Only)
Attn: The Motor Claims Department

Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07
The Concourse

Singapore 1995355
Dear Sir'Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHDII69YA AND SLG20T0E ALONG KHEAM HOCK
/BT TIMAH ROAD ON 18.03.2019

We have been authorized by Premier Taxis Pte Ltd, the owner of Taxi vehicle number:
SHD1169A, to claim against the party/parties responsible for the damages arising from
the above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number: SLG2070E at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle. Mr. GOH CHIEW KOK.

As a result of the accident caused by your Insured Driver's negligent driving and/or
management of your insured’'s Vehicle Number: SLG2070E, our client's vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair (GST included) $ 3.638.00
2) Loss of Rental - 4 Days @ $104.67 per day $ 41868
(3) Loss of Income — 4 Days @ $100.00 per day $ 400,00
(4) GIA Search fee $ 2.00

4.458.68

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
1) GIA report & skeich plan of SHD1169A
2) Driver's I/C and Driving Licence
3) Final Repair bill
4) Vehicle Registration card, Certificate of Insurance, Certification Letter
5) Check In/Out Voucher
6) GlA search

ken



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 20102
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG:200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Ref: SHD1169A/S]

We would appreciate if you could look into the subject matter and let us have your
favorable offer within 14 days. If you are agreeable to the settlement of the above said
claims, please forward us vour discharge voucher as for our client's signature and
payment made to “Premier Automaotive Services Pre Lid”.

Please note that if we do not hear from you within the stipulated 14 days, we will have no
alternative but to appoint our solicitor to act on our behalfto commence proceedings
against vou without further notice to vou.

Yours faithfully,

¥

Claims Department — Foong Shiuh Jve

Email: shiuhjve.foong@premienaxi.com
DID: 654466871
NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email to expedite all matters

PS: Please quote our reference no when replyving

c.¢, Client = Premier Taxis Pte Ltd



WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 This Se:tlement excludes any

The Concotirss bodily injuries ansing out of te
Singapore 199555 above said accident Lad pes:
s AR i U e [t roefim
Attn: The Moto :
Dear Sir/Madam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHDI169A AND SLG2070E ALONG KHEAM HOCK // BT
TIMAH ROAD ON 18.03.2019

We. Premier Taxis Pte Lid. the registered owner of vehicle No: SHD1169A. We. hereby
authorize the said workshop. M/s Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd to execute sign
discharge voucher/Indemnity forms and all necessary documents in connection with and arising
out of the above claim. and collect all compensation monies due to us from you or any other

party, regarding the said accident.

Thank You.

| m .Ia .
g/ s
A Date

Premier Taxis P:c Ltd
Authorized Signatory




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 18/19/19/VP05/021537
DATE 14 AUGUST 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of SLG 2070E the sum of Singapore Dollar Four
Thousand Two Hundred Eighteen and Sixty-Eight Cents Only (54,218 68) in full and
final satisfaction, hqudanon and discharge of all property losses competent 10 me/us
upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter o become manmifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving SLG 2070E and SHD 1169A on 18
March 2019 along Kheam Hock road and Bukit Timah road

I 'We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/ SOO KONG HUA (CHEN ZHUOQ)) aganst all clams and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said acaident.

I'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to PREMIER
AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice 10 all related claims and in respect of our
insured’'s recovery action

& ,-.
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PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

F /1" - OFFICE: 23 Changl South Avenua 2 80102 S{485443
'.-qf,';ll' P R c M l G R TEL a;aaun | B5435E80 FAX 82141511 :
' Y AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES CO REG NO- 2007077430 GST REG NO. 2007077430
TAX INVOICE
PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD DATE B8-May-2018
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02 PAGE 10F 1

SINGAPORE 486443

ITEM Description aTty U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA S 3.400.00
REGN NO: SHD 1169 A
o
TOTAL LUMPSUM REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR $ 3,400.00
GST@7%] § 238.00
GRAND TOTAL] & 3,638.00

%

for Premier Automotive Sarvices Pia Lid

(ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)




PREMIER

TAXIS

27 March 2019

To Whom It May Concern

Dear Sir/Madam

CERTIFICATION LETTER

This letter serves 1o inform that Huang Heng Jie of NRIC Number S0022240B is a
registered driver of SHD1169A. Huang Heng Jie is paying daily rental rate of $104.67
(Inclusive of GST),

Should you require further information, please contact us at 6214 8880,

Thank you.

Yours sincerely

v

Kellie Poh

Administration Manager

Prepared By: Hasnsh

PHEMIER TAXIS PTELTD

13 Chnngd Swuth Avenue 2

#1312

Singapore 486443

Telephone: +5 6214 ¥880 Fax: +65 6214 0330
www.premiertasl.cnm

Co. Reg No, 200304975H
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Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd yr/ ' P R E M l E R
R COUNEIENISE [Tax Invoice WY AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES
Singapore 4864473
GST: 2007077430 ROC: 2007077430
Phome:  (65) 6214 8880 Date Page
Fax: (B5) G214 4458 Aug 22, 2018 1
Involce Number
Sold To: Ship To: V1808013018
Lonpac Insurance BHD Lonpac Insurance BHD
100, Beach Road 100, Beach Road
#15-00 Shaw Tower #19-00 Shaw Tower
Singapore 169702 Singapore 186702
183702 189702
Smgapore Singapora
Shipment | DO No. Order Date Vehicie No. Casa 1D PO Number Terms
SM1808018563 SHD1168A TRME0318/SHD 11884 300
=/ Item Number Description Qty. Unit Price |Total Discount | Total Amount
Shp.
1 | ICGSTY Cost af Repar (subject 1o GST) 000 3.400.00
2 | ICGST2 Loss of Rental (subsect 1o GST) 0.00 301.28
3 | ICGIA GlA Search Fea (subject 1o GST) 0.00 1.87
4 | ICNGST Misc Charges (nol subject to GST) 0.00 160.00
Comments: . Subtotal 3.,953.16
Accident involwng SUG on 187318 Less discount 0.00
1 Total amount 3,853.16
J GST T% 265.52
Authori By: N
Grand total 4,218.68




Invoice Pape 2 0f 2

NE GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GE RA' RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Sin [48580
INSURANCE Ficne 55 5224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday S8am to Spm
GST Registration Mo MADDD1T735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Raf Mot GR-19-042101
Dale of Request: 18/032018 ¥our Ref No: Online Purchase
Premier Aulomothe Servicas Ple Lid
Z3 Changl South Ave 2
#01-02
Slngapore 486443
Dear SirMadam,
Ergquiry Dale 18032019
Enquiry By GARY SHI GUD RONG
TP Vehicla Mo, SLG20T0E
Accidant Date 18032019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT [S5)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 013
Total Amount Dua (GST Inchisive) 2.00
Thank Yoo,

This is a compuler generaled document and requires no signatura.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

htps://www.giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_genin... 18/3/2019



