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Poh Kin (LKKAuto)

From: MG Solution <mg3solution@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 5:14 PM
To: Poh Kin (LKKAuto)
Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: Re: FW: 3rd Party Claim for Accident involving Vehicle GQ5859J & SLN1923P on 

15/03/2019

Categories: clear

Your Ref: CC4/ASM19004944/Afb3 (SLN1923P) 
Our Ref: GQ5859J 
  
Dear Poh Kin, 
  
We refer to below email, we would like to counter propose as per below: 
  
Repair cost               $4815.00 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed 
LOU                           $  800.00 (8 days x $100) - Request: including of 1 PRI: 18/03 & 1 Sunday: 24/03; our 
vehicle belongs Toyota Hiace 3.0cc  
LTA Search                $      7.45 (Inclusive of GST) - Agreed 
Total                         $5622.45 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Su Wong 
MG SOLUTION PTE LTD 
No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre 
#02-03B Singapore 415933 
Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376 
 
 
 
On Tue, Aug 20, 2019 at 4:33 PM Poh Kin (LKKAuto) <pohkin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
SAVE AS TO COSTS 
  
Our Ref:                CC4/ASM19004944/Awb3 
Your Ref:              GQ 5859J 
  
Dear Su, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Towards an amicable settlement and without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we have 
instruction from our principal to offer settlement as below:- 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/gst)          S$    4,815.00  


