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MS@FirstCapital

6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel (65) 6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

MS First Capital Insurance Limited CoReg ho. 195000106C GST Reg, No. M2.0001676-9

Clalms & Motor Underwriiing Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehiclz
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.
Survey Type
Appointed

Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
13-03-2018 Our Ref No.
11-03-2019 Claim Type.
SH6260J Third Party Vehicle.
19 UBI ROAD 4
ELMER ALFONSO
84909666/ 67038691 Fax No.
WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
NA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D18001774MFSH

Third Party

SJDE58M

68467488

68416315

Please submiit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

AUTOLUTION FI——
INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD —
NA TP Solicitor Fax No.

MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

MsaAD [HCE




" Veron Chenﬂ.KKAuto)

e — e e —————
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 25 March 2019 3:29 PM
To: 'CWS Motor Claims'
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin’; SUR
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001774MFSH/1, SJD 658M
Attachments: SJD 658M PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SID 658M
Date of survey: 22/3/2019
Number of days : 5 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 March 2019 11:34 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001774MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.
G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 19 March 2019 8:08 AM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM




Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hui Chin

* <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001774MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
K WWWw.avg.com



Auto
‘{ U C:nsuﬂants
=

= Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R

51 UBI AVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX :1065) 62564315

Your ref: D19001774MFSH
Our ref: CS/FCI19004930/Uvd3 DATE: 25/3/2019
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SJD 658M

We thank for your instruction on 19/3/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
vehicle on 22/3/2019  at the premises of M/s AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD

Workshop Estimate Amount : $$6,647.74
Revised Estimate Amount : §§2,285.76
"Check" Items Amount :8§82,365.80
Market Value : 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%
Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
o/s rear portion. The undercarriage

affected due to collision.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



R192217019 PARFICOF Rehate Fnoning

"> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID: 2553H

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SJD658M

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 22 Mar 2019
Vehicle Make: NISSAN

Vehicle Model: SYLPHY 1.5 4AT
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2007

Engine No.: HR15258600A
Chassis No.: _ JN1BAAG11Z0106138
Maximum Power Qutput: 80.0 kW (107 bhp)
Open Market Value: $16,970.00
Original Registration Date: 10 Mar 2008

First Registration Date: 10 Mar 2008
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $18,667.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 30 Nov 2027

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10

PQP Paid: $41,994.00

COE Rebate Amount: $36,488.00

Total Rebate Amount: $36,488.00

Singapore NRIC

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Mar 2019

OK

s:wn.|1a.g|:w.sgrua.wruactlun.fanqu|rer<enateuyi-'un||cueroreusreglnput (FUNG TIUN_IUSFUSU4UUY | I



3/22/2019 Used Nissan Sylphy Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

scCAaARMART.COM Login ¢

.
.

New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles F

= 2020 8th Generation Hyundai Sonata
= 2019 All new Mazda 3 ?
» Why did you chose you current HDB flat ?

Post an Advertisement New 5 Years Renewal Coe Toyota Wish 1,8A rr((* A
Sell it yourselfl Advertise It at just ! |

QRGLD A [ Ay Tt i
2.88%PF. A Low Interesti@Gy

L Ho Bee Group
58 untll It'S S L ! Finance.2 Years Warrani
$ o D 2500 Down .'-"-!:12|1|§ From $648 ‘ one Slop Ca
GV Credit Pte Ltd St i [ Finance, Insurance
Post an Ad Advertiser Login Ways of Selling | New and Used Can
|
Browse by Category ¥ | [ Sort by Date Posted
) r— —]
4 vehicles |Nissan Sylphy ) - | ]
Make Model Price Depreciation Req Dat Eng Cap . Mileage v
Nissan Sylphy Any Any > 10°y|§ar(s) Any Any
Nissan Sylphy 1.5A (New 5-yr  $26,800 $5,350 /yr 26-Feb-2009 1,498 cc =

COE)

Cheapest In Market. Upfront $2130 To Driveway, Monthly $630 Only. Comfortable Family Sedan. Insurance Can Be Paid By Installment.
Call Us For Viewing Today!

Allmotoring.sg
Pasted: 12-Mar-2019 ;?S%sarl 2009 Nissan Sylphy, 2009 nissan sylphy, Nissan Sylphy, nissan sylphy, Nissan, Sylphy, sylphy, Used
Nissan Sylphy 1.5A (New 5-yr $28,800 5,750 Jyr 13-Feb-2009 1,498 cc -
COE)

Affordable Monthly From $700 Only! Warranty Packages Avallable! Excellent Condition, Extremely Well Maintained By Previous Owner! B
House Loan Available! Call To Enquire, View To Beligve!

Posted: 04-Mar-2019 L?S%:n 2009 Nissan Sylphy, 2009 nissan sylphy, Nissan Sylphy, nissan sylphy, Nissan, Sylphy, sylphy, Used

Nissan Sylphy 1.5A (New 5-yr  $28,800 $5,750 /yr 13-Feb-2009 1,498 cc 86,517 km
COE)

Too Good To Be Scrap, Overall Condition Still Looks New. Leather And Paintwork Looks

Tags: 2009 Nissan Sylphy, 2009 nissan sylphy, Nissan Sylphy, nissan sylphy, Nissan, Sylphy, sylphy, Used

Posted: 13-Feb-2019 Nissan

Nissan Sylphy 1.5A (New 5-yr $26,800 $5,350 fyr 2B-Nov-2008 1,498 cc -
COE)

$400 Plus Low Monthly. Selling Cheap! 1 Owner Only, Hurry! View Now. Up To 90% Flexible Loan. We Provide Lowest Interest Rate. Fle
High Trade In Are Available. Package With Unrivaled War...

Classic Credit Pte Ltd
Posted: 29-]Jan-2019

Tags: 2008 Nissan Sylphy, 2008 nissan sylphy, Nissan Sylphy, nissan sylphy, Nissan, Sylphy, sylphy, Used
Nissan

Save this search criteria, to get email alerts whenever a match is found.

Mtk Maodel Price Depreciation  ~  fteg Dats _ EngCap Mileage v

For old ad ‘ed ads

Compare

https:!Mww‘sgcarmart.coWussd_cars!lIsting.php?MOD=lesan+Syfphy&PRC=O&DEP=0&RGD=10&VEH=D&AVL=2 1/2



MBHH18033510-01 / Ajax Mars Pte Ltd - Bukit Marah
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 12/03/2018 23:32
SUBMITTED BY: Victor Ang

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver,

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies o
repudiate policy liability -

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies s not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapare (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers. you hereby consent to the archiving of this report al the centre and lo copies of the report being made available
aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 12/03/2019 23:32

Date Of Accident 11/03/2019 19:10

Exact Location Of Accident ALONG TANAH MERAH BESAR ROAD
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number SJD658M
Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner LOW WEI TECK

NRIC No S7612553H

Email Address OFFICIATE2@GMAIL.COM
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-98009780
Alternative Phone No OFFICE-98009780

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer NISSAN

Model SYLPHY 1.5 4AT

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at

time of accident PRIVATE

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle? NO

If No, Please slate action to be taken THIRD PARTY
Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company AVIVALTD

Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE
Fleet Policy NO

Policy Number 10571103

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver LOW WEI TECK
NRIC No S§7612553H
Date Of Birth 11/05/1976
Occupation INDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 18/04/1998

Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number
Fax Number
Contact Number
EMail Address

20 YEARS AND 10 MONTHS

MALE

(LOCAL) +65-98009780

OFFICE-98009780

OFFICIATE2@GMAIL.COM



Address NIL
Postcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured OWNER
Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -
Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle .
General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident SIDE SWIPE
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY
Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| hgvg been appmached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police? NO

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes,against whom?
Circumstances of Accident

My car travelling along Tanah Merah Besar Road approaching a cross junction (show red light). As my car was done passing the
entrance/exit of Upper Changi firepost, suddenly a Comfort taxi bearing registration SH6260J accelerate out and continue to
surge forward (turning right into my lane). This resulted his taxi hit my diver side rear wheel causing damages and its flying debris
cause dents and scratches at my driver side door during the loud impact moment. The taxi driver obviously was at fault and
repeated his apologies to me. | quoted that the taxi driver said to me this: "Although | am turning right (into my travelling lane) but
| was looking to the left side (away from his turning direction). Taxi driver told me he has no money to pay me, but | rebutted him |
will claim his insurance instead and he cannot escape your responsibility of liability as taxi driver caused this accident in the first
place due to lack of road awareness and his negligence to drive safety. After exchanging personal particulars, we parted-off with
the taxi driver saying sorry to me again as he has a job waiting to be fulfilled. My rear wheel now makes wired noise due its
alignment has run out permanently due to the direct impact at my rear wheel. Both parties are fine without any injuries. My
footage shown taxi was signaled to do a left turn but turned right instead (please see footage carefully). Whole accident is
witnessed by the SCDF Red Rhino bearing registration number GBF2462G at the time.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Remarks/ Reasons: WILL UPLOADED INTO FILEZILLA
Was there any audio recorded? NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number SH6260J

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour HYUNDAI COMFORT TAXI BLUE
Details Of Properties NA

Vehicle Category TAXI

Name of Driver CHAN KWOK FAl

NRIC/Passport Number 511880412

Page 2 of 27



Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

84981725

Page 3 of 27



Sketch Plan
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EMAIL ATTACHMENT

Sabitra

From: Low Wei Teck <officiate2 @gmail com >

Sent: Wednesday, 13 March. 2019 133 AM

To: Sabitra

Cc group@®ajaxmars.com

Subject: Re: GlA Report - SIDO658M

Attachments: IMG_20190311 191758 1 jpg; IMG_20190311_191840 jpg IMG_20190311_
192631 jpg; IMG 20190311 192620 jpg

Hi Ms Sabitra,
[ will addon this inside my report.

My car travelling along Tanah Merah Besar Road approaching a cross junction (show red light). As my car
was done passing the entrance/exit of Upper Changi firepost, suddenly a Comfort taxi bearing registration
SH6260) accelerate out and continue to surge forward (turning right into my lane). This resulted his taxi hit
my diver side rear wheel causing damages and its flying debris cause dents and scratches at my driver side
door during the loud impact moment. The taxi driver cbviously was at fault and repeated his apologies to
me. | quoted that the taxi driver said to me this: "Although | am turning right (into my travelling lane) but |
was looking to the left side (away from his turning direction). Taxi driver told me he has no money to pay
me, but | rebutted him | will claim his insurance instead and he cannot escape your responsibility of
liability as taxi driver caused this accident in the first place due to lack of road awareness and his
negligence to drive safety. After exchanging personal particulars, we parted-off with the taxi driver saying
sorry to me again as he has a job waiting to be fulfilled. My rear wheel now makes wired noise due its
alignment has run out permanently due to the direct impact at my rear wheel, Both parties are fine
without any injuries. My footage shown taxi was signaled to do a left turn but turned right instead (please
see footage carefully). Whole accident is witnessed by the SCDF Red Rhino bearing registration number
GBF2462G at the time

6 photos. | will send the footage via WhatsApp. THank you.
Regards, Mr Low.

On Tue. 12 Mar 2019 at 23:44, Sabitra <sabitra@ ajaxmars com> wrole:

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please send us a copy of the video footage from your car camera so we can submit to the insurance
company

Please find attached file, the GIA Accident Report for your perusal.

Page 6 of 27



at

Common Statement

ACCIDENT STATEMENT (2000 characters)

| was driving moderately straight on a one way lane , suddenly | felt an impact from my
right side of my vehicle. | stop and realised that a blue taxi from the side road turning
into my lane and hit the rear part of my vehicle.

We exchange particulars.

No injury involved.

| have video of the incident recorded in my in car cam.

| will be adding more to this statement through email.

Taxi Voucher No..

DECLARATION

1/'We declare that the above particulars & information provided above are lrue in every aspect

\Bjuw

VERIFIED BY AJAX MARS REPORTING OFFICER -
MOHAMMAD AZALY BIN ABOULLAH

MARS Officer
Rogisterag Ownet or Dnives's Signature
Job Complete Date/Time Date/Time
12 March 2019 at 641 PM 12 March 2019 a1 6.41 PM

Page 5 of 27



i 1O INDUSTRIAL PTE |
‘ 1% W8 ROAD. AL PTE v
SINGAPORE 408623
TEL 3460 3“‘" E',‘:‘:VI_ c":_;e -
AUTOLUTION INOUSTRIAL FTE. LTD.

ESTIMATE + ACCTDENT/BODY REPAIRS
REFERENCE + INS/IC/EA/D1B6/19
ATE : 12-MaR-2019

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
35 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSE

S(068877)

TEL : 65073848

FAX ¢

ATTH:MOTOR CLAIM DEPT @4/
ot Pt

OWNER'S NAME & MR LOW WET TECK 7/3 (?
ADORESS : BLK 104 TANAH MERAH BESAR ROAD 7

:::;;m ¢[;{,¢_/’hﬁ4&/ﬂfﬁ'q{‘j
&

TELEPHONE MO : 9B009780/65463977

TYFE OF CLAIM  : DIRECT SETTLEMENT / THIRD PARTY CLAIM

POLICY WO + 10571103

VEHICLE NO + SJD658M

MOCEL CODE + BOUARCAGLIEHY---~-

MODEL / YEAR + SYLPHY 1.5 4A/T SEDAN (MC)
ENGIRE NG + HR152586004

CHASSIS NO : JNIBAAGIIZO106138

MILEAGE : 120036 KM

DATE IN + 12/03/201%

LIABILITY ? 0.0a

EMCESS CLAUSE - 0.00

ESTIMATE BY  : ELMER = q(a‘/ < 003{/ .Q’,M o -’aylcccw‘t? L Cdom

ACCIDENT DATE = 11/03/2019



.
<

AUTOLUTION !NDUSTRIAL PTE. LTD.

.

ISTIMATED LABOUR CHARGES FOR ACCIDENT VEHICLE REGN NO SJD6SBM

2 12/002

3 22/004

4 27/005

5 12/008

6 221063

7 iine

NATURE OF JOB

LABOR CHARGES TO REPAIR RR BUMPER.RR RH FENDER
OUTER PANEL,B0TH RH DOOR & RH SIDE SKIRTING

CHARGES TD SPRAY PAINTING SAME

ESTIMATED SURVEY(R'S
CHARGES ~ RECOMMENDATION

2340.00

1500.00

REMOVE AND TRANSFER BOTH RH DOOR MECHANISM A 80.00

REMOVE AND INSTALL REVERSE SENSDR A1

REMOVE AND INSTALL 24 AR UNDER CARRIAGE REPLALE
PARTS IF NECISSARY

RENEW PR Rr WHZEL RIM.TYRE AND BALANCING

PERTORM & WrlEEL ALIGNMENT

TGTAL LABOUR CHARGES

55.00

240.00

15.00

4325.00

/{70

/00 O
s ¢
b 4

e
L



& f
AUTOLUTION INOUSTRIAL PTE. LTO

MATERIAL LIST FOR ACCIDENT VEHICLE REGN MO SJDBSEM

S/NOD PARTE DESCRIPTION
R ————
2 SPRING-REAR SUSPENSION RH RR
3 AR RH SPRING UPPER PUBBER SEAT
4 SUNDRIES
5 BH PR SUSPENSION ARM BRACKET
5 COVER BOUND ELMPER R/R SHOCK ARSOREER
7 TUBE DISTANCE SHOCK ABSORBER € SG0 74.90 EACH
8 BUSHING-REAR SHOCK ABSORBER & SG0% 15.40 EACH
9 WASHER SPECIAL SHOCK ABSORBER & 56D $2.90 EACH
10 SHOCK ABSORBER BUMPER ASSY BOUND
11 RH RR SHOCK ABSORBER
12 AR SUSPENSION BEAM
13 8H RE WHEEL HUB
14 B2 RH DO0R CHROME MOULDING
IS FHT FH DOOH CHROME MOULDING
16 CAP-GAS FILLER
I7 CLIP AR BUMPER @ SGD § 1.20 EACH

18 RH SIDE BRACKET RR BUMPER

SUB TOTAL

PERTS NUMBER

DAMAGED PARTS & PRICES

NETT LIST S/NETT REMARKS

55032-AX003

55020-E3004

55034 - AX0T1

New

55429-EDOD0

55248-30000

55323-A1000

S6217-AXC00

56113-AXC00

55240-3U000

£6210-EW00C

55501-ED000

4320220000

8Z870-EW04

BOET0-EW00A

76830-EW000

01553-10501

85226-EW000

LESS DISCOUNT (NETT-20.00%, LIST-30.00%, S/NETT-.00%)

GRAND TOTAL

OVERALL TOTAL

LEGENG: REMARKS( OK ) = APPROVED, REMARKS( ¥ ) = NOT AFPROVED

4 1w X

195.50 7

.

A A 19.30 .)‘5

0.0
w20 "2
oS
A 1 11.10
2
149.80 °
30.80
5,80
ﬁ
86.40
123.00 2
o360 1
7
363.50
6740 7
a4 mn X
Aa B 34
A 1w
.60 2
295.30 0.00  2086.50

59.06 0.00 0.00

236.2¢ 0.00  2086.50



. * AUTOLUTION [NOUSTRIAL PTE. LTO,

SUMMARY OF ESTIMATE FOR VEHICLE REGN NO SJDESAM

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 437500
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES 23z2.74
GRAND TOTAL 664774

* A1) cherges do? not inciuds GST.

SURVEYOR'S PARTICULARS
HAME :
SURVEYED DATE 3
AUTHORIZED DATE
EXCESS CLAUSE
LIABILITY
REMARKS

0.00
0.00

s ws es

PLS NOTE : This estimate i based on visual inspection of the
affected vehicle, Should we require further labour
charges & spare parts in the process of repsirs, we
shall inform you sccordingly.
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Code: FCI2
il Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 6260J Veh. Inspected SJD 658M
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19001774MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MAY CHUA Assign Date 19/03/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN SYLPHY (A) c.c 1498
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. JN1BAAG11Z0106138 Colour BLUE
Odometer 120313 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
& Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[195/65R15 RADAR 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 RADAR 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 RADAR 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |[195/65R15 RADAR 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTION.THE UNDERCARRIAGE AFFECTED
DUE TO COLLISION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  11/03/2019 Inspection Date 22/03/2019
Survey held at AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD
19 UBI ROAD 4
SINGAPORE 408623
5a. Remarks
A)THE VEHICLE HAS NOT SEND IN FOR REPAIRS.
B)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
C)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
D)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJD 658M
Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rkshop?sy)) (SI)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RR RH DOOR CHROME MOULDING (N) * CHECK 67.40 -
1|FRT RH DOOR CHROME MOULDING (N) NOT NECESSARY 102.10 -
1|CAP-GAS FILLER (N) NOT NECESSARY 82.00 -
6|CLIP RR BUMPER @%$1.20 (N) NECESSARY 7.20 7.20
1|RH SIDE BRACKET RR BUMPER (N) * CHECK 36.60 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -59.06 -1.44
236.24 5.76
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|RH RR LOWER SPRING RUBBER SEAT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 13.30 -
1|SPRING-REAR SUSPENSION RH RR (SN) * CHECK 195.50 -
1|RR RH SPRING UPPER RUBBER SEAT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 19.50 -
1|SUNDRIES (SN) * CHECK 50.00 -
1|RH RR SUSPENSION ARM BRACKET (SN) * CHECK 74.20 -
1|COVER BOUND BUMPER R/R SHOCK ABSORBER (SN)  [NOT NECESSARY 11.10 -
2|TUBE DISTANCE SHOCK ABSORBER @$74.90 (SN) * CHECK 149.80 -
2|BUSHING-REAR SHOCK ABSORBER @$15.40 (SN) * CHECK 30.80 -
2|WASHER SPECIAL SHOCK ABSORBER @$2.90 (SN) * CHECK 5.80 -
1|SHOCK ABSORBER BUMPER ASSY BOUND (SN) * CHECK 86.40 -
1|RH RR SHOCK ABSORBER (SN) * CHECK 123.00 -
1|RR SUSPENSION BEAM (SN) * CHECK 963.60 -
1|RH RR WHEEL HUB (SN) * CHECK 363.50 -
2,086.50 -
LABOUR
LABOR CHARGES TO REPAIR RR BUMPER, RR RH 2,340.00 1,170.00
FENDER OUTER PANEL, BOTH RH DOOR & RH SIDE
SKIRTING.
CHARGES TO SPRAY PAINTING SAME. 1,500.00 1,000.00
REMOVE AND TRANSFER BOTH RH DOOR MECHANISM. |NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
REMOVE AND INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR. NOT NECESSARY 55.00 -
REMOVE AND INSTALL RH RR UNDER CARRIAGE, * CHECK 240.00 -
REPLACE PARTS IF NECESSARY.

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19004930/Uvd3e2
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Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
o/ P Workshop ($)| __ (5)
RENEW RR RH WHEEL RIM, TYRE AND BALANCING. 15.00 15.00
PERFORM 4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 95.00 95.00
4,325.00 2,280.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,647.74 2,285.76
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 2,285.76

(REPAIR COST NOT CONCLUDE)
(EXCLUDE CHECK ITEMS $$2,365.80 NETT)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19004930/Uvd3e2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser




