Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 5:22 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto); Admin A

Cc Elaine Cheong; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Chee So Chow

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SDZ218E (Ol

SNM19D201208C02/8 ) and SIN2156D (TP) on 18.03.2019

LKK ref : CC6/CTI19004894/Kka3q2
CTI ref : SNM19D201208C02/8 (SDZ218E)

Dear Khanchna
We refer to your email pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 56,197.45.

We await your payment advice to enable Elaine to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsq/ | WeChat: A F#iii Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mall and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipiant,
please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Thursday, 4 July, 2019 4:34 PM

To: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com=>; khanchna@lkkauto.com; Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: FW: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SDZ218E (OI: SNM19D201208C02/8 ) and
SIN2156D (TP) on 18.03.2019

Dear Elaine,

Fya

Thank you

Lim Shu Min
Executive



Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
DID: (65) 63896156 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www .sg cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: AF i Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and
any copies of it thereafter.

From: Khanchna [LKK Auto) [mailto:khanchna®@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, July 04, 2019 4:27 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Ce: Admin A; Alfred Toh

Subject; RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 5DZ218E (Ol: SNM19D201208C02/8 ) and
SIN2156D (TP) on 18.03.2019

Your ref : SNM19D201208C02/8 (5SDZ218E)
Our ref : CC6/CTI19004894/Kka3q2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a 3 vehicle chain collision, our Insured vehicle is last. We are of the opinion that BOLA scenario 28 is applicable for
this matter. Liability is not in our insured’s favour, We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware
that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD " at & 6,197.45 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with G5T) S 7,499.19 S 5,350.00
2. Loss of Rent (6 days x $140) S B40.00 $  840.00 (6days x 5140)
3. LTA Search Fee 5 7.45 5 7.45
Total S 8,346.64 % 6,197.45

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



DID: EE#I}I&EHI email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
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{ WITHOUT PREJUDICE )

Attention To : MR VIC ALPEH

il A

K ) 2]

T

l LIM TAN

Your Ref: CCE/CTI19004894/Kha3

Our ref: LTP032019/025 (SJN 2156 D)

(From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)
Insurance Company : CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

Dear SiriMdm,

IN THE MATTER OF ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN2156D & SDZ218E ON 18.03.2019

We refer to the above matter.

We are instructed and autherised by our client to quantify, to act and negotiate settliement
In related to the above road traffic accident that was caused by your insured.

All supporting documents are enclosed herewlth:-
[ x ] Original Tax Invoice no. INV40100

[ x ] Authorization To Act

[ x ] Original Rental Receipt and Agresment

[ ] Letter Of Discharge

[ % ] LTA search receipt

[ ]

Survey was done by Insurance instruction and was surveyed by Mr Kenneth

on 27-Mar-19
e e .

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and has been put to loss and

Expenses, particulars of which are as follows:-

1] Cost of repair (inclusive of 7% GST)

2] Vehicle Rental
3] LTA Search
Total

5,350.00
840.00

7.45

$
$
$
5

6,197.45

Please acknowledge receipt of this letter within 14 days. If you agreeable to the above, please forward
your payment. Payment to be issued directly to LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD within 4 weeks. Should thare
settlam

ny injury rel to this m
claim.

Your faithfully
Mandy Lim
Email: mandy@itm.sq

{2

Tel 65-64520893 |
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31 UBTAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI19004894/Kha3
12 April 2019

GOH SIANG LENG
152M EAST COAST RD
SINGAPORE 428863

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDZ218E / SJN2156D / OTHERS ON 18/03/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

i

Khanchna

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
fMotor Claims Dept)



To Whom It May Concern

AUTHORIZATIONTO ACT

I'We, NICK ANG ZHAN CHENG ('the third party Claimant’) of BLK 45 STIRLING
ROAD #02-466 SINGAPORE 140045 (Address) owner of SIN2156D (vehicle number)
hereby authorize LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD ('the workshop') to act for me with

respect to my/our claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or Loss of use ('claim') for
my/our vehicle number SIN2156D that was damaged pursuant to the accident which
occurred on 18-Mar-19 (date) along KOON SENG ROAD (locate on) involving vehicle
number SDZ218E (the accident').

I/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim
in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in

favour of the workshop.

Dated this 18" (day) of March (month) 2019 (year)

Signed By ' the third party claimant ' Signed By ' the workshop® ©



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Policy Mo : DMPCSM1429831904 Claim Mo 3 SMM1SDEN1Z08COZ/8
Claimant : NICK ANG ZHAN CHENG

Amount :  B886,197.45
STNGAPCRE DOLLARS EIX THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED NINETY=-SEVEN &
FORTY FIVE CENTS Only

I/We agree to accept the above mentioneéd amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injurie=z / damages
Sustained by me/us through an acecident involving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SJW 2158
Insured Vehicle Mo, @ SDE Z148®

Date of Loss : 18/03/2019
Place of Accident : KOON SENG RCAD

IN COMSIDERATION of the payment made o me/us &f the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.. I/iie agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Mame : GOH SIANG LENG
ODriver Name t TING TUAN EE

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising cut of the said acecident,

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE {SINGAEQORE) PTE. LTD.

(1] Global Sum 85 6,197 .45
POIDAL 2 % % & 5 8% & % 5 HOE NS S By L9745
Claimant tame : NICK ANG ZHAN CHENG neic we : S9005507J

Signature B Date

Provide always that this discharge of my claim
for damages relating to the damage to my
vehicle shall not prejudice or affect or
preclude me ffom making o [urther claim for
general and special damages for my personal
injuries sustained in the same accident




T LIM TAN

LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD
HREBLAFRLA

Company's Registration Mo 1993072770
G5 T Regestration Mo, M2 200 19086-0

Branch Main OMfice ' Waorkshop
{Warmanty and Performance) BIk 9 Sector O #0]-38/40/42 Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #03-00/10/06
Sin Ming Industrial Estate, Singapore 575644 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721

Tel: +65 6452 2135 Fax: +65 6452 2159
Tel: +65 6452 0893 (24Hrs)
Fax: +65 6458 9127

Blk 17 Sector A #01-65 Email: sales@l TM.sg

Sin Ming Industrial Estate, Singapore 575673

WWW.LTM.SG
NICK ANG ZHAN CHENG TAX INVOICE
BLK 45 STIRLING ROAD
#02-466 NO o INV40100
SINGAPORE 140045
DATE Do03-05-2019
ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT MILEAGE :
TEL . WO NO. SOL0ERS TERMS o CoOD
FAX CAR NO. : SIN2156D
AICNO.  I0A0/06 MAKE - TOYOTA PAGE C
MODEL : WISH
== DESCRIPTION _ [:"l'_":r LU.PRICE DIS AMOUNT
' TOLUMP SUM REPAIR AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR I UNIT 5,000.00
E i
SINGAPORE DOLLARS : FIVE THOUSAND THREE HUNDRED AND FIFTY ONI Y
REMARKS: DOA - 18032019 "1'0'EQTY:" LU0 | SUBTOTAL 5,000 DL‘T
LKK REF - CC6/CTI19004894/Khal P
DISCOUNT 0.00
TOTAL 3,000.00
\ GST 7% 350.00
~ ] Z NET 5,350.00
) /1. Deposit 0.00
Balance 5,350.00

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE(SY

CUSTOMER NAME / SIGNATURE / DATE |

I'We confirm that I'We incurred the repair costs herein and will observe my/our Agreement with the repairer, 'We
declare the repair for the above vehicle have been completed to my/our satisfaction



L ]
Family Car Rental Pte Ltd
Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #03-06 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721
Tel: 65-64515120 Fax: 65-64531642
Company's Registration No, 200703924M

Y

RENTAL

Rental Agreement No: 5751

HIRER'S MAME VEHIELE NO Sp sy P
itk ﬂng 2o, Cong pepiatke it Toyotes  Axid
wr =
ADDRESS HOME oareowr . g3 9910 |tmeour Q. L5amm
B bg a'ridina ve) OFFICE ;
i DATE IN TIME IN
#01- ke wosLe: YL L AL | 0J bl 2oy )« 2o Pm
Em lonlsS MILEAGE OUT FLIEL OUT
HATIOMALITY a”ﬁm mﬁ 9 HEoR MILEAGE IN FUEL I
NRIC { PASSPORT NO | DATE OF BIRTH PLACE OF ISSUE FERAL M
. . | -
S WEo1 1k 02-B Qinopare b owe @ s LY 8l0
DRIVING LICENCE NO | LICENCE LOCALINTL TYPE | CLASS
BAR CODE NO 8 1A 9 WEEK(S) a8
-
S 00055073 OIRQCLE  Locer | 2 «dp MONTHS) @ ss
s NAME TOTAL CHARGES Sug W
fils} ]"-'PE'F DEPOSIT  (CashiCheque Ne.)
ADDRESS HOME - i
DFFICE - —_— ——m —
MOBILE - EXTENSION DTE | TIME
DATE | TIME
NATIONALITY ol AMOUNT DEPOSIT (REFUNDABLE)
NRIC | PASSPORT NO | DATE OF BIRTH PLACE OF ISSUE T BTN
REMARK *HIRER MUST ENSURE ALL DRIVER/S HAVE VALID SINGAPORE DRIVING LICENCE
IN ORDER TO OPERATE THE VEHICLE
DRIVING LICENCE NO | LICENCE LOCALINTL TYPE / CLASS
BAR CODE NO

VEHICLE IS STRICTLY FOR SINGAPORE USE ONLY AND MAY NOT BE DRIVEN OUT OF SINGAPORE

NOTE:

1. HIRER I3 SOLELY LIABLE FOR ALL TRAFFIC VIOLATIONS AND ALL PARKING FINES OR SURCHARGE DURING PERIOD OF HIRE,
2 DRIVING EXPERIENCE SHOULD BE OVER [ﬂ- YEARS AND AGE OVER m— YEARS OLD.
3. FLEASE NOTIFY OUR OFFICE AS SOON AS POSSIBLE WHEN THIS VEHIGLE IS INVOLVED IN ANY ACCIDENT.

4 HRER 15 LIaBLE T0 PaY FIRST 881000 - Excess FoR COLLISION  DAMAGE T0 FIRST PARTY fie FAMILY CAR RENTAL PTE LD VEHICLE AND ALSO FIRST

53 Lml; EXCESS FOR COLLISION { DAMAGE TO THIRD PARTY'S VEHICLE FOR EACH AND EVERY ACCIDENT / DAMAGE PLUS LOSS OF EARNINGS WHILE

DAMAGED VEHICLE 1S UNDER REPAIR.

SPECIAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS *HIRER IS LIABLE FOR ADDITIONAL EXCESSOFS__" __ FOR FIRST PARTY
ANDS___~  __ FOR THIRD PARTY'S COLLISION/DAMAGE IF DRIVER HAVE
LESSTHAN__—  YEARS DRIVING EXPERIENCE; AND/OR AGE
YEARS OLD AND BELOW,; AND/OR __—  YEARS OLD AND ABOVE

IAWE DECLARE THAT THE ABOVE PARTICULARS ARE TRUE AND CORRECT I EVERY RESPECT. IWE HAVE READ AND AGREED TO THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS BOTH ON SIDE OF THIS RENTAL AGREEMENT.
MYIOUR DRIVING LICENGCE ISARE CURRENT AND NOT DISQUALIFIED FROM DRIVING.

o
X X
SIGNATURE OF HIRER SIGNATURE OF DRIVER
(COMPANY CHOP IF APPLECABLE} (IF DIFFERENT FROM HIRER)

e 27 MAR 2019 o



> Back to OneMotoring

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration MNo. : M4-0006529-2
Print Date/Time : 18 Mar 2019 / 16:26:35
Receipt Date/Time : 18 Mar 2019 / 16:26:35

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt Mo, : ITNET-00000-190318-003142

Previous Receipt No. :
S/N ltem Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
MNe. GST (5%5) (5%) (5%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SDZ218E

As at 18 Mar 2019/11:30:00

Insurance Co: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD
1 Insurance Enguiry - SDZ218E

— Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.£9 7.49
20190318162410121095
Sub-Total T.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By
HRORGaONT 438 Sir_;.e:-';s::frlﬂard s
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amaount 0.00

THANK ¥OL AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider [ financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

Print Receipt Save as PDF




