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51 UBI AVE 1, 801-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (D65) 62564315

Your Ref: D19001817MFSH Date: 25/3/2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19004884/Jtd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO, SLG 9441Y
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
19/3/2019 at the premises of M/s World Auto have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount :S$ 5.135.20
Revised Estimate Amount s 1.500.00
“Check” ltems Amount 1 8% 0.00
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5%
Nett Value : 5%
A e
Description of Damage: e E
The vehicle sustained damages at the ': 1 _L_{'} -
rear portion. e

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Hwee Jie
Automotive Assessor



H i M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coseg bo 1950001060 G Reg. Mo He GOULE?S
MS‘ Flrstcaplta’ & Ratfles Quay 421-00 Singapore 048580 "
Tel [B5]6222 2311 Fax; (65)6222 3547

{Chaims B Metor Undenwriting Dept: 36 Fobinson Read #16-01 City House Singapore 063877
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fao: (B5) 6507 3849
wiwe. masfirsteapital com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 14-03-2019 Our Ref No. D18001817MFSH
Accident Date 09-03-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHAS018R Third Party Vehicle. SLG9441Y
Survey Location NO.1, KRANJI LOOP
Contact Person. DANIEL
Contact No. 63621776/ 0 Fax No. 64557576
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
A inted

i LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 684168315
Contact Number. MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop WORLD AUTO PTELTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA, TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge HENRY KAD

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Denise Ta: (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 11:27 AM

To: tgttan@waorldauto.com.sg
Subject: RE: SLG 9441Y Our ref: TP/2512/19
Dear Sophia,

Confirm COR $3,281.60 and 4 repair days.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 12 July 2019 8:35 AM

To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: 5LG 9441Y Our ref: TP/2512/19

Dear Sophia,
Sorry earlier email typo error on the calculation

Parts: 52,227/- x 80% = 51781.60
5/n: 5290
labour: 5710

Total: 52,781.60

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408333})

From: tettan@worldauto.com.sg <tgttan@worldauto.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019 6:12 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: 5LG 9441Y Our ref: TP/2512/19

Hi Denise

Finalised COR $3281.60 and 4 repair days.
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Cwner |D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Mar 2019

Company
4597K

SLGP441Y

Mo

22 Mar 2019
HOMNDA
VEZELHYBRID 1.5 A
Silver

2016

LEB5911138
RU31211018

112.0 kW (150 bhp)
$23,374.00

19 Oct 2016

19 Oct 2016

1

$5,000.00

Yes
18 Oct 2026
$3.750,00

18 Oct 2026

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$57,010.00

$43,160.00

$46,910,00

ALLPSHVTLIE. JOV.S0) RV ITacT o EMgUIrERE0AIE oY FUDICEBIONBUETEgINDUT T FUNL | IUN_IUSFUIUSUURE
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WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 6455 7576
E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. :

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
36 ROBINSON RD #16-01 CITY HOUSE
068877

Attention : Motor Claim Department
Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547

200006765H

Page1/2

Estimate : ES190021

Date : 12/03/2019
Vehicle Num. : SLG 9441Y (LCR)
Make/Model : HONDA VEZEL HYBRID
Chassis/Eng# :
Accident Date : 09/03/2019

Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
SN  Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount S§
LIST ITEMS :
1. 1 REAR TAILGATE 0o 1,100.00
2, 1 REAR TAILGATE HYBRID EMBLEM  va&o 7 SL 88.60
3. 1 REAR TAILGATE VEZEL EMBLEM A~ . 8480
4. 1 REAR BUMPER 0CE - 865.00
5 1 REAR BUMPER REFLECTORLENSRH W % 132.80
6. 1 REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING woc - 198.00-
List TotalS$ : 2,469.00
20.00% Discount S$ : 493.80
1,975.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :
1. 1SET REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS " * 30.00
2. 1SET REAR BUMPER CLIP ALL 30.00
3. 1SET REVERSE SENSOR Slortel ~ 2.0 280:00
4. 1 WINDSCREEN SEALANT e Lo 8000
Special Nett Total S§ : 420.00
LABOUR :
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS (20 189l00
WIRINGS CHECK AND RECTIFY WHERE NECESSARY Ho 15'.0'.00
TRANSEER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND ACCESSORIES o 186700
REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER TO FACILITATE 5'0 o 1,ﬁﬁ}.ﬂ0

REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL BEAT, REPAIR REAR END PANEL,

CONTINUE/ ...
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WORLD AUTO PTELTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 6455 7576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED Estimate : ES190021
36 ROBINSON RD #16-01 CITY HOUSE
0GBBTT Date : 12/03/2019

Vehicle Num. : SLG 9441Y (LCR)

Attention : Motor Claim Department Make/Model : HONDA VEZEL HYBRID

Chassis/Eng# :
Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No.: 6222 3547 Accident Date : 09/03/2019
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
S/N Quantity  Particular Unit Price Amount 5%
AND REPLACE ABOVE PARTS
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS ‘:: foke] 1,2@'/.00
Labour Total 5% : 2,740.00
i
E. & O.E. Total S§% : 5,135.20

T
i

for WORLD AUTO PTE LTD v



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya LIbi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 192607108R GET Reg. No. 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19004884/Jid3n2
e o Mo owe: worzoe [T
#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 9018R Veh. Inspected SLG 3441Y
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19001817MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  HENRY KAO Assign Date 18/03/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAVEZEL c.c 1456
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. RU31211018 Colour SILVER
Odometer 195216 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 STRADA 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 STRADA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[215/60R16 STRADA 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 STRADA & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5, General Information
Accident Date  09/03/2019 |Inspection Date 19/03/2019
Survey held at WORLD AUTO PTE LTD
47 JALAN PEMIMPIN
#01-02/03 HALCYON 2 BLDG
SINGAPORE 577200
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR; 4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Uibi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R G3T Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 9441Y
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | = orkahop {gﬂ - ﬂJI :
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAILGATE DENTED 1,100.00 1,100.00
1|REAR TAILGATE HYBRID EMBLEM MECESSARY 88.60 56.00
1|REAR TAILGATE VEZEL EMBLEM NECESSARY 84 60 56.00
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 865.00 BE5.00
1|REAR EUMPER REFLECTOR LENS RH NOT NECESSARY 132.B0 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING MECESSARY 198.00 150.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -493.80 -445.40
1.975.20 1,781.60
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS (SN) MNOT MECESSARY 30.00 -
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN) MECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 280.00 200.00
1|WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN} NECESSARY B0.00 60.00
420.00 290.00
LABOUR
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS. 180.00 120.00
WIRING CHECK AND RECTIFY WHERE NECESSARY. 180.00 40.00
TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND 180.00 50.00
ACCESSORIES.
REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER TO 1.000.00 500.00
FACILITATE REFPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL BEAT,REFAIR
REAR END PANEL AND REPLACE ABOVE PARTS.
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS. 1.200.00 500.00
2.740.00 1,210.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,135.20 3,281.60
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I | 3,281.60)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19004884/Jtd3n2

ONG HWEE JIE

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAMAER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES:- This Reporn is made solely for the use and bonafit of the Client named on the frond page of this Report.

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

E.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




