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EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD

No 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-62 AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit Singapore 417883

Tel : 67527740 Fax: 67528669
Co. Reg No. 201202259N

Name  : Tan Cheng Swee Johnny Accident Date:  13-Mar-19
Vehicle No : FBL205P Vehicle Model : ' YAMAHA
YBR128
Estimated Repair Costs
Oty Description Amount S($)
List Items
1 Exhaust pipe 2 1 6000 b 5406
1 Exhaust cover - rear g/ g~/ 5 60,00
1 Exhaust pipe gasket Ng ( $ 15.00
24 $ 425.00
97 & Less10% S 42.50
07 ¢ $ 382.50
S/No. Labour
1 Transport K==L 5 < 48.00
2 To provide labour 7 ke Ty ; , § Jer v 28000
el repouf  Exhaus
Fa havsl- g $ 328.00
Grand Total S 710.50
Dollars: Seven Hundred Ten and Cents: Fifty only
/l\ |I-: :' ' ';‘7_-—\ (a) o 0
\ . f".‘.'
\ e
EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD o) 248
£0
I:_| . i 360
W leac (")\J.;.L L f(kk_/
Lkk
Aty Casulfa | |
2 2EAlL
19131 350 estay
Flo (& s
Salss
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."» Back to OneMotoring

-;Enqui.re PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner 1D: 6353E
Vehicle Detalls

Vehicle No.: FBL205P
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended Deregistration Date: 19 Mar 2019
Wehicle Make: YAMAHA
Vehicle Model: YBR125
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Yoar 2016

Engine No: ESFSE041734
Chassis No: LBPRE101000056951
Maximum Power Output -

Open Market Value: $1.860.00
Original Registration Date: 03 May 2016
First Registration Date: 03 May 2016
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid $279.00
Intended PARF Rebate Totails

PARF Eligitlivy: Mo

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Renate Amount £0.00
Intended CCE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 02 May 2026
COE Categary D - Motorcycle
COE Perlod|Years) 10

QF Pald: $6,501.00
COE Rebate Amount: $4,628.00
Total Rebate Amaount: £4,628.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 19 Mar 2019

TP ETVFLITR. GOV, S5 VT GTGN ENGUINErMeoEIE DY - UDICOETOMEUEregImpul i LN | IUN_IDEruausuug | |
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: lionel.tan@fwd.com

Sent: Monday, 18 March 2019 3:18 PM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com; sur@lkkauto.com
Cc: motorclaims.sg@fwd.com

Subject: FW: Pre Repair Inspection - FBL20SP
Attachments: 18032019125333.pdf

Our Claim Ref: 120190006605/LT
HI LKK Team,

Please arrange SIE survey with repairer.

Regards,
Lionel

From: Chia Jia Rong [mailto:jiarong@roypartners.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, March 18, 2019 2:57 PM

To: Lionel Tan Tian Pej - SGUser i\ Jk
Cc: Mator Claims 5G - SG Common

Subject: RE: Pre Repair Inspection - FBL205P

Dear Sirs,

My Client Selects LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD as the Single Joint Expert for the Above Pre Repair inspection.
With regards,

Chia Jia Rong _ .
M/s Rov & Partners V1 b
101 Cecil Street ' i

#11-09 Tong Eng Building Vi 14 Vv

Singapore 069533 ki

Tel - 6536 8466 Fax : 6536 1963

Email . flarong@roypartners.com.sq

[IMPORTANT NOTE : The informetion in this ermail s confidental and may also be privileged.  If you are not the intended
recipnent, any use or dissemmeation of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is unauthorsed aned
strictly prohubited, If you have received this email in error, please notifi the sender immediately, You should also delete
ariel destroy all eopies of 1. Thank gou

From: lioneltan@fwd.com [mailta:lionel tan d.com
Sent: Monday, 18 March, 2019 1:19 PM
To: jlarong@raypartners.com.sg

Ce: motorclaims. sg@fwd.com
Subject: RE: Pre Repair Inspection - FBL2ZO5P

Our Ref: 120190006605
Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,



hl

-

Please select one of our surveyors as follows: -

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD
INFINITI APPRAISAL SERVICE

AJAX INSPECTION SERVICES PTE LTD
APPRAISALS ASSOCIATES PTE LTD
VICOM LTD

Ut Bl N

If you are not agreeable to any of the above, we would proceed to appoint a surveyor to conduct a pre
repair survey & post repair inspection within the timeline stipulated under the NIMA protocol.

We look forward to your reply.

Thank you.
Lionel
From: Chia Jia Rong [mallto:jiarong@roypartners.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 18 March, 2019 12:56 PM
To: Motar Claims 5G - 5G Common
Subject: Pre Repalir Inspection
Importance: High

Without Prejudice
Save as to cost

Dear Sir,

Our Ref: MKR/103/8748/2019/as.jr
Your Ref: Your insured vehicle SKZ 660C

Dear Sirs,

CLAIMANT: TAN CHENG SWEE JOHNNY
ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NOS. FBL 205P AND 5KZ 660C ALONG TANJONG KATONG ROAD ON
13.03.2019 AT ABOUT 1305 HOURS.

We refer to the above matter.
We act for TAN CHENG SWEE IOHNNY, the owner of the motorbike No. FBL 205P.

We are instructed by our client to notify you of a road traffic accident on 13" March 2019 at about 1305 hours along
Tanjong Katong Road involving our client’s motorbike registration number FBL 205P and motor vehicle registration
number SKZ 660C driven by your insured at the material time. A copy of the Singapore Accident report filed is
enclosed.

As a result of the accident, our client’s motorbike FBL 205P has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair
the damaged motor car, please let us know within two (2) working days of your receipt of this notice whether you
would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of our client’s motorbike FBL 205P at our client’s repairer workshop, M/s
EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD NO.1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #02-62 AUTOBAY@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883, Your said surveyor may contact Lee Lee at 6752 7740 to arrange the said inspection. If we do
not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the motor car

without further reference 1o you,




With regards,

'Chia Jia Rong

M/s Roy & Partners

101 Cecil Street

#11-09 Tong Eng Building
Singapore 069533

Tel : 6536 B466  Fax: 6536 1963

Email : flarong@roypartners.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTE : The information i this email is confidential and may also be privileged. [f you are not the intended
recipient, any use or dissemination of the mformation and any disclosure or copying of this email is unauthorised and
strictly prohibited. [f you have received this email in error, please notify the sender immediately. You should also delete
and destroy all copies of i Thank you.

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the
use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please
notify the sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not
use, disclose, copy or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT
been scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any
attachments.



Asher Snﬂ (LKKAuto) e

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Maonday, 29 April 2019 11:02 AM

To: erofia@singnet.com.sg

Subject: Accident Involving FBL 205P & SKZ 660C on 13/03/2019
SAVEASTO COSTS

Your Ref: FBL 205P
Our Ref: CC4/FWD19004880/Beb3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident Involving FBL 205P & SKZ 660C on 13/03/2019
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by bath parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
{subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlemeant for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client’s vehicle.

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor,

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In arder to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
sattlement.

Thank You

Bai! Regormh

Asher Sng | Cove Handbsr

LKE Auvto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 8841-4051 | email; gshenng@lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industiol Park, Ubl Avenge |, #02-25 | S{408733)
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Manman e-Claims

Claim Audit

[Me. On Audit Remarks y
1 310 am ot Modified Claimant’s Name: -> TAN CHENG SWEE JOHNNY. Claimant's 1D: -> 51285353E. S e
2 137372019 cim veh Model Changed (201294) YAMAHA YBR12S 123cc (M), W e
19 Mar 2019 Reg No: FBL2ZO5P. Acct Date: 2019/03/13. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: FWD Singapore Pta. (A] Law
] 14:12 Clm Created Ltd. (HQ). TP Insurer: NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (M), Workshop: Erofl Shy Pai
. a Motor Trading Pte Ltd [KAKI BUKIT)
19 Mar 2019 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ):; RR Reglon: FWD - Ext Auto Adj Assignment. Sugg [A] Lau
4 ja12 Ay Co Astigned ested Ad). : Infiniti Appraisal Service. Shu Pel
5 1ana ‘717 adjMext Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/03/28 LAy tay
19 Mar 2019 : 2 [A] Lau
] 14:12 Adj Mandate Sat Approved: 0,00, ReinsprAd) decides, Shu Pel
19 Mar 2019 ) [A] Lau
ey Label Added (20005):Direct Settiement , [ 1
19 Mar 2018 [A] Lau
-] 14:13 Adj Adjuster Assigned [None] -> MARCUS CHUA Shy Ped
[
gy AUAR SN BAgration Pol No:->PNPV2019-00001074. Ches
10 E::‘t‘:r o Adj Adjuster Assigned  MARCUS CHUA -> Lim Teaw Guan ;:Lt.;du|
29 Mar 2019 Adj Im. Advice ’ . [A] Lau
ey o b e Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/03/28 A} tau
' m&ﬂm‘
12 12357 %1% adj Rpt Initiated LEE
KHANG
MIN
. o
13 123729 cim ou Modified JP) Reg. Date: -> 2016/05/03. LEE
KHANG
MiN
| JOANNE
14 1 3P 299 cim etails Notified LEE
KHANG |
MIN
20 Sep 2019 Cur.Req:450,00: LIABILITY: 100% B:27 OID REAR ENDED TP QUANTUM: (a) COR : §35 AL:L_
15 30 Adj Mandate Request 0,00 + (b) LDU : $100,00 (5days x $20) Total: a+b = $450.00 PLEASE REVERT WITH ¥
: OUR APPROVAL / MANDATE / INSTRUCTIONS, IF ANY. s5ng
Rong ¥i|
Date From AT > pateTo AITEE] Audit Type | none v 6o
ACTIVITY B
{No record o
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History B ‘
, Sl e i . HEl Oehte | Bl Ty o Type -::-i---a ':rf::r:_":'r'l Rt 3 | a&fTimn _|
LKK Auto LKK Auto
2100234 | 2 Jar 20 | ‘:ﬁm Motar Consultants | Consultants SKZE60C ‘ 10.70
T Pre Ltd Pte Ltd (HQ)

hitps-{/singapare. merimen.com/claims/index cfm*usebox=M TRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistoryfcaseid=503631Aextid=288314ACFID=504 ..

112



Meriman e-Claims

Q25732019
Print Received Message

This mall is associated with ;
‘FBL205P (1201900006605)
[SKZE80C]

iz
TAN CHENG SWEE JOHNNY
Mar 13 2019 1:00PM
[Lim Bang Bang]
Erofia Molor Trading Pte Ltd

From FWD Singapore Ple. Lid. (HQ) (FWD_SG), sent on 20/09/2019 11:38 AM_

Te LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved {$$450,00) - FBL205P - Clalm Handler: Lional Tan

Approved:450.00.

hitps:/isingapore.marmen com/daimsindex ofm Husebox=5VCmaldfuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=50681084ACFTOKEN=e9480a28acSbB0-FATAJZS... 11



Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

1 Kakl Bukit Avenue 6 #02-62
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Tel: 67527740 Fax: 67528669

E-Mail: grofia@singnet.com.sg
Co Reglstration No: 201202259N

Our Ref: EMT1520/19/1t/FBLZ05P WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Your reference: BY HAND TO LKK

FWD Singapore Pte Ltd

6 Temasek Boulevard #18-01
Suntec Tower Four
Singapore 038986

Attn: Officer-In-Charge (Motor Claims Department)

Dear Sir

Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKZ660C AND FEL205P ON 13 MARCH 2019

We are instructed by our client Tan Cheng Swee Johnny to claim damages against your insured SKZ660C
In connection with a road traffic accident on 13 March 2019 at about 13.05hrs Along Tanjong Katong

Road with our client’s motorcycle registration number FBLZOSP

As a result of the accident, our client’s motorcycle was damaged and our client has been put to loss and
expenses, particulars of which are as follows:

1. Final Repair Bill as per surveyor's recommendation S5 350.00
3 Loss of Use (5 days x 5520.00/day) Repair + PRI 55 100.00
Total to Claim S5 450.00

Attached final repair bill for your early process of our daim
Thank you

Yours faithfully
Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

Teo Hwa Heng



Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #02-62
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Tel: 67527740 Fax: 67528669
Co Registration No: 201202259N

AUTHORISATIONTO ACT

We., 20 "-.*'L'ﬂf-_.'l wee hny (the third party claimant”) of

\4 Jampines < “”r.‘!nl J HI=s-2C J- hag )23 _(nddress), owner of
=L L7 (vehicle no.) hereby suthonze Emfia Motor Trading Pre Lid (“the
workshop™) to sct for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of
use (“claim”) for my vehicle no. L 08| That was damaged pursuant to the
accident which occurmed on 130 3 2019 (date)
Ploca, |-t’-‘l"l.|.lr'-fr|; ":"Jlfil'l:i '.'L'-"fl (location) involving wvehicle no/s
SK _."’_ 1’14" fi_- ) (“the accident™),

| further authorize the workshop to setile my above mentioned claim in a manner that they
deemed fit and the workshop 1s finther suthorized 1o receive payment further o settlement of my

claim with payment cheque's being made in favour of the workshop - EROFIA MOTOR
TRADING PTE LTD

I further acknowledge thar any settlement the workshop may reasch on my behalf 15 on o without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver'owner/insurers of the

other vehicle's 1s concemed.

Duted this /4 (day)of _C=5

o ]L

Signed by "the third pany claimant™ Signed by "the workshop”™

(With company stamp if applicable) {With company stamp)

IVIAE H)ws nad im Mscharpe of ms
clutm for damages rel g o b dunisge |
my veMicle shall

- lude me o ssuking & Turher et |
N pecial Jamagr T Y [eefeoits

el sumlnined e ilee smipe aco idest



RELEAS
Claim Reference: 1201900006605
Surveyor's Reference: | CC4/FWD19004880/Beb3
TP Reference: EMT1520/19/1t/FBL20SP

We, EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD (" Workshop”) hereby agree and confirm that we are
authorized by the owner (“Claimant”) of motor vehicle FBL 205P ("Vehicle”) to accept the sum of $450.00 ,
being the amount claimed for $350.00 (repair costs), $100.00 (loss of restatd usel, 5§ - (loss of income), §
= |dishursement) as compensation for the loss of or damage to the Vehicle, as a result of an accident
("Accident”) which accurred on 13/03/2019 (date of accident) st / along TANJONG KATONG ROAD (location)
involving vehicle no/s. FBL 205P and 5KZ 660C.

This s pursuant to the inspection conducted on 18/03/2019 (date) at the Workshop.

We confirm that this acceptance is in full and final settlement of all claims ansing from the damage to
the Vehicle (whether now or hereafter to become manifest), to the intent that FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd, and
all ather persans, in particular the driver of SKZ 660C be absolutely and finally exonerated and discharged from
all claims of every nature and kind whatsoever which have been made or which may be made in respect of

this Accident.

We zlso declare that we are authorized by the Claimant to receive the above compensation and we
have full authority to make the claim as set out above and to settle the matter on behalf of the Claimant in

any manner we deem fit.

This settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis. As such, this
Release is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the part of FWD Singapore Pte Ltd, their
policyholder and / or authorised driver and shall not be used as evidence in any claims and / or action which
may be lodged by any of them.

f.;lated this % dayof__ & 2015

f/| _
o\ ¢ "\__\

CLAIMANT i
/ / : / \
() ¢ ('._LKK,J
[ J \ ]
, / N/
—— = LTG
|Signed by the “Workshop™ wfft_jh' Co. Stamp) |FWD's appointed surveyor with Co. Stamp)|

For and on behalf of the “Claimant” For and on behalf of FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.



EROFIA MOTOR TRADING PTE LTD 01022500

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-62
Singapore 417883
Tel: 67527740 Fax: 67528669
H/P: 90696165 (Mr Teo)

INVOICE
Number Date Page
FBL205P 20-Aug-19 |
VEHICLE NO: FEL205P
MAKE/MODEL: YAMAHA YER128
NAME: FWD SINGAPORE PTE LTD
ADDRESS: 6 TEMASEK BOULEVARD #18-01
SUNTEC TOWER FOUR
SINGAPORE 0380886

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKZ660C AND FBL205P ON 13 MARCH 2019

FINAL REPAIR COST AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDATION 53 350.00
LOSS OF USE (5 DAYS X $20.0/DAY) REPAIR DAY+PRI 53 100.00
SUB-TOTAL: S$  450.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS: FOUR HUNDRED AND FIFTY ONLY

TOTAL : 8s 450,00

EROFIA MOTOR ING PTELTD



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

.«.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Direct Ssttiement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING o - |
Case | Notifed Est Submitted | Adj Assigned Ad] Apt [44) Submitted | Tns Auth'ed Gratus |

14 Mar 2019 1 ar-3010 S$5350,00 |$$350.00 Panding for Survey
e Lt Mg I aos soe fsumates | | vewmp

Claim Details

| [Created by adjuster]

Insured:  |Lim Beng Beng, 10: 572245324

Main ;

Cinimant: | TAM CHENG SWEE JOHNNY, 1D: S1286353F

Vehicle Reg. . (1303/2019 13:00 - :50

ho.: PRLI0aP Date of Loss: | /3.4 Manths and 10 Days Fram LTA Reg Date (Man Y]]
Ciaim Tyse: | TP / 1201900006605 Rocy/Cover | pum2019-00001074

Vehicle Reg. ]

Mo, SKZ660C :m“ SOS0041555-02

(Insured]: '

Excess:

Regirar: Erofia Mator Trading Pte Lid (KAKI BUKIT) 1 KAK] BUKIT AVE 6 #0262, 417683 Maki Bukit - Tel:

m FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6727 5700 ... [Handiad by Lionel Tan]

ﬁ:::l:-l:“ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operathve Ltd (HQ) - Tel: I
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handied by Lim Teow Guan] ... [Final Rpt due 28/03/2019]
| ASSDCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Man |

« FWD_SG (20/0%7019): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved [($$450,00) - FBL2OSP - Claim Handier: Lionel Tan

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View All | Seorch Tasks | Create hew Tusk | compiete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Comploted On Created On Done?
Mo results.
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*FBL205P (1201500006605)
[SKZ660C]
P
TAN CHENG SWEE JOHNNY
Mar 13 2019 1:00PM
[Lim Bang Beng]
Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Letters/Correspondences l1perpage [v] M
Ne |Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail Print
1 |(oraf) Third Party Express Settlement - Paymant Breakdown o Edit
Assessment Reports [1perpage T+ B4
Ne |Finalized On LKKE Aute Consultants Pte Lid {HQ) Thumbinall Print
1 |29/03/19 15:48 Adjuster Immediate Advice 0 | LoagHm
Photos/Images 1perpage (V] M
Mo |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Fra Lid (HQ) Thumbmail | Print
1 [19/08/1912:11 | Genersl View O | lesarc | BA
7 [1909/1912:11 | General View O s | B
3 |1%/09/1% 12:11 Ganeral View @ | woaws |
& | 1o/oo/19 12011 General View 0 | ediec | M |
5 |19/09/1812:11 | General View 0| wodivc | B
& [19/09/19 12:11 | Genersl View 0| edws | A
7 | 19%/09/19 12:11 General View 0 | Loaaru E_i;
8 |19/09/1912:11 | General View Q| reaws | A
8 |19/09/19 12:11 | Genersl View D | waws | A
10 |19/09/18 12:11 | General View @ | Leadiwc | B
11 [19/09/19 12:11 | Ganarsl View O waaws | B
12 190915 12:11 | Genersl View @ | e | M
13 | 19/09/18 12:11 Ganeral View 0| wears | &4
14 |1sy/0o/19 12:11 General View O | loadirc | M
1§ |19/09/19 12:11 Ganeral View 0D | wediws | A
16 | 19/09/19 12:11 General View @ | losdiec | B |
17 |19091912:11 | Genersl View Q| wadws | B
18 |19/09/19 12:11 General View 0| weaws | M
19 [19/89/19 12:11 | General View 0| wairc | EA
20 |19/09/1812:11 | General View D | edirs | B
21 |19/09/1912:11 | Genersl View O | wedirs | B
27 |19/09/19 12:11 | General View 0 | Laarc | A
3 |19/00/19 12:11 Ganeral View 0| weaws | B
24 [16/09/15 12:11 | General View D ot | B
Documentation [7 per page E %]
No | Relabel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (M) Thumbnail | Print
1 |1%03/1%14:13 | EMAIL FROM FWD DO 18031019 g Load POF

2 [1%/03/19 14:13 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF

3 [20/01/16 16:33 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF

4 |19/09/19 16:33 | WORKSHOP INVOICE s Load PDF

5 19/09/19 16:33 LoD Load POF

B | 0%/10/19 08:37 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM @ | LoadroF

7 |popi0/19 08:37 Rulease Voucher 0 | Lood POF

No | Finalized On FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |20/03/1912:39 | E-filed GIA report 0 | Load pOF
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Documents Checklist

'DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | save | oo |

show Remarks To: [J Handhing Insurer
Fiati - Bamarks 40 privede ankess you show & 15 olher parmes
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SKZ660C (Insd veh) Model: YAMAHA YBR125 123CC
FBL205P (TP veh) (M)
| Date of Accident: | 13/03/2018
Global Sum Settiement | :| [ | ves | [x] No
Repair Estimate o 710.50
Final Repair Cost & 350.00
Loss of Use . 100.00 5.00 days at $20.00 per day
Rantal (if any) - 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fes - 0.00
Others: s 0.00
-
Final Settlemant Sum .8 450.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
Ibalow)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable; Yes/ No BOLA Scenano Mo

B} For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (%) (%)
* Assessed Liability o be fillad only for chaln collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown
1) |Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd '§ 450.00
2) ' $

09 Oct
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Vouchar; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_d... 9/10/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg to 1sse071sam

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignmentsi@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/FWD15004880/BEB302

Date: 08/10/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: FWD Singapore Pte. Lid. Policy No: PNPV2012-00001074
Claimant .
Vehicle No : FBL205P Insured Vehicle No : SKZB80C
Date of Loss: 13/03/2019 Mature of Claim TP Claim No: 1201800006605
1 | ATI
Reg No FBL205P
Make & Model: YAMAHA YBR125, 123cc (M) Engine No: E3F5E041734
Reg. Date: 03/05/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No. LEPRE1010000565851
Calour. Black Odometer: 10118 km
Engine Capacity 124 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 80/80-18 Rear Tyre Size: 2,75-18
Front Left Side: Cheng Shan & mm Rear Lefl Side: CST 6 mm
Front Right Side: 0 mm Rear Right Side: 0 mm
The above values reprasani (e rermaming fyre reeds depth
COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 382.50 202.50 180.00 4706
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3258.00 248.00 80.00 2439
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Caleulated Gross Total (S5§) 710.50 450.50 260.00 36.59
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 350.00
MNett Amount (5§) 710.50 350.00 360.50 50.74
+ Loss of Use (5.0 x 5520.00/day) (S8) 100.00
Nett Liability (S5) 450.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 18/03/2018
Date Inspected: 18/03/2019 Inspected Al Erafia Motor Trading Pte Ltd (KAKI
BUKIT)
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-62
Singapore 417883
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days
Adjuster: Lim Teow Guan Manager: Asher Sng Rong Yl

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 9/10/2019
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NOTE: This report rapresents our findings af the time and piace of inspaction stated hersin. Such inspection has been carmed out fo te best of our
knowlodge and ability but any other lisbilify undar any other crcumstances is horety sxpressly exchided
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference ‘
|Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 18 Sep 2018) |
|Parts: NIA YAMAHA YBR125 123cc (M) (Model not available in database)

Labour; Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for FBL205P)

Validity: These eslimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page

iFurthlr Info: ltemsivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *. |

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Parl No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *EXHAUST PIPE Cut 350.00FL *150.00 FL
2 1 *EXHAUST COVER -REAR Scrailched 60.00FL *60.00 FL
3 1 *EXHAUST PIPE GASKET Necessary 15.00FL *15.00FL
F=Fmnchise part. L=ListhemDisc
Sub Total (5%) 425.00 225.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (5%) 42 50 2250
Total Parts (S$) 382.50 202.50
[ Report was Unsubmitted during this prini-out |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 9/10/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

Ther are no new miscellansous items selscted.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TRANSPORT New 48.00 48.00

2 TOPROVIDE LABOUR New 2B0.00 200.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 328.00 248.00

1 Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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