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VGS Singapore

247
Alexandra Road
158934 Singapore
Phane No +65 6305 7299
Fax No +65 6474 3642
VG Sngapare. 247, 150034 Singapere E-Mail sarvice@vw com sg
GUO SHADKUN VAT Registration No M20098505-2
5 JURONG LAKE LINK Tax No 1991014942
#08-21
Singapore. 648162 -
Sicktin Service Quote
Customer No Cvo40108
Quote No SER/QUO/1900550
QuoteDate 18/03/19
Salesperson REX LEOW
Page 1
THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
Make Model Description Mileage Service Advisor
Volkswagen Passeng SPORTSVAN 14 TSI CL 12.134 Kong Charmaine
License No. VIN Initial Registration Sales Advisor
SLW74418 WVWZZZAUZIWE20463 28/02/18 REX LEOW
Engine Code Labor Type Engine No. Model Code
T CZC 868397 AM13HZ
No. Description Qty. UoM Unit Price Amount
P B&P ALEX LABOUR LABOUR 3 Labor gho 250070
P B&P ALEX PAINT SPRAY PAINT 3 Labor Too g,wo’nn
P B&F SENSOR SUPPLY & INSTALL REVERSE SE 1 Pieces 40000~
P B&P DIAG PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION 1 Time Un 480 y,
COMPULSORY TO DO AFTER AC
P B&P MECH CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECU, S 1 Time Un 280,09~
Nett
Sum Labor 6.080.00
v
P 510807383A BUMPER GUIDE LH * XWA 1 Pieces 69 00
P 510807393C BUMPER BRACKET LH 1 Pieces 67 Bl
P 510807384A BUMPER GUIDE RH 7 MM 1 Pieces 69 00
P 510807394C BUMPER BRACKET RH T X WA 1 Piecas 67 80
P 510807417M GRU REAR BUMPER COVER B&~ 1 Pieces 1,263.06
Predecessor 510807417J GRU
P 510807863A STRIP T VAW 1 Pieces 72.02
P 5GB8075680 989 REAR DIFFUSER - % W ! Piaces 338 57
Use Predecessor SGEB0TSE8D
P 5GO807305A BUMPER REINFORCEMENT T 5¢WWA\ 1 Pieces 49515
Sum ltem 2.442.40

Paymeils 1o - BBN: - Acc -No .



Jnl Irene !thﬂﬁutu}

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Sunday, 31 March 2019 10:05 PM

To: €S A Team; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); theseira@singnet.com.sg

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGF 4699T / SLW 74418 / OTHERS ON 15/03/19
Hi Bridget,

Kindly call AIG hotline for our inquiry on your NCD and renewal.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
DID : 68412049

Fax : 6741 4108

From: theseira@singnet.com.sg <theseira@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 9:54:27 AM

To: C5 A Team; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGF 4699T / SLW 7441B / OTHERS ON 15/03/19

Hi,

Can someone please assist with my case on an urgent basis? 1 rang yesterday looking for Joy and 1 was told
she was not in the office and nobody could assist me. 1 tried sending Joy an email today and her out of
office message says that she is on long leave.

Please see my email below. | have received the attached liability confirmation and would appreciate it if
someone could please get back to me asap as | have to renew my car insurance and road tax soon.

Thank you,
Bridget Theseira
Tel 9759 5050

On Fri Mar 29 2019 09:46:51 GMT+0800 (+08) <theseira@singnet.com.sg> wrote:
Original Message —-—-—-

Hi Joy,

Is there any update on my case? | have received the attached liability confirmation from
MSIG to the workshop that is doing the repair work on my car. MSIG is the insurer of the
driver of vehicle number SFT3000D that collided into my car on 15 March 2019.

Appreciate an update from you so that | can renew my car insurance and my road tax.

Thank you.
Bridget



On Mon Mar 25 2019 11:07:37 GMT+0800 (+08) Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
<Joylrene(@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Original Message

OUR REF: CC3/AIG19004857/R 1jb3

BRIDGET ANGELA THESEIRA

Policy Holder

Dear Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGF 4699T / SLW 7441B / OTHERS ON
15/03/19

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific
Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized
driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.



Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver
had amongst other information given us your version of how the accident hnd
occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our
negotiations and settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of
this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) will be
withheld for the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in
settlement by our principal AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
DID: 6841-2409 | email: jovirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108

BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may
contain confidential and/or privileged information.If you are not the intended
recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or
distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.
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"PAYMENT ADVICE

Your ref: AIG Insurance Vehicle HNHo.

Claimant’s Vehlcle Ho. _ _"1_‘]5!1!#

Accident on involving vehlcle/s No,

- #longfat _ f.‘:‘. II_'m-"_ H_'ﬁl‘_'l-

BREAKDOWN OF PAYMENT/S

Volkswagen Centre Singapore
1. Rﬂp‘ﬂit Cost S5 _H__".‘:“:' - Pay‘hl‘- to

- = = - - -_ —_ -

2P0 v SGe
2. Loss-of-Use/ o Volkswagen Centre Singapore
T Car-fgntal S§_ n . Payable to B s TR e
3. Medigal and Volkswagen Centre Singapore
Search Fees 835 Z_ o Payable to

Hemarks :

Bervice Advliser

Contact Ho.H/P,



ng Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 25 March 2019 11:08 AM

To: ‘theseira@singnet.com.sg’

Ce: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGF 4699T / SLW 74418 / OTHERS ON 15/03/19

OUR REF: CC3/AIG19004857/R1jb3

BRIDGET ANGELA THESEIRA
Policy Holder

Dear Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGF 4699T / SLW 74418 / OTHERS ON 15/03/19

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your
insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter,

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD —if applicable) will be withheld for the time being. Pending
for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@|kkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or
privileged information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please
notify the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution
of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.



Provide always that this discharge of my claim
(]

for damages relating to the damage to my vehicle
shall not prejudice or affect or preclude me

from making a further claim for general and special

damages l'or. my personal injuries sustained

in the same accident
AUTHORIZATIONTO ACT

AIG Asia Pacific - Ex Third Party Claim

L _Quo  Shaokuw (the third party claimant™) of
ST_H_ ad (address), owner of __Stw 74416
(vehicle no.) hereby authorize Volkswagen Centre Singapore (“the workshop™)

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim") for

my vehicle no ELWT"“”E that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on
Iﬁ'{ﬂ?}hﬂ (date) alung Boots Loy ymy ““E JUBsNh Tow Hall ‘ul':‘p (location)

involving vehicle no/s _SAF¥98T  (“the accident™).

[ further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driverfownerfinsurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this __12"___ (day) of __ARIC (month) 2011 (year)

NAGEN

GROUP
SINGAPORE
ok &
Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed M"

(with chop if applicable) (with chop)




“Provide always that this discharge of i
N—- : for damages relating to the damage l:n;‘{:h[::r:
l G : shall not prejudice or affect or preclude me
\A . m?:%-WMhmwwm

2 el i Personal injuries sustained

RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific — EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)

CENTRE o
“Wefl,__NOL-XOWAGEN il 0, . (‘the workshop") hereby confirm that we/|
have reached an agreement with the a

G Asla Paclfic Insurance Pte. Lid,
LA AUTO CORPIUTINLD VO . Cnameo surveyor”) with respect to the amount claimed for
ss 4WD.oL (repair costs), s5__ \¥0-00

(loss of use/rental) s§  “2-00 (search fees)
for vehicle no, “SWW Fp that was damaged pursuant o the accident which occurred
on_\Stewlia (date) along TooN U oky

(location) Involving
vehicle nofs o Maay _

This Is pursuant to the Inspection conducted on 190 \q

— (dats) at "the workshop®,
) <
Well confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner __GU0 oMol — ("third party claimant)
of vehicle no 2VW FAMD o e e claim as set out In the aboye paragraph and wefl have fy
authority lo seltle the malter on his/her behalf In a mann

ar that well deem fit. We| enciose herein the letter of
authority given by "the third party claimant®. . ;

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AlG Asia Pacific |
expense Ihal they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant” after the aboye said
agreement lodges a further claim against the fb

brmer for any loss and eXpanses suffered pertaining to costs of
repairs andfor rental and/or loss of use pursuant fo the damage 1o _ 2L Fhkig
of the accident, '

¥

nsurance Pte, Lid for all damages, loss and/or

(vehicle no.) s a result

Well confirm that the agreement reached above is in full

claimant® pursuant to the accident and that further this 86
admission of liability basis,

and final settlement of any claim of “the third party
ltlement Is reached on a without prejudice and without

This agreement Is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive
jurisdication over any dispute arising out of the sama.

Dated this __ 09 Idayof  OF

- =% |

Iln
|

Signed by AIG uppull"ltad surveyor

caREHnN



Singapore 639178
Biz. Reg. No.: 1991014942
G5T No.: M200985052

VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE @
9 Tuus Avenue !
Volkswagen SKODOA w

lax invoice:

Page 1
Company Customer Detaiis: Document na 12333900092
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PIL Mr Document date 23-04-2019
78 Shenton Way GUo Customer no. 5211043735
#07-16 AIG Buiding SHADKUN Customer GST-ID 201009404M
Singapore 079120 5 JURDNG LAKE LINK Dealer 39594
20921 Job order number 2018000058/ 1
Singapore 648162 Job order dale 02-04-2018
Service Advisor MEI EWAN KONG
License plale | Model code Firsl regisiration | VIN Model Miteage
| SLW74418 AM13HZ 28-02-2018 WVWZZZAUZIWS20463 | Sportsvan 1.4CLBMT 92 TSI O7F 14,129
Position no. Description Quantity Uni Unit price Tax code  Total amount Total amount
excl. GST exol GST Incl, GST
§510807383C Guide Piece 1 pcs. B7.80 #1 67.80 7255
BUMPER BRACKET LH*'CD-050419
510807417 GRU  Cover For Bumper Primed 1 pcs. 1,283.06 #1 1,263.06 1,351.47
XA-040418
LABOUR 1 pes. 840,00 #1 B40.00 898.80
SPRAY PAINTING 1 pos. BOO.00 1 800.00 856.00
Diagnostic and Programming 1 pcs. 480.00 #1 480.00 513.60
Check Shon Circull / Harmess Repair 1 pcs. 280.00 &1 280.00 299.60
SUPPLY & INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR 1 pcs. 400.00 # 400.00 428.00
DIRECT SETTLEMENT AGAINST AIG
TP VEH: SGF4699T DOA: 153,19
Tax Labour Malerial GST % GST Total amouni Total amouni
Code axcl. GST incl. GST
g1 4,130.86 % 288,16 4, 130,86 442002

Customer

1030001

~==WISIT OUA WEBSITE: aliersaloa.vw.com.ag (lor online service appoinimsnts) ang volkswagen.com.sg and www.akoda com.sg |lor addiional services, products
and promelicns),-—-

Adl lund transter payments should ba mads payable to Vokewsgen Group Singapore Ple Lid, Bank Name: Deutscne Bark AG {Singapare Branch], Banx Account:
2528214002, Swift Code; DEUTSGSE. Pease indicate Customer Nurmbed (sg. 52100006 X), Customes Name and [rvoice Mumber I the paymonts.

Uniil payment o all goods (parts, accessones eic.] nas been made in 14l 1o and recaived by Yolkswagen Group Singapors (VGS), the goods remain in egal
possession ol VGS, imespective If they have aleady been instalied into your vehicle. Howaver, (he warranly ol ihe goods (where appicabin) starts with ihe ssuance ol
iha irwolos or the collection of your car, whichever is earfier.

For warranty lerms and conditions pleass visll our websde www.volewagen com.sg

This is an authorised document. Mo signature = required.



GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GERAL € Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

lNSURANCE Fhone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030

ASSOCLATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday S8am to 5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE 55! Redistration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Rel No: GR-19-041756
Date of Request: 16/03/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Valkswagen Centre Singapore
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 16/0372019
Engquiry By Charmaine Kong Mel Kwan
TP Vehicle No, SGF4699T
Accident Date 15/0372018
Enquiry Result
TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SGF4898T AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid. 12/04/2018-11/04/2018 £5-6419-3000
Thank You,

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibllity for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no llability whatsoaver for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the repors or thelr images

This is a compuler generaled document and requires no signature

https://www.giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_genin... 16/3/2019



Invoice Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +685 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday S8am to S5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MAMAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-041756
Date of Request: 168/03/2018 Your Rel No: Online Purchasa
Volkswagen Centre Singapore
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 16/0372018
Enquiry By Charmaine Kong Mei Kwan
TP Vehicle No. SGF46049T
Accident Date 15/0372019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S8)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date;
[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque

https://www.giarmc.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_genin... 16/3/2019




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Expreis

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

|

 Case  |Notified Est Submitten | Ad) Assigned | agj Apt Ad) Submitted | Ire Autied | Starun i

orzo SR o ssaisoss |
|_satnee o Ay e | Eait Estimates | | view Rpt [ Canci ow)

Claim Details

|[Created by adjuster]

Claimant: GUOD SHADOKUMN, [0: 5TEE9082G
Vehicle Reg, | | . [15/03/2019 07:00 - :59
No.: SLNTaiLE Date of LOSS: | 142 Months and 15 Days From LTA feg Gate (Man ¥r]

m:‘*‘fm’“’ 0100628695 (Comorehensive)

SGFABUST :';“ ""‘I A quunﬁu‘m

i
| o ) | Exgess: |
Volkswagen Centre Singapore (HQ) 247 Alexandra Road, 159934 Alexandra - Tel: 53057288

AIG Asis Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-1000 ... [Handied by Foo, Chit Yan] Chityan. Fao@aig.com

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: <45 G827 TE8E
te LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .. [Handled by MOHD RASUL] ... [Final Rpt due 27/03/2015]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED o

Thare are no mail for this case.

Wiew all |_ Campase m;l !

view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Comoete

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Ne results.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp ... 16/7/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLW7441B (33173159585G)
[SGF46595T]
™

GUO SHAOKUN
Mar 15 2019 7:00AM
[Bridget Angela Theseira])
Volkswagen Centre Singapore

Page | of 2
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Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
[‘d'_uhiuh No: SGF4699T (Insd veh) Model: VOLKSWAGEN SPORTSVAN
SLWT4418 (TP veh) 1.4 (A)
| Date of Accident: | 15/03/2019
Global Sum Settlement || [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate H 9,118.97
Final Repair Cost : 8 442002
Loss of Use 5 180.00 3.00 days at $60.00 per day
Rental (if any) ] 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee : 5 2.00
Others. 5 0.00
' §
Final Settlement Sum s 4.602.02

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [ X] NO (Kindlyindicale
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability (%) Assessed Liability (") 0 (%)
* Assessod Liability to be filled anly for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nof apply.
Ramarks

Payment Instruction; Payee's Breakdown

1) |Volkswagen Centre Singapore 5 460202
2) 5
3) 5
16 Jul
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill: Rental Invoice: Release Voucher: Authorisation to Act: Survey Report: Medical
Report/ Bill {if any)

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 16/7/2019



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ica reg o tsssar1ser

51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Page | of 4

Tel 6258-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC3/AIG19004857/R1JB302
Date: 18/07/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 0100628685
momant Vehicle g1 wr4418 Insured Vehicle No : SGF4699T
Date of Loss: 16/03/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 3317315858506
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg Mo: SLWT441B
Make & Model: VOLKSWAGEN SPORTSVAN, 1.4 (A) Engine No: CZCBBa3a7
Reg. Date 28/0272018 (Man. Year 2017) Chassis No: WAVWZZZALZIWS20463
Colour: White Odometer 12480 km
Engine Capacity: 1365 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (SS). Marke! Valua/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabls): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Froni Tyre Size: 225145 R17 Rear Tyre Size 22545 R17
Froni Left Side Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Lefi Side: Bridgestone B8 mm
Front Right Side; Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestona 6 mm
Thi above valies represent the mmaining fyre resds depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 2,442 40 1,330.86 1.111.54 45.51
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 6,080.00 2,800.00 3,280.00 53.95
Paintwork Labour D.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (58) B,522.40 4,130.86 4,391.54 51.53
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S5) 586.57 289.16 307 41 51,53
Nett Amount (S5) 9,118.97 4,420.02 4,688.95 51.53
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x S560.00/day) (S$) 180.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 2.00
Nett Liability (5$) 4,602.02
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 18/032018
Date Inspected: 18/03/2018 Inspecied At; Volkswagen Cantre Singapore (HQ)
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158834
Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0days
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Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: Joy lrene Bascao

NOTE. This repor represents our fincings af the lime and place of mapection stated harmn. Swueh napechon has beon camed ouf fo the best of ow
knowledgs and abllty but any other lability under any olher creumatances ia heroby axpressly axcluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
L *BUMPER GUIDE LH Not Necessary 69.00FS *-FS
2 1 *BUMPER BRACKER LH Necessary 67.80F5 “67.80FS
a 1 *BUMPER GUIDE RH Mol Necessary 69.00FS *-Fs
4 1 *BUMPER BRACKET RH Not Necessary 67.80FS “F8
5 1 ‘REAR BUMPER COVER Defarmed 1,.263.06F5 *1.263.06FS
6 1 *STRIP Mol Necessary T202FS *FS
7 1 *REAR DIFFUSER Not Necessary 338.57FS ~FS
g 1 *BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Mot Necessary 495.15FS *FS
FaFranchise pan S=Spchsf
Total Parts (S5) 2,442.40 1,330.86
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscelianeous items selectad.
Recommended Labour
Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amaunt
Labour ltems
1 LABOUR New 2.520.00 840,00
2  SPRAY PAINT New 2,400.00 800.00
3 SUPPLY & INSTALL REVERSE SE MNew 400.00 400.00
4  PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION COMPULSORY TO DO New 480.00 480.00
AFTER AC
5 CHECK WIRE HARNESS ,ECU.5 Mew 280.00 280.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 6,080.00 2,800.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. ]
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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