Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 February 2019 11:54 AM

To: 'ANG Yvonne'

Cc: 'HO Winnie'; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek’; LKK Valuation

Subject: RE: [MV] Check Market Value (MV) - SOM01DT6 / DOA: 13.02.19 / SIN 6654 G

Dear Yvonne,

The market value for SIN 6654G is $27K - 28K (est) as at February 2019.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: edna.lee@a-pac.sg [mailto:edna.lee@a-pac.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February 2019 11:00 AM

To: 'Lavander Pang' <surveyadmin2 @fta.com.sg>; claims@ajaxinspection.com; admin@autoprobe.com.sg;
chowauto@singnet.com.sg; admin@Ibs-auto.com; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>;
cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; rta@rta.com.sg; 'Wendy Tan' <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>

Cc: 'ANG Yvonne' <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>; 'HO Winnie' <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg>; 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek'
<Kitty.Teo@axa.com.sg>

Subject: [MV] Check Market Value (MV) - S9M01DT6 / DOA: 13.02.19 / SIN 6654 G

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within 48 hours.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Edna Lee

Motor survey

A-PAC Adjusters & Surveyors Pte Ltd
7030 Ang Mo Kio Avenue 5

#08 - 03 Northstar @ AMK
Singapore 569880

T : +656904 4922

E : edna.lee@a-pac.sg




