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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
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From: Jacqueline Leong <Jacquelineleong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 March 2019 4:57 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)
Cc: LKK Valuation
Subject: RE: D19000348MFVS - XE3117S - DOA: 06-01-2019 - Pls check MV.
Attachments: COLEX ENVIRONMENTAL PTE LTD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE3117S ALONG

GRANGE ROAD NEAR LAMP-POST NO. 20 ON 06 JANUARY 2018 - FLEET POLICY
NO. D19092529MFVS/30

Dear Denise

Attached rear end loader invoice for your attention.
Please let us have the MV of the whole vehicle.
Thank you.

Best regards,
Jacq

Jacqueline Leong
Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Limited | 36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House, Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3860 | Fax: 6507 3849 |

Company Regn. No. 185000106C
A Member of h INSURANCE GROUP
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that requlate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

if you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return
e-mail.

Change of email address notice
Please note that my email address is changed from jacquelineleong@first-insurance com.sg to

jacquelineleong@msfirstcapital.com.sg.

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 February, 2019 10:19 AM

To: Jacqueline Leong <Jacquelineleong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: D19000348MFVS - XE3117S - DOA: 06-01-2019 - Pls check MV.

Dear Jacqueline,

The market value for XE 3117S is $146KI - $150K(est) as at Jan 2019

Best Regards, a; E _ D 30 .

Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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ZENITH Engineering Pte Ltd

Im REG NO: 1979040247
34 JOO KOON CIRCLE, JURONG TOWN, SINGAPORE 829060

/ TEL: 68611100 FAX: 68621948
- E-mail; info@ze.com.sg
Wabsite: hitp://\www.ze.com.sg

TAX INVOICE

INVOICE NO: SA17-L0167

RECEIVED 15 AUS 207GST Reg No: M2-0037093-7

rerdue account.

CUSTOMER

4 \ -
Your Ret. No: 2172
Colex Environmental Pte Ltd e L
B.Tuas South Street 13 Tl Cash
Singapore 637083
Date: 11/08/2017
. ‘Account No: Page No:
» .
'- |
Description Quantity | Unit Price _ Amount
S8 5§
;I o Our Proj No : ZP 4832
Olympus Rear End Loader, 1 UNIT 106,178.25 106,178.2¢
Model: Olympus OL-21W body volume 20.0m3
suitable for 28MT GVW chassis
Add : 7% GST 7,432.4§
113,610.73
Less : Dowmpayment Paid (Inv.240142) . 28,402.6F
Total Payable 85,208.05
JA/sn.
of
terest at 1.5 % per month will be charge for E.&0.E. for ZEMW Pte Ltd







Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

— e
From: Jacqueline Leong <Jacquelineleong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 11 February 2019 4:43 PM
To: LKK Valuation
Cc: KKLau
Subject: D19000348MFVS - XE3117S - DOA: 06-01-2019 - Pls check MV.
Attachments: Log Card-XE3117S.pdf; sale agreement.pdf; Insd GIA (XE3117S).pdf
Dear Sir

We refer to the above matter. _
Please assist in providing the market value for the mentioned vehicle.
Thank you.

Best regards,
Jacq

Jacqueline Leong
Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Limited | 36 Robinson Road, #16-01 City House, Singapore 068877 | Tel: 6507 3860 | Fax: 6507 3849 |

Company Regn. No. 195000106C
A Memoer of m:nsunmcs GROUP

Personal Dala Protection Act 2012 ("FDFA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital com.sq for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notica: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privifeged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and nolify the sender immediately by return
e-mail.

Change of email address notice

Please note that my email address is changed from j elineleong@first-insurance.com.sg to g
jacquelineleong@msfirstcapital.com.sg. \\,\
o
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

PARF/COE Rebale Enquiry

Owner |D Type: Company
Owner ID: 3348M
Vehicle No.: XE3117S
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 30Jan 2019
Vehicle Make: MAN
Vehicle Model: TGS 26.320 6X4 BB
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2017
Engine No.: 50547410094738
Chassis No.: WMA26SZZ5HM745449
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $116,098.00
Original Registration Date: 07 Jul 2017
First Registration Date: 07 Jul 2017
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $5,805.00
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: .
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
COE Expiry Date: 06 Jul 2027
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $36,879.00
COE Rebate Amount: $31,099.00
Total Rebate Amount: $31,099.00
The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Jan 2019 \ Bg\t

hitps:/ivil.ta.gov.sg/ta/vri/action/enguireRebateBy PublicBetoreDereginput 7FUNC TION_ID=FU30400911
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@."'@ Singapore Technologies S eppus Teckplnghee
Kluetics 31 Corporation Road

Singapore 139296

Tel: 6470 8985

Fax: 6479 8167 “RN
(Regn. No.: 197100263N)

«m» A Company of Singapore Technologies Engineering

Reference: STK/Q/269/16

Date: 27 December 2016

- COLEX ENVIRONMENTAL PTE LTO %@/
Lt B N S e 8 S S R
8 Tuas South Street 13,

Singapore
Attn: MR LAWRENCE LIAU
Dear Sir,

UOTATION F! GS 26.320 6X4 BB (Euro

We would like to thank you for your inquiry. We are pleased to revise the quotation as follows:

MODEL QTY PRICE/UNIT
1) MAN TGS 26.320 6X4 BB 01 Unit SGD 138,000% -
Technical Specifications attached as »

Annex A (Euro 5 SCR) GVW: 28.5 tons

Front Spring & Rear Leaf Suspension
Tipmatics Transmission
Price includes:
e PTO \"‘2 W
* ABS (Anti Lock Brake System)
* M Cabin (Medium)
s (D player
e Reverse buzzer

*The above price is based on per unit and it jncludes 6 months road tax, 5% ARF, 1 -year warranty, 1-year free on
maintenance/servicing but Excludes GST, insurance, VPC, COE and other government taxes. Manufacturer warranty

applies.

Delivery
Delivery time commences 4 Months upon your confirmation..

Payment Terms

20% down payment upon contract agreement confirmation and balance upon registration.

Validity of Offer

This quotation/offer is only valid for 14 days from date of quotation,



@

@ll!.» Singapore Technologies f&:ﬁ”;ﬁ'{,ﬂ""“’"‘“ﬁ”
=

e 3 Kinetics 31 Corporation Road
"I» ; ' . . Singapore 139296
A Company of Singapore Technologies Engineering Tel: 6470 8985 AN
Fax: 6479 8167 l i‘ k
i st
(Regn. No.: 197100263N)

We trust the above is suffice and satisfactory to you. Should you have any further queries, please
do not hesitate to contact George Ang at 9660 8468.

Yours faithfully,
SINGAPORE TECHNOLOGIES KINETICS LIMITED

A

George Ang

gfn‘?;gemial Vehicle Division APPRO VED %%)
/
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