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Used Toyota Car & Used Cars & Vehjcles Singapore - sgCarMart

sellMyCar Directory

Login Sign up

A.ticles Forum

tl€w 5 Y€.3 !r. {..e*rl lrndr stream 1aaPost an Advertisement
Sellit yo!6elf! Advertise it atjust

$58 until it's SOLD!
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search Sele€tion Toyota wisa

(coEtill06/202r)

31Jrl-2006

Price Depreclation . i1.! itr:.: : Eng Gp

> 10 yea(s)
old

$34,a00 $6,960 /yr 30-Ocl-2008 1,194 cc

$6,960 lyt 22-5ep-2008 1,794..

' lllleaqe veh Type

An! Any

100,890 km l4Pv

AL

@@

ToYota wish 1.8A (New s-yr
col)

Posredi 2GOct-2018 Tags 2008 royota Wish, 2008 toyota wish, Ioyota Wish, toyola vishi Toyotai Wlsh, wrsh, rled Toyota

Toyota wish 1.8A xE (N€w 5- :33,800 $6,760 lyt

Toyoti wish 1,84 (New 5-Yr $34,800
coE)

'loyota Wish 1,aA (CO: aill
06l2o2t)

Fosted:26-0d-2018 la!s: 2008 Toyota Wish,2008 toyota wlsh, Toyota !ry sh, toyola w6h, Tolota, wish, w5h, us€n Toyot
E@

@

31-.lul-2008 1,794 c.
yr coE)

S3K Drive Away. Fully Refurblshed. Low Fuel Consurnption Widl PowedulEigine, Call Forviewing Nowl

Posicd 26-ocr-2018 T.!s: 2008 Toyota Wsh,2rl08 toyoi. I sh, toyot? Wish, toFta wish, royota, Wish, wish, Used Toyota

Toyota Wish 1,8Ax(News-yr $3s,800 $7,160 Jvt z4-oct'2008 1,794ct
c0r)

f4ost Poputar NIPV 7 Seat€6, New Paintwo And LeatherSeat Color Of Your Cholce, New 6 Month Road Tax, l YearWananty For Engiie And

cearbox, Trade In And High Loan Avaiable, Hurry I'lak€ An Appolntme,..

Postedi26-Oct-2018 Tags: 2003 Toyota Wish,2008loyota wlsh, Td.rot wlsh. toyota wish, Toyota, M/sh, wsh, U*d lovota

$22,000 $8,240 /yr 3r-lul-2006 1,794.c 148,0001m

931,a00 $5,530 /yr 12-S€p-2008 1,794 c.

@silver 6-seaier Toyota wish, Passenger Slation Wagon, 1.8A. Registrauon Date 11l! y 2006, COE Expir6June 2021.

Poned:26-Od 2018 ra!s: 2006Toyola Wjsh,2006 toyota wish, Toyota wsh, toy.ta *ish, Toyota, Msh, wish. Llsed Toyotn

Is your COE expiring? L€t us help you renew:t!

Getting your COE renewed is €asy, fast and atro.dabl€. W€llhelp you renewyour CoE and get a lGn for it, cet the cheapest loan in town and an

approvalin 2 days without efiortl Enquiretod.y.

Toyota wish 1.84 (COE till
09/2023)

- 98% per Annunr By GV Cars Financinq At $2000 Downpayment Frcrn $638 Lowest lvlonthly wth 1000/0 Loan Approval.2 Yea6 warranty ByGv In

Select used ca6 to Compare orAdd to alert Shortlist [ 1 ]

To compa( c.rt, Io (ompar...rs.
!e,.ct iom the sele€t from the

. .ear.h.€6rlls. I search r6ults,

{@

H Lak€ View
*Credit Pte Lld

https://wwwsgcarmart.com/used-cars/listing.php?BRSR=20&tVOD=Toyota&MMO=Wish&RPG=20&RGD= 10 1t3



From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) < ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com >

Wednesday, 31 October 2018 '1 
1 :47 AM

'KHONG Lynn'
'HO Vincent'; 'CHAN Sam'; 'KKLau'; 'LKK Valuation'; 'Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)'

RE: Assistance required: To effect MV for SLG8673B

Dear Lynn,

The market value for SLG 86738 is S23K - 24K (est) as at September 2018.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

shirley Hiew I case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte l-td

Phone;6256-3561 I email: Sur{alkkauto com I fax:6256 4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi lndustrial Park, UbiAvenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CHAN Sam Imailto:sa m.cha n @axa.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday,30 October 2018 8:37 AM
To: motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; KKLau <kklau@lkka uto.com>; Jimmy Lee Priority Svc <jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg>;

frankie@fta.com.sg; Autoprobe - Mr Tay <bhtay@autoprobe.com.sg>; AutoProbe Admin -surveyor

<ad min @autoprobe.com.sg>; LKK Va luation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; ricky@rta.com.s8; patrick.soo @a-pac.s8;

otivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau @lkkauto.com>; nick@ lbs-auto.com; elson @ rta.com.sg;

cynth ia. ong @ prio rityse rvices.sg; co llin.wong @a -pac. sg; be nso n @ lbs-a uto. com

Cc: KHONG Lynn <lynn.khong@axa.com.sg>; HO Vincent <vincent.ho@axa.com.sg>

subiect: Assistance required: To effect MV for 51G8673B

Dear Partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Lynn Kwong with the Market Value for this case.

DOA: 04/09/2018

Thanks in advance for your help.

-----Disclaimer-----
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee lf
you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content ofthis
message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notifl' the sender immediately Any views or

opinions presented in this message are solely those ofthe author and do not necessarily represent those of
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity ofthe AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and

duly authorized by the said companies.



From:
Sent:
To:

CHAN Sam < sam.chan@axa.com.sg >

Tuesday,30 October 2018 8:37 AM

motorsurvey@fta.com.sg; KKLau; Jimmy Lee Priority Svc; frankie@fta com sg;

Autoprobe - Mr Tay; AutoProbe Admin -surveyor; LKK Valuation; ricky@rta.com.sg;

patrick.soo@a-pac.sg; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); nick@lbs-auto com; elson@rta com.sg;

cynthia.ong@ priorityservices.sg; collin.wong@a-pac.sg; benson@ lbs-auto.com

KHONG Lynn; HO Vincent

Assistance required: To effect MV for SLG8673B

attachment 1.pdf; ATT0000'1.htm

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Partners,

Please assist to provide Ms Lyrur Kwong with the Market Value for this case.

DOA: 04/09/2018

Thanks in advance for your help.

-----Disclaimer-----
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use ofthe named addressee. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content ofthis
message. If you have received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or

opinions presented in this message are solely those ofthe author and do not necessarily represent those of
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity ofthe AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and

duly authorized by the said companies.


