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B B B Plelid Company Registration No. 193607198R

51 UKL AVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (B65) 62564315

Your Ref: D19001815MESH Date: 03 April 2019

Qur Ref: CS/FCI19004730/Esd3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ GBH 9575H .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 01/04/2019 at the premises of M/s Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd and have the following
to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :88 590564
Revised Estimate Amount : 55 3.704.00
“Check” Items Amount : 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8%

Nett Value + 8%

Description of Damage: sl

The vehicle sustained damages

at the rear portion. o ‘ ot

offside

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 4 Days

Yours faithfully,
Chen Tsue Yee
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited coReg ke 1950001060 CAF Meg Bo M2 D0006TE-9
& Raffles Quay 521-00 Singapore D48580

Tet {55) 6222 2311 Fax: (65| 6222 3547

Clalmes & Meinr Undemvaiting Depe: 35 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 0EBETT
Tet (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (65) 6507 3848

www mafirsteapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.

Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

14-03-2019 Our Ref No. D19001815MFSH
12-03-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHCE070J Third Party Vehicle, GBEH9575H

BLK 53 UBI AVE 1 #01-24 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL FARK
DARREN

58442475/ 0 Fax No. 68442474

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

TEAMWORK GARAGE Attantion. NIL
PTELTD
NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>
Sent: Friday, April 26, 2019 9:12 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: TEAMWORK

Subject: FINALISED GBH9575H

Dear Sir,

We confirm COR @52600 and DOR @4 days.

Regards,

Shu Shan

Teamwork Garage Pre Ltd
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1
#01-24

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 6844 2475

Fax:6844 2474



Shirie: Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 5:26 PM

To: 'May Chua Hui Chin’;'CWS Motor Claims; assignments
Cc SUR: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001815MFSH/1
Attachments: GBH 9575H - Preli Advise -.pdf

Dear May,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBH 9575H.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkautp.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 15 March 2019 4:35 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: "May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12001815MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that repairer agreed survey on 18/03/2019.

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

Erom: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 15 March 2019 3:47 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hui Chin
<maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12001815MFSH/1



Dear Sir/Mdm,

Wa refer to the above reference.
please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
wWwWWw.avg.com
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DAREINOE Dahaota Ermsidns

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to Ee.Exp orted:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Maodel:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actu.al-ARF F;aid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount;
Intended COE Rebate Details
CCE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 02 Apr 2019

OK

Business
1372C

GBH9575H

No

02 Apr 2019
TOYOTA

DYMA 3.0 MANUAL
Silver

2018
1KD2821580
KDY¥2318035552
$34,050.00

14 Nov 2018

14 Nov 2018

4]

$1,703.00

Mo

$0.00

13 Nov 2028

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$30,354.00
$29,181.00
$29,181.00
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TeamWork Garage Pte Ltd

53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934

Paya Ubi Industrial Park "
Tel : 6844 2475

E-mail : claims@teamwaorkgarage.com
Register number : 201015366H
3IRD PARTY CLAIM ESTIMATION

First Capital Insurance Ltd ' It Vehicle number GBH9575H
6 Raffles Quay. U Make | Model TOYOTA/DYNA
Singapore 048580 fa AU~ |chassis number KDY2318035552
o 1L - ' Accident date 12 March 2019
2707 Reference 1903-23
Qty  Particulars Unit Price - SGD §
PARTS REPLACEMENT - LIST ITEMS
1 (tancate X € /I P 1910.80 < /S/f
2 |TAILGATE LOWER BRACKET T, 304.70
2 |TAILGATE STOPPER * N/ en 55.00
1 |FLOOR PANEL STEP BRACKET » /"  1E977 298.10 "
2 [Rear TAILLAMP R+~ ER V= It 315.90 [S/ 754
2| |TAILLAMP PANEL F1 m_ N- ‘{*'f _ 294.40 /19 747
24 | [TALGATEHINGE FH .~ Pl L= TS 105.00 (77
1 |TAILGATE LOWER MEMBER — £/ fugp ~ 485.90
1 |SPARE TYRE CARRIER ' 2197.76 385.22
1 |REAREXHAUST ~ M M (e 850.00 *
1 |REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING M A R e 42.50
74 01 5047.52
Less 25% 1261.88
Subtotal 3785.64
Balance C/F 3785.64
PARTS REPLACEMENT - SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
Balance B/F 3785.64
1 |70KM/H STICKER NEC 30.00 /
1 |6 PAX STICKER 30.00
1 SET |[REVERSE SENSOR ~ AgF IV 400.00 ¢
Subtotal 460.00 Cadl
Balance C/F 424564
S/No LABOUR AND MISCELLANEOUS CHARGES
i Balance B/F 4245.64
1 |CHECK REAR WIRING AND LIGHTNING SYSTEM 60.00 17
2 |REMOVE AND RENEW REVERSE SENSOR 150.00 *
3 |TRANSFER PARTS, ATACHMENT FROM OLD TAILGATE TO NEW 200.00
4 |PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED ARBRS | i 310 Consultants hence notify I 5§z, 600.00
5 |SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED Aﬁ?ﬂha Repairer of the following: - 500.00 4087
6 [APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS® e &0 < 150.00
: };arzs prh;.; af:ium:ﬁ '.ln c;rr;amnumgl"bmtal 1660.00
= Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudics” basis |l 149
* No Segel modtcetion(s) s SSowsd Grand total 5905.64
:;upt-um*: io final approvad from Ingurance Company
AT R T
Acknowiedged by Repairer (2055
Signatune:

Date:




=

MWork
ragc

Pte Ltd

TeamWork Garage Pte Ltd

33 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934
Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Tel : 6844 2475

E-mall ; claims@teamworkgarage.com
Register number : 201015366H

REPAIR PERFORMA INVOICE

First Capital Insurance Ltd Vehicle number GBH9575H
6 Raffles Quay. Make / Model TOYOTA/DYNA
Singapore 048580 ( 6 Upﬁ J Chassis number KDY2318035552
Accident date 12 March 2019
Reference 1903-23
Qty  Particulars Unit Price - SGD 5
PARTS REPLACEMENT - SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
Balance B/F #REF!
1 |TEL: 63583219 STICKER NEC 80.00 7
2 |EMAILSTICKER _ JLf 200.00 /|
1 |DYMNA STICKER S 50.00
1 [1500KG STICKER /i 50.00 U7
Subtotal 380.00
Balance C/F 380.00

(¢



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19004730/Esd3n2
416,01 1Ty HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date: 07052018 memmmw
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 8070J Veh. Inspected GBH 9575H
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No. D18001815MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MAY CHUA Assign Date 15/03/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA DYNA c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. KDY2318035552 Colour SILVER
Odometer 14507 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |17575R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |17575 R15 BRIDGESTOMNE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |175/75R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |175/75R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  12/03201% Inspection Date 01/04/2018
Survey held at TEAMWORK GARAGE PTE LTD
53 UBI AVENUE 1
#01-24
SINGAPORE 408934,
Sa. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUGCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: G250 4313

Reg. No: 199807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBH 9575H
; N Estimate Qur Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts gpm.ﬁﬁoh Wo rksﬁdﬁ?g'}] : ‘:%
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1| TAILGATE DENTED 1.910.80 1,588.00
2| TAILGATE LOWER BRACKET TO REPAIR SEE 304.70 -
LABOUR
2| TAILGATE STOPPER MOT NECESSARY 55.00 -
1|FLOOR PANEL STEP BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 298.10 -
2|REAR TAILLAMP 0/S BROKEN 315,90 157.95
2| TAILLAMP PANEL 0/S DENTED 294 .40 119.30
2| TAILGATE HINGE 0I5 DENTED 105.00 B80.00
1| TAILGATE LOWER MEMBER DENTED 485.80 485.90
1|SPARE TYRE CARRIER NOT NECESSARY 385.22 -
1|REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY B50.00 .
1|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING NOT NECESSARY 4250 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,261.88 -607.79
3,785.64 1.823.36
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|70KM/H STICKER (SN} NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|6 PAX STICKER (SN} NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 400.00 -
1| TEL: 63583219 STICKER (SN)(ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY BO.00 B0.00
2|EMAIL STICKER (SN)(ADDITIONAL) MECESSARY 200.00 160.00
1|DYMNA STICKER (SN)(ADDITIOMNAL) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|4500KG STICKER (SM)ADDITIONAL) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
840.00 360.00
LABOUR
CHECK REAR WIRING AND LIGHTING SYSTEM. 60.00 30.00
REMOWVE AND RENEW REVERSE SENSOR NOT MECESSARY 150.00 -
TRANSEER PARTS ATACHMENT FROM OLD TAILGATE  [NOT NECESSARY 200.00
TO NEW
PANEL BEATING ON AFFECTED AREAS.INCLUSIVE OF 600.00 550.00
THE REPAIR OF TAILGATE LOWER BRACKET.
SPRAY PAINTING ON AFFECTED AREAS. 500.00 400.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19004730/Esd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AJE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
/—! TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:2 of 2
- Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qi Description of Parts Condition ;
3 v Workshop (5))] _($)
APPLY ANTI RUST ON AFFECTED AREAS. 150.00 60,00
1,660.00 1,040.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,285.64 3,223.38
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,600.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19004730/Esd3n2
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CHEN TSUE YEE

Automotive Assessor

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Licensed Appraiser

DESCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor is made sobely for the use and benefit of the Client named on tha front paga of this Report.

part. An

B.Eng.,AMSOE.AMIRTE. AMSAE-A M.MATAI




