Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim <jamilahbegum@hcspl.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 5:46 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SLC1899) DOA: 09/03/2019 FINALIZATION
Attachments: juntaiyo@hcspl.com.sg_20190507_162438.pdf

Dear Veron,

We have issued the attached Invoice.
Kindly update Merimen to Offer for Acceptance.

Thank you & regards,

Jamilah

Auto Servicing

Total Vehicle Solutions Department

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

Jun Taiyo Service Centre (Automobile Leasing & Workshop)
8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

t: 6833 6265

e: jamilahbegum@hcspl.com.sg

w: www.hitachi-capital.com.sg

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, April 30,2019 8:51 AM

To: Vonn, LM Siow <vonnim.siow@hcspl.com.sg>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim <jamilahbegum@hcspl.com.sg>; JiongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLC1899) DOA: 09/03/2019 FINALIZATION

Dear Vonn,
Confirmed finalize amount $3609 @ 5 working days.

Will offer in merimen shortly.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Vonn, LM Siow <vonnlm.siow@hcspl.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 4:00 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim <jamilahbegum@hcspl.com.sg>; JiongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SLC1899) DOA: 09/03/2019 FINALIZATION

Hi Veron,

Please see attached.

Thanks & Regards

Vonn Siow

Motor Claims Advisor

Auto Servicing

Total Vehicle Solutions Department

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

Jun Taiyo Service Centre (Automobile Leasing & Workshop)
8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

DID: 6833 6274 Mobile: 96435107

e: vonnlm.siow@hcspl.com.sg

w: www.hitachi-capital.com.sg

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, April 29, 2019 3:49 PM

To: Vonn, LM Siow <vonnlm.siow@hcspl.com.sg>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim <jamilahbegum@hcspl.com.sg>; JiongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SLC1899) DOA: 09/03/2019 FINALIZATION

Dear Vonn,

No attachment.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vonn, LM Siow <vonnlm.siow@hcspl.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 April 2019 3:12 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim <jamilahbegum@hcspl.com.sg>; JiongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SLC1899) DOA: 09/03/2019 FINALIZATION




Dear Veron,
Thanks for your call.
Enclosed herewith the latest Audatex report for your reference.

Please finalise the COR.

Thanks & Regards

Vonn Siow

Motor Claims Advisor

Auto Servicing

Total Vehicle Solutions Department

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

Jun Taiyo Service Centre (Automobile Leasing & Workshop)
8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

DID: 6833 6274 Mobile: 96435107

e: vonnlm.siow@hcspl.com.sg

w: www.hitachi-capital.com.sg

From: Vonn, LM Siow

Sent: Friday, April 26,2019 12:17 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@I|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Jamilah, Binte MohdKassim <jamilahbegum@hcspl.com.sg>; JiongHow, Ng <jionghow.ng@hcspl.com.sg>
Subject: SLC1899) DOA: 09/03/2019 FINALIZATION

Dear Steve,
We refer to the subject above and the attachments are for your reference.

Kindly confirm the COR for us.

Thanks & Regards

Vonn Siow

Motor Claims Advisor

Auto Servicing

Total Vehicle Solutions Department

Hitachi Capital Asia Pacific Pte. Ltd.

Jun Taiyo Service Centre (Automobile Leasing & Workshop)
8 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629705

DID: 6833 6274 Mobile: 96435107

e: vonnlm.siow@hcspl.com.sg

w: www.hitachi-capital.com.sg




