Shmasnm . nw
If.\.ﬁ*' REC.BY: I REF: Cﬁlfﬂ | 400 46'53/@" "/cls lspecm T

Suejor - a8 ASSTGNMENT (Office)

o {Pesson); @R B §n c1x i Da.tc.ri'i:rnn;__lﬂiilm_@ 2-49pmM

Estimated Cost: Bill to:

on WS TP RES/ OD RESIEU’AIMIM‘.’IE‘E

To I¥fect Vehicle Ho, 31l 63384 mued:_ GRE S$303§
ut "I.U*‘-rlf..uh-.:p s e I G ?" '4 g8 g DT%'F_

- _J}éﬂl-_(lb ﬁ | iﬂ; 4_50 == il
F-:-t:q,r No: Clamm Ho: S&Lﬂ D 20 '-55@ 0>
Sumlswred __ Exess: —
o EArES Bk ;‘Jni‘;; oo
CA | REV | REP. | REV 24 HRS fﬁ a0e

H.OD, Endopsement:

DatefTime; MFYE@HBM Person Contacted: __"Lhﬂﬂﬂ__h . Velicle TN 'r -

Date/Time ﬁuilun-’llulnmunuf [/"" ) B iﬁh'ﬂt;

N L & .-. 4 .'..I-o— AR '_'.'|--:i.|': & I




\ REF:

bkl

Date:

From

Eslimated Cost

0D /TP | WS | TP RES | OD RES | EVAINV/ MV

T Ingpect Vehicle Mo o
At Warkshop mis b 1
of 1
Insurad
Paficy Mo

Claims Bo

Sum Ingured: Excess
{Client's Recard)
Make of Veh:
0 2 Lres t',r‘l--
(Palicy Condition) '

Bemark: The veh had commenced its
repair at the time of inspection.

Bal. or Market Value:

Consistent? : Yes or No

ASSIGNMENT

Tt

NS | OIS

_7%7_

IDAC Accident Rport:

s | PR Seen: Caonsistent? : Yes or No
Est. Repalrs: days Res: Yes or No
Lum Sum. iy 3val: Yes or No

CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS

Date: Person Contacted:

Vehicle: INJOUT

Yah Mo, éb{- é%; ge’? " Regn @BIWQO

Typa: M@M.cyclg | Bus | Van { Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover |

Hondn wezg| < (€76

Colour Pﬂb“/ﬂ MG Insured | Std ! NETNA
Sp Reading IW :l/‘/ T/Radio- Insured | Std | NI | NA

Eng/Mor - -
oo QU(R209)(

Gen, Cond: E‘@” Fair | Poor | Burnt

Truck | Traller m

Make

Sleering: Inofger | Jammed | Leaked | Burnt of

Brake: Inckeér | Jammed [ Leaked | Burnt or
Mod©  Nil | SIRim | STI(&RIm or
Tyre Size: F: Ug/ 6¢ﬂ %
i e
BS/ EXNOVA | GY | FS | LIZA | MIC | OHTSU | PIR | SUMII

-

TOYO | YOKD or

Rear

Eront
RiBal, é mm RiBal g mm
LiBal. é_. mm L/Bal mm
DOA Dol ol
s Iy —
W [
Survey held at (s 9 ¢

{2
Des. of Damages - Frt | : oIS | NIS | UIC | Rooftop or

-

The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected due to collision

Date | Time Action [ Instruckion

DataiTima, Fie Pass bo? - Preli. REPOT‘E

L

]
Dt T, File Retum o?

1 wle- 'BFH’

: Final Report

eomen
Bl o

Report Format ¢

Lump Sum / LB (5

—

R[-{.L ED I AL AR
Days Of Repair: &
Resurvey No. of Trip: ‘ Survey Fee.

) ' Transgortation
Add Fee: -Site Insp (3 }__S+RS_Si

) D: Intendew (% } Bhotos

[:' Tech lnvs (5 b Cilheirs
: D Weersnd (8 o 20
o [—




Veron 'Che-rl {LKK&UT.D} e s ——————————————————————————

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 12:38 PM
To: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram
Ce: SUR

Subject: RE: FW: SLL 6338G-DOA: 12/3/2019
Dear Thana,

MNoted with thanks.

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to CHINA TAIPING

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Erom: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram <thana@jackcars.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 12:31 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: Re: FW: SLL 6338G-DOA: 12/3/2019

Greetings M3, Veron ,

For an amicable settlement would agree with $4216.40 @ 4 working days.
Kindly revert.

Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

JACK CARS ENTERFPRISE PTELTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sq

On Tue, Jun 11, 2019 at 8:02 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Thana,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer part by part $4216.40 @ 4 working days.

Please check and confirm urgent please.



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 5:08 PM

To: thana (thana@ijackcars.com.sg) <thana@jackcars.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SLL 6338G-DOA: 12/3/2019

Dear Thana,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Offer part by part $4216.40 @ 4 working days.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consuitants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

f e —— e e
From: Bokhari Makrob <bokhari@aaplpro.com>

Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 11:22 AM

To: Chee So Chow

Cc Alfred Toh; SUR: Information aapl

Subject: RE: OUR REF : SNM19D201155C02

URGENT

Dear So Chow,

Our driver has attended at CAD interview,
ASP Choo Kwang Meng is asking for the survey report as well as the TPPD LOD urgently.

Thank you and regards.

BOKHARI BIN MAKROB

APPRAISALS

ASSOCIATES PTL LTD
2 Sims Close #06-14 Gemini @ Sims | | Singapore 387298 || D: 67472822 || M: 81384347

APPRAISALS ASSOCIATES PTE. LTD. Company registration 201707686W

The information contained in this message and any attachment[s) may be privileged and confidential and is intended for the exclusive use of
the addressee designated. If you are not the addressee any disclosure, reproduction, distribution, on-transmission, dissemination or use of the
communication is strictly prohibited. Whilst any attachments may have been checked for viruses you should rely on your own virus checking
programmes and procedures. To facilitate our communications we will store on our database your e-mail name and address together with any
other contact details you have provided. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual sender, except where the sender
specifically states them to be the views of Appraisals Associates Pte. Ltd.

From: Chee So Chow

Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 4:32 PM

To: SUR

Ce: Bokhari Makrob; Alfred Toh
Subject: OUR REF : SNM19D201155C02

Dear Veron

Please expedite on the survey report as thisisa police case.

Chee So Chow (Ms)
Deputy Manager
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

1 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
Direct (65) 6389 6176

Fax (65)6224 7175 /62247478

Email : claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com




sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com
Website:www.sa.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
In Sinpapere sinee 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,

please notify the sender immediately.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Friday, 10 May 2019 4:32 PM

To: SUR

Cc: Bokhari Makrob; Alfred Toh

Subject: OUR REF : SNM19D201155C02

Attachments: SNM19D201155C02 - PRI OF SLL6338G . pdf

Dear Veron

Please expedite on the survey report as this is a police case.

Chee So Chow (Ms)
Deputy Manager
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 073909
Direct (85) 6389 6176

Fax (65)6224 7175 /6224 7478

Email : claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com

Website:www sq.cntaiping com

\ N A I3
ALY
I Simgapare sinee |

Disclaimer :
This message is confidential its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in awritten agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,

use or dissemination. either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please natify the
sender immediarely.



Anaie Foo =

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Tuesday, March 19, 2019 10:43 AM
To: Angie Foo

Subject: FW: PRI of SLL6338G (ANR)
Attachments: PRI FORM.pdf

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram [mailto:thana@jackcars.com.sg]
sent: Wednesday, 13 March 2015 12:14 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=

Subject: PRI of SLL6338G

Greetings ,

Attached would be the PRI of SLL6338G for your kind perusal.

Kindly revert.
Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTELTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701500

Fax 67488834

Email ; thana@jackcars.com.sq

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com




JACK CARS a1

Cur ref 1 2019.JC.5LL46338G
Your ref : GBEB202G

13 MARCH 2019

PLEASE REPLY VIA EMAIL(thana@jackcars.com.sg)

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD | Surveyor from CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

3 Anson Road Vehicle  SLL&33BG  inspected as follows by Name:
#16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claims Dept Signature Signature Signature

2 DAY'S PRE-REPAIR NOTICE Date/Time: Date/Time: Date/Time:

Dear Sir/Madam,

NOTICE TO THIRD PARTY INSURER FOR PRE-REPAIR NOTICE

CLAIMANT: POON TECK JIN (JOJO TRANSPORT)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL4338G & GBE8202G ON 12™ MARCH 2019 ALONG CLEMENCEAU AVETO
NEWTON CIRCUS

We refer to the above matter wherein we are instructed to act for POON TECK JIN (JOJO
TRANSPORYT) , the owner of vehicle no. SLL6338G.

Our Client's vehicle SLL6338G is available as follows; please call prior appointment for the pre-
repair inspection:

Jack Cars Enterprise Pte Ltd

Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1,

#01-450,

Singapore 408701

Tel: 67488824 (Ms 5.Thanaletchumi)

Please arrange for the pre-repair inspection on the damaged vehicle within 2 working days from
the time of nofification, excluding Saturdays, Sundays and public holidays.

Regards,

S.Thanaletchumi

Claims Manager

Jack Cars Enterprise Pte Ltd

£:3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-450 5(480701) T:67488824 F:67488834 W:www jackcars.com.sg



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

E

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2019 3:49 PM

To: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram

Ca ‘assignments’

Subject: RE: PRI of SLL6338G

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir,

We will appoint LKK.
Dear LKE,

Pls pri.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 83896171

Fax: 62247175

Email: boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.cam
Website: www sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute o commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in @ written ogreement between you and Ching Taiping Insurance (Singopore) Pte, Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
gither in whale ar portial, is prohibited. If you ore not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram [mailto:thana@jackcars.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 14 March, 2019 3:43 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: Re: PRI of SLL6338G

Greetings Mr. Boon Sen ,

Would agree with Mr. Marcus as our SJE.

Kil‘ldhl' revert. Ting - 51 2y

Thank You. Jicon ThaN

Best Regards , o OV

5.Thanaletchumi (Ms) .

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTE LTD Caimmne. V

Office : 67488824

Maobile : 91701300 MW TP T L
Fax 67488834 | 4.5 Pl i Al oy



Email : thana@jackcars.com.sg

On Thu, Mar 14, 2019 at 3:42 PM Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong(@sg.cntaiping. com=> wrote:
Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs

\We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your motor
workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single
joint expert.

ADRIAN LING
Kelvin Ang

SEE CHEW SENG
MOHD FADHILAH BIN
OSMAN

XING QUO QIANG
KENNETH KONG
SIMON HO

CHUA WEIJIE
MARCUS CHUA
HENRY NG

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the
single joint expert.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen

Claims Executive

Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 0793008

Co. Reg No. 200208384E

DID: 83898171



Fax 62247175

Email boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com

\Website: www_sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer !

Thie message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where
provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance {singopore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or
dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. Ifyou are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the senderimmediately.

From: Thanaletchumi Santerashigaram {maiitn:thgna@'a;kcars,mm.sg]
sent: Thursday, 14 March, 2019 3:35 PM

To: Chong Boon 5en <hognsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>=

Subject: PRI of SLL6338G

Greetings Mr.Boon Sen ,

As spoken , attached would be the PRI of SLLB338G for your kind perusal.

Kindly revert,

Thank You.

Best Regards ,

S.Thanaletchumi (Ms)

JACK CARS ENTERPRISE PTELTD
Office : 67488824

Mobile : 91701900

Fax :67488834

Email : thana@jackcars.com.sgq




This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner |ID Type: Business
Owner ID: 5718)
PEVERICE De talEH S e St et e S Lo i g e | 0
Vehicle No.: SLL6338G
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 19 Mar 2019
Vehicle Make: HONDA
Vehicle Model: VEZEL 1.5XCVT
Primary Colour: Brown
Manufacturing Year: 2016
Engine No.: L15B4409270
Chassis No.: RU11209271
Maximum Power Qutput: 96.0 kW (128 bhp)
Open Market Value: $19,816.00
Original Registration Date: 03 Mar 2017
First Registration Date: 03 Mar 2017
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $9,816.00
[Elntended PARE Reb AT D ST i it (o o3 it e i U, i
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 02 Mar 2027
PARF Rebate Amount: $7,362.00
COE Expiry Date: 02 Mar 2027
COE Category: A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $49,430.00
COE Rebate Amount: $39,291.00
Total Rebate Amount: $46,653.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 19 Mar 2019

OK

RpsvrLIta gov.sgitanriiacionfenquireKebatedyHublicHetorelereg Input /E N [ HION_IL=FUSUSUUL T |

11



MPAZ19033316 | Progressive Car Care Pte Lid - B0

ENTRY DATE & TIME: 12032073 1546
' SUBMITTED BY. Lily Lim

IMPORTANT NOTICE

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

1 Please report comecty the delails of the accident to speed up the ctaims process
2 This Farm mist be completed by the Policyhoider and/or the Authorised Driver

3. information provided mus! be as truthiul and sccurale as

repudiate palicy fiabdity

possible. Any wilful misrepresantation or withalding af matenal facts may allow insurance companies o

4 The iseue and acceptance of this Form by Insurances compantes is not an admissicn of paolicy lability an the part of the insurance companies

5, Any false reporting may be refermed to the Police for in

6, This report will be forwarded by the ins
archiving and thal coples of this reporl will,

vestigation.
wrers of the GlA Records Management Cenlre established by the Genaral insuranca Association of Singapore [GIA) for
for a fes, be made available upan application oy interesled parties

7. By the lodgement of this repart 1o the insurars, you hareby comsent 1o e archiving of this repod at the centre and to copies of the reparl being made avallable

aforesaid

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

Country/State of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
MName Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Maodel

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used al

time of accident

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

12/03/2012 15:46

12/03/2019 14:30

CLEMENCEAU AVE TO NEWTON CIRCUS
SINGAPORE

SLLB338G

JOJO TRANSPORT
53355718J
JOJOCHENPL@GMAIL.COM

OFFICE-812B1765

HOMDA
VEZEL

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy un

for repair to your vehicle?

If Mo, Please state action to be taken

Vehicle Category
Insurance Company
Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage
Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number
Driver

Mame of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Mumber

Contact Number
EMail Address

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE HIRE

FWD SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

PNCVZ2019-00000209

POON TECK JIN
S1621271G

21111963

OUTDOCR

27071981

37 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-96179380

NOEMAIL

Fage 1ol 12



BLK 475D UPP SERANGOON CRESCENT #16-563
PARKLAND RESIDENCES

Postcode 537475
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES

. Address

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured
Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Wehicle =

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
MNumber of vehicles {(including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2
Was any body injured in the Accident? YES
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 2

Passenger 1 NAME: . RYNA YVETTE
GENDER: : FEMALE

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reparted to the police? NO

If ¥es, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO ATTACHED STATEMENT RECORDED BY LILY - PROGRESSIVE CAR CARE PTE LTD 6741 5336
Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Remarks/ Reasons: REQUEST FROM OWNER

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number GBEB202G

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Delails Of Properties

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Name of Driver TAN KHENG HONG
MNRIC/Passport Number 51200206H

Contact Murmber 96649898

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Page 2 of 12



Mature OFf Damage

* Mo, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Mame

Approximate Age

Injuries Sustain

Injured person in which vehicle?
Were seal belts worn?

Was this injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Address

Postcode

Name

Approximate Age

Injuries Sustain

Injured person in which vehicle?
Were seat belts wom?

Was this injured conveyed (o hospital by
ambulance?

Address
Postcode

DETAILS OF INJURED PERSON 1
POON TECK JIN

SLLE338G

DETAILS OF INJURED PERSON 2
RYMNA YVETTE

SLLE338G

Page 3 of 12
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| mcrcz CARS

ESTIMATE

DATE OF ACCIDENT : 12/03/2019

VEHICLE : SLL6338G

MAKE & MODEL : HONDA VEZEL

INSURANCE : CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE

SURVEYOR : LKK AUTO

PARTS CONDITION | AMOUNT
1. |REARBOOT . g,.c . ‘ 62| $1940 |~
2. | REARBOOT INNERCOVER ~ fu{ - 15,4 ] $520 |~
3. | REARBOOT GARNISH ~ 7X 1/ ¥ | $270 | ¢
4. |REARBUMPER . 2. o 2| sz20 |
5. | REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER 42 % p/V v $450 |y
6. | REAR END PANEL Y/ fspajr ¥ | s730 |
7. | REAR END PANEL TOP COVER / £ . 423 $240 |
8. | TALGATELAMP-INNER . , . c92| $780 |~
5. [ TAILGATE LAMP-OUTER , JoHX ~ oy | $920 |-
10. [LOCK -~ pT. - - 67, | $380 |-
11. | REARRIGHT SIDEPAD " 7 , 195 | 8480 |
74205
SPECIAL NETT asl v ] 2b. {Jf;
1. |REVERSESENSOR 2 | ./ % | $200 |¥
2. |RELAY SENSOR 7F / X | $180 |x
3. | WINDSCREEN MOULDING n | '"sW D
4. | SILICON SEALANT - ( M. $ 100 [cre
5. | CLIPS z ] $80 |2.
6. |‘HONDA"EMBLEM 7L njV $96 |y
7. |"VEZEL"EMBLEM . »¢C . S $76 |/
1o

A:3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-450 S(480701) T:67488824 F:67488834 W:www. jackcars.com.sg
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W3 JACK CARS n
: B
1 LABOUR
1. | TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT OF AFFECTED AREA oo $ 1200
2. | TO PANEL BEAT & RENEWAL OF ALL NECESSARY : $ 1500
DAMAGED BODY PARTS Poo
3. | TO CHECK WIRING & REWIRE Lo $ 80
TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL TAILGATE bo $ 120
COMPONENTS {
5. | TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REAR BOOT | $120
UPHOLSTERY _
8. | TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN (e | $200
7. | TO REMOVE & REINSTALL REVERSE & RELAY $ 150
SENSOR B “p"”_
8. | TO CHECK LIGHTING SYSTEM x | $120
— M
9. | ANTI RUST TREATMENT x| $120
230
PARTS -20% : | $ 5,584
SPECIAL NETT : | $ 880
LABOUR : | $ 3,610
TOTAL : | $ 10,074
7% GST : | $ 705.18
GRAND TOTAL : | $ 10,779.18
O (_lppyufs, '.,-?Hé-“/*’

b
F
1

tar S, hence nﬂllf]r
parer | "'~ following:
|I er spray painting

* Ta dispizy damaged parrs}l:lum;rmm
= F'ars prices ane subject 1o confirmation

* Third party survey i on a *Without Prejudice” basgis
* No iitegal modification(s) is allowsd
. _Suppremmrgr itemis) must ba and

& subject 1o final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowladged by Repairer
Signatune:
Data:

A:3007 Ubi Road 1 #01-450 S(480701) T:67488824 F:67488834 W:www. jackcars.com.sg




Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno1sss07158R
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: BB44-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CS/CTI12004683/GVD3aN2
Date: 11/06/2019
REFERENCE
Handling . ; . .
lemirar China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Fle. Lid. Policy No:
Claimant i
h | | z BE
Vehicle No : SLLB338G nsured Vehicle No : GBEB202G
Date of Loss: 12/03/2019 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: N/A
D PT D 1
Reg No: SLLB338G
Make & Model: HONDA VEZEL, 1.5 (A) Engine No: L15B4409270
Reg. Date: 03/03/2017 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: RU11209271
Colour: Brown Odometer; 144524 km
Engine Capacity: 1496 cc
Market Value/Mew Car NIA

Price:
Sum Insured (S%):

Market Value/New Car Price

C ICLE HE T
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/60R16 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60R16
Front Left Side: Dunlop 6 mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop & mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop 6 mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop 8 mm
Tha above values represant the remaining fyre ireads deplh
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference Diff %
Parts 6,464.00 2,886.40 3,577.60 55.35
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,610.00 1,330.00 2,280.00 63.18
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (55) 10,074.00 4,216.40 5,857.60 58.15
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 705.18 20515 41003 58.15
Nett Amount (S5$) 10,779.18 4,511.55 6,267.63 58.15
IN CTION
Date of Assignment: 25/03/2019
Date Inspected: 18/03/2019 Inspected At: Jack Cars Enterprise Pte Ltd - Ubi (HQ)

Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-450

Singapore 408701

Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG

NOTE: This report represents our findings &f the time and place of inspection sfated herein. Such inspection has been carned ouf to the Des!

Manager: VERON CHEN

krowiedge and abiity but any other ability under any ather circumstances is heraby axpressly excluded

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/ index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g...

of aur

11/6/2019



Adijuster Report Page 2 of 3
REPAIR DETAILS

Reference |
\Part Source: MRM-5G \ersion: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 11 Jun 2018) |
Parts: M1-5UW HONDA VEZEL 1.5 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0) |
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List}

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLLE338G)

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page |
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Validity:

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BOOT Buckled 1,540.00 FL *g72.40FL
2 1 *REAR BOOT INNER COVER Cut 520.00 FL *“153.40FL
3 1 *REAR BOOT GARNISH Mot Necessary 270.00FL “.FL
4 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed 730.00FL *463.TOFL
5 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER COVER Mot Necessary 450.00 FL *FL
6 1 *REAR END PANEL Repair 730,00 FL *-FL
7 1 “‘REAR END PANEL TOP COVER Deformed 210.00FL *02 30FL
8 1 “TAILGATE LAMP-INNER Cracked 750.00FL  *529.20FL
9 1 *TAILGATE LAMP-OUTER Cracked §20.00 FL *B57.40FL
i1 *LOCK Bent 380.00FL  *™157.10FL
1 1 *REAR RIGHT SIDE PAD Deformed 480.00FL  *195.00FL
122 1 *REVERSE SENSOR Mot Necessary 200.00F5 “-Fg&
13 1 *RELAY SENSOR Mot Necessary 180.00FS *FS
14 1 “WINDSCREEN MOULDING Mecessary 160.00FS *50.00FS
15 1 *SILICON SEALANT Mecessary 100.00FS *40.00F5S
16 1 *CLIPS Mecessary BO.DOFS *30.00FS
17 1 *HONDA EMBLEM Not Necessary 95.00FS *~F5
18 1 *VEZEL EMBLEM Mecessary 75.00FS *30.00FS

F=Franchise part, S=Spchett L=ListhemDisc. -

Sub Total (S5) 7.,860.00 3,570.50

. List ltem Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S§) 1.396.00 684.10

Total Parts (S%) 6,464.00 2,886.40

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

hltps:f-’singﬂpnre.mcrimen.::om.h:laimsfindﬂx.ulm‘?fusebﬂx=MTRadjuster&fuseaclinn=g. . 11/6/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 3 of 3

Mo Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINT OF AFFECTED AREA New 1,200.00 700.00

2 TO PANEL BEAT & RENEWAL OF ALL NECESSARY Mew 1.500.00 400.00
DAMAGED BODY PARTS

3 TO CHECK WIRING & REWIRE Mew 80.00 30.00
TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL TAILGATE Mew 120.00 60.00
COMPONENTS }

5 TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REAR BOOT MNew 120.00 0.00
UPHOLSTERY }

6 TO REMOVE AND REINSTALL REAR WINDSCREEN MNew 200.00 100.00

7 TO REMOVE & REINSTALL REVERSE & RELAY SENSOR  New 150.00 40.00

8 TO CHECK LIGHTING SYSTEM New 120.00 0.00

9 ANTI RUST TREATMENT MNew 120.00 0.00

Gross Labour Cost (S3$) 3,610.00

1,330.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

]

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfi m?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 11/6/2019



