Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April 2019 2:42 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: TP CLAIMS - AJR6178 AGAINST QX1031B DOA 01/03/2019
Attachments: EST.PDF; POLICE REPORT.PDF

CS/SPF19004662/R1vd3

From: Suann <suann@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 9:37 AM

To: Frankie_THAY@spf.gov.sg; Rosalyn_TAN@spf.gov.sg

Cc: Abdul_Rahman_Mohamad_Salim@spf.gov.sg; tanyw@mova.com.sg; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>;
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - AJR6178 AGAINST QX1031B DOA 01/03/2019

Dear sir / Mdm
Please advice the liability for direct settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards

Suanne Chiu

Claims Asst.Manager
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: +65 6272 3892

Fax: +65 6270 8314

@MOVA

Auvlomative Pla Lid

Connect with us on nhﬂ

Privileged/Confidential Information may be contained in this message. If you are not the addressee indicated in this message (or responsible for delivery of the
message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by
reply email. All opinions, conclusions and other information expressed in this message not of an official nature shall not be deemed as unless otherwise indicated
by an authorized representative independent of this message.

From: Nitha [mailto:nitha@mova.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 21 March 2019 11:09

To: Frankie THAY@spf.gov.sg; Rosalyn TAN@spf.gov.sg

Cc: Abdul Rahman Mohamad Salim@spf.gov.sg; 'Suann'; tanyw@mova.com.sg
Subject: RE: TP CLAIMS - AJR6178 AGAINST QX1031B DOA 01/03/2019

Dear Frankie & Rosalyn,
Please kindly advise on the liability for the this case.

Thank you,

Best Regards,



N UHroe
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA o o

Automolive Plte Ltd

From: Nitha [mailto:nitha@mova.com.sq]

Sent: Tuesday, 12 March 2019 3:44 PM

To: 'Abdul_Rahman_Mohamad_Salim@spf.gov.sg'

Cc: 'Suann'; 'tanyw@mova.com.sg'

Subject: TP CLAIMS - AJR6178 AGAINST QX1031B DOA 01/03/2019

Dear Mr Rahman,
Kindly assist to advise on liability & assign surveyor for the above mention case.

Thank you

Best Regards,
N tHrao
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Plte Ltd



