Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi Veron,

CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter <pandan_cr@sparkcarcare.com>
Friday, 29 March 2019 11:48 AM

Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto)

Denise Tay (LKKAuto); SUR

Re: AFTER Adjust and finalization for vehicle SJL7887E

img-329110404-0001.pdf; img-329110412-0001.pdf

Kindly refer to the attachment which is the invoice and DV for the following case .

Thank you.

Chen Chee Kiong
Pandan Crash Repair

ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte. Ltd.

DID 68676919

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 29 March 2019 11:23:00 AM
To: CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter; Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: AFTER Adjust and finalization for vehicle SIL7887E

Dear Chee Kiong,

Re-confirm repair amount @ $13,977.01 (before less excess$750.00) @ 5 working days.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter <pandan_cr@sparkcarcare.com>

Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 2:35 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: AFTER Adjust and finalization for vehicle SIL7887E

Hi Veron,



Kindly refer to the attachment as supplementary list .

Thank you.

Chen Chee Kiong

Pandan Crash Repair
ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte. Ltd.
DID 68676919

From: CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter

Sent: Thursday, 28 March 2019 9:05:45 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Ng Zong Xiong; Johari Bin Cary
Subject: Re: AFTER Adjust and finalization for vehicle SIL7887E

Hi Veron,

Any updated for the following case ?

Thank you.

Chen Chee Kiong

Pandan Crash Repair
ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte. Ltd.
DID 68676919

From: CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 8:53:18 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Ng Zong Xiong; Johari Bin Cary
Subject: Re: AFTER Adjust and finalization for vehicle SIL7887E

Hi Veron,

Finalize cost of repair amount @ $13,154.86 is wrong should be $13977.01 (before less excess$750.00)
Attach audatex final report and invoice supplier for you re confirm cost of repair.

Please confirm and reply ASAP we need close this case by this month .

Hope to hear soonest ,

Thank you,

Wong Chee Wei
Pandan Crash Repair



ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte. Ltd.
DID 68676919

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 March 2019 3:39 PM

To: CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter; Rasul (LKKAuto)
Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: AFTER Adjust and finalization for vehicle SIL7887E

Dear Chee Kiong,

Confirmed finalize amount $13,154.86 before excess $750 @ 5 working days.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CDGE Pandan Private Cars Crash Repair Counter <pandan cr@sparkcarcare.com>
Sent: Thursday, 21 March 2019 7:16 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: AFTER Adjust and finalization for vehicle SJL7887E

Hi Rasul ,
Kindly refer to the attachment and prepare the finalization .

We will like to close the following case by this month .

Thank you.

Chen Chee Kiong

Pandan Crash Repair
ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte. Ltd.
DID 68676919



