A B Y. | ki es [ eTt A wéue rﬂﬂdiﬂy-. e
R Ft‘.itt‘\ ASSTGNMENT ((OFfice)y |
. Fron {eszing % ﬂm S¢n 0l €L Lhates Ui H—M.M1 ]HFM

Liibinnntigel € 7uaid . e
OD VA WS T RES 1 OD RESTEVA INV I MY % .
Vi bt Welingle T S'I'L n?ﬁ‘l MI’N{ Inganreil: &R"l U'TL
il Wokshge p"hl’ﬂlﬂ'u' Fel:
o 303 Buxande goad
Paakiey Ha (a v SN T W18 Clainn M SMI P20l e er
R TR TR - Hxoem
Mk of Vidy DO Q.3 %19
§1 Hirnd e Hrwssnily e
CA L REV 7 REP. 1wy 24 1w "“l' ILCKER. Fisiloganien!

Lhgle/ e 1= ¥ "'1 q.,}dr-l"'l Permom Combacti (‘"WHN‘ Velule i :@

.“.""i"l'l“'__ ﬁll'illlllqlf'il‘!_lﬂ_i:q_.{ L,/‘Il I"_l.'h'l,‘ll.'
(s ITCI 1T 00 )y

E Ly

"|| i 1y )

- K T. W
W90 &1 cB Confrmad wirte Custine o M 6 23eL.30, 3 days,
Chd & S1550 , 75 ) B




REF: [l

L ]

=2
i

o

77

From
=stimgtest Lost
0Ly TP /WS | TP RES | 0D RES | EVA INV | MY

— i ey D
To Ingpect Vishicle No NiE- X

st
al Wotkshop mis ,f A :

d 403 Mevanded  faa
Insured

Pollcy N

Claima No

Sum Insured Ewcess

[Olignls Recoid)

| 1&11”
ASSIGNMEN]
Wl Mo SLK' uglg i1 Hinign hr‘ | w
T M M.Cycia | Bus / Van | Lorry | Taui | Prime Mover |
Truch | Trailer o

Mobe MW J20 T o 199%
Calaur Mk_ A Imsured | Std | NI MA&
spResdng X OO TR Insured 1 Std [ NI | NA
EngMNa
oo WBAER [boobh w3 FHAK

Gen Cond: Good (Rag | Poor ( Burnt

Slearing: | | Jammed | Leaked | Burnt or
Brake I Jammed | Leaked | Burnl of

Make of Veh Madli - Nl { STD AIRIm or
dfter (O = TyeSize.  F }‘)61 SoR (7
{Policy Condition) S R: R
Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | 0% | | 8BS/ DUNIEXNOVA I GY | FS I LIZA I MIC | OHTSU @sum |
repair at the lime of Inspection. TOYO | YOKO o *
Bal. of Markel Value Frgil R
IDAC Accldent Rpor Consistent? - Yes or No R/Bai mim HiBal f i
GlA | PR Seam Consistent? - Yes ar No L/Bal mm LBl et
Est Repairs F'!- days Res: Yes or No DOA %‘I{ﬂ Dol ﬂ&rﬁ‘i
4
Lum Sum % 3Val: Yes or No Survey held &l P pri it
wif Frt 1 OIS | NIS | UIC | Roaftop of
CA | REV J REP. | 24HRs M/ o of Demaget Fit -l p
Vehicle INJOUT
Oite Parson Contacted: The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected dus to collision
Date | Timea Action /| Instruchon

RECEIVEY &=

i T, Filr Pasa 7 D: Prell. Report

i) 5"?'&* '-ﬁ/?f-:';?.}" D: Final Report

DT Fle Rotam (o7

n Add Fee:

nee-7

Report Format :
330k Be

Lump}:‘.‘ LB, (3

AR 2008
"y
Days Of Repair; ’;'
Resurvey No. of Trip: Survey Fee:
Transportae
‘Site Insp (¥ ) Sems 8 P
EI' Interview (% | Proms '

Tech. Invs (% ) (e

Waeekapnd {5 i

1GTAL




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Chong Boaon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2019 3:28 PM

To: PBSP

Ce: ‘assignments’

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201170 - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SLK1232R &
GBGG67R ON 08/03/2079 - ANR+FRS

Attachments: SKM_55B219031208150.pdf; SLK1232R(MARCH) . pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir,

We assign LKK,

Dear LKK,

Pls pri.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive

Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #18-00 Springleal Tower

Singapore 079809

Co. Reg. No. 2002083B4E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175

Email. boonsen chong@sg cntaiping com
Website www sg cntaiping.com

Dsclaimer

This message &5 confidential; jts contents do not constitute o commitment by Ching Taiping insurance [Singapore] Pre. Lid, except where provided
forin g written agreement between you and China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unautharized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partiol, is prahibired, If you are not the intended recipient of the message. please notify the sender immediately.

From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 14 March, 2019 2:06 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM19D201170 - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SLK1232R & GBGG67R ON 08/03/2019
- ANR+PRS

Dear Boon Sen

We are agreeable to use a common surveyor - LKK Auto - as the SJE.

1 Ay L. 2
Thank you. prfee - (arg o™
Regards, v - o

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint Egrefilbd



303 Alexandra Road Singapore 158941
DID: 6319 0174 Fax: 6479 4601

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.cho .cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 14 March 2015 10:50:44 AM

To: PBSP

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201170 - REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SLK1232R & GBG667R ON 08/03/2019
- ANR+PRS

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs
We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your motor
workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single
pint expert.
ADRIAN LING
Kelvin Ang
SEE CHEW SENG
MOHD FADHILAH BIN
OSMAN
XING QUO QIANG
KENNETH KONG
SIMON HO
CHUA WEIJIE
MARCUS CHUA
HENRY NG

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors
as a single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the
single joint expert.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Tower

Singapore 078008

Co. Reg No. 200208384E

DID: 63886171

Fax 62247175

Email boonsen.chong@@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www sg cntaiping com

Dischairmer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute o commitment by Chinag Taiping nsuronce (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except where provided
for in a written ogreement between vou and China Toiping Insurance [Singapare) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole ar partial, (s prohibitted. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: PBSP [malilto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.

Sent: Tuesday, March 12, 2019 8:19 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg. cntaiping.com>

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SLK1232R & GBG66TR ON 08/03/2019

Dear Sirs,



We refer to the above matter.

We have instructions from our client to seek repair cost and loss of use/car rental from you through Direct
Settlement

Attached Is the estimates and supporting documents for your consideration,

Please let us have your confirmation that you agree that liability is clear and we may proceed with Direct Settlement.

If Direct Settlement is approved, kindly let us have your offer for LOU / rental.

Thank you
Regards,

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

DID: 6319 0174 Fax; 8479 4801

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the
named addressee ("the Recipient”) and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or
proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws.
If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding
and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete
all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the
Message being infected by computer virus or other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions

expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime
Dm_h}li 5_-“-

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.svmanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com




Shiau Chan [LKI{Autnz

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April 2019 1:28 PM
To: PBSP: Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: FINAL REPORT / SLK1232R

Dear Caroline,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm final fig $3,306.30 before GST and 3 repair days.

Kindly send the relevant documents to China Taiping Insurance company.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@ [kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 13 April 2019 11:45 AM

To: Rasul [LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FINAL REPORT / SLK1232R

Dear Sirs

We refer to the above and attached Final Report.

Please confirm COR as follows:

Total Labour : 2,014.00
Total Parts:  1,292.30
Total Labour & Parts : 3,306.30

Repair days: 3

Thank you.

Regards,
Caroline



WEML1B0AZAED | Pefarmance Mors Leonied - Mesandra
ENTRY DATE & TINE: 11038 1400
SUSMITTED BY Meinnie Sebavweti

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Plamss raport mrlm:u:- the details af e accdant o apesd up e Clema process

2 This Form musl be completed by the Palicyholder andior the Authonsed Dnver

1. Information provided must be as ruthful and accurate as possible. Amy wilful msrepresantation or wilhelding of ratenal lacls may allow insurance companies (o
repudinte palicy lability ———————

4. The issue and scceptancs of thin Form by INEUraNcs companies M not an admisson of policy Lebillty on fhe part of e INSuM@NGe COMPaNIES

5 Any false reporiing may be referred to the Police for imvestigation.

8, This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GiA Records Management Cenire established by the General Insurance Associaton of Singapone (GLA| for
prchiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made avaidable upon applcabon by inleresled parmies

T. By the lodgemeni of this report o the insurers, you héfeby consent to the archiving of ihis roport af he centre and io coples of the report being made availahle
aforesma

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 11/03/2012 14.00

Date Of Accident 08/03/2019 18:00

Exact Location Of Accident JALAN BUKIT MERAH
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number SLK1232R
Insured/Palicyholder

Name Of Registered Owner GOH BEE LAY

NRIC No S7232077H

Email Addrass PAM.GOHES@GMAIL.COM
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-01558995
Altemative Phone No OTHERS-91558995
Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturar BMVY

Model 3201 SPORTS

Exacl Purpose for which vehicle was being used al

time of accident NORMAL USAGE

Arg you claiming under your own insurance palicy

for repair to your vehicle? NC

If No, Please state action o be laken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category FRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company LIBERTY INSURANCE PTE LTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy NO

Policy Numbser UNAVAILABLE

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver GOH BEE LAY

NRIC No ST232077H

Data Of Birth 04/08/1872

Occupation OUTDOOR

Date Of Driving Pass 02/03/19485

Driving Experiance 24 YEARS AND 0 MONTHS
Gander FEMALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +55-91558995
Fax Number

Contact Number OTHERS-01558985

EMail Addrass PAM.GOHO9@GMAIL.COM

Page 1af 11



Address BLK 5158 TAMPINES CENTRAL 7 # 13-18
Postcode 522515

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

It Ne, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured  OWNER

Vehicle Registration Number of Dnver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vahiche -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Waeather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any loreign vehicle involved in this acciden!? NO

MNumber of '-I‘Bhl‘.':FE? {including own vehicla) 2

invalved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO

ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| have been approached by unknown persan(s)

soliciting/oflering accident claims essistance, NO
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

VWas the accident reported to the polica? NO
If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution glven? NO
If Yes.againsl whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO ATTACH,

Attachmeni(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES

Was there any audio recorded? ND
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number GBGEETR
Vehicle Maka/Model/Colour TOYQOTA SILVER
Details Of Properiies

Vehicle Category
Name of Dnver
MNRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Addrass

Pastcode
Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
SHAHMIL EKNUR BIN EKRAM
S8026022G

87529844

SHAH'S COMPANY IS DAYPLUS FOOD FTE LTD
65150948

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.
FRONT

Page 2 of 11



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN
IMPORT

1 Hemrmﬂmmlmn:dmmmtmumuptnnm:prm.
1 This Form rust b gompl

E it

3 information providee must Ee a0 truthtul pod scourste a3 pogsible Any wilful misregrisentation or withholding of matarisl
faces may aliow insurance companies to repudliate policy llabilly.

4. The lssee #99 acceptance of this Form by ‘meurance companies i3 not an admisslan of policy Lebility on the port gl the imwrance
comoanies

5. Any false reporung may be referred 1o th Folice for investigation

€. Tha report will be torwarded by the insurars of the GIA Becords Manzg=men Cantre establiished by the General nsurance

Association of Sngapore (GIA] for archiving end that copies of this repert will for a fee be made available upon zpplication by
Intarayted Farties

7. By the lodgment of this repart to the Ingurees, yeu hereby consent 1o the archiving of this report st the cenre and 0 cofies of
the repart beng mede svallable aforessic,

B Conent under the Personal Dats Frotection Act [POPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that

{3l My inturer, my workihop and the Gereral Insurance Association of Simgapore [“GIA" | may/are permities to caliect, uie,
disclose wnd/or process my pericna| gata/persenal information et eut i thig [form|] and #ry other persanal information
provided by me or passsared by mry Insurer (collestivaly the “Personsl information”] ana disciose and transter such
Feryoral informatian to all insureris} wha have insured vehicle|s) involved i this sccdent [all ingurer(i) wha kave insured
vehicle(s| invalved in this accident shail be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the insurers’ lmwyer/low firma, the
Manetary Author(ty of Singapore snd any relevant governmen sgeEncy/authonty (such as the paiice], for the purposels)
d’.

ll] precessing, handing snd/or dealing weh my clalmi including the seitiement of the claims and any necessary
imemstigations redating o the claims;

[li] Irvewstigating the sccident andjer my daims:
{lil} carnying out andlor desfing with my inttructions o responding to any enguities by me:

[v] adminlatering my claim (including the malling of correspondence. SATEMANTS, Mvoices, TeRArts o notices 1o me,
wiich eauid invcive disciolure of certain personal daty about me to bring about delivery of the tame 25 well 51 on the
external cover of snvelopey/mad paceages); pnd/for

{v} compiying with applicable law in sdmiristering, processing, handiing and/us gealing with my clami jeallectvly the
“Purposes”)

(o] allingurer(s) wha have invured vebiche(s] mvalved in this secident anl thet Insuress’ imwypersiaw firms, may/are pesmined
to collest, use, disclose and/or process my Parsoms) Information for ane o more of the above Pumpotes, and

£} my Persanal Information may/can be diszlosed By sny of the Inurers and/or 1A o their third party service providers o
agentsiinzluding ther lewyeru/law firms], which may be sited outtide of Singapore, tor ane or more of the above Pusposes

(€] my Personal information will sl be ealeceed and ubed 0 compile clams hustory fer the purpose of fraud detectinn,
imrvestigation and management in prasent and s futurs claims

[#] the information w caliecies under |d] sbeve may be thares / disclosed

b} te & imurers andfor any other third parties that assist in sudlGating mueitigating, controlling or managing fraua,
regulaton, law enforcement and government agoncies 33 ressonably required for the purpases stated, of

%f for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws ar Cour efders -

Wr: Sigrature Orver's Sigrature Recorting Centre Persannel’s Slgnatuce
Date & Time: 'I:'\ 1“§-ﬁ°“ﬂfﬂhﬂl 18 novt Lhe puboyholoer] Fame

1\\_?- “\ B Dute & Time: WRIC/F N M.

Page 3 of 11



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

SKETCH PLAN

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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= s ES L157E01%S3E O5T Neg. W5 MO-J930081 -
AL A NS Ty ey fime Dariy minene plniee
Singapere 199341 Singapore 430140 Sy ST |AltmrSnlan
Tel. 3198180 (Ealew & Adsim) Tel., SILFOAAN (AftacEales EI1FR511/538 |Wozorradi
E1L9R1LL (ATEerSalswi Fax. &HARTT) FEx. E4TRESRD |AfrerEainm
Fax EETATTTE EaThEEId Iz errmd)
GST REG. NO : M2 - 0020081 - X
12 MAR 2019
ESTIMATE
[ Estimate No. : bl 50447 Fage No. l1of 5
Date Estimated : 11/03/2019
L Prepared By : Kevin Leong Wai EKit
- ESTIMATE REPAIR FOR - - ACCOUNT - 135

Goh Bea Lay
515B Tampines Central 7
#13-18

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

| Singapore 522515

REGN. NO. CHASSIS HNO. REGHN. DATE MODEL MILEAGE
SLK1232R NU39695 06/01/2017 320iA/4Dx 0 )
DESCRIPTION  VALUE
Tore replace rear bumper panel and all attachmenis cause by §Su 1.7e000
accidant
Painting on rear bumper panel 9% Y 1 00
To check electrical wiring systems al the rear section [TV .00
for proper function.
Sundries. 4 BO.OD
Tota abour 2,995.00
DESCRIPTION - QrY PRIC VALUE
RR EUMPEH BOTTOM REINFORCEMENT 1 69.80 69.80
REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUIDE :,} 1 3290 3290
REAR BUMPER CARRIER (ECE) * g 1 4B7.95 467 .95
REAR BUMPER TOWING EYE C{WER PRIMED l’*"‘-\j 1 4325 4325
REAR BUMPER LH SIDE GUIDE T 1 58.50 58.50
REAR BUMPER RH SIDE GUIDE T 1 58.50 58.50
REAR BUMPER BLACK TRIM STRIP © 1 81.40 81.40
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED {IJHES] "f" @ 1 117230 1,172.30
SET MOUNTING PDC/PMA SENSOR REAR 1 6695 66.95
DECOUPLING RING PDC TORQUE CCINVERTE 4 5.05 20.20 |
(DG/SL) ADHESIVE SET KB A%, — 1 53.05 53.05
Total Parts 2,124 B0

n'l‘



=« =uc Performance Mutors Limited

& mp=ier =f the lse Darkby &

Cp. Reg, Bn I¥TAULIAME OFT lﬂ e M -DO30HL - x
i § e Eoad

§05. Alsmmndrs Boad 80, Esmpong AZang Road i-:-. ‘:‘;::‘-;-l:i:l.:l:'i TREE T
Iiss Darby Perforoance Cestre Engy Coast :ﬂ::"_:'! Eingapore 319844
Singapere 1598l Fiagapore 438181 TRl &1190838 Afterfales
Tal W)IIMOT00 {Salem & Admam) Tl SEIFOERF (AJCErSaies | 1100 FEIE (MoterTRd

2180111 ThfterSaing) tax $HATTT) FRx  E4IREED] |AfrerSales
Fam, Suislvid ERTREEDS iMoterTad

GST REG. NO : M2 - 0020081 - X

ESTIMATE

J

Estimate No.

Date Estimated
Prepared By

: bl 50447
: 11/03/2019
: Kevin Leong Wai Kit

Page No. : 2 of §

REGN. NO. CHABSIE NOD. REGN. DATE MCDEL MILEAGE
SLK1232R NU356595 06/01/2017 320iA/4Dr 0
"
@
>
w/o!ﬁn |
I
Qurvon by |
|
I
Lz
Labour 1 2,985.00 ]
Parts 2,124.80
Labour 2 0.00
Excess 0.00
Total GST @ 7% 358.39
Grand Total 5|475-19
“* THIS ESTIMATE IS VALID FOR A PERIOD OF 30 DAYS ONLY** LA b

** PRICE FOR PARTS ARE SUBJECTED TO CHANGE WITHOUT PRIOR NOTICE ** il




Performance Motors Limited

i ey o P Terew Daitey Grnug:
o, Py, e, 10780 TESAN. GT B, Ma WP -OETCORT N

FINAL REPORT
Estlmate Mo, Bl 50447 Fage Mo.
Oate Est|mated 11/03/2019
Prapared By Esvin Leong Wai Kit
REPAIR FOR - = ACCOUNT - 135
Goh Bas Lay China Taiping Insurance (5] Pte Ltd
5158 Tampines Centzal 7 3 Anson Road
#13-18 #16-00 Springleaf Towsrc

Singapors 079909
Singapore 532515

REE N CHASSI S5 NO REGM DATE MIDEL M LEACE
SLEK123ZR NU3IAESS 0&/01/2017 3204A74Dr o
DESCRIPTION ORIGINALPRICE  DISC. % NETT
To raplace rear bumper panel and attachments include 850.00 850.00
knocking out dents caused by the accident
To spray paint rear bumpser 834.00 934.00
To check etectrical wiring systems at the rear section 150.00 150.00
for proper function
Sundries B0.00 B80.00
DESCRIFTION UNIT PRICE QTY _ DISC.% NETT
REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (LINES) 1,172.30 1,00 1,17230
SET MOUNTING PDCIPMA SENSOR REAR 66.95 1.00 66.95
[DGISL) ADHESIVE SET KE 53.06 1.00 53.05
& SUPPLEMENTARY ITEMS
Toial Labouwr ; 201400
Total Parts : - 129230
Total Labour & Parts : 3,306.30
Deduction for Excess : S
Total Repair Costs less Excess: 3.306.30
GST &7%: B 23144
Grand Total : 3,537.74

Final Report SLK1232R, Pags 1 Finalisad by; Carpline DID: 63190174 Fax 64794601



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING |
Case  |[Wotihed  |Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Ad) Rpt Ad) Subrrittest | Ins Auth'ed Status
17 Apr 2019 Pending for Survey
| Man |17 Aer2019 18:08 $$3,306.30  5$3,306.30 :
£an Adj Aot | o esomates | | _view Ao Cancel Cise |

Reference

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by insurer]

Insured: |-, ID: .
Main
Clalimant:
Vehicke Keg. | . 108032019 18:00 - :59

No. SLEAIR2R Date of Loss! |12 Months and 2 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r))

Claim Type: | TP / SNM19D201170C02 PoCV/CaVer | DMCVSNI17704818011

|GOH BEE LAY, 1D: 57132077H

Palicy No
Itmmnu;
_ |Exoms  [S8D.00 = —
| Performance Motors Limited (Alexandra) 301 alesandra Road, Sime Darty Performance Cantre, 159941 Alexandra - Tell
| 631901 72/531001 74 =

!ﬂh‘l'llﬂu Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111

| UNAVAILABLE
|

. [Handied by Chong Boon San |

Liberty Insurance Pie Ltd (HQ) - Tel: (65) 6221 B611
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5255-1561 . [Handled by MOHD RASUL] . [Final Rpt due 26/04/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED
There are no mall for this ase.

View M1l | Compose Case mail |
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (cores e 1sssor1eer)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CSICTI8004544/R10D302

Date: DEMN5/2018
REFERENCE
; China Talping Insurance 1 .
Handling Insurer (Singapore) Pte. Ltd Paolicy No DMCVSN1TT04818011
E::I_rnlm Vehicle SLK1232R :l:umd Vehicla GBGESTR
: o
Date of Loss: 03/03/2019 MNature of Claim: TP E:'_m SNM18D201170C02
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No SLK1232R
Make & Model: BMW 3201, 2.0 LED NAV SHAD. LIGHT (A) Engine No: 20950604B48B20A
Reg. Date: 06/01/2017 (Man, Year, 2016) Chassis No: WEBABA 16000NU3SE95
Colour; Black Odometer: 45740 km
Engine Capacity 1898 cc
Market Value/New Car Pnce: N/A
Sum Insured (55) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/50 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225/60 R17
Front Lefl Side: Pirelli 6 mm Rear Left Side: Piralll 8 mm
Front Right Side Pirelli 8 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli 8 mm
The above vaites represeni the remaining tyre treads deolh
COST OF CLAIMS ‘Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 220480 1,372.30 832.50 37.76
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 Q.00 0.00
Labour 2.815.00 1.934.00 961.00 3365
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 5,119.80 3,306.30 1,813.50 35.42
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5§) 358.39 231.44 126.95 3542
Nett Amount (S§) 5.478.19 3.537.74 1,940.45 35.42
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 17/04/2019
Date Inspected 20/03/2019 Inspected Af; Performance Motors Limited (Alexandra)
303 Alexandra Road, Sime Darby
Perfarmance Centre
Singapore 159641
Estimated Period of Repair 3.0 days
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Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: SHIAU CHAN

NOTE. This rport mpresents our findings af the ima and place of ingpechion stafed hevein. Such ngpection hoa besn camed out fo the basf of our
knowladge and abiity but any offer hability wnder amy ather croumstances s hvedy exprassly arciuded.
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Parl Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: D6 May 2019)

Parts: 143 BMW 3201 2.0 LED NAV SHAD. LIGHT (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominaled Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLK1232R)

Validity: These estfimales are valid only if they contain the print code |above) on all estimale pages. running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the lasl estimate page

[Further Info: lemsivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk °.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *SUNDRIES MNecessary 80.00FS *B0.O0FS
2 1 *RR BUMPER BOTTOM REINFORCEMENT Nol Necessary B9.80FS *-F5
i 1 *REAR BUMPER CENTRE GUIDE Not Necessary 32.90FS *.F5
4 1 *REAR BUMPER CARRIER (ECE) Mol Necessary 467 85FS “-F5
5§ 1 ‘REAR BUMPER TOWING EYE COVER PRIMED Not Necessary 4325F3 *F5
(-] 1 *REAR BUMPER LH SIDE GUIDE Nol Necessary 58.50FS *-F8
7 1 *REAR BUMPER RH SIDE GUIDE Nol Necessary 58 50FS ~F5
8 1 *REAR BUMPER BLACK TRIM STRIP Not Necessary B140FS *.FS
8 1 *REAR BUMPER PANEL PRIMED (LINES) Deformed 1.172.30FS *1.172.30F5
0 1 *SET MOUNTING PDC/PMA SENSOR REAR Necessary B6.85FS *68.95FS
11 4 *DECOUPLING RING PDC TORQUE CONVERTE Not Necessary 20.20FS *-FS
2 1 “{DG/SL) ADHESIVE SET K6 Necessary 63.06F5 *53.05FS
F=Franchise part S=SpcNatt

Total Parts (S§)  2,204.80 1,372.30

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous tems selectod.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER PANEL AND ALL New 1,700.00 850.00
ATTACHMENTS CAUSE BY ACCIDENT

2  PAINTING ON REAR BUMPER PANEL New 1,038.00 834 00

2  TOCHECK ELECTRICAL WIRING SYSTEMS AT THE REAR New 177.00 150.00

SECTION FOR PROPER FUNCTION

Gross Labour Cost (5§ 2,915.00 1,934.00

| Repart was unsubmitted during this print-out. [

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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