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SMRT Accldent Vehicle Repair Estimates
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SMRT Accident Vehicle Repair Estimates
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. 531019 Merimen e-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail s associated with :

*SMB227Z (MCT19030244)
[SHA1161L]
P
SMRT BUSES LTD
Mar 10 2015 3.00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
SMRT Automolive Services Ple Lid

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (I1I_SG), sent on 23/05/2019 09:02 AM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$17700.00) - SMB227Z - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri

Approved:17700.00:LOU @ %250 per day.

hitps://singapore. mermen, com/claimslindex ofm Husebor=SVCmailSfuseaction=dsp_PrintACFID=536023844CFTOKEN=bITI80(Tb15388c0-81... 11



Audﬂ Woo (Auto Sves/Claims 8 1A/Claims & IA/Buses)

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com:

Sent: Friday, 31 May, 2019 5:24 PM

To:’ Eileen Bay Yee Ling (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & [A/Buses)

Cc Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Audrey Woo (Auto Sves/Claims & 1a/Claims & LA/Buses); Chong Fei
* Yuan (Auto Svecs/Claims & 1A/Claims & [A)

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB227Z AND SHA1161L ON 10/03/2019 ALONG

BENCOOLEN ST LKK REF CC4/1I19004641/Jhb3
Attachments: DV.pdf; ATA pdf
Without Prejudice

Dear Eileen,
We refer further to your below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our Insured’s part,
we have our principal’'s mandate and we prepared to settle at a global sum of $17,700.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim.

If agreeahle, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and ATA and forward back the original signed copy to us for payment

processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to SMRT BUSES LTD.

Thank you.

"Plegse note thot our obove offer and any settiemant grising from the above offer are made on a without prefudice basis, and should nof
be construed as on admission of liability on our part or on the part of our insured Driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be
disclosed In any other reloted matter(s) in respect of the occident. Qur offer made in respect of this present motter s made solely to resolve
this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this affer in any other related matters

Best Regards.

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Prte Ld

Phone; 6841-2090 | email: vicalpehar lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Hlk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | S{408933)

r L-es -

Al A= = Save the Lartkh Print only whes secessory
This e-mail cantain confidential and privileged material, and ae for the sole use of the intended recipien) Uss or distributkon by an
uninfended reciplent 4 prohibiled, and may be a ywolation of law, | you beleve thal you recewed this e-mall in e, please do nol read this
a-mail or any attached teims. FPleass delale the e-maill and all attachments  including any copies thetecf. and inform the sendet that you

have apleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copres thereofl, Thank you

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 April, 2019 9:06 AM

To: 'Motor Claim - III'; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: 'Zuhaidah Samsuri'; 'Stanley Lai'; assignments; Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: FW: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB227Z AND SHA1161L ON 10/03/2019 ALONG BENCOOLEN 5T



"Vic (LKKAuto)

e ——————————————————

From: Admin-D [LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 April, 2019 9:06 AM

To: ‘Motor Claim - III'; Vic (LKKAuUto)

Ce: ‘Zuhaidah Samsuri’; ‘Stanley Lai’; assignments; Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: FW- LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB227Z AND SHA1161L ON 10/03/2019
ALONG BENCOOLEN ST

Attachments: SMB227Z.PDF; img-425182120-0001.pdf

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the email.
Deaar Vic,
Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/11119004641/Jhb3

llest Regnrds,

Gi.Nivitha| Admin

KK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phone: BB41-1972 | email: gssignmentsélkkpulocom | fax: 6256-4715
Wk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenoe 1, #02-25 | S(408939)

From: Motor Claim - Il [mailto:motorclaim@iil.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 26 April 2019 9:01 AM

To: 'sur@lkkauto.com’ <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Zuhaidah Samsuri <aida@iil.com.sg>; Stanley Lal <stanley.lai@Iiii.com.sg>; Eileen Bay Yee Ling (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz
Sves/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) <eileenbay@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: FW: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB227Z AND SHA1161L ON 10/03/2019 ALONG BENCOOLEN 5T

Dear LKK,

LOD from SMRT. Kindly assist with direct settlement.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

® InDIA
P INTERNATIONAL
( InsurancE
FIHNQATFrODRI}
lerving EAF regeen smcy | W7

4 Cecll Street; #05 - 10B Bullding
Cingapore 049711
T=l: 6347 6100, Ext — 248




From: Eileen Bay Yee Ling (Auto Svcs/Claims & I1A/Claims & I1A/Buses) [mailto:eileenbay@smrt.com.sg)
Sent: 25 April, 2019 6:30 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <mptorclai ill.com.sg>

Ce: Audrey Woo [Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & 1A/Buses) <audrey@smrt.com.sg>; Chong Fel Yuan (Auto
Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims & 1A) <FeiYuan@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB227Z AND 5HA1161L ON 10/03/2019 ALONG BENCOOLEN 5T

SMRT Ref: BUS/03/19/1028/AW

SMRT 0IC: Audrey Woo
Dear Sir / Madam,
We claim on behalf of SMRT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle Reg. No.: SMB227Z.

Your driver’s negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses:-

Cost of Repair $16,700.00
Loss of Use $1,100.00 ( 4 daysx §275.00 )
| Total $17,800.00

We enclose the following documents:
1} Repair Invoice
2] SAS report

We look Forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email,
Kindly note to issue payment in favour to SMRT BUSES LTD.

* Please direct all correspondences to our officer in charge Ms Audrey.

Thanks and regards,

Elleen Bay
On behalf of Audrey Woo

JIC DID: 65563521 | Email: audrey@smrt.com.sg
b Ang Mo Kio Street 62

Singapore 569140

@smnr

AUTOMOTIVE

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed 1o have agreed 1o us collecting, using,

Jdisclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located

hoth inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling

and/or dealing with vour claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable

laws. If you do not agree to the same, Kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

2



If vou are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
¢ou by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
mtereepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses,

I'herefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

ﬂ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
& WWW.avE.Co



Bus/ 03 m):m 8/ fre

AUTHORISATION TO ACT

___.-._—l-_l-l_"-—.I

/We. SMRT BUSES LTD (“the third party claimant™ of 60 _WOODLANDS

INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705 (address), owner of SMB 227Z (vehicle
10.) hereby authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to

act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™)
for my vehicle no. SMB 227Z that was damaged pursuant 1o the accident which occurred on
10/03/2019 (date) along BENCOOLEN STREET (location) involving vehicle no/s SHA
1161L (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they
deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of
my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the claimant, SMRT BUSES LTD.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofur as the driver/fowner/insurers
of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

U [
Dated this (day) of AUNL (month) 20___[{year)

}II' A r_1 e |

I.*iL_:J. ‘J.‘Jl-, ;

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the kashﬂp"
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

{|l-Direct Settlement (PODS)

india Ref: MCT19030244
Claimant Ref ' BUS/03/19/1028/AW | Sme 1213

WHL'_?’MRT OMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTPIM workehap”) heraby confirm fhat well have regched an agresment
with the appainted Surveyor of India Intemational Insurance pre L LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD __ name

of Survayor) with respect ta the amount claimad for S3 17.3@-9_"-] {_ m. @ . _ (loss of

useirental). §§ _—  (sasrch fes), vehicia no. SMB227Z that was damaged pursuant 1o the accident which occurmed
on 10/03/2018 _ (date) &l BENCOOLEN STREET _____ (location] involving vehicie no. SHA1161Linsured

vehicie). This & pursuant to the inspection conducted on _13/03/2019 _ (date) g1 “the workshop’

\Wall confirm that well are/am aulhotized by the cwnar SMRT BUSES LTD (“the third party
claimant) of vehicle no. SMB227Z10 make the claim s sel out inthe above paragraph and we/l have full authority 1o seitie
{he matter on his/her behall in a manner that well deem fil. Well encioss nersin ihe letier of authority given by "Ine third

pafty claimant”

Wl further confirm that well will indemnify India Intsmational Insurance Ple Ltd for all damages. 1058 andior expense that
they will o have already Incutred in the gvent thal “the thied pary claimani® after the above sad poreamant |oHges @
further claim agamst the former for any loss and expenses suffored pertaining to cost of repairs and/or rental andlor loss
of use pursuant to the damage 1o SMB227Z (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident

Waﬂmrd‘mthltmtanmmm gbove ks in full and final saftlement of all ciaims of “the third party claimant”
pursuant 1o the acciden! and that furthar this settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of lisbility

basis

This agreement s subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any
dispute arising out of the same.

Well authorize youto pay the total amount of S§ 17,700.000 SMRT BUSES LTD

IsDiA INTERMATIONAL IssUiaNCE P Lii

el

-

Dated this '3 day of TL“"L . L.c?
\
CLAIMANT WITNESS: \:{3‘ )
Signature: Signature. OW3
Signed by Surveyor
Mame: Mame: LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS FTELTD
NRIC NRIC: 199607198R
Address Address 51 UBI AVENUE 1 #0125
PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK (5) 408933
Maliznality: Mationality
Occupation: Occupation:

-



SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

customer Code: J000066

ST Mitomotive Sarvices Pta Ltd
281 Morth Bridge foad Singapora 175102
Tal: 65 £3311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoice
GST Reg Na. ¢ MR-8500001-7

CRN . 16%0042802

gMRT BUSES LTD Invoice Ho. ¢ 1V190400157
Date : 10.04.2019
Block Unit yehicle No. ¢ SMB227%
STREET 62 vour Ref Ho. ! BUS/03/19/1028
§ ANG MD KIO gur Ref No. ¢ 24100577
SINGAPORE 569140 Terms : 30 Days
pescription oty Unit Add Disoount Amount
Cost % Amount

LUMPE S0M AMOUNT FOR REPAIR 1.00 -] 16, 700.00

AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDATION

Remark :
Make/Meodel + MAN AZ22
fccident Date @ 10.03.201%

W,B. Payment by chaque should ba crossed and
sadn payable to 'EMET Autemotive Sazvices FPte Ltad' .
¥o roceipt will be {asusd unless raguasted.

page 1/1

GRAND TOTAL 3 16,700.00

¢

Authorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive gervices Pte Ltd

E. & 0.E



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Dirgct Settiement

'trl.l..'_tH SUBFOLDER TRACKING - |
Case | Notified Est Submitted | AgQ) Asmigned | Ad) Ripe Adj Submitted Ing Auth’ed | Status |
[ 14 Mar 2018 ;1} Mar 2015 $$16,700.00 £8$16,700.00 Imdh'hrm
L Ty [00:00 Eon Estmates | | view ape | |“'““
| e ey rpe | | Cancel Case | .

Main Reference Claim Detalls

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
LII‘E.I-'II-'!!I: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. MNa.: -

| Main
lca e SMRAT BUSES LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 1982022%2D

10/03/2019 15/00 - (59
|88 Months and 24 Days From LTA Beg Dats (Man ¥r)] —

Palicy/Cover
TP/ MCT19030244 Note Mo MCOMOOLS

Policy Mo.
(Claimant)

SMB227Z Date of Loss:

SHALLGIL D-1808 02 24MFEF

i | Excess: =i
| SMAT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) £0 ‘Woodlands industrial Park B4, 757705 Woodtands - Tal: 68662628

| India Intarnational Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) - Tel! 63476100 ... [Handied by Zuhaldah Bte Samsurl - 5347 8070]

| MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel! 62222311
| LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (MQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handied by ONG HWEE JIE] _ [Final Rpt due 25/03/2019]

View All | Compose Case Mail |

« 1I_SG (23/05/2015): Alert - Ad) Mandate Approved [S$17700.00) - SMB227Z - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bt...
* [H_SG (01/04/201%): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5§0.00) - SMB227Z - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bte Sa...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS View All | Search Tasks | Creste Mew Task | Complete |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Dane?
No resulis.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 19/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Cl

aim Documents

*SMB227Z (MCT19030244)

[SHA1161L])
™
SMAT BUSES LTD
Mar 10 2019 3:00PM

[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]

Upload Ciocurments | Upised Photes | Compose tew Lerter |

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

i

i
g
i
<

Page 1 of 2

Photos/Images Ceerome [ |
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print |
|1 18/03/1909:33 Gaeneral View © | waws | A
2 | 1B/03/1506:33 | General View © | Loat s !
3 1803/1208:33 | General View Load G | B2 |
4 [1803/1909:33 | Genersl View O | wors | @
‘s |18/03/1909:33 | Geners! View © | oaaws | &
6 18/01/1908:33 | Genersl View © | aws | B
7] :i;r;:mn 05:13 | Ganaral View 0 wadwrs | & ]
8| 18/03/19 09:33 General View D | wadws | A
9 |18/03/19 09:31 | General View 0 | toadws | 4 |
10 18/03/1805:33 | General View 0 | weaws | & |
11 18/03/1909:33 | General View O | wews | @
12 | 18/03/19 09:33 General View ) | woedrs
13 |18/03/19 09:33 | Genersl View 0 | e | A
14 | 1B/03/1908:33 | Ganers| View 0 | wawrs | A
15 |18/03/1909:33 | Genaral View © | taiwc | B8
|16 |18/03/10 06:33 General View 0 esdic | A
17 1803710 09:33 General View 0 | s | B
18 1B/03/19 09:33 | General View 0| cors | &
19 1B/03/1909:33 | General View 0| s | A
0 18/03/19 0933 | General View D wedws | A
2L 18/03/19 0931 | General View ﬁ Load G | BA
22 |18/03/1909:33 | General View O | v | &
23 1B/03/1909:33 | General View Q| e | A
124 Elmme 09:31 | General View 0| wedre | & |
25 [18/03/1909:33 | General View O | aws | B
26 | 1B/03/1909:33 | General View © | seaws o |
27 |08/04/1909:55 | Photo After Spray O | eed s =3
28 [DB/04/12 00:55 | Photo After Spray D | weaws | A
29 (0B/D4/19 09:55 | Photo After Spray 0O | ceaws | B
30 |0B/04/19 09:55 | Photo After Spray 0D | oeaws | &
31 | DE/O4/15 09155 Photo After Spray D | lceds | M
32 |08/04/1509:55 | Phote After Spray J_L,_L“’ we | B
33 |DB/04/15 09:55 | Photo After Spray 0D | dws |
Documentation - 1 per page E A
Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumtinadl | Primt
1 [14/03/18 14:40 | EMAIL FROM I11 DD 13032019 | Load POF
14/03/15 14:40 | TP ESTIMATE | Losd PoF

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc...

19/6/2019
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Page 2 of 2

|Photos/Images Jperpage (v} A
[No | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (MG Thumbnall| Print|
3 [14/03/19 1440 | TP GIA REPORT ) | toad PoF

4 14/03/19 16:13 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED @ | Loagpre

5 21/D5/19 11145 | WORKSHOP INVOICE ) | LoadroF .
|6 19/06/1909:38 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF I
7 19/06/18 09:38 | DISCHARGE VOUCHER K Load POF |
B |19/06/19 09:38 LoD €Y | Load POF |
[Me_|Finalized On India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |15/03/1909:2) | Singapore Accident Statement € | LosaroF

12 |oa/msye 10y  [Serterof Demand from Third Party © | Losaror

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

neset | save | prim |

There are no document checklists configured,

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks Tor [ Handiing Insurer
Feoln- Rermarkd @i privete unhess yau Bhows it 0 sther partes

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 19/6/2019



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg no tassoriser;
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sun@ikkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/1118004841/JHB302

Date: 18/06/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Lid ~ Policy No: MCOMDO15
Clalmant Vehicle )
No : SMB227Z Insured Vehicle No : SHAT161L
Data of Loss: 10/03/2018 Mature of Claim: T Claim No: MCT19030244
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SMB227Z
Make & Modei: MAN ML3IZ0F (A22), 10.5 D ABS TURBO (A) Engine No: 50320355662038
Reg. Date: 1411272011 (Man. Year: 2011) Chassis No: VWMAAZZZZ1BTO01201
Colaur: Mulli-colour Odomeler: 720448 km
Engine Capacily: 10518 cc
Marketl Value/New Car Price: N/&
Sum Insured (S$) Market Valua/New Car Price
F AT THE TIM F RV
General Condition: Stearing (Serviceabla)! Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): ¥Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 27570 R225 Rear Tyre Size: 27510 R225
Fronl Left Side Firenza 7 mm Rear Laft Side: Firenza 7 mm
Front Right Side Firenza 7 mm Rear Right Side: Firenza 7 mm
The above values represant the ramaring fyre resds depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 22 500.90 18,630.00 3,870.90 17.20
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 ~ 0.00
Labour 2,906,00 1,771.00 1,135.00 35.06
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 25,406.90 20,401.00 5,005.90 19.70
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 16,700.00
Nett Amount (SS) 25.406.90 16,700.00 8,706.90 3427
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x 55250.00/day) (S§) 1,000.00
Nett Liability (S§) 17,700.00
Global Sum Settlemeant (S5) 17, 700.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 13/03/2019
Dale Inspected: 13/03/2019 Inspected At: SMRT Automotive Services Pte Lid
(Woodlands)
60 Woodlands Indusirial Park E4
Singapore 757705
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 19/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: ONG HWEE JIE Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: This mpont represenis our findings: af the time and plece of inspection stated hevein, Such inspection has been camed oul fo the besr of our
kmawledge and abillty but amy ather latilty under any other circiamsiances i3 hersby axpressly srciuded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 19/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: {Last Synchronised: 21 May 2018)

Parts: NIA MAN NL320F (A22) 10.5 D ABS TURBO [A) (Model not available in database)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)
Print Code; (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SMB227Z)

Validity: These estimates are valid only If they conlain the print code (above) on all estimate pages. running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page

Further info: lems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an aslerisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

L | *LEAF ASSY :REAR DOOR ,FOR MAN A22 BUS Bent 20,700.00F =20,700.00FL
2 1 *PANEL ,SIDE :L7,FOR MAN A22 BUS Not Necessary 330.70F *-FL
3 9 “PANEL ,SIDE :L9,FOR MAN A22 BUS Mot Necessary 248.20F “FL
4 *PANEL ,SIDE :L12,FOR MAN A22 BUS Not Necessary 247.30F “FL
5 1 *COVER :REAR TAIL LAMP LH,FOR MAN A22 BUS Not Necessary 87470 F *FL

F=Francmse pan. L=LmilemDisc
Sub Total (S8) 22,500.90  20,700.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/10.00% (S5) 0.00 2.070.00

Total Parts (S$) 22,500.90 18,630.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 19/6/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous llems seiecied.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE & INSTALL ABOVE ITEMS AND REPAIR OTHERS  New 2,120.00 1,325.00
DAMAGED AFFECTED AREAS
2  PROVIDE LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY  New 786.00 448.00
ABOVE REPAIR ITEMS
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 2,906.00 1,771.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. —|
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 19/6/2019



