Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Audrey Woo (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <audrey@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 3 June, 2019 3:11 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); motorclaim@iii.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Chong Fei Yuan (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA)

Subject: Pend CHQ $17,700 from Il - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB227Z AND SHA1161L ON
10/03/2019 ALONG BENCOOLEN ST LKK REF CC4/11119004641/Jhb3

Attachments: img-603145651-0001.pdf

SMRT Ref: BUS/03/19/1028/AW
LKK Ref : CC4/11119004641/Jhb3
Without Prejudice. Save as to Costs.

Dear Vic,

Above attached signed DV and ATA for your records and easy reference. Original signed hardcopy had
been postal mailed over to LKK office today, please keep a lookout for it. We shall await India
International Insurance’s cheque from hereon.

CHQ $17,700 shall be issued to SMRT BUSES LTD and postal mailed back to 6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62
Singapore 569140.

Audrey Wee | DID : 6556 3521 | FAX:64819221 | Email : audrey@smrt.com.sg | Claims
Department | 6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 Singapore 569140

S SIRT

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 31 May, 2019 5:24 PM

To: Eileen Bay Yee Ling (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Audrey Woo (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses); Chong Fei Yuan (Auto
Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA)

Subject: RE: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB227Z AND SHA1161L ON 10/03/2019 ALONG BENCOOLEN ST LKK REF
CC4/11119004641/Jhb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Eileen,

We refer further to your below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we prepared to settle at a global sum of $17,700.00 (all in) to
settle your client’s claim.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and ATA and forward back the original signed copy to us for
payment processing. The above amount is to be made payable to SMRT BUSES LTD.




Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd | Phone: 6841-2096 | email:
vicalpeh@lkkauto.com fax: 6741-4108 | Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

F LFL :
S | Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 April, 2019 9:06 AM

To: 'Motor Claim - lll'; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: 'Zuhaidah Samsuri'; 'Stanley Lai'; assignments; Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: FW: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB227Z AND SHA1161L ON 10/03/2019 ALONG BENCOOLEN ST

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the email.

Dear Vic,
Kindly assist. FYNA Our Ref : CC4/11119004641/Jhb3

Best Regards,
G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Eileen Bay Yee Ling (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) [mailto:eileenbay@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: 25 April, 2019 6:30 PM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Cc: Audrey Woo (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <audrey@smrt.com.sg>; Chong Fei Yuan (Auto
Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA) <FeiYuan@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB227Z AND SHA1161L ON 10/03/2019 ALONG BENCOOLEN ST

SMRT Ref: BUS/03/19/1028/AW
SMRT OIC: Audrey Woo

Dear Sir / Madam,

We claim on behalf of SMRT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle Reg. No.: SMB227Z.
Your driver’s negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses:-

Cost of Repair $16,700.00
Loss of Use $1,100.00 ( 4 daysx $275.00 )
Total $17,800.00

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repair Invoice
2) SASreport

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email.
Kindly note to issue payment in favour to SMRT BUSES LTD.



* Please direct all correspondences to our officer in charge Ms Audrey.

Thanks and regards,

tileen Bay

On behalf of Audrey Woo

OIC DID: 65563521 | Email: audrey@smrt.com.sg
6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62

Singapore 569140

@SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE




