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g ‘f '/ Auto
- Coansuianis
o B Company Registration No. 199607158R

51 UBIAVE 1, #0225 PAYA UBLHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SING APORE 408933 TEL : (W51 62563361 FAX ; (3 62564315

Yourref:  D19001725MFESH

Our ref’ CS/FCI19004572/Kvd3 Date : 10/7/2019

The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.SLS 21695

We thank for your instruction on 13/3/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
9/7/2019  at the premises of M/s  ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTE LTD
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8§3.945.55
Revised Estimate Amount 1 8%2,772.13
"Check” Items Amount : 35763.43
Market Value 1 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 8%

Nett Value (58

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the rear
ofs front portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

Kenneth Kong
Licensed Appraiser



MS @ FirstCapital

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tek (B5) 6222 2311 Fax: (65) 6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited Cofeg Mo 1950000060 GST Req. Mo, M2 00016769

Clalms & Mator Undewrining Dept 36 Robinsan Road #1601 City House Singapore DBBETT

Tek (65) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) B507 3845
www, mafirstcapital.oom.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
12-03-2019 Our Ref No.
08-03-2019 Claim Type.
SHAZ2568U Third Party Vehicle.

BLK 5033 ANG MO KIO, IND PARK 2 #01-251/259
CARMEN LIM
87990066/ 87990066

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Fax No.

D19001725MFSH

Third Party

5L521685

62593326

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

ESTEEM

PERFORMAMNCE PTE Attention.
LTD

NA TP Solicitor Fax No.
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

MNIL

NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

f R NS RERCE GROLF




. Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 July 2019 12:43 PM

To: ‘CWs Motor Claims'

Cc: 'Eileen Lee’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001725MFSH/2, SLS 21695
Attachments: SLS 2169S PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLS 21698
Date of survey: 9/7/2019
Number of days :2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 March 2019 12:23 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D12001725MFSH/2

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone; b841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 March 2019 11:05 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LERAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee@msfirstca ital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19001725MFSH/2

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workf{low System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

‘ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
L WWWL. AVE.COM



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 4:24 PM

To: SUR

Subject: Attn : Yvonne - police investigation resuit {5LS21695 - DOA : 08.03.2019)
Attachments: 20190708162412779.pdf

Dear Yvonne,

pls refer as attached.

Thank you

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards

Carmen Lim
Accident Claim Executive | Operation Division
Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

M: 8799 0066
P: 6484 1221
E: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259
(Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
{Showroom)

www esteemperformance com




Traffic Police

SINGAPORE 10 Ubl Avenue 3
g 40BBES

y POLICE FORCE Tel 125 6647 000
Fax +65 6547 G250
W, police.gov.sg

Our Ref s TPAR/13939/2019

Date : 30 May, 2019

WONG DING JIE, LYON

BLE 609 ANG MO K10 AVENUE 4

#11-1149

SINGAPORE 560609

Dear SirMadam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS21698 & SHA2968U0 ALONG ECP TOWARDS AYE
ON TOP OF BENJAMIN SHEARES BRIDGE ON 8 MARCH 2019 AT 1315 HRS

1 refer to the above accident,

e Please hi:'l%iﬂt"urmed that we have completed our investigations which shows
that the driver of SHA2968U has committed the following offences:

(#) Inconsiderate Driving under Section 65(a) Road Traffic Act Chapter 276.

(b) Careless Driving under Rule 29 Road Traffic Rules.

(c) Failing to stop after an accident under Section 84(1)(a) Road Traffic Act Chapter 276.
{d)Failing to report accident within 24 hours under Section 84(2) Road Traffic Act Chapter -
276.

Action has been initiated against the driver for the said offences.

3. If you have any queries, please contact the Investigation Officer, Tan Chin
Yong at 65476178 or via email at TAN_Chin_Yong@spf.gov.sg.

Yours faithfully

o —

Jemeema Farween

Jfor Head Traffic Investigation
Traffic Police

Singapore Police Force

A FORCE FOR THE MATION
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ESTEEM Bik 5033 Ang Mo Klo, Ind Park 2 #01-251/ 259, 568536
P[ﬂfﬂﬂ”‘”g Tal: +B5-6484 1221 Fax: +65-5484 7829 Website: www esteempert.com 59
AU :
Repair Estimates 5L52169S 4 "4’7 ’4@4,/

Parts (a) Cost/ List Price Items $ 4,127.40 /i% V4 Qﬁ?";?

PlusiLess 25% % 1,031.85

Total of Cost/ List ] 3,095.55

(b} Mett Price [tems

Less

Total of Nett Item

{c) Special Nett ltems

Total Parts Cost

Labour 3 B50.00

Total $ 3,945.55

The above total will be subjected to 7% G.5.T.

Mame of Surveyor : /%’7 o "";

Company : Z’/ Cre
Survey conducted on i ?/;'/?P at "’H“?/H

Remarks By Surveyor

(a) The repair of this vehicle is};nﬂgﬁedf is not authorized until further notice.

ib) Recommended Days of Repair ! ﬁﬁ day(s)
{c} Resurvey ! Required / N‘g.t-ﬂyeguired
(d) Excess 4]

{e) Signature of surveyar : /pt‘ Date: ?/ ,Z/ / .P




HF ﬂM ” [ Blk 5033 Ang Mo Kig, Ind Park 2 #01-251/ 259, 589536,
PE Tel +65-6484 1221 Fax- +65-6484 7820 Websita: www esteemparf.com.sg

Spare Parts
Vehicle No.  : SLS 2169 S Submit By : Carmen Lim
Make & Model : TOYOTAPRIUS Year Manufacture 2017
Chassis No JTDKEIFU203568901 Engine Mo. ;
Cost/ List
S/No. Part Description Qty Unit Price Disposition by
Price Surveyor
1 |Headlamp RH Lo 1 |$2.531.60 —
> |Front bumper Hg /Ly 1 |$450.80 —
3 |Front bumper clip {10 |[s40.00 —
s+ |Front bumper side retainer RH L1 s107.20 4
s  |Front bumper emblem Ad 1 [s87.10 —
& |FoglampRH Al 1 [s910.70 v
; ]
8
g
10
k]
12
13
14
15
16
%7
18
19
20
21
22
23

Note: If any of the quoted parts are recommended fo be repaired, then an additional labour charge

will be charged accordingly under supplemeantary.

i @
BIk 5033 Ang Mo Kio Indusirial Park 2 #01-239 Singapore 569536 Tel: 64841221 Fax: 64847829

Company Reg Mo, 200005485N / G5T No 20-0015485-M




ESTEEM

P F ”ﬂ‘”c Bk 5033 Ang Me Kio, Ind Park 2 801-251/ 250, 560536,
Eﬁ Tel +65-54584 1221 Fax +65-6484 TA20 Website: www asteernper com 59

Labour
Vehicle No. ¢ SLS 2169 S Submit By : Carmen Lim
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS Year of Manufacture @ 2017
S/No Labour Description Esimated Adjusted
Price Price
1 |TO RENEW DAMAGED PARTS & KNOCK OUT ACCIDENT
REPAIR AREA. (FRONT BUMPER) $400.00 Zeosf
2 |TOPUTTY, RESPRAY PAINT FOR AFFECTED ACCIDENT
REPAIR AREA. (FRONT BUMPER) sa0000 | 222
3 |To check wiring & focus headlamp $50.00 Zelf

Naote: The above estimate of repair is based on visual assessment of the external affected areas. Any
additional damages ohserved during the course of rapair will be quote accordingly as a supplementary.

e
Company Reg No, 20054855 ( GST No. 20-0005485-M



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 190607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607 128-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

Ref : CS/FCI9004572Kvd3In2

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date: 17-07-2019 I"m'mll"m’lm
Code: FCI2
1; Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA 29680 Veh. Inspected SLS 21695
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim Mo. D19001725MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 13/03/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA PRIUS (A) c.c 1798
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JTDKB3FU203569501 Colour METALLIC SILVER
Odometer 145915 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 YORKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA B mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE OfS FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/03/2018 Inspection Date 09/07/2019
Survey held at ESTEEM PERFORMANCE PTELTD
BLK 5033
ANG MO KIO INDUSTRIAL PARK 2
#01-259
SINGAPORE 569536
Sa. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTE!!.-1ATED HORMAL PERIOD FOR REFAIR: 2 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. 5LS 21695

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: G256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page No.:1of 1

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | g (;;} 5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|HEADLAMF RH CuT 2.531.60 2.531.60
1|FRONT BUMPER BUCKLED / 450.80 450.80
DENTED
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIP MECESSARY 40.00 40,00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH SERVICEABLE 107.20 -
1|FRONT BUMPER EMBLEM NECESSARY B7.10 B7.10
1|FOG LAMP RH SERVICEABLE 910.70 -
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,031.85 -f77.38
3,095.55 233212
LABOUR
TO RENEW DAMAGED PARTS & KNOCK OUT ACCIDENT 400.00 200.00
REPAIR AREA.(FRONT BUMPER).
TO PUTTY ,RESPRAY PAINT FOR AFFECTED ACCIDENT 400.00 220,00
REPAIR AREA.(FRONT BUMPER).
TO CHECK WIRING & FOCUS HEADLAMP. 50.00 20.00
850.00 440.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,945.55 277212
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 2,772.42|

/%4

KOMNG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19004572/Kvd3n2

DISCLAIMER OF LEABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made soloby for the use and benadit of the Client named on the front pags of this Repart.




