To: Claims Dept of CT1; Admin A
Cc Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLT4841R (O SNM19D201125C02/1(ock)

AND SGUS096Y (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19004520/Eka3) on 07/03/2019

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdepl@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019 12:23 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLT4841R (Ol: SNM19D201125C02/1(ock) AND SGUS096Y (TP : LKK
REF - CC&/CTI119004520/Eka3) on 07/03/2019

LKK REF - CC6/CT119004520/Eka3
CT1 REF - SNM19D201125C02/1(ock)

Dear Khanchna
We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter,
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 54,078.00.

We await your payment advice to enable Chin Kiat to act accordingly.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 T478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.comi/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A& ¥ #iif Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mall and any files transmitted with It is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential Information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either In whole or partial, is prohibited, If you are not the intended recipient,
please nofify the sender Immediately. Please delete the e-mall and any coples of It thereaffer.

From: Khanchna (LEK Auto) [mailto:khanchna@ |kkauto.com)|

Sent: Thursday, 11 July, 2019 12:05 PM

To: Lim Shu Min <shumin.lim .cntaiping.com>; Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh
i




Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna {LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 917 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI'; Alfred Toh

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLT4841R (Ol : CAl - TBA) AND SGU5096Y
(TP : LKK REF - CCB/CTI19004520/Eka3) on 07/03/2019

Attachments: POLICE INVESTIGATION RESULT pdf; TP LOD.pdf; LETTER TO Ol.pdf, LKK Adjustment

Report.pdf: LKK INSPECTION PHOTOS.pdf; LKK REINSPECTION PHOTO.pdf; LKK
REINSPECTION PHOTOS.pdf

Your ref : Please advice [SLT4B41R)

Our ref : CC6/CTI19004520/Ekalg2

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

Our Insured vehicle coming from minor road onto main road. We are of the opinion that BOLA scenario 9 is applicable
for this matter, Police Investigation Result indicate that 5.65(b) RTA is against our Insured driver. Liability is not in our
insured’s favour. We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be
affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer "PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD" at S 4,078.00 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with G5T) S 5,808.37 S 3,852.00
2. Loss of Hire/Rental (5 days x 5 44.80) S 224.00 S 224.00 [Sdays x 544.80)
3. LTA Search Fee ) 2.00 S 2.00
Total $6,034.37 S 4,078.00

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@Ikkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Best Regards,



Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No : 201606560M

& Benoi Place Singapore 629927

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2948

PRIME GROUP

Date: 03.04.2019

Our ref: SGUS096Y
Your Ref® Please advice

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

51, Ubi Ave 1, #01-25 without prejudice

Paya Ubi Industrial Park,

Singapore 408933

Attn: Mr. Vic -Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT ON 070320019 INVOLVING VEHICLES SGUS06Y & SLT4841R

We are on behall of M/S Comfy Limousine Services Pre Lid vehicle No. SGUS096Y in their

third party claim against your insured / driver of SLT4841R

Appended below our claims:-

Cost of repair $ 3.852.00
Loss ol hire @$44.80 x 5 days $ 22400
GIA search fee $ 2.00

Total elaimed $ 4.078.00

We enclosed our invoice no. 3371, GIA search receipt, letter of authority, Letter ol Certification,
Car rental agreement & Police Investigate Result for your retention. Please acknowledge receipt,

For amicable settlement, please let us have vour offer

Regards

Yours faithfully,
A

Alice Leong
e-mail: aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com
Encl.

Vic



S1 U AVE Lo #0122 PAYA UBTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGATORE 408933 TEL 1 (063) 62563361 FAX : (005) 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI19004520/Eha3
21 May 2019

NG MARIA THERESE
BLK 116 CLEMENTI ST 13
#10-80

SINGAPORE 120116

Dear Sir'Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 4841R AND SGU 5096Y ON 07/03/2019

We refer 10 the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us as your
vehicle was turning out from minor road towards the main road and resulted the accident.
We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should vou however wish 10 further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

|

CHAN JIA LE

Case Handler

DID: 6849 5792

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: jiale@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Moror Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Fo: PRIME ALUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE. LTD,

Re: ACCIDENT ON 07.03.2019 INVOLVING SGUS096Y & SLT4841R
AT LENG KEE ROAD

IF We. Comfy Limousine Services Pre Ltd hereby authorized you to carry out repairs of

the damage caused 1o my 7 our vehicle no. SGUS096Y  in the above accident.

I/ We further also confirm and agree that all sums of money to be recovered by you on
my/ our behalf shall be paid to vou. 11 We hereby also authorise the third party insurer to

release 1o you such sums of money recovered on my © our behalf,

.:‘-r"_t.;;r'.;nu'; (e mr; ;‘-;;’;--h-;;;"”p if upplicable)
Name: Umeuling  Copmegs PlIg LTO
NRIC: '} oHN



Policy Mo ¢ DMPCSHIDSSE71800 Claim No ¢ SHM19D203125C02/] (OCK)

Claimant 2 COHFY LIMOUZINE SERVICES #TE LTD

Amount 1 554,076.00

DOLLARE FOUR THOUSAND SEVEMTY-EIGHT ONLY

I/Wn agrom to scce=pt the above nentiloned smount to be pald to me/uz in Full &
final settiemsnt af all claims, costs i disbursements for injuries / damages
sustalned by =/ us through an Eccident invoiving

Claimant Vehicle Mz, & BGU S0%6Y
Insured Vehicls No. 3 SLT 4841R

tate of Losa
Place of Accigent

0740372018
LENG KEE ROAD

IH CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mesus of fhe aforsmencioned sum by

CHINA TAIPING THSURANCE (SINGAPORE]

FIE. LTD., 1/We agree absolutely to

discharge CHINA TAIPING INSUBANCE (SINGAPORE| BTE. LTD. and/er

Indudrad Hama

fram gl] claims, present or future

i ENG MARTA THERESE
telver Mame i FHG MARIA THERZSE

in respoct of all ices, injury or damage

sustained by mefus arising cut of the saig accldent,

I acknowledge that chis paypent im made without admiseion aof liabillcty on the
part of CHINA TAIPING TINSURANCE (SINGAPORE] FUE. LT,

111 Genersl Damages 53
7] Coar of Fepalrdéseess 5 3,852.00
13) Loss of ése/Hental/Bertdig 35 224.00
i4) G1A/Felice REoports/

Inuvestigation Results/Search Fees 55 2.00
15) Medica] Reports/Expanses 35
i8) Sucrvey Feea/?.T. Fees 55
i7) Cost including Disbuzsesent 55

TOEAL & 5 5 v eetaE % % . . 88 4,078.00

Claimane Mame : HRIC Mo : ,'Jﬂ

2ignaturs :

e €[

“ The contents of this document apply to
vehicles damages only. All personal
injuries and damages arising therafrom
are excluded from the ambit and
application of this document”



TAX INVOIC NO.: 3371

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Benol Place Singapore 620927

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2048

GST Reg. No: 201606560M

PRIMEGROUP  Rag No. 201606560M

MESSRS  CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD S - —
3A Road WORKS ORDER NO : 3362
#16-00 Springleaf Tower VEHICLE NO : SGUS096Y
SINGAPORE 079909
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Mike/ Model :  TOYOTA VIOS
Repair Date - 2019
Terms of Payment : TDAYS
THIRD PARTY CLAIMS
| BEING LUMP SUM REPAIR FOR THE ABOVE 5 3600.00
VEHICLE
Compound interests al the rate of 1% per month SUB TOTAL s 3,600.00
will be: charged on late payment. GST ™ 5 252.00
ROUNDING ADJ  § 0.00
TOTAL § 3B52.00
|
l
PREPARED BY.” PRIME AUT() CLAIMS SERVICE



COMFORT LIMOUSINE SERVICES PTE LTD
PRIME TRANSPORT & LIMOUSINE SERVICES PTE LTD
BEST MOTOR LEASING & LIMOUSINE SERVICES PTE LTD

Wember of Prime Ciroup of Compaies

PRIME GROUP & Benot Place Simgapore 6294926

lel: 6862 8878 Fax: 6863 6566

Co. Registration No; 201 508380W
2075441 18N 20151 2366W

Your Ref  :Please advise

Date : 11-March-2019

To : Whom it May Concern

From : Comfy Limousine Services Pte Ltd

RE : LETTER OF CERTIFICATION FOR MR. CHOON JOOT CHYE

This letter serves to confirm that Mr. Choon Joot Chye Lawrence of NRIC number
§1638775D is a chauffeur-driven hirer for Comfy Limousine Services Pte Ltd hiring
Vehicle Registration Number SGU5096Y at a daily rate of Singapore Dollars Forty-Four
and Cents Eighty (5544.80) only.

Should clarification require | can be contacted at 8121 6313.

Thank you with Best Regards.

Yours Sincerely / SAE T
Y (Hfemem)e

[4 e

Ms Veronica Lim
Deputy Manager



Mamber of Pnme Group of Companes
Co. Registration No: 201508380W

@ Benol Place Singapora 629827

Tel 6862 8878 Fax 6863 6566

"'1_‘_ .'" .':'.Tn.

COMFORT LIMOUSINE SERVICES PTELTD

RENTAL AGREEMENT
REF: RA-0503-5096-8602

VEHICLE NO MAKEMODEL ccC CHECK OUTIN
. SGUS0SSY _ Toyota Vios (P) | 1487 RENTAL START DATE 15102018
HIRER'S DETAILS T ACTUAL RENTAL END DATE -
HIBER NAME Choon Joat Ghye AGREED RENTAL END DATE a 13082018

ADDRESS, Biw 411 Pangan Gargens #12-87

COLLISION DAMAGE WAIVER (CDW)

SIB00411] NOTE FURTHER EXCESS OF 58214000 SHALL APSLY IN ADDITION TO

EMAIL wamochoanicdgmad oom

THE AMCILNT STATED IN THIE RENTAL AGREEMENT WHEN AT THE
TInE OF AN ACCIDENT THE MOTOR VEHICLE IS DRIVEN BY 1) ANY
PERSON (WHETHER NAMED | UNNAMED) WHO IS BELDOW 30 YEARS
OF AGE OR MORE THAN B5 YEARS OF AGE |I] MELD A DHIVING
UICENCE FDRA LESS THAN 3 "E.llﬂ"

HOME NO.

'MOBILE

.'c NO.
[it.leuse NO.

poaB |03/01/1964

81891828

516367750 COUNTRY Singapars

_SlﬁJBTTSD 'mumv .Smgmnre

EXPIAY DATE
ADDITIONAL DRIVER

EXPIRY DATE

REFUND
COLLECTED BY

SIGNATURE
AMOUNT COLLECTED: 5§
PREPARED BY BENJAMIN
/ATTENDED BY 'VERONICA

| HERESY AGREE TO ABIDE BY THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS STATED
ON THIE AGREEVENT AND THE ACCOMPANY|NG CONTRACT OF
EMPLCYMENT

SIGNATURE OF HIA EFJ

MNota: Duration maimum completion ol three (03] months

EXPENSES WILL BE AT HIRER EXPENSE

HN‘-HAWEH!;BLE EXCESS FEﬂ INCIDENT

SINGAPORE 552.5.15
'MALAYSIA (JOHOR STATE I

(ONLY) e
TI'JTI.L LOSS $10.700

* WEHICLE OUT OF JOHDR AREA WILL MNOT BE COVERED ALL LDSS &

SIGNATURE th-..
P | I.EEII.‘I‘EHT lHEIJFMNEE {FAII

ACCEPTPAILY]
PHEMIUM: SE0 L _"
SIGNATURE SIGHATURE

MAINTEMANCE CHARGES
DMLT'@SI 5544 80 ¥ MO OF DAYS A MONTH
III.'..‘HTH LY @‘ S5
PETHDL
WIHD‘E-GHEEN S50.20 X NO OF DAYS & MONTH
GST &% TR 1
TOTAL

DEPOSIT SE1.500
Receipt No - PRE-PAYMENT 5550

HODE ll.'.IF Pl‘flulEHT
GHEDITCARD” C-l.E-HH MNETS[] OTHERS [ ]

HAME
CARD NUMBER
E'.‘IPTFI"I' ﬂlTE CvV

FLILL LIABILITY WILL HE IMPOSED ON THE HIRER SHOULD THE
VEHICLE BE DRIVEN BY ANY OTHER PERSONS WITHOUT OUR

HNOWLEDGE. VEHICLE MUST NOT BE USED FOR ANY ILLEGAL OR

WAMDAAL ACTIVITIES I O’

"\u\‘

COMFORT LIMOUSINE SERVICES PTE LTD

Aetund of deposit will be approximataly 4 weeks upon vehicie rafum



Inveice

. ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECDORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registralion No. M4D0017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raflles Q 18-00. 8 BE5BO
INSURANCE e -6 6221 0010 Fax. re5 6224 0030

Dur Ref No GR-19-037284

Drate of Request 0B/032019 Your Rel Na: Onfline Purchase

Prime Auto Claime Service Ple Lid

& Benol Place

Singapore 620927

Dear SiefMadam),

Enauiry Dsto 08/032014

Enguiry By Llu Ped Yee

TP Vehicle No. SLT4B41R
.menl Date 07/03/2019

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No [rsurer Panod of insurance Insurer Tal. No.

SLT4841R China Taiping Insurance |Smnoopore) Pe g A0MM0I201R-29/10/2019 B388 6111

Thank You

The images provided 1o you are taken from tha gngingl reports forwarded 1o the cantre by the members of the General Insurance Association of Singapore
and wa laka no responsiblity for their accuracy or conbonts and shéll bo undar no lability whatsomeer for any loss o damage ansing aul ol or in conpaclion

Wit the pofts of their images

This is & compluiles genarated document and requires no signature

hitps. isingapote menmen com/claimsindes ofm HusaboeMTRsasbfuseaction=dap geninvip&mfio=20TE0E4A CFID=48487 254 8CFTOKEN=3a4 .

112



YarEoe

H’i) GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
| L GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Haffies Quay #18-00, Singapars 04REB0
lNSURA"CE Phono: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 D030
Oparaling Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No MADOO17735

KECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Inwaice

TAX INVOICE
Cur Rel No GR-19-037280
Date al Request: 0am3zn1e Your Ref No: Oriline Purchasa
Prime Auto Claims Senvice Pie Lid
A Benol Place
Singapore 6208927
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Dato DRDAZ018
Engulry By L Pel Yee
TP Vehidle No SLT4841R
'iunm Date o7/032018
DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insuret Enguiry 1.87
GST Amoun _ D13
lotal Amouni Due (GST Inclusive] 200

Thank Yews

This is & compuler generaled document and requires no signatura

Far GIARMC Official use
Daty
[X] GIRO | | Cash | | Cheque

fittpscif@ngapore: menmen comicimmsaindes cfimPfusabox=MTHeasduseachon=dep pomnvipd&miid=20T9%480F ID=48487 2544 CFTOKEN=3a4

21



TRir | waLmie
12 barch NMI®

CHYY
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S »09 MHnumm

SINGAPORE st 1 1

Dhear Ser Mindar

KEF ROAD
m INVOLVING SGUSI9sY & SLTAS4IR Mg?::'“‘*:*:f
™~ OF HOY FATT ROAD ON 7 MARCH 2019 &

1 refer w the above sccident
ol oy esugatmns whach

i |nconsidemic Drmving
been initiaied aganst

2 Pleasc be informed that we have completed
revealed that the driver of SLT4841R had commutted an offence o
under Section 6:5(b) of the Road Traffic Act, Chapter 276. Action has
the said driver for the said offence.

= [fywh\tmymp!mcmmﬂ:almﬂmm
a1 65476415 or via email at NG _Beifengaspf.gov.sg

Ng Befeng




