Vic (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 17 June, 2019 2:44 PM

To: loy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cec: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: MANDATE REQUEST: Accident Involving SJG2082U & SLS7771U on 9/3/2019 -

Letter of Demand (Your Ref: 18/19/19/VP05,/021505) [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Irene,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senlor Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
TE.I.L.(..EE} 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

y

The all £ #ew | lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential dala is for use by authonsed external parties only.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:Joylrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 14 June, 2019 4:44 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; KKLau; Admin A

Subject: MANDATE REQUEST: Accident Involving S)IG2082U & SLS7771U on 9/3/2019 - Letter of Demand (Your Ref:
18/19/19/VP05/021505) [External Confidential]

Importance: High

Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021505

Dear Gerald,
Our insured was moving out from stationary position.
Liability is not in our favour.

Summary to offer to repairer M/s LEONG AUTO PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED
TO OFFER
Cost of Repairs S 11,640.12 (estimate no GST) S 4,066.00 GST included
Loss of Rental S 1,080.00 (5120 x 9 days) S 900.00 (5100 x 9 days)
LTA Search Fee S 7.45 S 745




| ToTAL | $ 12,727.57 | $4,973.45

Our adjusted COR is at lump sum $3,800.00 + GST = $ 4,066.00
Our recommended days for repair is 7 days + 2 days PRI and weekend. = 9 days.

We are preparing for survey report for the meantime, we seek for your approval to offer the revised
guantum.

Relevant supporting claim documents attached for your perusal and reference.
For your approval please.
We apologize for any inconvenience casued.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@Ilkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.|f you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Friday, 14 June 2019 4:26 PM

To: Joy Irene [LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: R3: Accident Involving 5JG2082U & 5L57771U on 9/3/2019 - Letter of Demand (Your Ref:
18/19/19/VP05/021505) [External Confidential)

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Irene,

Any problems as this is the 2™ reminder that the third party has sent.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

=1

The all (. ¥w | lonpac.com.sg



Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Leong Auto Admin [mailto:tjh@leongauto.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 14 June, 2019 4:22 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Leong Auto Trading; Ops Leong Auto

Subject: Re: R3: Accident Involving SIG20B2U & SLS7771U on 9/3/2019 - Letter of Demand (Your Ref:
18/19/19/VP05/021505) [External Confidential]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

We would appreciate it if you could help to advise the status of our claim.
Best Regards,

Daniel Tan/Cady Lee

Leong Auto Pte Lid
Office - 6266-6448 Fax ' 6266-8358

Please like our Facebook page at:

On Wed, 29 May 2019 at 14:36, Ops Leong Auto <opsl@leongauto.com.sg> wrote:
Dear Ms lrene,

We would appreciate it if you could help to advise the status of our claim soon as LOD was sent since
03/04/2019.

Best Regards,
Leong Auto Pte Ltd

Shawn Chen
Office | 62666448 Fax ' 62666358

Please |ike our Facebook page at: hitps.//www face

On Tue, May 14, 2019 at 4:18 PM Leong Auto Ops <gpsl{@leongauto.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Irene.
We would appreciate if you could help to advise on the status of our claim

Best Regards,
Leong Auto Pte Ltid

William Wong/Shawn Chen
Office | 62666448 Fax : 62666358

Please like our Facebook page at: hitps://www.facebook com/leongautogroup

On Mon, Apr 29, 2019 at 2:54 PM EMELLENE TENG <tjh/@leongauto.com.sg> wrole:
Dear Ms Joy,



We would appreciate if you could help to advise the status of our claim.

Best Regards,

Emellene Teng

Leong Auto Pte Lid

Office  6266-6448 Fax = 6266-6358

Please like our Facebook page at hitps.//www facebook com/leongautogroup

On Thu, 4 Apr 2019 a1 09:00, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh/@lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Irene,

Kindly look into the documents and revert to them.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all M%) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only

From: EMELLENE TENG [mailto:tjh@leongauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 4:53 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN; Leong Auto Trading; Leong Auto Ops

Subject: Accident Involving S1IG2082U & SLS7771U on 9/3/2019 - Letter of Demand (Your Ref:
18/19/19/VP05/021505)

Dear SiriMadam,



Attached is the LOD on behalf of our client
Please help to relay to the officer-in-charge.

We look forward to your early response.

Best Regards,
Emellene Teng
Leong Auto Pte Ltd

Office : 6266-6448 Fax ' 6266-6358

Please like our Facebook page at: https //www facebook com/leongautogroup



LEONG AUTO PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive #02-13 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Tel 6266 6448 Fax: 6266 6358 Email: Sales@leongauto.com sg
Business Registration No 201312B46W
GST Registration No. 201312848W

Our Ref- S5JG2082U
Your Ref: SL37771U

3 April, 2019

Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road

#17-04/07 The Concourse

Singapore 189555

Attention” Motor Claims Depariment
Dear SiriMadam.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJG2082U & SLS7771U on 9/3/2018

We are writing on behalf of Ms Sun He, the registerad owner of Vehicle No SJG2082U) involved in the
above accident

We are instructed that the above accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your
msured's vehicle no. SLSTT71U. As a result of which, our client had suffered loss and expenses

We are instructed by our client to claim for

- Cost of Repair 5 4 068 00 (as finalised with surveyar + GST)|
- Loss of Rental (9 days x $120/day) s 1,080,00
= LTA Search Fees ] 745

Total s 5,153.45

We enclosed herewith the following documents for your consideration

- Invoice - GIA Report
- Vehicle Rental Agreement & Invoice - QOwner/Driver ldentity Card/Driving Licence
- LTA Search Fee - Certificate of Insurance

Flease acknowledge receipt of the above documents and we look forward to your favourable response

Yours faithfully,
LEONG AUTO PTE LTD

A

Enc



ro . UNJAe AN Ly BHD

Dear Sirs,

r
CLAIMANT : “WN H%

ACCIDENT INVOLVING __ D& 2082 U anp IS HE Y
on__ 09lo3]aeq  ar Bl Reie west AUENUE &5 TaipRDS Buiel] RATok CEATRAL

IWe, WHN HE , am/are the

regisiered owner of Vehicle No. SJa 2632 U

Please note that | have assigned all compensation monies due to me/us in the above said
accident to M/S LEONG AUTO PTE LTD.

I/We, hereby authorize you 1o release all compensation monies pertaining to the above said
accident to M/S LEONG AUTO PTE LTD. and forward your settlement cheque to M/S
LEONG AUTO PTE LTD whom l/we had authorized to collect the said compensation

monies.

Thank you.

Signature of Chiimant

{Company Stamp, if applicable)

Date: |7 \ HL; l W \\O\



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

#%* This Duscharge Voucts apphies unly i the clamant’y elajn

for his property damage and will pot affoet his personal
mpuries claim sndior uninsured Josses efam in 8 h}::: d:::

Fusther, the sealement terms berein shoalil not be wsed o1 an

CLAIM NO : 18/19/19/VP0S/021505 ::E-E:?u!?h?:ﬁ:f::ﬂlm; :Ihqlum!'t reunal mpunes claum
DATE :01 JULY 2019 e e s ol the

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, SUN HE confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
andfor the owner of SLS 7771U the sum of Singapore Dollars Four Thousand Nine
Hundred Seventy Three and Cents Forty Five Only ($4,973.45) in full and final
satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the
said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by
me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or
indirectly from an accident to my vehicle, S]G 2082U on 09 MARCH 2019 along

BUKIT BATOK WEST AVENUE 5.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LOH AI / LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any
person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly 1o M/S LEONG
AUTO PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice 1o all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Name of vehicle owner/Dale



Leong Auto Pte Ltd

180 8in Ming Drive
#0213 Bin Ming AutaCity
578722

=
WP

160 Sin Ming Drive
#0213
Singapore 575722

Tel 62066448  Fax: 62666358 62666448
Email: smmm-? sales@leongauto.com.sg
e e e GST Registration No. : 201312846W
Tax Invoice
INVOICE TO INVOICE NO. INV2D19/034
SJGE20820U DATE 08/07/2019
Lonpac Insurance Bhd DUE DATE 09/07/2019
300 Beach Road TERMS Due on receipt
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
VEHICLE NO. DOA/REPAIR DATE VEHICE MODEL
SJG2082U 08/03/2018 Honda Fit 1.3G A
NO  DATE ACTIVITY a8t AMOUN?
1 08/03/2018 Cost of 7% SR 3,800.00
Cost of Repairs (as finalised with surveyar)
SJG2082U & SLETTTIU DOA 0002018 SUBTOTAL 3,800.00
GST TOTAL 266.00
TOTAL 4,066.00
BALANCE DUE $$4,066.00
GET SUMMARY
AATE a51 NET
GST@ 7% 266.00 3,800.00




Leong Auto Rental LLP
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-13

Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
82823333

lsong@leongauto com.sg
Company Registration No, T16LL0OG15D

Invoice

INVOICE TO

Sun He

Blk 3203 Bukit Batok Wes! Ave
5

#21-480

Singapore 650383

VRA NO.
Loazz

ACTIVITY

INVOICE NO. 2019/068

DATE 18/03/2019

DUE DATE 18/03/2018
TERMS Due on receipt

AMOUNT
1,080.00

Vehicle Rental from 09/03/2019 1340 Hrs 1o 18/03/2018 0930 Hrs, 8 @ 5$120.00

SMG3734E/5JG20820U

BALANCE DUE

S$1,080.00



= LEONG AUTO RENTAL LLP
160 Sin Ming Drive, #02-13 Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapers 575722 =G J3=a5sAu

Tel: 64563008  Email Leongg@ieongauto.com.sg
UEM Registration No. T15LL0815D L
Mobde: 52922333
Mobile: 93533333
VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT No.L 0422
HIRER'S PARTICULAR Voh No i, (3 ZAZ §-£ | Replace Veh No
Name mambg_ ==un  HE s T
NRIC / PASSPORTNo: = 143 BES C Mans & Moow T ot Make & Modal
Adgress Res): B 393 ST ST = eaT | avorManoel (/) Autt | Manusl
e S, Wa-4co S asoaiy) out Daw |39 OUT  Date
Hame & Aadress of Employer © oUT Time | 245 O fa_| OUT: Tima
AENTAL CHARGES
Ocoupation Oy oy X e 12O
Ol Ma L Yype - Locaifnle rational
Pans Date Dater of Binth :
T™ O " HEPG :
ADDITIONAL DAIVER'S PARTICULARS S
_| Name : {as in U'C) S -
NRIC / PASSPORT No e e
DAL No : VL Type : Localintormatianal | PA i
Agarass (Ras) : Dby Sorvew:.
TakiHg SUB-TOTAL $

our
P |
P,
(A} - ACCIDENTS [0 - DENTSE (8] - SCRATCHES £ r £ ¥

i g =
Non Waiver Excess: 5 3"@ {

ACCESSORIES CHECK ; Cw
] Asoray C] cgugnies (7 []87Tye
] s Tosis [ e [ M Caps

] P 7 Cons [] covcastmdges Clssmm

|Ml#.dulummme.WNMﬂmWnMIwhﬂm.mm

licence(s) isfare current and not disqualiiied from driving Yow may charge all amoun! Sue on the rental 1o myfour croait cand

* IMPORTANT e

! ONLY PERSONS ABOVE 18 YEARS OF AGE WITH MORE THAM 3 YEARS DAIVING EXPERIENCE. AUTHORGED. LICENSEO ANO SIGNING THS
AGREEMENT MAY DRIVE THE VEHIELE - 1 & "

2 mlmvmmmmvmnmmﬂtmumurmmmmrﬁmw
LEDNG ALTO RENTAL LLP -

3 N THE EVENT OF AN ACCIDENT, THE MIRER OR AUTHDRIZED DRIVER

1] o g o Ry b e Laed saree i T O st s
o) aha i vt Wi b Coenpiers uned muyt P e WAR | Motcr detu s iupeee foemm) peed sl Tines Bt el s S sl Fe “NON- MU LAGTON ACCICE NT

TEEPOATY STLMEME [ bt el b it sl wites: Fo grcmined m Smgmr w e Cler= |
1] i vt i the e st 24 bt B e occetenes e Bilowry e o aocoeess
(]

() . inpury G sy 2 Congieten P o TGS B Domeeand ponpmily

il e oy o =isbeeg 8 I sefuce (n obiien Fis moms simno paircy Mimapns e S o G dnvee Vet sumoon L) CET 5 Ve s i1 s

R RO i O ey & ERIVLITGN G @il
%
RETUAM OF VEHICLE-THE MIREWDRWVIN 1§ AEDUIRED T0O SIGN M il COLUMMN DIGNATURE OF WIRERIDRIVER" FAILING WHICH THE 0AY AND TikE
MESERTED BELOW SHALL BE DEEMED 1D BE THE DY AND TIME THE VEMICLE 1S RETURNED 10 LEDNG 410 RINTAL LLFAND THE SAME SHALL BE ACCERTED
ummmummmmummmmmmmm

DATE 14 TIME N MILEAGE CHECKED BY | \J[/
|

,'-‘.',/;f | 1 'f'”r ;/ ; b .




AW2019 Recsipt

* Back to OneMotoring
| il |!'.;l'|-a.|h|1 'x"ll_l'llll'l'ly

Lama Tramspon Adinamy X
i Atz SIGE Yo U
Sengapore M0
GAT Regeiralion Mo WD00ANIE 3
Print Date/Time 09 Mar 2018/ 145113
Riscespt Datw'Tirs -~ 00 Mar 20187 14.51°12

Tax Invoice/Racelpt
Recmpt No.  [THET 200001 0308-00 1370

Pravous Recepf s

&N hem Descriplion Amoum GST Amcnt
Business Transaciion Reference Bofore  Amount  After GST
Mo, GST (58 158 5%

Rosull of Insurance Enguiry - SLETTTIU

An ai 09 Mar 2070011.10:00

Inswrance Co LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

1 Insrnnce Eagquiy - SLETTTU
Enmuery Fee T.00 048 Tan
20150008 1 44RETI 04

Sub-Total T.00 0an Fan

Tatal Betors Rownding To0 oay ran

Rounding Differsnce ©.04

': Total Amouit Payabis Fas
B By

mnpnrramneanii | Crutht Cast ras

WEAMART A

Tuial Fas

Cashi Change 000

Timrctmrant Aeramar rae

Ew e Heturriable amauy ] -]

THUARS, ¥iOU AMD HAVE & NICE Dy

Pleass ensure thal all paymenis o the Authority are good and promptly seftied by the paymant sarvice
provider | financial inatitution. Otherwise, he transaction and receipt is considered vold snd Late fes
may npply.
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