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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 July, 2019 3:28 PM

To: Ops Leong Auto

Cc: Leong Auto Admin; Leong Auto Trading; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalised: Accident Involving SJG2082U & SLS7771U on 9/3/2019 - Letter of 

Demand (Your Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021505) [External Confidential] LKK REF 

CC4/LPC19004460/Kha3

Attachments: DV.pdf

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Shawn, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please find attached DV as requested. 

 

Kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward back to us (LKK) the original signed hard copy together with 

the Authorization to Act Letter and Final Repair Invoice for payment processing. 

 

Thank you. 
 

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present 

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Ops Leong Auto [mailto:ops1@leongauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 27 June, 2019 4:38 PM 

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Leong Auto Admin; Leong Auto Trading; Admin A 

Subject: Finalised: Accident Involving SJG2082U & SLS7771U on 9/3/2019 - Letter of Demand (Your Ref: 

18/19/19/VP05/021505) [External Confidential] 

 

Dear Ms Joy, 
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We accept the offer of $4,973.45 for property damage only. 

The breakdown as follows: 

COR: $4,066.00 (agreed) 

LOR :$900 (agreed) 

LTA: $7.45 

Total: $4,973.45 

  

Please make payment to Leong Auto PTE LTD & please let us have the soft copy of the DV.  

 

Best Regards, 
Leong Auto Pte Ltd 

Shawn Chen 
Office : 62666448  Fax : 62666358 
 
Please like our Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup 
 

 

On Tue, Jun 18, 2019 at 3:40 PM Ops Leong Auto <ops1@leongauto.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Ms Joy, 

 

Thank you for the offer. Our counter as follows: 

  

COR: $4,066.00 (agreed) 

LOR (9 days x $120/day): $1,080.00  

LTA: $7.45 (agreed) 

Total: $5,153.45 

 

We would appreciate it if you could re-consider as our client's vehicle is a Passenger Motor Car, Honda Fir 1.3G A and our client's 

rental vehicle is a Private Hire (Self-Drive) Motor Car, Toyota Vios 1.5E A. 

 

Best Regards, 
Leong Auto Pte Ltd 

Shawn Chen 
Office : 62666448  Fax : 62666358 
 
Please like our Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup 
 

 

On Mon, Jun 17, 2019 at 2:52 PM Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <JoyIrene@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

  

Dear Cady, 

  

On without prejudice basis and without admission of liability, we offer settlement as follows: 

  

1)      COR       $ 4,066.00 GST INC. 

2)      LOR       $    900.00 ( $100 x 9 DAYS )   

3)      GIA        $        7.45  

TOTAL   $4,973.45 

  

  

Kindly confirm acceptance. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or 

privileged information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please 

notify the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or 

distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 
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From: Leong Auto Admin [mailto:tjh@leongauto.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 14 June 2019 4:22 PM 

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <JoyIrene@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Leong Auto 

Trading <sales@leongauto.com.sg>; Ops Leong Auto <ops1@leongauto.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: R3: Accident Involving SJG2082U & SLS7771U on 9/3/2019 - Letter of Demand (Your Ref: 

18/19/19/VP05/021505) [External Confidential] 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

We would appreciate it if you could help to advise the status of our claim.  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Daniel Tan/Cady Lee 

Leong Auto Pte Ltd 

Office : 6266-6448  Fax : 6266-6358 

  

Please like our Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup 

  

  

On Wed, 29 May 2019 at 14:36, Ops Leong Auto <ops1@leongauto.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Ms Irene, 

  

We would appreciate it if you could help to advise the status of our claim soon as LOD was sent since 

03/04/2019. 

  

Best Regards, 
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Leong Auto Pte Ltd 

Shawn Chen 

Office : 62666448  Fax : 62666358 

  

Please like our Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup 

  

  

On Tue, May 14, 2019 at 4:18 PM Leong Auto Ops <ops1@leongauto.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Irene, 

  

We would appreciate if you could help to advise on the status of our claim. 

  

Best Regards, 

Leong Auto Pte Ltd 

William Wong/Shawn Chen 

Office : 62666448  Fax : 62666358 

  

Please like our Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup 

  

  

On Mon, Apr 29, 2019 at 2:54 PM EMELLENE TENG <tjh@leongauto.com.sg> wrote: 

Dear Ms Joy, 

  

We would appreciate if you could help to advise the status of our claim. 

  

Best Regards, 

Emellene Teng 

Leong Auto Pte Ltd 
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Office : 6266-6448  Fax : 6266-6358 

  

Please like our Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup 

  

  

On Thu, 4 Apr 2019 at 09:00, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote: 

Lonpac External - Confidential 

  

Dear Irene, 

  

Kindly look into the documents and revert to them. 

  

  

Best Regards 

Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 

  

 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

From: EMELLENE TENG [mailto:tjh@leongauto.com.sg]  
Sent: Wednesday, 3 April, 2019 4:53 PM 

To: MT_Claim_SG 

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN; Leong Auto Trading; Leong Auto Ops 
Subject: Accident Involving SJG2082U & SLS7771U on 9/3/2019 - Letter of Demand (Your Ref: 

18/19/19/VP05/021505) 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 
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Attached is the LOD on behalf of our client. 

Please help to relay to the officer-in-charge. 

We look forward to your early response. 

  

Best Regards, 

Emellene Teng 

Leong Auto Pte Ltd 

Office : 6266-6448  Fax : 6266-6358 

  

Please like our Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup 


