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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 April, 2019 1:11 PM

To: Nora Khai

Cc: 'Claims'; 'Jacquelyn Tan'; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Premium Leasing Car - SMG 653A accident LKK REF CC3/AIG19004400/Eha3

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Nora, 

 

Claimant’s vehicle COR finalized at $1,974.00 (before gst) with 4 days. 

 

We are still pending for the LOD. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Nora Khai [mailto:nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 30 April, 2019 12:59 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: 'Claims'; 'Jacquelyn Tan'; Admin A 

Subject: RE: Premium Leasing Car - SMG 653A accident LKK REF CC3/AIG19004400/Eha3 

Importance: High 

 

Hi Vic,  

 

Can you share with me how much is the claim total?  

 

 

 

Kind Regards, 

Norah Khai 

Claims Manager 

 

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 
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p. +65 6366 2323  d. +65 6768 9827  f. +65 6841 1183 

e. claims@@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

Email Disclaimer 

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your 

system. 

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank 

you 

 

 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, April 29, 2019 1:33 PM 

To: Nora Khai <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; 'Jacquelyn Tan' <jacquelyn.tan@premiumleasing.com.sg>; Admin A 

<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Premium Leasing Car - SMG 653A accident LKK REF CC3/AIG19004400/Eha3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Nora, 

 

Please find attached video footage as requested. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
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From: Nora Khai [mailto:nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 29 April, 2019 1:24 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: 'Claims'; 'Jacquelyn Tan' 

Subject: RE: Premium Leasing Car - SMG 653A accident  

 

Hi Vic,  

 

As spoken , please share video as the third party claims has video footage.  

 

 

 

Kind Regards, 

Norah Khai 

Claims Manager 

 

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd  (Reg No 199902271W) 

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699 

p. +65 6366 2323  d. +65 6768 9827  f. +65 6841 1183 

e. claims@@premiumauto.com.sg   w. www.audi.com.sg 

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre  281 Alexandra Road   Singapore 159938  p. +65 6836 2223 

Email Disclaimer 

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your 

system. 

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank 

you 

 

 

 

From: Jacquelyn Tan [mailto:jacquelyn.tan@premiumleasing.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, April 12, 2019 4:00 PM 

To: 'Norazima Khairuddin' <nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Cc: Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg> 

Subject: Premium Leasing Car - SMG 653A accident  

 

Dear Nora, 

 

Enclosed is the LKK letter regarding the accident of the above Premium Leasing car & third party SMA 2296R, for 

your necessary action. 

 

In our accident report, our customer claimed he was unaware that he has knocked into third party’s vehicle during 

parking. Kindly update me should you have further info. 
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Thanks & Best Rgds, 

Jacquelyn Tan 

Leasing Manager 

  

Premium Leasing Pte Ltd (Reg No 201009676M) 
9 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159090  

p. +65 6471 2123 d. +65 6891 9075 f. +65 6474 0523 

e. jacquelyn.tan@premiumleasing.com.sg  w. www.premiumleasing.com.sg    

  

Audi Approved:plus  9 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159090 p. +65 6836 5223 

Premium Pre-Owned 53 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408698 p. +65 6836 6223 

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223 

 

 

 

 
 
Email Disclaimer 
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged. 
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system. 
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you. 
 


