Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 March 2019 4:57 PM

To: Anikka Lai

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: SLV5591U - TP CLAIMS AGAINST SJY630G DOA: 03/03/2019 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021501

Dear Anikka,

Our insured has yet to lodge the accident report and we are
unable to comment liability.

For survey arrangements, you can contact LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all ©Hew" lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Anikka Lai [mailto:anikkalai@honda.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 8 March, 2019 2:55 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: SLV5591U - TP CLAIMS AGAINST SJY630G DOA: 03/03/2019

Dear Sir / Madam,

Attached pls find the claims document for your necessary action. Kindly advise the liability of direct settlement.
Thank you

Warmest Regards

Anikka Lai



Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd

6A Mandai Estate

Singapore 729903

DID : 6514 5248 HP : 8288 6302
Email: anikkalai@honda.com.sg

From: Printer Service <printservice@honda.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 7 March, 2019 7:02 PM

To: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg>

Subject: Attached Image

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual
or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete
the mail. Thank you.



