Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Monday, 11 March 2019 11:07 AM

'ONG LI LI'; assignments

'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021480 PRS SJS7467Y [External General]

Please be informed Surveyor Sathya is no longer with us, therefore repairer agreed another surveyor from ourside to
survey this vehicle.

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Friday, 8 March 2019 4:32 PM

To: Autolnsure (Claims) <claims01@autoinsure.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>;
assignments@Ikkauto.com; 'Admin-D (LKKAuto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 18/19/19/VP05/021480 PRS SJS7467Y [External General]

Lonpac External - General

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Geraldine

Please choose one of the motor surveyors listed below as a Single Joint Experty:-

Dear Nivitha

Pls follow up and arrange TP survey.

No.

Name

Please tick VvV

Kalvin Ang




2 Xing Guo Qiang

3 Mohamad Taufikh

4 Bryan Ang

5 Adrian Ling

6 Mohammed Rasul

7 Marcus Chua

8 Kenneth Kong

9 Muhammad Nazril Bin
Abdullah

10 Sathya Sai Kathirrasen

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of
these motor surveyors as a single joint expert.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

.-*’- .

The all ©Hew" lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: Autolnsure (Claims) [mailto:claims01@autoinsure.com.sq]
Sent: Friday, 8 March, 2019 3:02 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: PRS S1S7467Y

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi,

Attached for your attention.



**As we are doing direct settlement with your company, please give us a list of SJE (single joint expert) to
choose from.

Thanks.

*Kindly note that our mailing address is as follows:

6 Marsiling Lane $739145
tel: (65) 3157 2626

Please mail all future correspondence to stated address. *

Regards

Geraldine Lim
did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628
mobile: (65) 9743 6363

e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
201437380M
6 Marsiling Lane S739145

t: (65) 3157 2626

f: (65) 6368 0081

w: www.autoinsure.com.sg
g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is
privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the

sender and delete the mail.--

Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This may
Include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers
and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy.
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