Jia Le (LKK Auto)

=— E— = = E— ————————
From: Tan Kah Leong <Kahleong Tan®@sg.cntaiping.com=
Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 2:43 AM
To: Jia Le (LEK Auto)
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201017/TANKL - Direct Settlement - Accident Involving
SLD6155] (O CTI - TBA) AND SHBB437R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI19004356/K1db3 )
on 28.02.2019

Dear lia Le,

We refer to your email dated 19.09.2019.

Please proceed to resolve the matter at $7,537.30(all-in).

We await your payment advice before we proceed with payment.
Thank you.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assistant Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908
DID: (65) 63896193 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www sa.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook com/chinataipingsg/

Disciaimar: This e-mail and any files fransmitted with it is intended only for the named recipiants and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this massage, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the infended recipient. please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of if thereaftar

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:Jiale@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, September 19, 2019 12:34 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong. Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D201017/TANKL - Direct Sattlement - Accident Involving SLD6155J (01 : CTI - TBA) AND
SHEZ437R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119004356/K1db3 ) on 28.02.2019

Your ref - SNM19D201017
Owr ref * CC3/CTNF004356/K1db3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLD 4155J(Ol) & SHB 8437R(TP) ON 28/02/2019

we refer to the above matter.

The said chain collision involved 3 vehicles whereby our insured was the last vehicle, In accordance to
the MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to seftle the front vehicle's claim at 100%.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any)} would be
affected.



. We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE
LTD" ot 57,537.30{all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Amount Revised

Claimed
|. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $£15.61291 $ 4.045.50
2. Loss of Rental [15days x $99.32) $ 42000 $ 1.489.80 (15days x §99.32)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $ 2.00 $ 200

Total $16,034.91 $7.537.30

**05 days recommendation for repair + 2days Traffic police compound + 15un = 15days
Enclosed hare with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval/instruction please.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{208933)

From: Tan Kah Leong <Kahleong. Tan{@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2015 2:34 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM13D201017/TANKL - Direct Settlement - Accident Inveolving SLD6155) (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND
SHB8437R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI19004356/K1jb3 ) on 28.02.2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Shu Pei,

We refer to your email below,

Attached is our insured’s accident report as requested.
Thank you,

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assistant Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 075909
DID: (65) 63896183 | F; (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook comi/chinataipingsa/

Digclaimer: This e-maill and any files ransmitted with if is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthonzed disclosune, vse or dissemination of this message. efher in whole or partial, is prohibited, If you are not the intended recipient, pioase
notify the sender immediately, Please delafe the e-mail and any coplas of it therealter
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From: Lim Shu Min

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 1:18 PM

To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Shu Pei
(LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D201017/TANKL - Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLD6155J (O1 : CTI - TBA} AND
SHBB437R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT119004356/K1jb3 ) on 28.02.2019

Dear Kah Leong,

Please revert LKK.

Thank you

Lim Shu Min
Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809
DID: (65) 63856156 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook comi/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: & T3 Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is infended only for the named recipients and may contain confidenttal information. Any
unauthorzed disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited, If you are not the intended recipient. please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter,

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 9:24 AM

To: Lim Shu Min <shumin.lim@sg.cntaiping.comz

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLD6155J (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SHB8437R (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI19004356/K1jb3 ) on 28.02.2019

Dear Shu Min,
Please be informed that Ol vehicle number is should be 5LD 6155).
Amended subject email.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax; 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2019 4:.08 PM
To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>




- Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLR6155J (O : CTI - TBA) AND SHB8437R (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI19004356/K1jb3 ) on 28.02.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank vou

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: 5hu Pei [LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 9:45 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Elzine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg. cntaiping. coms

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLR6155J (01 : CTI - TBA) AND SHB8437R (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT119004356/K1jb3 ) on 28.02.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE URGENT
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: 5hu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 13 May 2015 12:17 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Joy Irene
(LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLR6155J (01 : CTI - TBA} AND 5HBB437R (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI19004356/K1jb3 ) on 28.02.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action,

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shup ei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 March 2019 6:32 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Joy Irene
(LKKAuto) <loylrene@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLR6155) (OI : CT1- TBA) AND SHB8437R (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI119004356/K1jb3 ) on 28.02.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHB 8437R at M/s Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409.

Thank you.

Eest Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL: 65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG: 200707743D GST REG: 200707743D

Our Ref: SHB8437R/SR
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

15 April 2019 (By Email Only)

Attn: The Motor Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Dear Sir'Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB8437R AND SLD6155J ALONG TAMPINES ST 21
- PIE/CHANGI ON 28.02.2019

We have been authorized by Premier Taxis Pte Ltd. the owner of Taxi vehicle number:
SHB8437R. to claim against the party/parties responsible for the damages arising from
the above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number: SLD6155J at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, Mr. Soon Chee Guan.

As a result of the accident caused by your Insured Driver's negligent driving and/or
management of your insured’s Vehicle Number: SLD6155J, our client’s vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair (Incl. GST) $ 6.045.50
(2) Loss of Rental — 15 Days (@ $99.32 per day $ 1.489.80
(3) GIA Search fee % 2.00

§ 7.537.30

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

(1) GIA report/ Police report & sketch plan of SHB8437R

(2) Driver's I/C and Driving License

(3) Final repair bill

(4) Vehicle Registration card, Certificate of Insurance. Certification Letter
(5) Check In/Out Voucher

(6) GIA search

(7) Scene Video



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL: 65446671 FAX: 62141511
CO. REG: 200707743D GST REG: 200707743D

Our Ref: SHBR43TR/SR

We would appreciate if vou could look into the subject matter and let us have your
favorable offer within 14 days. If you are agreeable to the settlement of the above said
claims, please forward us your discharge voucher as for our client's signature and
payment made to “Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd".

Please note that if we do not hear from you within the stipulated 14 days, we will have no

alternative but to appoint our solicitor to act on our behalfto commence proceedings
against you without further notice to you.

Yours faithfully, [

7
Claims Department — Shafawati Md Rabu

Email: shafawati.rabud@@premiertaxi.com

NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email to expedite all matters

PS: Please quote our reference no when replying

c.c. Client — Premier Taxis Pte Ltd



' VV Auta

- W =W Consultants
el BRA B Pte Lid

S1UBILAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC3/CTI19004356/K1db3

27/06/2019

EASYDRIVE CAR RENTAL
200 JALAN SULTAN

#02-38

TEXTILE CENTRE
SINGAPORE 199018

Dear Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLD6155J / SHB8437R AND OTHER VEHICLES ON
28/02/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third-Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Jimmy

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2928

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: jimmychen@]lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)




AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

I. PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party clﬁmmt*'}ﬂfl}iﬂﬁmmww
£03-02 SINGAPORFE 486443 (address), owner of SHB 8437R (vehicle no.) hereby authorize
PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with respect
to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SHB
8437R that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 28/02/2019 (date) along

TAMPINES ST 21 — PIE/CHANGI (location) involving vehicle no/s SLD 6155J (“the
accident™).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop,
I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/fowner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this (day) of o (month) 20__ (vear)

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop™
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)




Folicy No ¢ IDMHCSN12041013200 Claim Mo’ ; SNM1SD201017
Claimsnt FREMLIEHR 1ANIS e Ly
Amount v :B87,BATCAD

LOLLARS $E".-'EI'I THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED THIRTY SEVEN AND CENTS
THIRTY ONLY

I in full &
H f damages
=}

Claimant Vehicle Mo, @ SHE B437R

Ipsured Yehlele Mo. 51D 81EEJ

DEte of L £ ZBRS02

Place of ¢ TAMPINEES ST Z1 - BIE/CEANGI

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment msds fo mefug of the ‘dforementicned sum by

CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD., .|/ /We sagres absolutely ta
discharge CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. andfor

Insured Name : ERSYDRIVE CAR:RENTRL
Driver Name ¢ MUHRMMAD HAFIZWHAN BIN RABOUL RZIZ

gll clsime; present or futurs in respect of all léss; injury or damzge
ariging out of the =aild accident:

I eckpnowledge that this peyment iz made without eBdidssisn of Liakility on the
part of CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD.

1) Gen 1 Damages 55
(2) i O Repall ) emeeen 55 6, 045.50
(37 S DeeRental ) S 55 1,48%.80
14y GIA/Police Reports/

Investigation ‘ResultssSsarch Fess 55 2.00

o) Medical Reports/Expenzes 33
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sement 35

=
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[ + Xpa |
¥ . / )
Claimant Name:: | E( ‘]f; / WRIT No = meﬂu‘q%g H

i v (sl 1l
Signaturs s e Date !
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PREMIER

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
OFFICE: 23 Changi South Avenue 2 #01-02 S(4B6443)
TEL: 65436676 / 65436880 FAX 62141511
CO.REG NO.: 2007077430 GST. REG. NO. 2007077430

TAX INVOICE
PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD DATE 26-Mar-2019
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02 PAGE 10F 1
SINGAPORE 486443
ITEM  |Description aTty U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA $ 5,650.00
REGN NO: SHB 8437 R
el
TOTAL LUMPSUM REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR | § 5,650.00
£ GST @ 7%| $ 395.50
/ GRAND TOTAL| § 6,045.50
[
| /
4
/ I',
s |

= = - ==
for Premier Automotive Services Pte Lid

(ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)




PREMIER

TAXIS

07 March 2019

To Whom It May Concern

Dear Sir'/Madam

CERTIFICATION LETTER

This letter serves to inform that Soon Chee Guan of NRIC Mumber 51292460G is a
registered driver of SHB8437R. Soon Chee Guan is paying daily rental rate of $99.32
(Inclusive of GST).

Should you require further information, please contact us at 6214 8880.
Thank you.

Yours sincerely

g

Kellie Poh

Administration Manager

Prepared By: Hasnah

PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD

23 Changi South Avenuwe 2

#il3-02

Singapore 486443

Telephone: +65 6214 B850 Fax: +65 6214 0330

www, premiertaxicom
Ca, Reg. Mo, 200304%75H



PREMIER
TAXIS -

[ 4

REPLACEMENT VEH GIVEN YES/NO

CHECK IN / OUT VOUCHER

b

WVEH NO.

DRIVER'S NAME 54 ah]

CHEE CUAN [

NG s ] 2924E064

HANDPHONE 22 2 35'6 s5¢

MAKE / MODEL

TaM| REGH MD. EHEE‘F;?E Jébl
DATE IN TIME IN DATE QUT TIME QUT
sgo 3l q 1046 <624 Do
KILOMETF_!EE [11] FUEL IM KILOMETRES OUT FUEL OUT
362978 [elwlve]asF] € [1a]v2lau] 7 |
TAXI METER DOWNLOADED
DATE / TIME TOWED B TO WCRKSH
VES HO O Daed BxY A [T it |
DIATE  TIME CALLTO DANER FOR VEHCLE COLLECTICN
DD MY Y FIokE BYOBA

| ACKNOWELDGE AND CONFIFM THAT | HAVE
THAT THE SAME |5 IN GODD CONDITION AND

TOGETHER WITH THE ACCESSORIES / ITEMS LIST ABOVE. THIS VOUCHER 15 USED IN
COMJURMCTION WITH THE TERM RENTAL AGREEMENT.

CHECK IN
-%wh\%m«&@&a ¥
(TS

¥

ORIVER'S NAME

EXAMINED THE ABOVE SAID VEHICLE AMD
TO MY SATISFACTION IN EVERY RESPECT

CHECK OUT

S X

DRIVERS HAME

X

DARIVER'S SIGNATURE [ DATE f TIME

DRIVER'S SIGNATURE / DATE / TIME

gl

CHECHED M BY
[PREMIER'S ALTHORISED WORKSHOR) ]

CHECKED OUT BY
[PREMIER'S AUTHORISED WORKSHOP)

INDICATE AREA OF DAMAGE HERE:

REAR

O— [

O

FRONT
BODY MARKINGS
1 = Light Dent 8 - Damaged
2 = Barious Dent - Chip
3 - Light Seratzh 7 =Crack

4 — Gerious Serateh 8 - Pesling

SERVICE / REPAIRS DOMNE

DRIVER'S REMARKS

0 SERVICING

Q TIBELT

0 AIRCON SYSTEM
0 TURBO

0 BRAKE SYSTEM

0 CLUTGH SYSTEM
0 BULE

0 UNDER CARRIAGE
0 GPF

0 BATTERY

0 OTHERS:

28024

ACCIDEMT: DATE / TIME of ACCIDENT:

TPV

2j 00

IRC (@Y, ~ 25\ 4o BB\




Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
""GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Cluay #18-00, Singapore 048580
IHSURANCE Phone: 35;:2"24 0o10 Fal}'::gd-pﬁ?j 6224 D030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CeNTRe G5 Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No; GR-19-037123
Date of Request; 0B/03/2015 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Premier Aulomaotive Services Ple Lid
23 Changi South Ave 2

#01-02

Singapore 486443

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 0B/0372019

Enquiry By VINCENT CHUA WEE AN

TP Vehicle No. SLDE155)

Accident Date ZBM0212018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance !Insurer Tel. No.
5LDB155) China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. 25/01/2019-24/01/2020  [6389 6111
Thank You,

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the canire by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy of contents and shall be under no liability whalsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and reguires no signature.

https:/fwww. giarme.org.sg/claims/index. cfmTusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp geninv... 8/3/2019



Invoice

“GENERAL

ASSOCIATION

INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +55 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am o Spm

GET Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Cur Ref Ma: GR-18-037123
Date of Reguest: 0E/0Z/2019 Your Ref Mo Online Purchase
Premier Automotive Services Ple Lid
23 Changi South Ave 2
#01-02
Singapore 486443
Dear SinfMadam,
Enquiry Date 0B/03/2019
Enquiry By VINCENT CHUA WEE AN
TP Vehicle No. SLDG155]
Accident Date 280212019
[DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$5)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 013
Tolal Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official usa:
Data:

[%] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque

https://www.giarme.org.sg/claims/index.cfin?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninv... 8/3/2019



SINGAPORE Tt Poton

10 Ubi Avenue 3
POLICE FORCE Singapore 408865

Tal +66 6547 6246
Wiw. polce. gov. 59

Our Ref s TRIPM2023/2018

Date : 6 Marche# 2018

NAME: SOON CHEE GUAN

NRIC ! FIN: 51292460G

Dear Sir / Madam,

CASE OF TRAFFIC ACCIDENT ALONG TAMPINES ST 31 ON 28/02/2019
NOTICE FOR VEHICLE (SHB8437R) COLLECTION

Please collect the above vehicle which is registered under your name at Traffic Police
Vehicle Pound located at 517 Airport Road, Singapore 539942 within 30 working days from the
date of this notice. The Duty Officer at Traffic Police Vehicle Pound can be contacted at 6280 7841.
The collection hours are:

Day of week Operational hours
Monday 2.00 pm to 4.00 pm
8.00 am to 12.00pm
Tuesday to Friday 2,00 pm to 4.00 pm
2 You have to make your own arrangements to remove your vehicle at your own cost. If you are

authorising someone else to collect the vehicle on your behalf, please ensure that he / she produces
his / her NRIC / Passport for verification. Please fill up the letter of authorization at Annex 'A’.

3 Take note that the vehicle must be collected within 30 working days from the date of this
notice or storage fee will be levied as follows:
Type of vehicle Storage fee per day
Motoreycle/Scooter $20/-
Motorcar $40/-
Others $80/-
4 Traffic Police will proceed to dispose the vehicle if it remains unclaimed after 30 working
days from the date of this notice. Should you require further clarification, please contact the
undersigned at telephone number 6547 6201 or via email at

Muhammad_Noor_Rahman@spf.gov.sg.

Yours faithfully, y

MUHAMMAD NOOR
INVESTIGATION OFFICER
TRAFFIC POLICE

A FORCE FOR THE NATION



CASH SALEN\IDRKFURBER No:AE 8399

)‘J! PEOPLE’S VEHICLE SERVICE PTE LTD
BLK 30234, UBI ROAD 1 #01-80. SINGAPORE 408717
TEL : 6743 1987 ( 3LINES ) FAX : 6743 (13

Reg Mo: 200415052wW

¥ Vﬁ”"“‘@ kf” | Date, é‘?/ﬁ / r?

MBS il aiiitbinei] e vauinainsvorinnsarsaransas sun banssn s vonson sanna sadanavamnror va s kra f Aok ekt S0 puimemindme siailiog

Vehicls No: \S'-'\B 2?‘{’3 TEQMod:?t NO: e }‘4 ...........................................
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