7209 Claim Portal

RE: Re:<TP - Mandate IA> - SYMO1I5T ERC%IDENT
<« INVOLVING ]SDS 1666A(0l)/ SLF 5877E(TP)/ OTHERS ON
07/03/2019

Type
© Question

Message
Hi, third party rejected our offer at $4 600.00(all-in) and proposed $5,750.00(all-in). For your further mandate/
instruction please, Thank you. Hsiao Tong - 06 July 2019

£
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TI28/201%9 Claim Portal

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (TP) = Menu

e:<TP - Mandate | 0 [I,E\CCIDENT
& INVOLVING]SDS 1666A(O / SLF 7E(
07/03/2019

Type
© Question

Message
Pls attempt settlement at $5k.

hitps:/ivp smariclaims. axa.com sg/claim-portal/htmlindex-vendor-service-requests. himl#/service-requests/view-message/ 7serviceRequestNumber=10... 11
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hitps:ivp.smartclaims. axa.com.sg/claim-portal himbindex-vendor-service-requests. htmi#/service-requests/iview-messaga/7service ReguestNumber=10....

Claim Portal

LKK AUTD CONSULTANTS PTELTD (TP - Meni

RE: Re:RE: Re:
INVOLVING S 1666A

P - Man Pt) e IA> - SOMO1IST [ACCIDEN
ol)/
7/03/2019]

SLF 587 E(T P)/ OTHERS O

D

Type
© Question

Message

Hi, third party rejected our offer at $5,000.00(all-in) and proposed $5,570.00(all-in). For your further mandate/
instruction please, Thank you. Hsiao Tong - 26 Aug 2019

i



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 3 September 2019 9:36 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: New message for service request 106604, vehicle number SLF5877E
= 6772019
CHT |11:21.23
AM
' : . 8712019 |
11707119 12:57 AM KHOR Saw Theng —Pls attempt settiement at $5k. LSP |g.90-00 AM
B (57 281712019
]_ Revla_ed offer at g/s SE,DDU.E.II.I] ‘ . CHT [o.29.08 Al
1 Message Hi, third party rejected our offer at $5,000.00(all-in) and proposed $5,570.00(all- CHT 26/8/2019
lin). For your further mandate/ instruction please. Thank you. Hsiao Tong - 26 Aug 2019 7:53:50 AM |
, - 3/9/2019
] E9:’2#'1 8 11:33 PM KHOR Saw Theng——Pls maintain offer. LSP |g.03.3a an

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

-----Original Message-——

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 September 2019 8:32 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New message for service request 106604, vehicle number SLF5877E

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LkK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

—---Original Message--—-

From: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg <sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 2 September, 2019 11:34 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 106604, vehicle number SLF5877E

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S9MO1I5T.

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided forin a
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

1



Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: claims@96motorsports.com

Sent: Friday, 6 September 2019 3:06 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: Acknowledgement: Direct Settlement -Our ref :SLF5877E (ref: 96M-19-379)

Your ref : SOMO1IST MC/NPS

Dear Hsiao Tong,

We accept.
Please let us have the DV

Thank you and Best Regards,
Jade Lim

96 MOTORSPORTS
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

Ark @ KB Singapore 417893
Tel : 6702 6996

Fax : 6384 6996

Email :claims@96motorsports.com
Website: www.96motorsports.com

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Friday, September 6, 2019 B:37 AM

To: claims@9%6motorsports.com

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Acknowledgement: Direct Settlement -Our ref :SLF5877E (ref: 96M-19-379) Your ref : S9MO1IST
MC/NPS

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to your below email.

Our principal had further reviewed the matter and we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to
maintain our offer at a global sum of $5,000.00(all-in).

Please consider our offer.

Thank you.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/for the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice

1



engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims."”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: claims@96motorsports.com <claims@96motorsports.com>

Sent: Monday, 29 July 2019 12:03 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-ai@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Acknowledgement: Direct Settlement -Our ref :SLF5877E (ref: 96M-19-379) Your ref : SOMO1I5T
MC/NPS

DearSir/Mdm,

We regret to inform you we are unable to accept your offer of Global Sum hence,
We propose to settle at a global sum of $5,570.

Thank you and Best Regards,
Jade Lim

© © morvorseorTs
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
Ark @ KB Singapore 417893
Tel : 6702 6996

Fax : 6384 6996

Email :claims@96motorsports.com

Website: www.96motorsports.com

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Sunday, July 28, 2019 8:51 AM

To: claims@96motorsports.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Acknowledgement: Direct Settlement -Our ref :SLF5877E (ref: 96M-19-379) Your ref : SSMO1I5T
MC/NPS

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your patience.
We have our principal instruction to improve our offer at a global sum of $5,000.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.



“please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/er the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice

engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: claims@96motorsports.com <claims@86motorsports.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 July 2019 12:13 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Acknowledgement: Direct Settlement -Our ref :SLF5877E (ref: 96M-19-379) Your ref : 59MO1IST
MC/NPS

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Sorry we can't accept
The COR is already higher than your all-in offer,

Please find our offer as below:

COR: $5136.00 (as agreed)
LOuU:; 570 x 7 days = 5490
LTA & GIA: $64.45

TOW: 560

Total: $5750.45

Please consider my offer and looking forward to your favourable reply

Thank you and Best Regards,
Jade Lim

© © mororseorrs
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

Ark @ KB Singapore 417893
Tel : 6702 6996
Fax : 6384 6996

Email :claims@96motorsports.com
Website: www.96motorsports.com

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=>
Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2019 12:37 PM

To: claims@96motorsports.com
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>



Subject: RE: Acknowledgement: Direct Settlement -Our ref :SLFS877E (ref: 96M-19-379) Your ref : S9MO1IST
MC/NPS

Without Prejudice
(save as to cosls)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your patience.
We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $4,600.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: claims@96motorsports.com <claims@96motorsports.com=>

Sent: Saturday, 15 June 2019 1:50 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com:>

Subject: FW: Acknowledgement: Direct Settlement -Our ref :SLF5877E (ref: 96M-19-379) Your ref : 59MO1I5T
MC/NPS

Without Prejudice
Dear Vic,
Kindly refer to the LOD attached for settlement.

Please expedite on the matter so that we can close this case on both our end.

Do let us know if you require any other documents from our end, otherwise we see no reason for the delay on this
matter.

We hope for your most favourable reply at the soonest

(ggnyﬂ'ﬂ gsf?ua

,6 MOTORSPORTS
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

Ark @ KB Singapore 417893

Tel : B702 6996

Fax : 6384 6996

Email : Operation@96motorsports.com
Website: www.S6motorsports.com




From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 4 April, 2019 8:26 PM

To: claims@96motorsports.com

Cc: Gary 96 <gary.chang@96motorsports.com>, Andyson <andysonckl@yahoo.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Acknowledgement: Direct Settlement -Our ref :SLF5877E {ref: 96M-19-379) Your ref : 59MO1I5T
MC/NP5

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/ASM19004338/Ahb3 Vic

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: claims@96maotorsports.com <claims@96motarsports.com=>

Sent: Thursday, 4 April 2019 3:27 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Gary 96 <gary.chang@96motorsports.com>; Andyson <andysonckl ahoo.com>

Subject: RE: Acknowledgement: Direct Settlement -Our ref :SLF5877E (ref: 96M-19-379) Your ref : 53M01I5T
MC/MNPS

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly refer to the attached LOD for direct settlement.
Please let us have your DV if any.

Thank you
Jade Lim

© © mororseorTs
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

Ark @ KB Singapore 417893

Tel : B702 6996

Fax : B384 6996

Email : claims@96motorsports.com




Website: www. 96motorsports.com

From: RATAN BHOSALE Pragati <pragati.bhosale@axa.com.sg>
Sent; Tuesday, March 26, 2019 1:26 PM

To: claims@96motorsports.com
Subject: Acknowledgement: Your ref :SLF5877E Our ref : S9MO1I5T MC/NPS

Dear Sir, Without Prejudice

We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list below to
conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a Single Joint Expert.

List of our motor surveyors:-

Mohd Fadhilah Bin Osman/ Chris Ang (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)
Stan See Chee Seng (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)

T. Thiyagarajan (LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd)

Ricky Teng/ Elgene Teng (RT Appraisal Pte Ltd)

Michael Chong/ Elson Teng (RT Appraisal Pte Ltd)

Simon Ho/ Mohammed Rasul (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)

Ma Chin Fook/ Adrian Ling/ Chua Weijie (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)
Kenneth Kong/ Marcus Chua/ Hendry Ng (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)
Philip Phoong/ Victor Seng (A-Pac Adjuster & Surveyors Pte Ltd)

0. AXA in house surveyors

Lot = R - L B i

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate guotation in
order for our surveyor to complete the pre repair survey,

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of one cause of action,
save as to costs and expenses.

Regards
Pragati

From: claims@96motorsports.com mailto:claims@96motorsports.com]
sent: Tuesday, March 26, 2019 11:57 AM

To: 5G AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Cc: Gary 96 <gary.chang@96motorsports.com>; Andyson <and sonckl@vyahoo.com>
Subject: PRI FOR SLE 5877E; YOUR INSURED 5DS 1666A

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear AXA,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLE 5877E and SDS 1666A on 07.03.2013
AT / ALONG PIE CHANGI BEF TPY LOR 6



We act for HO KOON WAH, whose vehicle registration number SLE 5877E was damaged in the above accident.

Kindly let us have your list of surveyors within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice should you like to conduct a pre-
repair survey of the vehicle,

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle
without further reference to you.

Thank you.

Jade Lim

9 ‘ MOTORSPORTS
62/64 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

Ark @ KB Singapore 417893

Tel 1 6702 6996

Fax : B384 6996

Email :claims@96motorsports.com
Website: www 96motorsports.com

-—--Disclaimer--—--

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Singapore - Externals or any
other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.



© O mMOTORSPORTS PTELTD

Company Registragon: 2017117832

Invoice To : HO WEI JIE

62 Kaki Bukit Ave b
Singapore 417893
ARK@KB

Tel: 6702 6396
Fax: 6384 6996

E-mail: claims@%6motorsports.com

REPAIR BILL NO,

BLK 924 HOUGANG AVE 9 Repair Bill No. 96-ACC-0415-0230
#07-68 Date 02-04-19
SINGAPORE 530924 Vehicle No. SLF 5877E
Vehicle Model HONDA CIVIC
Accident Date 07-03-19
Description Amount
LUMP SUM REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE SLF 5877E 5 4,800.00
Sub-Total| S 4,800.00
GST7%| & 336.00
Kindly cross & make cheque payable to : 96 MOTORSPORTS PTE LTD Total Payable | $ 5,136.00

THIS IS A COMPUTER GENERATED
DOCUMENT
MO SIGMATURE IS REQUIRED

96 Motorsports Pte Ltd

62 / 64 Kaki Bukit Avenue &
ARK@KB Singapore 417893




62 Kaki Bukit Ave &

©6 MOTORSPORTS PTE ITD S s

Company Begissration: 20071 TR32 Tel: 6702 8996
Faw: G3B2 B306
E-mail: claims/@96motorsports.com

Onr Ref ¢ A6M-15-379
Your Ref @ SIMOLIST MCINPS

Date o 02-D4-1%9

Attn ; Motor Claim Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING : SLF 5B77E & SDS 1666A & SHC BROZP & SKD B204A
DATE OF ACCIDENT . 07-03-19

ALONG :  PIE = CHANGI BEF TFY LOR 6 EXIT

We refer to the above mentioned accident.

We are claiming as below:

Cost of Repair (8 5,136.00
Lossof Use 580 x 7 days % 560,00
LTA Search - 745
3rd Party Report 2 1 57.00
Towing 5 64040
Grand Total : 5 5.820.45

The sbove settlement is in respect of our client's for damage peraining to his motor vehicle and shall not prejudice our
client's cladm in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal injuries.

Kindly take note that our office is located at 62 Koki Bukit Ave 6 THE ARK@KB Singapore 417893

If vou have any queries, please contact me at 6702 6996, or email 'claims@motorsparns.com

Yours Faithfully,
Jade Lim



G

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
ENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

:,j h . I"I
.I:; T B
% %@ NSURANCE rrone: =65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ﬁ#ﬁ’:'? ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am o 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Cur Ref No:
Date of Request:

GST Registration MNo: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

GR-18-041386
15/03/2018 Your Ref No: WALK IN ROY

98 MOTORSPORTS FTE LTD
G2/54 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
SINGAPORE 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Date of Accident;
Wehicle Mo:
Place of Accident:

07032019
SLFSBTVE
PIE TWDS CHANG| BEFORE TOA FPAYOH LOR 6 EXIT

Involving Vehicle No:  SDS1666A

your application for the sccident report, we have attached the following accident reports as re uested:

With reference o y

DOCUMENTS |ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (S%) |QTY |AMOUNT (S5} |
SDS1666A PIE TWDS CHANGI BEFORE TOA PAYOH LOR & EXIT 14.0001 13.08
GST Amount 0.92
Total Amount Due {GST Inclusive) 14.00

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the ngeral Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no respansibility for their accuracy or contents and shail be under no llability whatsoever for

any loss or damage arising out of or In connection with the reports or their images.

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:

Date:

[]1GIRO [¥] Cash [ ] Cheque



s

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

I & RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
gl GENERAL Raff .00, Si
",j:-? INSURANCE ghuaneef-ﬁ%u:g;f;ﬁﬂ Falﬂi%?;;;;ﬁggn

© ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam o S5pm
= 2 GS5TR ion Mo:; M400017735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE egistration No

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-189-0413684
Date of Reguest: 15/03/2018 Your Ref MNo: WALK IN ROY

96 MOTORSPORTS PTE LTD
f2/54 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
SINGAPORE 417883

Dear SirMadam,

Date of Accident: 07032018
Wehicle Ma: SLFS8TTE
Place of Accident: PIE TWDS CHANGI BEFORE TOA PAYOH LOR 6 EXIT

Involving Vehicle No:  SKDB2044A

With reference to your application for the accident report, we have attached the following accident repors 25 reg uested:
DOGUMENTS  |ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (5%} |[QATY |AMOUNT (S5}
SKDB2044 PIE TWDS CHANGI BEFORE TOA PAYOH LOR 6 EXIT 14.00{1 13.08
GST Amount 0.82
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 14.00

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Assoclation of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for

any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.
Thank You

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[1GIROC [¥] Cash [ ] Cheque




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

A 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-3607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CC4/ASM18004338/Apb3s2
AT ONERSNGAPORE oue: oo [N
ATTN: SAW THENG Code: ASM
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SDS 1666A Veh. Inspected SLF 5877E
Policy No. CMNO368457 Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. SOMO1IST Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SAWTHENG Assign Date 11/03/201¢
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CIVIC c.c 1595
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. JHMFD462085200850 Colour BLUE
Odometer 171682 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3, Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 KUMHC & mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R18 KUMHO & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55R18 KUMHO G mm
L/H Rear Tyre 205/55 R16 KUMHO & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE WEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/03/2019 Inspection Date 11/03/2019
Survey held at 96 MOTORSPORTS PTELTD
B2/64 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
SINGAPORE 4178593
ARK @ KB
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

’EST'IMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 7 Working Days




1 7d 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

adm mE 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
/’_4 TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607186-R Page Mo..1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLF 5877E
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Woskehos {gﬂ [2{
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BOOT LID (CONSISTENT) DENTED 780.40 £83.00
1|BOOT LID BADGE (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 65.30 65.30
1|BOOT LID EMBLEM (CIVIC) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 74.00 74.00
2|BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE LAMP L+R (CONSISTENT) MNOT NECESSARY 110.00 -
1|BOOT LID NUMBER PLATE LAMP GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 125.40
[COMNSISTENT)
2|BOOT LID LAMP L+R (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 648.40 40580
2|BOOT LID LAMP INNER SEAL L+R (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 80.00 50.00
10|BOOT LID LAMP CLIP (COMNSISTENT) MECESSARY 20.00 20.00
1|BOOT LID INMER LOCK (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 248.40 115.30
1|BOOT LID LOCK CATCH (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 46.00 -
1|BOOT LID INSULATOR (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 167.80 .
10|BOOT LID INSULATOR CLIP (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 .
1|BOOT LID WEATHERSTRIP (CONSISTENT) cCuTt 189.70 188.70
2|BOOT LID HINGE L+R (CONSISTENT) MOT NECESSARY 210.00 2
1|REAR BUMPER (CONSISTENT) DISTORTED 728.00 638.00
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAIMER L+R (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 120.00 45.00
10|REAR BUMPER CLIP (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER ARCH BRACKET (CONSISTENT) |DEFORMED 127.00 24,90
2| TAIL LAMP L+R (CONSISTENT) N/S CRACKED / O/S 784.80 616.00
curt
2| TAIL LAMP INMER SEAL L+R (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 80.00 40.00
10| TAIL LAMP CLIP (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 20.00 20,00
1|END PANEL (CONSISTENT) DENTED 49800 305.00
1|END PANEL TOP TRIM (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 156.00 156.00
10|END PANEL TOP TRIM CLIF (CONSISTENT) MECESSARY 30.00 10.00
1|SPARE TYRE PANEL (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE g087.30 -
LABOUR
1|SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP BOARD (CONSISTENT) DEFORMED 379.40 298 .80
2|REAR FENDER L+R (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 1.770.80 -
LABOUR
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM L+R (CONSISTENT) W/S DEFORMED BE4.00 242.80
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10| REAR FENDER INNER TRIM CLIP (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 30.00 30,00
2|REAR FEMDER INNER SHIELD L+R (CONSISTENT) MOT NECESSARY 210.00 -
10|REAR FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIF (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 166.00 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SEAL (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST SILENCER (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 825.40 -
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTING (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY B0.00 :
1|REAR EXHALST GASKET (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 40.00
1|REAR EXHAUST HEAT PLATE (CONSISTENT) MOT NECESSARY 154,20 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -2.169.26 -811.82
8,637.04 3,247 68
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
1|REAR NUMBER PLATE WITH COVER (SN) (CONSISTENT) |BENT 150.00 70.00
1|BODY PANEL JOINT SEALANT (SM) (CONSISTENT) NECESSARY 150.00 60.00
2|REAR EXHAUST CHROME PIPE (SN) [CONSISTENT) NOT MECESSARY 300.00 -
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN} (CONSISTENT) DAMAGED 350.00 200.00
1,070.00 320.00
LABOUR
TO KNOCK, STRAIGHTEN AND REALIGN ACCIDENT 2,000.00 1,200.00
AFFECTED AREA. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF SPARE
TYRE PAMEL AND REAR FENMDER L+R.
T0 PUTTY AND RESPRAY ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA. 1.800.00 1,000.00
TO RUST PROOF ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA, 120.00 B80.00
TO R&R REAR WINDSCREEN. MOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
TO R&R CARPET AND SEAT. 250.00 80.00
TO R&R REVERSE SENSOR. 150.00 £0.00
TO R&R REAR EXHAUST, NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
4,670.00 2,420.00
GRAMD TOTAL 14,377.04 5,997.68
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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