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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 7:53 AM

To: ‘Claims Dept of CTI'; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: ‘Elaine Cheong'; 'Alfred Toh'

Subject: . RE: MARKET VALUE OF SKE418Y AS AT 18.02.2019 - SNM19D200887C01/8
Dear Alfred,

The market value of SKE 418Y is $175K (Estimated) as at Feb 2019

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 11:46 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Elaine Cheong' <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Alfred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: MARKET VALUE OF SKE418Y AS AT 18.02.2019 - SNM19D200887C01/8

Dear Alfred,
Thank you for your email
Dear Veron,

Please assist.

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 10:21 AM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com; SUR <sur@lkkautc.com>

Cc: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: MARKET VALUE OF SKE418Y AS AT 18.02.2019 - SNM19D200887C01/8

Dear Sirs

Please assist to check the market value as at 18 February 2019.

Best Regards



Alfred Toh
Senior Executive
Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
Tel {65) 6389 6183
Fax  (65)6224 7478
Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com
Disclaimer : :
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. excepi
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately.

AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWww.avg.com




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: x
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information caontained herein is correct as at 28 Feb 2019

Singapore NRIC
8241E

SKE418Y

Yes

01Mar 2019
NISSAN
GT-R3.8A
White

2008
VR38006991A
R35004855
353.0kW (473 bhp)
$80,487.00

03 Oct 2008
03 Oct 2008

2

$80,487.00

Forfelted

$0.00

30Jun 2028

Doy mbl[c\
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B - Car (1601cc & above)

10

$37,906.00
$35,368.00
$35,368.00

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregnput? FUNCTION_ID=F030..~ 28/2/2019



