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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 4 April 2019 3:39 PM

To: 'Cher Yip'; Allan Goh

Cc: SUR; Nicole Chong

Subject: RE: SMF 7539G-DOA: 5/3/2019

Dear Cher Yip, 

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to SOMPO INSURANCE 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Cher Yip <casgaragesg@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 4 April 2019 3:33 PM 

To: Allan Goh <allangoh.cas@gmail.com> 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Nicole Chong 

<nicolechong.cas@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: SMF 7539G-DOA: 5/3/2019 

 

Dear Veron 

 

Thank you for the finalized amount. Attached is the LOD documents for your further action. 

 

Regards, 
Cher Yip 

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd.   
Addr: 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, #02-22 

          Autobay. Singapore (417883) 

Hp: 8866 1222 

Office: 6484 2220 

UEN: 201828067M 

 

 

On Thu, 4 Apr 2019 at 13:26, Allan Goh <allangoh.cas@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Veron, 

 

We would accept the finalized amount of the final repair cost at $6700 with 8 working days of repair. 
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Regards, 
Allan Goh 

CAS Garage Pte. Ltd. 
No.1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 

#02-22 

Singapore 417883 

UEN: 201828067M 

Tel: 6484 2220 

Mobile: 8782 7171 

 

 

On Thu, Apr 4, 2019 at 1:20 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Allan, 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

As spoken. 

  

Confirmed Lump Sum $6700/- @ 8 working days. 

  

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents to SOMPO INSURANCE 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 2 April 2019 4:16 PM 
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To: 'Allan Goh' <allangoh.cas@gmail.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SMF 7539G-DOA: 5/3/2019 

  

Dear Allan, 

  

WITHOUT PREJDUICE 

  

Offer Lump Sum $5600/- @ 8 working days 

  

Parts-$5044.10 (less 5%)=$4791.90 

SN  -$80 

Labour-$2170 

  

Total-$7041.90 (less 20%)=$5633.52 

  

Please check and confirm. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


