Asher Snﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ionpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 1 August 2019 3:23 FM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT Claim_SG

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Accident involving GBD 7449 Z & YK 9922 B on 03/03/2019
along Commaonwealth Rd twds Ghim Moh Rd [External Confidential]

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Asher,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only,

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 29 July, 2019 4:26 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Accident involving GBD 7449 Z & YK 9922 B on 03/03/2019 along Commonwealth
Rd twds Ghim Moh Rd [External Confidential]

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter,

We have highlighted to your good office on 23/04/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

The accident occurred when our insured change lane and hit third party vehicle.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer HUA HONG PTE LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) £ 2.961.76 $1,605.00




2. Loss of Use (4days x $120) $ 4B0.00 %  480.00 (4days x $120)

3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 2.00 3 2.00
Total | § 3.443.76 __i 2,087.00

**4 days recommendation for repair.

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

AsherSng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
phone: 4841-6051 | emal: gshersng@lkkouto.com | fax: 4741-4108

Blk 51, Payo Ubi industrial Park, Ukl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 April 2019 6:57 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.coms

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving GBD 7449 Z & YK 9922 B on 03/03/2019 along Commonwealth Rd twds Ghim Moh Rd
[External Confidential]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle GBD 7449Z at M /s Hua Hong Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupei@lkkaut | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408233)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com:=
Sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 5:21 PM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>




Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: Accident involving GBD 7449 Z & YK 9922 B on 03/03/2019 along Commonwealth Rd twds Ghim Moh Rd
[External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Shu Pei,

Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only,

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 March, 2019 5:04 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5SG; Poh Kin (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving GBD 7449 Z & YK 9922 B on 03/03/2019 along Commonwealth Rd twds Ghim Moh Rd
[External Confidential]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Our case handler in-charge is Poh Kin and he can be contacted at DID: 6841-2132.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 1:11 PM



To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'
<geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving GBD 7449 Z & YK 9922 B on 03/03/2015 along Commaonwealth Rd twds Ghim Moh Rd
[External Confidential]

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that the vehicle currently not in the workshop and repairer will arrange.

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@ kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Shu Pej (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 12:29 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Accident involving GBD 7449 Z & YK 9922 B on 03/03/2019 along Commonwealth Rd twds Ghim Moh Rd
[External Confidential]

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupe|@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Libi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408%33)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh{@lonpac.com=

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 12:28 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Yvonne Toh <yvonne@huahong.com.sg>
Subject: FW: Accident involving GBD 7449 Z & YK 9922 B on 03/03/2019 along Commonwealth Rd twds Ghim Moh Rd
[External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our Ref : 18/19/19/VC05/021475

Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to survey and revert to them on liability.



Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all (%% . lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Yvonne Toh [mailto;yvonne@huahonag.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 4 March, 2019 2:26 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: "Jerleen Tang'

Subject: Accident involving GBD 7449 Z & YK 9922 B on 03/03/2019 along Commonwealth Rd twds Ghim Moh Rd

Dear Sir/Mdm
Kindly advise liability for this accident case.
Our insured claiming third party. GIA report as per attached.

Should you have any clarification, please contact us @ 6661 9688.

Thank you.

Regards
Yvonne Toh
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
250 SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

il @ @
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LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
300 BEACH ROAD

#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSE
SINGAPORE 199555

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir/ Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GBD 7449Z & YK 9922B ON 03/03/2019
We are authorized by the owner of GBD 7449Z their above claims.

I/We therefore propose to claim from your as follows:

1. Cost of Repairs S$  1.605.00
2 Loss of Use/Rental (55120 x 4 days) S$  480.00
3. LTA Search Fee/GIA Reports S$ 2.00

TOTAL S§ 2.087.00

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I, ASACONTRACTS PTE. LTD. (the third party claimant) of __31. MANDAI ESTATE

#07-11, INNOVATION PLACE. 5(720933)  (address), owner of _GBD7449Z  (vehicle no.)

hereby authorize HUA HONG PTE. LTD. (“the workshop™) to act for me

with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle
no. _GBD 7448 Z  that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 03/03/2019

(date) along _COMMONWEALTH RD TWDS GHIMMOHRD _ (location) involving vehicle nofs

YK9922B  (“the accident”).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this & (day) of Mﬁrﬁlﬂ (month) 2019 _(year)

2HAC
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Signed b}r “the third party claimant” Signed by “thr:'wt}rishup“

(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 18/19/19/VC05/021475
DATE .05 AUG 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, ASA CONTRACTS PTE. LTD. confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner YK 9922B the sum of Singapore Dollars TWO
THOUSAND AND EIGHTY SEVEN ONLY. ($2,087.00) in full and final
satisfaction, liguidation and discharge of all property losses competent 10 me/us upon
the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses
sustained by mefus whether now or hereafier to become manifest, ansing either
directly or indirectly from an accident involving, GBD 7449Z on 03/03/2019 along/at
COMMONWEALTH RD TWDS GHIM MOH RD.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (SING & SAN
CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD /LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims
and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of
the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/s HUA
HONG PTE LTD

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

s I-T.\;' -
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Signatré of vehicle owner/Date

Name of vehicle owner/Date



HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

250 SUNGE KADUT STREET 1, SINGAPORE 729332
Tel: |65 4441 9488 Fox: |43) 4661 9469% Email: info@huahong.com.sg

TAX INVOICE

08 May 2019 W0201803-0007

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD.
300 BEACH RD, #17-04/07
THE CONCOURSE
SINGAPORE 199555

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD7449Z & YK9922B ON 03/03/2019 ALONG COMMONWEALTH RD
TWDS GHIM MOH RD AT ABOUT 1710 HOURS

Insured 4 ASA CONTRACTS PTE. LTD.

Vehicle Registration No. ; GBD74492

Vehicle Make : TOYOTA

Vehicle Model : TOYOTA DYNA 150 MANUAL

Vehicle Chassis No. : JTFAT35Y00K204285

Palicy No. ' VCA/P1743766

Date of Accident - 03/03/2019 Type of Claim: Third Party

S/N  Quantity Description Unit Price S8  Amount 5%

Lump sum repair for the damaged portion $ 1,500.00
7% GST § 105.00

1,605.00
Third Party Insurer Enquiry (Receipt attached) $ 2.00
Loss of use @ 4 days x $120 per day. $  480.00

Total $_2087.00

Authorised by Claims Dept

Co. Reg. No. 200900309M | hyahong.com.sg 3T Reg. Mo, 200900309
Page 1 ol 1



Invoice

" GENERAL
INSURANCE

ASSOCIATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-19-034138
Date of Request: 04/03/2019

Hua Hong Pte Ltd
250 Sungei Kadut Street 1

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref Mo; Online Purchase

Singapore 729332

Dear SirMadam,

Enguiry Date 04/03/2018

Enquiry By Y¥vonne Toh Yi Zhuang

TP Vehicle No. YK9922B

Accident Date 03/03/2019

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S8)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is & computer generated document and requires no signalure,

For GIARMC Official use:
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