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51 URI AVE 1, #00-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (65) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62584315

Your Ref: D/191538 Date: 8/3/2019
Our Ref: CSIFCI18004147/Atd3

The Motor Claims Department

First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO, SGA 7700D

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
6/3/2019 at the premises of M/s Premium have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : 59 11,799.00
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 8.159.00
“Check” [tems Amount : 8% 2.381.00
Market Value ' 8%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value :S%

Description of Damage: roar
The vehicle sustained damages at t

Rear n/s portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Adrian
Automotive Assessor
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Denise Ta: (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 June 2019 3:26 PM

To: Boo seng yak; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A; Carrine Leong;
jiayee yap@premiumauto.com sg; Chang Chee Sing

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SGA7700D- TP FIRSTCAP - SURVEYED & MAR 19

Dear Mr Boo,

confirm repair cost of $9964.20 @ 4 days of repairs.

Please submit your relevant documents to First Capital directly.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phona: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay @|kkauto.com fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 May 2019 4:04 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@Ilkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com=>; Admin A <admin-
a@Ilkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg; Chang
Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg=

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SGA7700D- TP FIRSTCAP - SURVEYED 6 MAR 19

hi Adrian and all,

Revised estimate is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $9964.20 @ 4 days of repairs.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



Denise Taz (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 8 March 2019 10:36 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Joanne Yong Lai fong'; assignments

Subject: RE: PRI REQUEST : FC REF: SHA4417E. (D19001516MFSH) 8 TP REF: SHA9556D.
(SGATT00D) ACCIDENT ON 28-02-2019

Attachments: PRELI ADVISED SGS 7700D.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SGA 7700D

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; denlsetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 8 March 2019 9:51 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: PRI REQUEST : FC REF: SHA4417E. (D19001516MFSH) & TP REF: SHA9556D0. (SGA7700D) ACCIDENT ON
28-02-2019

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment

Shiau Chan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 12:19 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: Joanne Yong Lai fong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; CWS Motor Claims
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI REQUEST : FC REF: SHA4417E. {DlBGﬂlSlEMFSH] & TP REF: SHAS556D, (SGA77000) ACCIDENT ON
28-02-2019




Nivitha (LKK Auto)

e
From: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 3:28 PM
To: ‘assignments@lkkauto.com’
Cc: May Chua Hui Chin
Subject: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMNENT - OUR REF: D19/1538 - IV VEH: SHA3757E TP
WVEH: SGA7T00D DOA 01/03/2019
Attachments: SGA 7700 D - 01032019 GIA ADDENDUM.PDF; FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGA

7700 D AND YOUR INSURED SHA37S7E DATED ON 01/... (59.1 KB}

Importance: High

Dear Sirs

Survey assignment for your handling urgent as per attached.

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Motor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Rebinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | DID ; 6507 3848 | Fax Mo, : 6507 3849 |
A Homser of [EIOR1Y INSURANCE GRO

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 "PDPA" )

Under the POPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.

Please refer to weww.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement,

Configentiality Motice: This e-mail Is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are nat the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it,

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all coples from your system and notify the sender immediately by
return e-mail

From: laime Tay

Sent: Friday, March 01, 2019 5:47 PM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweelkeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: spam>ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGA 7700 D AND YOUR INSURED SHA3757E DATED ON 01/03/2015

Dear 5K,

Survey - SHA3757E = CTPL (reported)
Thank you,

With regards,
Jaime Tay
Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877 | \ : 6507 3848 | & 6507
3849 | Cu_mg_a_rj‘,r Regn. No. 195000106C
s

AMemser of ls INSURANCE G

Change of email address
E jaimetay@msfirstcapital.com.sg




From: ILPROCESSCENTRE //ICICILOMBARD/HYD <ilprocesscentre @icicilombard.com>

Sent: Friday, 1 March, 2019 5:33 PM

To: Motor Claims <Motor Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: spam>ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGA 7700 D AND YOUR INSURED SHA3757E DATED ON 01/03,/2019

From: Mastura [mailto:mastura@premiumauto.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, March 01, 2019 2:57 PM

Ta: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: spam>ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGA 7700 D AND YOUR INSURED SHA3757E DATED ON 01/03/2019

Dear all,

Kindly assist in the liability clearance for the above mentioned case. We propose for 100% direct settlement in our
clients favour.

We herein attached the GIA report for direct settlement for your reference.
We will forward you the estimate once is available.

Do take note, kindly arrange the survey on 06/03/2019, Wednesday, 2 PM.

Best Revards
Mastur

Havms Administrator

Premium Automobiles Pre Ltd e s 100moariwy

A5 singapore 086400

pe=0d Ak 2E23 gl +63 6T08 BE2R [ +63 6841 183
Ty

Audi Showr

IO CONESE W Wi adb com. S

b
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. “please note that this email, including any attachments, is intended solely for the individual (s) or entity lies) to
whom they are addressed and may contain information that is private, confidential and privileged. In case you are
not the intended recipient, request you to notify the sender by reply mail and delete this email, including any copies
or attachments from your system. Any unauthorized dissemination, disclosure and/or use of the contents of this
communication te anyone is strictly prohibited and punishable by law.

Opinions, conclusions and statements of intent expressed in this e-mail are of the sender and ICIC| Lombard General
Insurance Company Limited (Company) does not accept liability for the views expressed in this email unless
confirmed by an authorized representative of the Company independently of this communication or for the
consequences of any viruses that may be transmitted with this email.”
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AXA Insurance Pte Lid

& 1600 880 4888 [Within Singapore)
(65) 6BB0 4888 (International)

redefining /insurance =i s SR

O ywww,axa.com.s¢

acopunt number

Certificate of Insurance 00953

Migtar Venicles (Tird-Party Risks and Compansation) Ac, (Chapter 168} - Mator ehiclas Thisg Pty Risks and Compensation) Rules, 1960 -Foeed Transport Act, 1987 (Malagsia)

potor Vehickes |Third-Party Risks ) Rules, 1359 (Malaysial

Policy details

Policyholder name LECK TIN HENG Certiflcate number GA4383T3 /1

Cover Comprehensive Chassis number WALZZZAHOENDL2352
Flan name Flexl Engine numbar CREDO24ET

NCD applicable 50%

Vehicle registration number SGATTOOD

Period of Insurance from 26/01/2019 to 25,01,/ 2020 (hath dates inchusive)

Finance loan company Mil

Persons or classes of persons entitied to drive*

{a) The Policyholder
(b} Ary Mamed Oriver as stated in the Policy
1. LEGKH HAlLJIN 2. LECH KAl SEN

(¢ Any person who is driving on the Policyholder's order ar with their permission

Provided that the perscn driving is permitted in accordance with the livensing or other laws o regulations 1o drive the Motor Vehicke or has Deen so
permitted and is not disqualified by order of a Court of Law or by reason of any enactment or regulation in that behalf frown driving the Maotor Viehicla.

Limitation as to use*

lJse only for social, domestic and pleasure purposes and for the Policyholder's business,

The policy does not cover - use for hire of reward, racing. pace-making, reliability trial, speed testing, the carriape of goods other than saniples in conneciion
with any trade o business or use for any purposa in connection with motor trade; or when the Motor Car, whether stationary, In use or Gherwise, & i Gr on,
a racing track, circuit, route, CoUurse or-any other rozads by whatever name called that are tymcally used for racing, pace-making or such similarn purnposes
i Limitations rendared Incperative by Section 8 of the Motor Vehicles (Tharg-Party Risks and Compenealion) ACt, [Crapter 1891 and Section 85 of the Aoed Transport Aoy, 1987
(Malaysia), Bre not to be intluded under thess headings,

EXCESS Basic Own Damage Excess SGDE00.00
Wiridscreen Excess SGD 10000

An Additional Excess is applicable as follows:
1, 5%500 for unnamed Autharsed Dviver
2, 54500 for declared Young and Inexperienced Driver
3. §%5,000 for undeclared Young and Inexperienced Drivers. This additionel excess is reduced 10 552,500 if You have chosen AXA Premium

‘Workshaps.

Additional clauses & endorsements to your policy

Additional Clause 1

IT IS HEREEY NOTED THAT THE FOLLOWING NAMED DRIVER 1S ADDED INTO THE POLICY,
DRIVER TYPE; ADDITIONAL DRIVER

DRIVER MAMEVINCENT NG HWEI YERN

MALAYSIA NRIC : TE0T19145967

DATE OF BIRTH: 19/07/14976

DRIVING EXPERIENCE: 10 YEAR(S)

GEMDER/MARITAL STATUS: MALE/SINGLE

RELATIONSHIP : 50N

I/We hereby certify that the policy to which this Certificate relates (5 issusd in accordance with tha provision of the Motor Vehickes (Third Party Risks and
Ccompensation) Act, (Chapter 189) and Part IV of the Road Transport Act, 1987 {Malaysia)

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd

e

v

bithorised signature

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (199903512M) lora
B Shenton Way, #24-01, AXA Tower,

Singapore DB8811

Customer Centre, #81-01



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Ropad 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Email; Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg/ claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate 1 Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad1

Contact No X 6366 2323

Fax No :  6B41 1183

Reference * PA/TP/O278B/2019/GW
Date : 2-Mar-19

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.
Your Insured Veh No: SHA 3757 E

First Capital Insurance Ltd
36 Robinson Road
# 16-01 City House
Singapore 068877

Attn: Motor Claims Dept
Tel:6854 3909 Fax: 6507 3849

Owner's Name ¢ Mr. Leck Tin Heng
Address : 100 Telok Kurau Lor M
#01-07
Singapore 425403
Telephone :  HP+6591912037
Type of Claim :  Third party Claims
Pulity No. r GA439373/1
Vehicle No : SGA7700D
Model Code - Audi ABLD4 3.0 TFSI QU
Model / Year :  Mar-15
Engine No :  CREOO24B7
Chassis No : WAUZZZ4HUEND12352
Mileage :
Date In .
Liability 4
Excess Cost S
Estimated By :  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date :  1-Mar-19

Place of Accident :  Still Rd Junction Towards PIE Near Mosque



Premium Automobiles

G5 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Name - Ad.ﬂém_ 6\\
Surveyed Date : 06153 I Q 'j
Authorised Date -

Excess Cost

Liability

Remarks : A Mﬂr&df 23 017/)

Please Note *  This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SGA 7700 D

Estimated
S/n Nature of Jobs Charges

1 To remove and transfer rlear parking and rear lid kick SN S 360.00 L/
sensor assy. Check function.
To dismantle and renew front bumper assy.Inspect lhs

2 rear fender for damages. Re-organise rear crash = 1,&9.0/0 So»
management components. Reinstall all parts removed.

3 Torespray rear bumper and lower spoiler. S 1,500 [ 3

4 To carry out diagnostic check. S/N $192.00 "

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

$ 3,252.00



Premium Automobiles

£S5 Ubi Read 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:68411183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGA 7700 D

Damaged Parts & Prices
S/N  Parts Description S/Nett Remark
1 ReARBUMPER  pda— S 3,342.00< .
2 REAR BUMPER SPOILER Q‘E—-A S 614.00
3 RFAR BUMPER TRIM STRIPS-LH/RH urr-ﬂn:*wr 25 FRETRT = Lo
4  REAR BUMPER TRIM STRIPS-CENTER  Cau(—d 3 828.00
5  REAR BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT-LH A€Vt 5 171.00 &
6  EXHAUST TAILPIPE TRIM  plagese X 5 517.00 /
7 REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP Ade $ 143.00 =~
8  REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS ~MN-€ e~ s 131.00 4
9  REAR SENSOR Nt N 2 s 462.00 7
10  REAR SENSOR SEALRING Mot N(c s 5.00
11 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH Ntz M s 21.00 ¥~
12 REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LHOUTER At «~ & 30.00 A
13 REARBUMPER CARRIER T ™™ $ 1,370.00
14  REAR BUMPER BRACKET-OUTER A=t [t S 44.00 -,
15  REARVENTTRIM A »— 5 85.00%
16 SUNDRIES  Nfe $ 500.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $  8,547.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES S 3,252.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 11,799.00

All charges are not inclusive of G5T.
Legend : Remarks (0K} = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 63662323 Fax;6B41 1183
Email: Nora. khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Supplementary Estimate

GST Reg No. 19-9902271-W

First Capital Insurance Ltd Estimats No. PA/TP/D2TBI2019/GW
136 Robinson Road Date 28-Mar-18
#16-01 City House Isuﬁuum [CHANG
ISingapore 06BB77 Pages ofi
| Attn: Motor Claims Dept ‘Regn No |SGA 77000
Tel: 6854 3909 Fax: 6507 3849 Model Mo AUD! ABL D& 3.0TFSIQU
[T Guaighon - | UmtPrics [ Amou ount
Labours

1 Torepair LHS tail panel panel, 5 60900 400 -

! hao goo -
7 |To respray LHS tail lamp panel and LHS rear fender. § 1 W e 2 .
GRAND TOTAL $ 2,400.00

For Premium Automobiles Pre Ltd

z‘ﬂmub—i

o1foulrs,




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183
Email: Nora. khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate - Accident Repairs
Workshop +  Ubi Road 1

Contact No - G366 2323

Fax No = BB41 1182
Reference + PATPIOZ278/2019/GW
Date + 2-Mar-18

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.
Your Insured Veh No: SHA 3757 E

First Capital Insurance Ltd
36 Robinson Road

# 16-01 City House
Singapore 068877

Attn: Motor Claims Dept
gl:6854 3009 Fax: 8507 3848

Owner's Name :  Mr. Leck Tin Heng
Address + 100 Telok Kurau Lor M
#01-07
Singapore 425403
Telephone = HP 46591912037
Type of Claim :  Third party Claims
Policy No. : (GA438373M1
Vehicle No : SGA7700D
Model Code : AudiABLD430TFSIQU
Model / Year : Mar-15
Engine No +  CRE 002487
Chassis No ¢ WAUZZZAHDEND12352
Mileage :
Date In '
Liability v
Excess Cost -
Estimated By +  Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
Accident Date : 1-Mar-18

Place of Accident - Still Rd Junction Towards PIE Near Mosque



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1182

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle SGA 7700 D

Estimated
Sin Nature of Jobs Charges
To remove and transfer rear parking and rear lid kick
1 sensor assy. Check function. SN 3§ 360.00
To dismantle and renew front bumper assy.Inspect Ihs rear
2 fender for damages. Re-organise rear crash management 3 1,200.00
components, Reinstall all parts removed.
3 Torespray rear bumper and lower spoiler. $ 1,500.00
34 Added labour charges - see attached £2,400.00
4 To carry out diagnostic check. SIN $192.00

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

360.00

800.00

1,200.00
1,600.00

192.00

$ 5,652.00

4,152.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubki Road 1, Singapore 408689
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SGA 7700D

Damaged Parts & Prices

SIN  Parts Description S/Nett Remark
1 REAR BUMPER $ 3,342.00 § 3,342.00
2  REAR BUMPER SPOILER $ 61400 § 613.50
3 REAR BUMPER TRIM STRIPS-LH/RH $ 28400 § 141.50
4 REAR BUMPER TRIM STRIPS-CENTER $ 828.00 § §27.50
5 REAR BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT-LH $ 17100 8 170.50
6 EXHAUST TAIL PIPE TRIM $ 517.00 § 516.50
7  REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP $ 14300 § 143.00
8§ REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS $ 131.00
9 REAR SENSOR $ 462.00
10 REAR SENSOR SEAL RING $ 5.00
11  REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH $ 2100 § 20.90
12  REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH OUTER 3 30.00
13  REAR BUMPER CARRIER $ 1,370.00
14 REAR BUMPER BRACKET-OUTER $ 44.00
15  REAR VENT TRIM $ 85.00
16  SUNDRIES $ 50000 § 36.80
TOTAL SPARE PARTS $ 8,547.00 $ 5812.20
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 5,652.00 $ 4,152.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 14,199.00 § 9,964.20

All charges are not inclusive of GST.

Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks {¥) = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Nett.




Premium Automobiles

&5 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel - 666 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto, com.sg

Supplementary Estimate

GST Reg No. 18-0602271-W

First Capital Insurance Ltd Estimate Mo. PATRIOZTRIZOIRIGW

36 Robinson Road Date 28-Mar-18

# 16-01 City House Service Advisor CHANG

Singapore 08BETT Pages 1al1

Attn: Motor Claims Dept Regn No SGA 7700 D

Tel: 6854 3909 Fax: 6507 3849 Model No ALDI ABL D4 3.0 TFS1QU

Quanty] Descripion | UnitPrice | Amount

Labours
1 To repair LHS taill panel panel. 5 600.00 ¥ 400.00
2 Tao respray LHS tail lamp panel and LHS rear fender. 3 1,800.00 % 1.200.00

GRAND TOTAL : $ 2,400.00 $§ 1.600.00

For Premium Autormobiles Ple Lid

Authonsed Signature



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note - This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Morah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Ma. 18-0807188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref :  CS/FCI19004147/Ad3n2
ot Iy HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 D) e Nmm"“mmm
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SHA3757E Veh. Inspected SGA 77000
Policy No. D-19092580MFSH Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19001538MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From TEOQ SWEE KEONG Assign Date D6/03/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model AUDI A c.C 2995
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. WAUZZZ4HOENO12352 Colour BLACK
Odometer 74497 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IM ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |255/45R19 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Front Tyre |255/45 R18 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |255/45 R19 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |255/45 R13 PIRELLI & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  01/03/2019 [Inspection Date 06/03/2019
Survey held at PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD
55 UBI ROAD 1.
SINGAPORE 408699
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6266 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SGA 7700D

Page No.:1of 2

ay Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) (s)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER (SN} DEFORMED 3,342.00 3,342 00
1|REAR BUMPER SPOILER (SN} DEFORMED £14.00 £13.50
2|REAR BUMPER TRIM STRIFS-LH/RH (SN) N/S CUT 284,00 141.50
1|REAR BUMPER TRIM STRIPS-CENTER (SN} CRACKED 828.00 B27.50
1|REAR BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT-LH (SN) DAMAGED 171.00 170.50
1|EXHAUST TAIL PIPE TRIM (SN) cuT 517.00 516,50
1|REAR BUMPER SECURING STRIP (SN) NECESSARY 143.00 143.00
1|REAR BUMPER FIXING PARTS (SN) MOT MECESSARY 131.00 -
2|REAR SENSOR (SN} NOT NECESSARY 462.00 -
1|REAR SENSOR SEAL RING (SN) NOT NECESSARY 5.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH (SN} MECESSARY 21.00 20.80
1|REAR BUMPER GUIDE SECTION-LH OUTER {SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER CARRIER (SN} NOT NECESSARY 1,370.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER BRACKET-CUTER (SN} MNOT NECESSARY 4400 -
1|REAR VENT TRIM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 85.00 -
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 500.00 36.80
8,547.00 5812.20
LABOUR
TO REPAIR LHS TAIL PANEL PANEL.(ADDITIONAL). 600.00 400.00
TO RESPRAY LHS TAIL LAMP PANEL AND LHS REAR 1,800.00 1,200.00
FENDER, (ADDITIONAL).
TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER REAR PARKING AND REAR 360.00 360.00
LID KICK SENSOR ASSY CHECK FUNCTION,
TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER 1,200.00 800.00
ASSY . INSPECT LHS REAR FENDER FOR DAMAGES RE-
DRGANISE REAR CRASH MANAGEMENT
COMPONENTS REINSTALL ALL PARTS REMOVED.
TO RESPRAY REAR BUMPER AND LOWER SPOILER. 1,500.00 1,200.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK. 192,00 182.00
5,652.00 4,152.00
GRAND TOTAL 14,198.00 9,964.20

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19004147/Atd3n2




Page No.:2 of 2
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS I | [ 996420
Report Ref No. CS/FCI19004147/Atd3n2

S

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER: OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart Is mace solely for the use and bensfit of the Client named on the frant page of this Repart.

Fepart, in whete or in par, doss 5o ai his of her own risk




