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Merimen e-Claims

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

o 1, |\|-_.'|'.|-.'-:' ].’-I Sul

palisicia)

] o "~ Pending for Survey

= fudj B d- | Ad
l:l. Mar 2019 ‘

|05 Mar 2019 16:21

Main

o ST ——

|

|Report

| Cancel Case

Reference

Claim Details

Documents

|[Created by insurer]

o i = - R E
Main | 14
Claimant: | "UA HONG PTE LTD . ) 5
\Vehicle Res. | s1z74892 Date of Loss: | 15/02/2019 00:00 - 59 |
! | Claim Type: | TP / SNM19D201082C02 .ﬁ%‘gﬁmr an:swusuumm: 3
Ty o R | Policy No :
No SLT9727E e, Bl
] Cla 3
|| (Insured): | Hekaimant) B .
(= Excess:  |5§750.00 _ §
| Repairer:  Hua Hong Pte Ltd (Sungei Kadut) 25D Sungel Kadut Street 1, 729332 Sungel Kadut - Tel: 6760 8815 / 6760 0539 g
:":;"ﬂ':? China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111 ... [Handled by Irene Tay Hul Ping - 638386192 E
\Adjuster: | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 .., [Handled by MOHD RASUL] ... [Final Rpt due 20/03/2019]
| |assucm1*£n MAIL RECEIVED mw"ﬂil | _compose Case Mail |
\There are no mail for this case. _
L - = = —— S — . g
| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKsE View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete | ﬁ
I Due Date Priority  Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Deane
No results,
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2015 6:00 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Cc Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-SLZ 74892
Dear Veron

Confirmed COR 51684/-

Will forward LOD to China Taiping.

Thanks & Regards
Ash Le;b* Tan

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

250 SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

fRinBMENG)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 4:28 PM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-5LZ 74892

Dear Ashley,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Part by part amount $1684 (@ 3 working days.

Please check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 2:51 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>




Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PE NDING FINALIZE-SLZ 74892

Dear Veron

Can finalise on part by part basis based on photos attached?

Thanks & Regards
Ashley Tan

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
‘a-“' 25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
',v.-‘ . T.6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

£ llin MCINGC)

it

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com=
Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 1:58 PM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-5LZ 74892

Dear Ashley,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Offer Lump Sum $1350 @ 3 working days.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 July 2019 9:15 AM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>
Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-5LZ 74892

Dear Ashley,

Please provides before paint photos for part by part.

Best Regards,



Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

BElk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 3:20 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Rasul [LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-5LZ 74892

Dear Veraon

Please refer to the photos attached for part by part finalisation.

Thanks & Regards
Ashley Tan

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T.6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

£ llin MCNGC)

e
" (S

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 25 July 2019 2:20 PM
To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; yvonne@huahong.com.sg; Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>;

yvonne@huahong.com.sg
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-5LZ 74892

Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July 2019 3:32 PM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; yvonne@huahong.com.sg; Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>;
yvonne@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-SLZ 74852




Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 12:32 PM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; yvonne@huahong.com.sg; Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-5LZ 74892

Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 4:13 PM

To: lerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; yvonne@huahong.com.sg; Ashley Tan <ashle huahong.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-SLZ 74852

Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,



Veron Chen | Case Handler
. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 4:01 FM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; yvonne @huahong.com.sg; Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg=>
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-SLZ 748592

Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 5:06 PM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; yvonne@huahong.com.sg; Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE-SLZ 74892

Dear All,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 4 April 2018 12:10 PM
To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; 'yvonne@huahong.com.sg' <yvonne @hua hong.com.sg>; Ashley Tan

<ashley@huahong.com.sg>
Subject: PENDING FINALIZE-2 VEHICLES




Hi,
Kindly advise vehicle status,

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

1) SLZ 7489Z-DOA: 15/2/2019
2) SIW 197B-DOA: 4/2/2019

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Veron Chen (LKKAuto) —

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 4:47 PM

To: Jerleen Tang; yvonne@huahong.com.sg; assignments; SUR

Cc: Irene Tay; Chee So Chow; Alfred Toh; Jacky Huang; anselalim979@gmail.com

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLT9727E & SLZ7483Z an 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit 70 -
SNM19D201082C02/7

Without Prejudice

Your Ref: SLZ74892
Our Ref: SNM19D201082C02/7 (SLT9727E)

Dear Sirs
We refer to the above matter.

Please note that liability is clear and we agree to go for Direct Settlement, subject to consistency of damages, based on
M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd’s findings, with supporting documents.

Aside to M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, please let us have your report and bill uploaded in Merimen at your earliest
convenience.

Aside to Irene, please assist to keep track on the matter.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: A ¥ 4ii# Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mall and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 2:02 PM

To: 'Jerleen Tang' <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; yvonne@huahong.com.sg; Jacky Huang <jacky@neocandco.sg>
Cc: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Elaine Cheong
<elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com=; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Accident involving SLT9727E & SLZ7483Z on 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit 70 - SNM19D201082C02/7

Without Prejudice

Your Ref: SLZ7489Z



Our Ref: SNM19D201082C02/7 (SLT9727E)

Dear Sirs
We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

Please note that we are not in position to discuss on liability as our client has failed and/or has not and/or has yet to
file Accident Report.

Aside to Jacky, please assist to notify Mr Peh Eng Chen to file Accident report IMMEDIATELY to enable us to handle the
incoming claim against his Motor Insurance Policy on his behalf.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079903
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www_facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: K F#li Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential infarmation.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient,
please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Jerleen Tang [mailto:jerleen@huahong.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 3 May, 2019 11:50 AM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com=>; Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI
<claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.com:>

Cc: yvonne@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLZ7489Z & SLT9727E on 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit 70

Dear Irene
We refer to several emails below. Please advise us on the liability
Thank you.

Regards
Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T.6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

e @

From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 15 April 2019 5:29 PM

To: 'Irene Tay' <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com:; ‘claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

2



Cc: 'yvonne@huahong.com.sg’ <yvonne@huahong.com.sg>; 'Elaine Cheong' <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: Accident involving SLZ7489Z & SLT9727E on 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit 70

Dear Irene

Vehicle was already surveyed on 7/3/2019.
Kindly advise liability

Thank you.

Regards

Jerleen Tang
Claims Department
P st HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T.6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

Mo e




Catherine Chung (LKK Auto)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, & March, 2019 2:46 PM

To: 'Elaine Cheong'; ‘assignments’

Cc Trene Tay'; 'sur@Ilkkauto.com’

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLZ7489Z & SLT9727E on 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit
70

Dear Elaine.

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards

Veron Chen | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phane: 67.y1-5434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(408933)

From: Elaine Cheong [mailto:elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Wednesday, & March, 2019 2:45 PM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>; 'assignments’ <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: yvonne @huahong.com.sg; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com:>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLZ7489Z & 5LT9727E on 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit 70

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jerleen

We refer Lo vour email of 06.03.19,

B vart the accident To us.

We will be assigning M/s LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to survey your client’s vehicle.

Aside to
Please proceed to survey the third party vehicle.

Thank you

Regards

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Motor Claims)

Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance [Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Ansorn B #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 073901

Co. Reg No 20020

D]

Fax: &.



Email .elzne cheona@sg cntaiping.com
Websife www sg.cntaiping.com

Ju Bingapare pouve 1938

From: Jerleen Tang [rialltojer leen@huahong.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 6 March, 2019 2:12 PM

To: Elaine Cheong <¢laine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>
Ce:yvonne 2 huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLZ 7489 Z & SLT 9727 E on 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit 70

Dear Elaine

We choose Kelvin Ang.
Kindly advise on liability asap

Thank you,

Regards
Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGE| KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

Bl 0 @ ®

From: Elaine Cheong <glaine.cheongi@sg.cntaiping.com:>
Sent: Wednesday, 6 March 2019 2:05 PM

To: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: yvonne::a huahong . com.sg

Subject: RE: Accident involving SLZ 7489 Z & SLT 9727 E on 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit 70

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jerlean,
We refer to your email of 06.03.19.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your maotor
workshop, We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a
single joint expert,

ADRIAN LING

Kelvin Ang

SEE CHEW SENG

MOHD FADHILAH BIN OSMAN
XING QUO QIANG




KENNETH KONG
- [[s1MON HO

+ CHUA WEIJIE
MARCUS CHUA
HENRY NG

Please let us know within bwo{2} working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by
the single joint expert.

Regards

Elaine Cheong
Executive (Muator Claims)
Claims Departrment

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson FRoad ®#16-00 Springleal Tower

Singapore 070005

Co, Reg, Mo 200208384E
DID: 52

Fax: Bi 5224 75
Email: elang cheong@@sg cntaiping.com
Website A com

I Simzapare

rce JUSE

From: Jerleen Tang [ nailtoerleen@huahong.com.sgl
Sent: Wednesday, & March, 2019 1:50 PM

To: Elaine Cheong <claine.cheong@sg cntaiping.com>
Coxyvonne i huahong.com.sg

Subject: FW: Accident involving SLZ 7489 Z & SLT 9727 E on 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit 70

Dear Elaine
As spoken, kindly assist
Thank you.

Regards
Jerleen Tang

Claims Department

P e HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
" 250 SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
. T.6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

flinlONG




From: Jerleen Tang <jerleen@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 1:55 PM

To: cfmmsdept@sg cntaiping.com' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
c‘:+_1--. (LT IERLET: ‘--; II"'I \E'

Subject: RE: Mmdent :m.rolwng SLZ 7489 Z & SLT 9727 E on 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit 70

Dear Sir/Mdm
Kindly advise liability
Thank you.

Regards
Jerleen Tang
Claims Department

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
250 SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T.6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

@ @

From: Jerleen Tang <|erleen@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 February 2019 4:55 PM

To: clalmsdept@sg r.ntammg com' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com:

Cor yvani IO E. CO L5

Subjecr ﬁxccldent mmh.rmg SLZ 7489 Z & 5LT 9727 E on 15/2/2019 along CTE before Exit 70

Dear Sir/Mdm
Kindly advise liability for this accident case.

Qurinsured claiming third party. GIA report as per attached.

Should you have any clarification, please contact us at 6661 9688

Thank you,

Regards
Jerleen Tang

Claims Department

A HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9688 | F. 6661 9699 | W. huahong.com.sg

Jj ._;j ::-_:: (=)
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HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

250 Sunged Kadul Street 1 Singopars T332
Tel [45) 4661 FEBE Fox: [65) 4as1 94779 Email; infe@hwohang.comsg =

Estimate Repair List
06 February 2019 ' HHTPClaims19-30

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #15-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 7489 Z & SLT 9727 E ON 15/02/2019 ALONG CTE BEFORE
EXIT 70 AT ABOUT 0655 HOURS

Insured . HUA HONG PTE LTD
Vehicle Registration No : SLZ T489 Z
Vehicle Make £ TOYOTA
Vehicle Model : C-HR HYRBID 1.85 CVT
Vehicle Chassis No i ZYX102113628
Policy No - 5087272209-01 _
Date of Accident . 15/02/2019 Type of Claim: Third Party
S/M  Quantity Description Unit Price 5% Amount 5%
1 1 Rear Bumper " 'ﬁ“"i’* $ 950.00
2 10 Rear Bumper Clip pm 7 : $ 3.00 % 30.00
3 1 Rear Bumper Lower - $ 650.00
4 1 Rear Bumper Tow Cover s % 55.00
5 1 Rear Reinfocement ~ L+ ./~ $ 520.00
% 2,205.00
Less 20% 3 (441.00)
3 1,764.00
7 i
6 Rear Reverse s P
1 ear Reverse Sensor | NETT 3 200.00
To dismantle & change rear bumper, rear reinforcement, knocking & 9 M —
pull straight rear panel and all area affected by accident \P\ =
OV RC
To perform wire checking ‘inﬁ!{m{,? $ ED.UE%,
To dismantle & refit rear bumper sensor _5 % BU.EQ,/
To spray rear bumper, rear reinforcement and rear panel 3 _ﬁQﬂfD 200
( % 3,244.00
s 7% GST 5 227.08
01 ‘Jz,fﬂ?@ Total & _ 3,471.08

mo
Authorised by Claims Dept

Mrs Tan @ 9639 9195 (Eg_%u) -(,—u;ﬂ..L rg_ﬁ}m

Co. Reg. Ma. 2007003070 | huohong.com.sg | G5T Req, Mo, 200900307
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg.no:19ss07198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email; sur@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CS/CTI19004137/R1VD3N2
Date: 13/08/2019
REFERENCE
Handling China Taiping Insurance ;
TR (Singapore) Pte, Ltd. Policy No: DMPCSN1T674018011
Claimant Insured
VehicleNps  SoelaseE Vehicla Moz SCISI2lE
Nature of Claim
Date of Loss: 15/02/2019 Claim: TP No: SNM19D201082C02
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLZT4892Z
Make & Model: TOYOTA C-HR HYBRID, 1.8 S CVT (A) Engine No: 2ZR8409032
Req. Date: 17/05/2018 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: ZY%102113628
Colour: Blue Odometer: 66298 km
Engine Capacity: 1797 cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S3): Market Value/Mew Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/60R17 Rear Tyre Size: 215/60R17
Front Left Side: Dunlop & mm Rear Left Side: Dunlop 6 mm
Front Right Side: Dunlop & mm Rear Right Side: Dunlop & mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads deptf
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 1,864.00 1,204.00 760.00 38.70
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,280.00 480.00 800.00 62.50
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S5) 3,244.00 1,684.00 1,560.00 48.09
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 227.08 117.88 109.20 48.09
Nett Amount (S5) 3,471.08 1,801.88 1,669.20 48.09
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 11/03/2019

Date Inspected: 07/03/2019 Inspected At:

Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Hua Hong Pte Lid (Sungei Kadut)

250 Sungei Kadut Street 1
Singapore 729332

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL

NOTE: This repart represents our findin

Manager: VEROMN CHEN

knowledge and ability but any other labilly under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.

af the fime and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been camisd out to the best of our

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fi useaction=g... 13/8/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MEM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 08 Aug 2012)

|Parts: M1-SUV TOYOTA C-HR HYBRID 1.8 5 CVT (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0}

|Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

|Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLZ7489Z)

E‘Jalldity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

[ numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page !
Further Info: ltems/values not in re!erenc& catalogue are _pra_fixed with an asterisk g ] 4

Recommended Parts

Mo. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Repair 950.00 FL *-FL
2 10 *REAR BUMPER CLIP Mecessary 30.00FL *30.00 FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER LOWER Cut 650.00 FL *650.00 FL
4 1 *REAR BUMPER TOW COVER Scratched 55.00FL *55.00 FL
5 1 *REAR REINFORCEMENT Bent 520.00FL *520.00FL
6 1 *REAR REVERSE SENSOR Mot Working 200.00FS “200.00F5
F=Franchise part. S=SpcMell. L=ListhemDisc. = =
Sub Total (S§) 2,405.00 1,455.00
- List ltern Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S$) 441.00 251.00
Total Parts (S$) 1,964.00 1,204.00
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 13/8/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type

Labour ltems
1 TO DISMANTLE & CHANGE REAR BUMPER,REAR Mew

REINFORCEMENT,KNOCKING & PULL STRAIGHT REAR
PANEL AND ALL AREA AFFECTED BY ACCIDENT

2 TO PERFORM WIRE CHECKING New

3 TO DISMANTLE & REFIT REAR BUMPER SENSOR MNew

-4 TO SPRAY REAR BUMPER,REAR REINFORCEMENT AND  New
REAR PANEL

Gross Labour Cost (S5)

Page 3 of 3

Repairer's Amount
600.00 200.00
20.00 20.00
60.00 60.00
600.00 200.00
480.00

1,280.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 13/8/2019



